

1 JOHN WALSHE MURRAY (074823)
ROBERT A. FRANKLIN (091653)
2 THOMAS T. HWANG (218678)
DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP
3 305 Lytton Avenue
Palo Alto, CA 94301
4 Telephone: (650) 857-1717
Facsimile: (650) 857-1288
5 Email: murray.john@dorsey.com
Email: franklin.robert@dorsey.com
6 Email: hwang.thomas@dorsey.com

7 Attorneys for Official
Committee of Unsecured Creditors

8
9 **UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT**
10 **NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA**
11 **SAN JOSE DIVISION**

12 In re:

13 **TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED LLC,**
14 **fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED**
15 **INC., A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**
16 **fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED,**
17 **A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**

18 Debtor.

Case No. 13-51589-SLJ-11

Chapter 11

Date: April 9, 2014

Time: 1:30 p.m.

Place: United States Bankruptcy Court
280 S. First Street, Room 3099
San Jose, CA 95113

Judge: Honorable Stephen L. Johnson

19 **EXHIBIT "II"**

20 **TO**

21 **FIRST APPLICATION FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES**
22 **BY ATTORNEYS FOR OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS**

23
24
25
26
27
28
EXHIBIT COVER

Task	Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Amount
W	3/22/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference R. Harris regarding Creditors' Committee engagement (.3); miscellaneous regarding same (.5)	0.80	536.00
W	3/23/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to team regarding new engagement (1.0)	1.00	670.00
W	3/23/2013	John Murray	Review Court file (1.0)	1.00	670.00
W	3/25/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference R. Harris regarding Relief From Automatic Stay regarding Brown (.2) telephone conference S. Kim regarding same (.2)	0.40	268.00
W	3/25/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from members of List of 20 Largest Unsecured Creditors regarding agreement to serve on Creditors' Committee (.5)	0.50	335.00
W	3/26/2013	John Murray	Due diligence regarding debtor (4.6)	4.60	3,082.00
W	3/26/2013	John Murray	Review voice mail from E. Keller; correspondence to E. Keller regarding acceptance forms; review same (.3); telephonic conference call regarding miscellaneous questions (.5)	0.80	536.00
W	3/27/2013	John Murray	Commence preparation of Power of Attorney for Creditors' Committee members; telephone conference with R. Harris regarding status; correspondence to E. Keller regarding same; telephone conference with J. Ellaha regarding same; correspondence to prospective Creditors' Committee members; continue diligence debtor; prepare for Creditors' Committee meeting telephonic conference call; preparation of Creditors' Committee bylaws; review court orders regarding order shortening time , motion for relief from automatic stay, etc.; correspondence to creditors regarding same	6.20	4,154.00
W	3/28/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with E. Keller regarding status of appointment of Creditors' Committee (.1); miscellaneous regarding voicemail from P. Vargas regarding Creditors' Committee contact information (.1); correspondence to and from G. Kaplan regarding interest in serving on Creditors' Committee (.1); review second Motion for Relief From Automatic Stay, Order Shortening Time (.7); correspondence to and from S. Kim regarding Motion for Relief From Automatic Stay (.1); correspondence to and from B. Kirkendall regarding courts denial of Motion for Order Shortening Time (.1); interoffice conference with R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding Brown Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay (.2); correspondence to courts regarding telephone conference with E. Keller (.2); review correspondence from United States Trustee to prospective Creditors' Committee members and correspondence regarding same (.5); continue diligence on debtors (2.8); correspondence to and from E. Keller regarding addresses of prospective Creditors' Committee members (.1)	5.00	3,350.00
W	3/29/2013	John Murray	Review voicemail from R. Harris regarding telephone conference; correspondence to R. Harris regarding same (.1); analysis and evaluation regarding engagement (.2)	0.30	201.00
W	3/29/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding Beresford and Creditors' Committee organizational meeting (.3); correspondence to D. Wright regarding same (.2)	0.50	335.00
W	3/29/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation and analysis regarding case commencement and committee duties; prepare action item memorandum (1.3); review case docket and analysis regarding application to employ special counsel and order denying same; memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.3)	1.60	672.00
W	3/29/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and respond correspondence J. Murray regarding engagement (.1)	0.10	42.00
W	3/30/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from R. Harris regarding telephone conference regarding status (.1); telephone conference R. Harris regarding status (.3); telephone conference D. Wright regarding Beresford and service on Creditors' Committee (.7); correspondence to E. Keller regarding telephone conference with D. Wright and miscellaneous regarding same (.1)	1.20	804.00
W	3/31/2013	John Murray	Prepare for organizational meeting	1.00	670.00

W	4/1/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with R. Harris regarding executory nature of licenses (.2); telephone conference with D. Wright regarding organizational meeting (.1)	0.30	201.00
W	4/1/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from B. Kirkendall regarding Creditors' Committee meeting (.1); review multiple correspondence from D. Wright regarding Beresford regarding same (.2); multiple correspondence to E. Keller and D. Wright regarding telephone conference call (.2); telephone conference with D. Wright regarding same (.1)	0.60	402.00
W	4/1/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation re filings by debtor and update case summary memorandum regarding same	0.90	378.00
W	4/2/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from Agility regarding United States Trustee organizational meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
W	4/2/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with attorney H. Binder regarding status (.4); telephone conference with E. Keller regarding Creditors' Committee (.1)	0.50	335.00
W	4/2/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference call with E. Keller and D. Wright regarding Beresford's interest in participating on Creditors' Committee (.5); prepare for Creditors' Committee organizational meeting (1.7)	2.20	1,474.00
A	4/3/2013	John Murray	Attend Creditors' Committee meeting (5.5)	5.50	3,685.00
A	4/3/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from E. Keller regarding Creditors' Committee organizational meeting (.1); telephone conference with E. Keller regarding same (.2); prepare for organizational meeting (1.6); review and revise memorandum regarding status of case (.3)	2.20	1,474.00
F	4/3/2013	Thomas Hwang	Analysis and evaluation regarding schedules, statement of financial affairs, and creditor lists; memorandum J. Murray, S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding same	0.40	168.00
G	4/3/2013	Thomas Hwang	Revise memorandum regarding case developments and debtor; meetings J. Murray regarding same (.3); review and evaluation UCC lien search results (.3)	0.60	252.00
A	4/4/2013	Robert Franklin	Draft Committee Bylaws (1.2)	1.20	612.00
A	4/4/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation court electronic filing notification guidelines and draft, revise requests for special notice (.6); meetings J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.70	294.00
A	4/4/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation regarding case developments (.9)	0.90	378.00
Bb	4/4/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding initial telephone conference and regarding process (.3)	0.30	201.00
Bb	4/4/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with K. Beresford, D. Wright and D. Andrew of Beresford regarding Creditors' Committee meeting and strategy going forward (1.0)	1.00	670.00
Ga	4/4/2013	Robert Franklin	Draft Committee NDA (.5)	0.50	255.00
Ka	4/4/2013	Thomas Hwang	Analysis of debtor's motion regarding settlement procedures and memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.5)	0.50	210.00
Bb	4/5/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to and from G. Kaplan regarding creditors committee contact information (.2)	0.20	134.00
Eb	4/5/2013	Thomas Hwang	Continue preparation of employment application (1.1); update same; meeting J. Murray regarding same (.1)	1.20	504.00
L	4/5/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference R. Harris regarding cash collateral, etc (.4)	0.40	268.00
Bb	4/6/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from K. Beresford regarding availability and communications with Debtor (.1)	0.10	67.00
C	4/6/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Harris regarding telephone conference (.1)	0.10	67.00
A	4/7/2013	John Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding bylaws and NDA (.4)	0.40	268.00
Bb	4/7/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding consent to circulation of electronic mail address (.1); analysis and evaluation regarding Creditors Committee availability for telephone conference (.3); correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding telephone conference (.2)	0.60	402.00

Eb	4/7/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation of application for Employment of Counsel (1.0)	1.00	670.00
Ka	4/7/2013	Erin Darda	Review schedules, settlement motion and other materials for committee call (.6)	0.60	180.00
A	4/8/2013	John Murray	Organize action items (.5)	0.50	335.00
A	4/8/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding bylaws and confidentiality agreement (.3)	0.30	201.00
Bb	4/8/2013	Erin Darda	Emails with J. Murray, J. Mikhailevich and committee members regarding telephone conference (.4)	0.40	120.00
Bb	4/8/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to team regarding Creditors' Committee telephone conference; Debtor's Motion's, etc (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bb	4/8/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from S. Kim regarding questions (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bc	4/8/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from E. Darda regarding attendance at Creditors' Committee telephone conference regarding recording minutes (.2)	0.20	134.00
C	4/8/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference R. Harris regarding presentation to Creditors' Committee regarding cash flow (.3)	0.30	201.00
Eb	4/8/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation of application for employment of counsel (1.0)	0.10	67.00
Eb	4/8/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation of application for employment of counsel (1.6)	1.60	1,072.00
H	4/8/2013	John Murray	Interoffice conference with T. Hwang regarding Debtor's Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay (.2)	0.20	134.00
H	4/8/2013	Robert Franklin	Review oppositions to Debtor's Relief from Automatic Stay motion (.3)	0.30	153.00
H	4/8/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation and analysis regarding debtor's motion for relief from stay, and legal research regarding same (1.4); meetings J. Murray regarding same (.2); draft opposition to same (4.2)	5.80	2,436.00
A	4/9/2013	John Murray	Prepare Creditors' Committee directory (.5)	0.50	335.00
A	4/9/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence G. Kaplan regarding bylaws and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.5)	0.50	255.00
Bb	4/9/2013	Erin Darda	Emails with J. Murray and committee members regarding telephone conference	0.20	60.00
Bb	4/9/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference D. Wright to discuss Creditors' Committee telephone conference (.3)	0.30	201.00
Bb	4/9/2013	John Murray	Prepare for Creditors' Committee telephone conference (.5)	0.50	335.00
Bb	4/9/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference Creditors' Committee regarding agenda items, etc (1.8)	1.80	1,206.00
Bc	4/9/2013	John Murray	Prepare minutes regarding Creditor telephone conference call (.8)	0.80	536.00
C	4/9/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference R. Harris regarding whether Acer claim for attorney fees is a pre or post petition claim; meeting with Debtor and Creditors' Committee, etc. (.2)	0.20	134.00
C	4/9/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference R. Harris regarding meeting with Creditors' Committee regarding cash flow (.1)	0.10	67.00
C	4/9/2013	Thomas Hwang	Telephone conference R. Harris regarding call with committee and debtor (.1)	0.10	42.00
Eb	4/9/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation of engagement agreement (1.6)	1.60	1,072.00
Eb	4/9/2013	John Murray	Multiple telephone conference D. Wright regarding retention as Creditors' Committee Counsel (.3); telephone conference S. Kim regarding same (.1)	0.40	268.00
Eb	4/9/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference H. Binder regarding Creditors Committee counsel (.1)	0.10	67.00
Eb	4/9/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference M. Brown regarding Creditors' Committee representation (.1)	0.10	67.00
H	4/9/2013	John Murray	Analysis and review regarding Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay (.5)	0.50	335.00
H	4/9/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review responses of ACER and HTC regarding motion for stay relief (.2); obtain pleadings regarding same; meeting J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
Ka	4/9/2013	John Murray	Review detailed voicemail from T. Lewis regarding Debtor's Motion regarding settlement Protocol (.1); correspondence to T. Lewis regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
Ka	4/9/2013	John Murray	Review, analysis and evaluation Debtor's Motion etc, regarding settlement protocol (.5)	0.50	335.00
Ka	4/9/2013	Thomas Hwang	Investigation regarding Rule 9019 motion, and notice of same (.1); conferences J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.20	84.00

A	4/10/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation of Creditors' Committee bylaws (.8)	0.80	536.00
Bb	4/10/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from Creditors' Committee regarding call in information for 4/11/13 telephonic conference call with Debtor (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	4/10/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from G. Felcyn regarding meeting with Debtor regarding cash flow (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bc	4/10/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with with D. Wright regarding Creditors' Committee meeting minutes (.2)	0.20	134.00
D	4/10/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with M. Lubic regarding Acer litigation (.3); correspondence to A. Jarvis regarding same (.1)	0.40	268.00
D	4/10/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Charles regarding meeting with C. Hoge regarding TPL litigation (.1); telephone conference with G. Charles regarding same (.2); correspondence to G. Charles regarding telephonic conference call (.1)	0.40	268.00
Eb	4/10/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation of engagement agreement (1.0); correspondence to and from K. Jorgensen regarding same (.6)	1.60	1,072.00
Eb	4/10/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation of engagement agreement (.7)	0.70	469.00
H	4/10/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from Attorney Harris regarding Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay	0.10	67.00
H	4/10/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with Attorney Harris regarding telephonic conference call with Creditors' Committee regarding Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay, etc. (.3)	0.30	201.00
H	4/10/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from H. Binder regarding service of Reply (.1); review Debtor's Reply to Creditors' Committee's Opposition to Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay (.6); prepare for hearing regarding same (.6)	1.30	871.00
H	4/10/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from P. Marcoux regarding Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay (.1)	0.10	67.00
H	4/10/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation and analysis regarding debtor's response to committee opposition to relief from stay, and memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same	0.40	168.00
Ka	4/10/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to and from E. Keller regarding Debtor's Motion regarding settlement procedures (.1); telephonic conference call with E. Keller and E. Dowell regarding same (.2)	0.30	201.00
Bb	4/11/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from S. Kim regarding meeting with Debtor's special IP counsel (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bb	4/11/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to and from C. Johnson of Patriot regarding attending Debtor's presentation to Creditors' Committee (.1); review multiple correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same and miscellaneous regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
Bb	4/11/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding Creditors' Committee/Debtor's meeting (.1); review multiple correspondence from B. Kirkendall regarding same regarding slides and regarding hearing regarding Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay (.1); review correspondence from M. Imhoff regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
Bc	4/11/2013	Erin Darda	Prepare minutes of creditors' committee conference	0.40	120.00
C	4/11/2013	Erin Darda	Emails with J. Murray, T. Hwang, J. Mikhailevich and H. Binder regarding creditors' committee conference	0.30	90.00
C	4/11/2013	Erin Darda	Telephone conference with creditors' committee, debtor's counsel and debtor	3.90	1,170.00
C	4/11/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with R. Harris regarding Debtor's issues going forward (.2)	0.20	134.00
D	4/11/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from C. Cavazos regarding Creditors' Committee directory (.1); correspondence to and from E. Keller regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
D	4/11/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to G. Charles regarding meeting with Creditors' Committee (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	4/11/2013	John Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding Debtor's slides regarding revenue projections (.3)	0.30	201.00

G	4/11/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and investigation regarding debtor budget and power point presentation, regarding debtor meeting with committee (.2); correspondences E. Darda regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
H	4/11/2013	John Murray	Prepare for hearing regarding Debtor's Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay regarding NorCal litigation (.8); attend same (2.5)	3.30	2,211.00
H	4/11/2013	John Murray	Attend meeting with Creditors' Committee and Debtor regarding Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay, cash flow and litigation (4.5)	4.50	3,015.00
L	4/11/2013	John Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding Debtor's cash collateral budget (.2)	0.20	134.00
L	4/12/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from R. Harris regarding cash collateral (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	4/13/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to and from Creditors' Committee regarding Sunday telephonic conference call (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	4/13/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to and from S. Kim and K. Beresford regarding registry of potential assets of bankruptcy estate (.1)	0.10	67.00
C	4/13/2013	John Murray	Review draft of minutes of 4/11/13 Creditors' Committee meeting with Debtor (.2); correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
C	4/13/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from H. Binder regarding telephonic conference call (.1)	0.10	67.00
L	4/13/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from R. Harris regarding request for Order Shortening Time regarding hearing regarding motion to use cash collateral; review Application regarding same (.5)	0.50	335.00
L	4/13/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding cash collateral motion, bylaws, NDA, etc. (.2)	0.20	134.00
Ba	4/14/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to T. Hwang regarding action items (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bb	4/14/2013	Erin Darda	Emails with J. Murray regarding committee calls	0.20	60.00
Bb	4/14/2013	John Murray	Prepare for Creditors' Committee telephonic conference call (1.0); attend same (1.3)	2.30	1,541.00
Bc	4/14/2013	Erin Darda	Revise committee conference minutes'	0.30	90.00
L	4/14/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with R. Harris regarding cash collateral motion (.2)	0.20	134.00
A	4/15/2013	Robert Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding bylaws and NDA	0.20	102.00
Bb	4/15/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from G. Felcyn regarding telephone conference with Patriot (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	4/15/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference C. Johnson and G. Felcyn regarding mediation between Alliasence and PDS (.5)	0.50	335.00
C	4/15/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference H. Binder regarding status (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ka	4/15/2013	Thomas Hwang	Analysis and evaluation regarding debtor's motion regarding settlement procedures and legal research regarding same (1.4); draft opposition regarding same (.5)	1.90	798.00
A	4/16/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and revise Bylaws (2.4)	2.40	1,224.00
A	4/16/2013	Robert Franklin	Review committee members comments regarding bylaws' analysis and evaluation regarding same and incorporate as appropriate in revised draft	0.20	102.00
Bb	4/16/2013	Erin Darda	Emails with J. Murray and K. Beresford regarding committee call and list of unsecured creditors	0.20	60.00
Bb	4/16/2013	John Murray	Prepare agenda for Creditors' Committee telephone conference; review all correspondence regarding action items (1.9)	1.90	1,273.00
C	4/16/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from H. Binder regarding miscellaneous action items (.5)	0.50	335.00
C	4/16/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference H. Binder regarding miscellaneous action items and information for Creditors' Committee (.5)	0.50	335.00
Ga	4/16/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and revise NDA (2.8)	2.80	1,428.00
Ka	4/16/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference G. Charles regarding PDS/Alliasence agreement and Debtor's settlement protocol Motion (.2)	0.20	134.00

Ka	4/16/2013	Thomas Hwang	Legal research regarding debtor's motion for settlement procedures (.6); draft opposition to same (3.5)	4.10	1,722.00
L	4/16/2013	John Murray	Review Debtors' Motion for Order Shortening Time regarding hearing on cash collateral Motion (.2); review cash collateral Motion (.5)	0.70	469.00
L	4/16/2013	Robert Franklin	Review cash collateral motion, analysis and evaluation regarding potential issues and draft memorandum regarding same (2.5)	2.50	1,275.00
L	4/16/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and analysis debtor's pleadings regarding cash collateral motion	0.20	84.00
A	4/17/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and revise bylaws (.2); finalize Bylaws (.3)	0.50	255.00
Bb	4/17/2013	Erin Darda	Emails with J. Murray, R. Franklin and committee members regarding committee conference and Alliacense issues	0.50	150.00
Bb	4/17/2013	Erin Darda	Creditors' committee conference	1.70	510.00
Bb	4/17/2013	John Murray	Continue to prepare for Creditors' Committee weekly telephone conference; review correspondence for action items (3.3); attend Creditors' Committee telephone conference (1.8)	5.10	3,417.00
Bb	4/17/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding financial advisor (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	4/17/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference D. Wright regarding communications from D. Lecrone to K. Beresford (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	4/17/2013	Robert Franklin	Prepare for meeting with Committee (.2); attend Committee meeting (1.8)	2.00	1,020.00
Bc	4/17/2013	Erin Darda	Prepare minutes of committee call	0.90	270.00
Bc	4/17/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding minutes of Creditors' Committee meeting of April 10 (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ga	4/17/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding NDA and respond to same (.4); review and revise NDA (1.0)	1.40	714.00
H	4/17/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation of Order regarding Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay (.4)	0.40	268.00
H	4/17/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding Order regarding Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay (.1)	0.10	67.00
H	4/17/2013	John Murray	Review and revise Order regarding Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay regarding NorCal actions (.2); correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
Ka	4/17/2013	Thomas Hwang	Continue preparation, finalize opposition to settlement procedures motion	1.30	546.00
L	4/17/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation of objection to Cash Collateral Motion (.2)	0.20	134.00
L	4/17/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference R. Harris regarding cash collateral Motion (.2); correspondence to and from R. Harris regarding carveout regarding same (.2)	0.40	268.00
L	4/17/2013	Robert Franklin	Review cash collateral motion and prepare opposition thereto (2.0); finalize opposition (.4)	2.40	1,224.00
A	4/18/2013	Robert Franklin	Finalize Bylaws and NDA and forward to Committee for approval	0.40	204.00
Bb	4/18/2013	Erin Darda	Emails with J. Murray, P. Marcoux and R. Franklin regarding relief from stay order, bylaws and NDA	0.40	120.00
H	4/18/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to and from D. Wright regarding Order on Motion for Relief on Automatic Stay (.2); review multiple correspondence from Creditors' Committee members regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
H	4/18/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Harris and H. Binder regarding form of Order regarding Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay	0.20	134.00
Ka	4/18/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review objection of United States Trustee to motion regarding settlement procedures; review objections to cash collateral motion	0.10	42.00
L	4/18/2013	John Murray	Prepare for hearing regarding Debtors' cash collateral Motion (1.0); attend same (3.2)	4.20	2,814.00
A	4/19/2013	Robert Franklin	Review status of return of NDA and Bylaws (.4); detailed telephone conference with D. Wright regarding same (.2)	0.60	306.00

Bb	4/19/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from Creditors' Committee members regarding bylaws and NDA (.2); correspondence to and from R. Franklin regarding same (.1); correspondence to H. Binder and R. Harris regarding same (.1)	0.40	268.00
Eb	4/19/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting J. Murray regarding employment application (.1); continue preparation of same (.4)	0.50	210.00
H	4/19/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to and from H. Binder regarding Order regarding Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay (.2)	0.20	134.00
L	4/19/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to and from R. Harris, C. Hart and J. Ellahie regarding form of cash collateral Order (.2); review CD of cash collateral hearing and review and revise Order regarding same (1.9)	2.10	1,407.00
A	4/20/2013	John Murray	Organize action items (1.7)	1.70	1,139.00
Bb	4/20/2013	John Murray	Report to Creditors' Committee regarding week's events (1.3)	1.30	871.00
C	4/20/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to H. Binder and R. Harris regarding Debtor's presentation to Creditor's Committee regarding Alliacense (.1)	0.10	67.00
Eb	4/20/2013	Thomas Hwang	Continue preparation of employment application and supporting declaration	0.70	294.00
H	4/20/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding further Opposition to Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay regarding NorCal litigation (.1); telephone conference R. Franklin regarding same (.1); correspondence to H. Binder regarding Order regarding Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay (.1)	0.30	201.00
H	4/20/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Rao regarding Stipulation for Relief from Automatic Stay regarding Brown litigation; review proposed stipulation (.2); correspondence to R. Franklin and S. Kim regarding same (.1); correspondence to D. Rao regarding same (.1)	0.40	268.00
J	4/20/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to C. Cavazos regarding project billing categories	0.10	67.00
A	4/21/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from R. Franklin regarding status of bylaws and NDA (.1); review correspondence from Creditors' Committee regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
A	4/22/2013	John Murray	Review docket regarding recent filings and correspondence to S. Bloomer regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
A	4/22/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence J. Murray to Committee members regarding case status; memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
Bb	4/22/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation of correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding recent and scheduled events (.3)	0.30	201.00
Bb	4/22/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding schedule, etc (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	4/22/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from S. Kim regarding inquiry from G2 Investments (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	4/22/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from M. Brown regarding Section 341 Meeting of Creditors (.1)	0.10	67.00
C	4/22/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to and from H. Binder regarding Aliasence presentation (.2); multiple correspondence to and from Creditors' Committee regarding same (.2); correspondence to and from E. Darda regarding same (.1); correspondence to and from C. Johnson regarding same (.1)	0.60	402.00
C	4/22/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from H. Binder regarding Beresford claim; correspondence to K. Beresford regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
D	4/22/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference E. Keller regarding telephone participation at Section 341 Meeting of Creditors (.1); correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding same (.1); correspondence to E. Keller regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
Eb	4/22/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding application for employment of counsel; continue preparation of same (.3); review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding same (.3)	0.60	402.00
G	4/22/2013	Erin Darda	Emails with J. Murray regarding Aliasence presentation	0.20	60.00
G	4/22/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to M. Leckrone regarding Allicense presentation (.1)	0.10	67.00

G	4/22/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from R. Franklin regarding alter ego claims (.2)	0.20	134.00
G	4/22/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to and from R. Harris regarding request for documents and NDA (.1); review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
G	4/22/2013	John Murray	Legal research regarding Debtor's obligation to provide financial information (.2); correspondence to and from team regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
G	4/22/2013	Robert Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding options to obtain information from Debtor (.4)	0.40	204.00
G	4/22/2013	Robert Franklin	Legal research regarding alter ego claim (.6); correspondence with K. Curry regarding alter ego claim (.4)	1.00	510.00
G	4/22/2013	Thomas Hwang	Legal research regarding debtor's duties of disclosure (.3)	0.30	126.00
H	4/22/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to and from H. Binder regarding Order regarding Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay (.2)	0.20	134.00
H	4/22/2013	John Murray	Review Creditors' Committee supplemental objection to Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay	0.20	134.00
H	4/22/2013	John Murray	Review Patriots memorandum of Points and Authorities and declaration regarding Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay and settlement protocol Motion (.2)	0.20	134.00
H	4/22/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from H. Binder regarding Creditors' Committee Opposition to Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay; correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
H	4/22/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from R. Franklin regarding Stipulation regarding Relief from Automatic Stay regarding Brown (.1); review multiple correspondence to Creditors' Committee and Debtor's counsel regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
H	4/22/2013	Robert Franklin	Draft supplemental opposition to Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay filed by Debtor regarding the NorCal actions (.8); review and revise same (.2)	1.00	510.00
H	4/22/2013	Robert Franklin	Review proposed Stipulation for Relief from Automatic Stay regarding the Browns (.2); detailed telephone conference S. Kim regarding Stipulation (.2); correspondence with Committee members and Debtor's counsel regarding Stipulation (.2)	0.60	306.00
Ka	4/22/2013	John Murray	Prepare for hearing regarding settlement protocol Motion (.2); review U.S. Trustee's objection regarding same (.2)	0.40	268.00
Ka	4/22/2013	John Murray	Review Debtor's reply regarding objection to settlement procedures Motion (.4)	0.40	268.00
Ka	4/22/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and analysis regarding reply to opposition regarding settlement procedures motion	0.20	84.00
L	4/22/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Harris regarding cash collateral Order (.1); correspondence to C. Cavazos regarding comparing to markup (.1); analysis and evaluation regarding same (.1); correspondence to R. Harris regarding same (.1)	0.40	268.00
L	4/22/2013	Thomas Hwang	Investigation regarding security interests in debtor; evaluation cash collateral motion regarding same (.4); exchange correspondences R. Harris regarding same; correspondence R. Franklin and J. Murray regarding same; review correspondence R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	0.60	252.00
A	4/23/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation regarding case developments and action items, and prepare memorandum regarding same (.7)	0.70	294.00
C	4/23/2013	Erin Darda	Emails with J. Murray and committee members regarding Alliacense presentation; attend Alliacense presentation and prepare minutes	4.00	1,200.00
C	4/23/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to M. Lecrone regarding copy of powerpoint presentation (.1)	0.10	67.00
C	4/23/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and revise minutes (.4)	0.40	204.00
G	4/23/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from K. Beresford regarding meeting with Alliacense (.1); correspondence to and from R. Harris regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
G	4/23/2013	John Murray	Prepare for meeting with Alliacense (.3); attend same (3.5)	3.80	2,546.00

G	4/23/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from H. Binder regarding production of documents; correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	4/23/2013	Robert Franklin	Attend presentation by Alliacense to the Committee and Committee meeting (3.5); detailed telephone conference W. Smith regarding the NDA and analysis and evaluation regarding protective order (.3)	3.80	1,938.00
Ka	4/23/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference D. Wright regarding settlement procedures Motion and creation of sub-committee (.2)	0.20	134.00
Ka	4/23/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding Debtor's reply to Opposition to Motion regarding settlement protocol (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ka	4/23/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation and analysis, and legal research regarding Debtor's reply to opposition regarding settlement procedures motion (.7); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.4)	1.10	462.00
A	4/24/2013	John Murray	Attend Section 341 Meeting of Creditors (3.2)	3.20	2,144.00
A	4/24/2013	Thomas Hwang	Investigation regarding status conference requirements, court procedures (.3); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.40	168.00
Bb	4/24/2013	John Murray	Commence preparation of agenda for 4/25/13 Creditors' Committee telephone conference (.3)	0.30	201.00
Bc	4/24/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding minutes of 4/17/13 Creditors' Committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ea	4/24/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to prospective financial advisors and forensic accountants regarding engagement by Creditors' Committee (.5)	0.50	335.00
Ea	4/24/2013	Thomas Hwang	Investigation regarding potential financial advisors (.5); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.60	252.00
G	4/24/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from M. Lecrone regarding Alliacense presentation and correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding same (.1); correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding minutes of meeting regarding Alliacense (.1)	0.20	134.00
H	4/24/2013	John Murray	Attend hearing regarding Debtor's Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay and Motion to establish settlement protocol (3.5)	3.50	2,345.00
A	4/25/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to C. Cavazos regarding obtaining CD of Section 341 Meeting of Creditors (.1)	0.10	67.00
A	4/25/2013	Robert Franklin	Review status conference statement by Debtor (.3)	0.30	153.00
Bb	4/25/2013	John Murray	Review notes, organize and review action item memorandum and prepare agenda for Creditors' Committee telephone conference call (1.6); attend Creditors' Committee telephone conference call (1.8)	3.40	2,278.00
Bb	4/25/2013	Robert Franklin	Attend Creditor Committee meeting (1.8)	1.80	918.00
Bb	4/25/2013	Robert Franklin	Commence review correspondence S. Kim regarding Debtor's actions pre-petition (.3)	0.30	153.00
Bb	4/25/2013	Thomas Hwang	Weekly meeting with Committee regarding case status and strategy (1.8); prepare for same; review correspondences regarding same, and review nondisclosure agreement and comments (.2); meeting J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	2.10	882.00
Bc	4/25/2013	Erin Darda	Revise committee minutes	0.40	120.00
Bc	4/25/2013	Erin Darda	Emails with T. Hwang, J. Murray and R. Franklin regarding committee minutes	0.20	60.00
Bc	4/25/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft minutes to Committee meeting	1.30	546.00
Ea	4/25/2013	Thomas Hwang	Investigation regarding financial advisors and memorandum J. Murray regarding same	0.20	84.00
Eb	4/25/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to M. Brown regarding execution of engagement agreement (.1)	0.10	67.00
Eb	4/25/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to and from T. Hwang regarding Dorsey Application for Employment of Counsel, etc (.2)	0.20	134.00

Eb	4/25/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation regarding engagement agreement, and review and revise employment application (.7); review and revise declaration regarding same (.2); revise order regarding same (.1); memorandum J. Murray regarding same; meeting J. Murray regarding same (.1)	1.10	462.00
Ec	4/25/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review memorandum J. Murray, and investigation docket and debtor filings regarding status of employment pleadings	0.30	126.00
G	4/25/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to H. Binder regarding document request (.2)	0.20	134.00
Ga	4/25/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding NDA and correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Ga	4/25/2013	Robert Franklin	Review of Debtor's comments and changes to NDA and preliminary response to same (1.8); draft summary to Committee and draft response to Debtor's changes (1.5); detailed telephone conference D. Wright regarding revisions (.4); correspondence with S. Kim regarding revisions (.1); review and revise response (.5); detailed telephone conference W. Smith regarding revisions (.4)	4.70	2,397.00
Ka	4/25/2013	John Murray	Commence preparation of protocol regarding litigation settlements/licensing (1.2); conference with H. Binder and J. Ottesen regarding same (1.2); continue preparation of settlement protocol (1.0)	3.40	2,278.00
Ka	4/25/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from K. Prochnow regarding settlement protocol (.1); correspondence to and from S. Kim regarding same (.2); correspondence to H. Binder and J. Ottesen regarding same (.1)	0.40	268.00
Ka	4/25/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review memoranda J. Murray regarding proposed settlement procedures protocol and comments thereto from Committee members	0.20	84.00
L	4/25/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to and from R. Harris regarding status of cash collateral order (.2)	0.20	134.00
L	4/25/2013	Robert Franklin	Draft correspondence to R. Harris regarding status of cash collateral budget (.1)	0.10	51.00
A	4/26/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from C. Cavazos regarding CD of Section 341 Meeting of Creditors (.1)	0.10	67.00
A	4/26/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review Debtor's status conference statement (.1)	0.10	42.00
Bc	4/26/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding Creditors' Committee meeting minutes (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bc	4/26/2013	Thomas Hwang	Continue preparation of meeting minutes (1.4); memorandum J. Murray and R. Franklin regarding same (.3); correspondence Committee regarding same; review correspondence C. Brown regarding same (.1); review memorandum from R. Franklin regarding same, regarding action items (.1)	1.90	798.00
Eb	4/26/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation and analysis of employment pleadings filed by Debtor and memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same	1.60	672.00
G	4/26/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference C. Johnson and G. Felcyn regarding license fee from Ford Motor Company (.2)	0.20	134.00
Ga	4/26/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Franklin to Creditors' Committee regarding outstanding issues regarding NDA (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ga	4/26/2013	Robert Franklin	Correspondence with W. Smith regarding NDA (.3); detailed telephone conference D. Wright regarding developments and strategies for closing the NDA discussions (.7); review redlined agreement from the Debtor and correspondence with S. Kim regarding same (.4); revise NDA and draft correspondence to W. Smith regarding same (.5)	1.90	969.00
H	4/26/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to and from H. Binder regarding Brown Stipulation regarding Relief from Automatic Stay (.1); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
H	4/26/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from R. Harris regarding form of Order regarding Debtors' Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay (.2); review correspondence to and from T. Walker and R. Harris regarding same (.2); review correspondence from R. Eisenbach regarding same (.1)	0.50	335.00

H	4/26/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences R. Franklin regarding nondisclosure agreement and regarding stay relief and stipulation regarding Browns (.1)	0.10	42.00
G	4/28/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding payments to Allicense (.2)	0.20	134.00
A	4/29/2013	Robert Franklin	Respond to correspondence regarding preparation of directory (.2)	0.20	102.00
Bb	4/29/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding intra-committee communications (.2)	0.20	134.00
G	4/29/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence from Creditors' Committee members regarding pre-petition conduct of debtor, financial transactions and flow of funds (1.5)	1.50	765.00
G	4/29/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation regarding status of nondisclosure agreement and memorandum R. Franklin regarding same, regarding Debtor's employment pleadings	0.10	42.00
Ga	4/29/2013	Robert Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding status of NDA (.2); review response by S. Anhalt to Committee's revisions to NDA and draft correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding same (.6); detailed telephone conference D. Wright regarding NDA and settlement procedures protocols (.6); detailed telephone conference H. Binder regarding NDA (.2); draft correspondence to Committee members regarding latest Debtor proposal and settlement procedures status (.4); correspondence with S. Kim regarding NDA (.2)	2.20	1,122.00
Ga	4/29/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences R. Franklin regarding nondisclosure agreement (.1)	0.10	42.00
Ka	4/29/2013	Erin Darda	Emails with J. Murray, G. Kaplan, P. Marcoux, S. Kim and committee regarding settlement protocol	0.40	120.00
Ka	4/29/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding debtor's position regarding flow of settlement funds (.3); correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding settlement protocol motion and distributions to Alliacense (1.0)	1.30	871.00
Ka	4/29/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences D. Wright, R. Franklin, J. Murray, S. Kim regarding case status, regarding Alliacense and settlement procedures (.2)	0.20	84.00
L	4/29/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from R. Harris regarding payments due under cash collateral order (.2)	0.20	134.00
A	4/30/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and finalize directory (.2)	0.20	102.00
Bb	4/30/2013	John Murray	Preparation of agenda for Creditors' Committee telephone conference and correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding same (.5); review minutes of last Creditors' Committee telephone conference (.2)	0.70	469.00
Ea	4/30/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from E. Webb regarding presentation regarding financial advisor position (.1)	0.10	67.00
F	4/30/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review amended filings of debtor regarding statement of financial affairs and schedules	0.20	84.00
G	4/30/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from K. Curry regarding payments to Alliacense (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	4/30/2013	Robert Franklin	Review waterfalls from settlement proceeds (.2); correspondence with Committee regarding same (.1); review status of NDA (.1)	0.40	204.00
G	4/30/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and analysis waterfalls of payments to Alliacense and correspondences R. Franklin, H. Binder, D. Wright (.3); meeting J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same, regarding case status (.5)	0.80	336.00
Ga	4/30/2013	John Murray	Analysis and evaluation issues regarding NDA (.2)	0.20	134.00
Ga	4/30/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding NDA (.1); review multiple correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding same (.2)	0.30	201.00
Ga	4/30/2013	Robert Franklin	Interoffice conference with J. Murray and T. Hwang regarding response to pending motions and NDA	0.50	255.00
Ga	4/30/2013	Robert Franklin	Detailed telephone conference S. Kim regarding NDA negotiations and background (.3); correspondence with S. Anhalt, H. Binder, P. Califano and W. Smith regarding revisions to NDA (.6)	0.90	459.00
Ga	4/30/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences K. Curry, S. Kim, M. Brown, R. Franklin regarding nondisclosure agreement issues, and drafts of same (.4)	0.40	168.00

H	4/30/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from attorney Harris regarding revised Order regarding Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay (.1); analysis and evaluation regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
Ka	4/30/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding meeting regarding Creditors' Committee position regarding NDA and settlement protocol Motion (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ka	4/30/2013	John Murray	Review Technology Properties cascade of funds analysis (.6); correspondence to and from H. Binder regarding same (.1); correspondence to and from S. Anhalt regarding same (.1); review revised cascade of funds (.2)	1.00	670.00
Ka	4/30/2013	John Murray	Interoffice conference R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding outstanding issues regarding NDA and settlement protocol and supplemental Opposition to Motion (.5); review and forward relevant correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.3)	0.80	536.00
Ka	4/30/2013	Robert Franklin	Draft status update pleading regarding Relief from Automatic Stay Motion and Settlement Procedures Motion and correspondence with Committee regarding same (3.5)	3.50	1,785.00
Ka	4/30/2013	Robert Franklin	Detailed telephone conference D. Wright regarding settlement procedures motion and NDA (.4); review "Waterfall" summary of distribution of proceeds (.4); review correspondence from Members regarding settlement procedures and NDA (.5)	1.30	663.00
L	4/30/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation and analysis regarding case status, regarding cash collateral, settlement procedures and relief from stay matters (.3); review memoranda R. Franklin regarding same, and review and evaluation update and opposition pleadings (.5); legal research and investigation local and procedural rules regarding motion to seal documents (1.3); draft, revise same (2.9); meetings R. Franklin regarding same (.1); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	5.20	2,184.00
Bb	5/1/2013	John Murray	Prepare for Creditors' Committee telephone conference (.7); attend same (1.3)	2.00	1,340.00
Bb	5/1/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to P. Marcoux regarding K. Prochnow's contact information (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	5/1/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from K. Beresford regarding payments to Alliacense (.1); review multiple correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
Bb	5/1/2013	Robert Franklin	Prepare for meeting with Committee (.9); attend Committee meeting (1.3)	2.20	1,122.00
Bb	5/1/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review agenda regarding Committee meeting (.1); attend same (.7); meeting P. Marcoux, J. Murray, R. Franklin, M. Brown and C. Brown regarding same and case action items, regarding case history (.2)	1.00	420.00
D	5/1/2013	Thomas Hwang	Call to E. Keller regarding 341 meeting of creditors; review correspondence E. Keller regarding same	0.10	42.00
Ea	5/1/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from J. Crom regarding financial advisor position and correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ea	5/1/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference D. Aguilera regarding financial advisor position (.1); correspondence to and from E. Webb regarding same (.2)	0.30	201.00
Eb	5/1/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from T. Hwang regarding Dorsey Application for Employment of Counsel (.1)	0.10	67.00
F	5/1/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from T. Hwang regarding Statement of Financial Affairs (.1)	0.10	67.00
F	5/1/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation and analysis regarding amended schedules and statement of financial affairs (.6); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.80	336.00
Ga	5/1/2013	Robert Franklin	Telephone call W. Smith regarding closure of NDA negotiation (.1); finalize and circulate NDA to Debtor and Committee members (.9); detailed telephone conference P. Califano regarding Alliacense NDA and background (.3)	1.30	663.00
Ka	5/1/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference R. Harris regarding settlement procedure Motion and interoffice conference with R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ka	5/1/2013	John Murray	Prepare for hearing regarding settlement protocol Motion (.5)	0.50	335.00

Ka	5/1/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and revise Status Update regarding Settlement Procedures Motion and finalize same (2.5); interoffice conferences with T. Hwang regarding procedure for filing under seal (.3); review Debtor's Status Update Report and correspondence Committee regarding same (.2)	3.00	1,530.00
Ka	5/1/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review comments R. Franklin to motion to file under seal and revise and finalize same (.5); attention to filing of same and to communication to court regarding same (.3); review supplement regarding settlement procedures motion and provide comments to same (.4); revise and finalize supplement to settlement procedures motion and exhibits (.5); telephone conferences with court (L. Chen) regarding motion to seal, regarding local civil rules (.3); evaluation regarding local civil rules (.3); meetings and memoranda to R. Franklin regarding motion to seal, regarding supplement to settlement procedures motion (.3); draft, finalize declaration regarding motion to seal (.8); prepare pleadings for submission to court, and attention to service and filing matters regarding same, and meetings S. Bloomer regarding same; manage preparation of pleadings for hearing and status conference (1.3); review statement filed by debtor regarding settlement procedures (.1); meetings R. Franklin regarding same and regarding correspondence R. Harris (.1)	4.90	2,058.00
Bc	5/2/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft committee meeting minutes (2.4)	2.40	1,008.00
Ea	5/2/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding presentations by prospective financial advisors, etc. (.3); correspondence to D. Aguilera regarding same (.1); correspondence to E. Webb regarding same (.1); correspondence to K. Prochnow regarding same (.1)	0.60	402.00
Ea	5/2/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to forensic accounts regarding issues of interest to the Creditors' Committee (.5)	0.50	335.00
Eb	5/2/2013	Thomas Hwang	Revise employment application and order (.2)	0.20	84.00
Ec	5/2/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review debtor's pleadings to employ special counsel Bragalone (.1); review and evaluation court order regarding employment of Simon law firm and memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.8)	0.90	378.00
Ga	5/2/2013	Robert Franklin	Review communications and correspondence from Committee members and analysis and evaluation regarding pre-petition conduct of debtor (1.8)	1.80	918.00
Ga	5/2/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences R. Franklin, R. Harris regarding request for loan documents and nondisclosure agreement (.1)	0.10	42.00
Ka	5/2/2013	John Murray	Prepare for hearing on Motion to establish settlement protocol (.2); attend same (3.0); commence preparation of proposed form of order regarding same (.3); telephone conference H. Binder regarding same (.1); correspondence to and from W. Smith regarding same (.1); review revised Order (.2); correspondence to W. Smith regarding same (.1)	4.00	2,680.00
Ka	5/2/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding results of hearing regarding settlement protocol Motion (.9)	0.90	603.00
Ka	5/2/2013	Robert Franklin	Prepare for hearing on Settlement Procedures Motion (1.2); attend hearing and conference with Committee Members regarding results (3.0); draft memorandum to Members regarding same (.4)	4.60	2,346.00
Ka	5/2/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting R. Franklin regarding hearing on settlement procedures motion; review correspondence J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
L	5/2/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from attorney Harris regarding payments due under cash collateral Order (.1)	0.10	67.00
A	5/3/2013	John Murray	Interoffice conference C. Cavazos regarding transcription of Section 341 Meeting of Creditors (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	5/3/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding next weeks schedule (.1); review correspondence from D. Wright regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
Bb	5/3/2013	Robert Franklin	Detailed telephone conference with D. Wright regarding status and next steps (.2)	0.20	102.00
D	5/3/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from E. Keller regarding conclusion of Section 341 Meeting of Creditors (.1)	0.10	67.00

Eb	5/3/2013	Thomas Hwang	Prepare memorandum regarding employment application (.1)	0.10	42.00
Ga	5/3/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to and from S. Kim regarding NDA (.1); review correspondence to M. Brown regarding execution of NDA (.1)	0.20	134.00
Ga	5/3/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and respond to correspondence S. Kim regarding scope of NDA (.1); draft correspondence to S. Kim regarding request for identification of documents (.1); follow up with members regarding signatures (.4); draft correspondence to members regarding use and duty of confidentiality regarding "Confidential Information" (.4)	1.00	510.00
Ga	5/3/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences R. Franklin, S. Kim regarding nondisclosure agreement and designation of confidential documents (.2)	0.20	84.00
Kb	5/3/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence regarding settlement procedures and status of NDA from R. Harris and Committee members (.2)	0.20	102.00
L	5/3/2013	John Murray	Review Debtor's proposed cash collateral budget (.4); interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same (.1); correspondence to R. Harris and H. Binder regarding same (.1); telephone conference R. Harris regarding same (.2); interoffice R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	1.00	670.00
L	5/3/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to and from Creditors' Committee regarding Debtor's cash collateral budget (.2)	0.20	134.00
L	5/3/2013	Robert Franklin	Review supplemental Hannah declaration and long term budget (1.4); review comments from G. Felcyn and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.4); telephone conference with R. Harris regarding budget (.2) review UCC filings (.2); review correspondence P. Marcoux regarding cash collateral budget (.2); interoffice conference J. Murray regarding budget (.2); draft correspondence to R. Harris requesting further information and clarification of line items in budget (.6)	3.20	1,632.00
L	5/3/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation cash collateral budget (.2); review memoranda R. Franklin regarding same and review comments from G. Felcyn, P. Marcoux regarding same (.4)	0.60	252.00
S	5/3/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to and from R. Harris regarding secured loan documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	5/3/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding Vendiku lien and avoidability (.2)	0.20	134.00
S	5/3/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to W. Smith regarding Vendiku lien and requested documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	5/3/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences R. Harris, R. Franklin regarding secured claims (.1); evaluation UCC filings regarding same (.2)	0.30	126.00
S	5/3/2013	Thomas Hwang	Correspondence Committee members regarding Proofs of Claim (.3)	0.30	126.00
Bc	5/4/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding preparation of minutes of Creditors' Committee meeting 5/1/13 (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	5/4/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to T. Hwang regarding Creditors' Committee proofs of claim (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ea	5/5/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to D. Aguilera regarding presentation to Creditors' Committee (.1); correspondence to and from E. Webb regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
L	5/5/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding cash collateral motion (.4)	0.40	268.00
L	5/5/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review memoranda J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding cash collateral motion, case strategy; correspondence R. Franklin regarding same; review correspondence G. Felcyn regarding same; (.2)	0.20	84.00
Ea	5/6/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference E. Webb regarding BPM presentation to Creditors' Committee (.3)	0.30	201.00
Ga	5/6/2013	Robert Franklin	Review status of signatures to NDA (.2); review and respond to correspondence W. Smith and R. Harris regarding same (.2)	0.40	204.00
L	5/6/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence G. Felcyn and J. Murray regarding expenditures and revenues and review budget regarding same (.4)	0.40	204.00

L	5/6/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review memoranda R. Franklin and correspondence from R. Harris regarding cash collateral budget items (.1)	0.10	42.00
C	5/7/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences R. Harris and R. Franklin regarding confidentiality and sec. 1102(b)(3) motion (.1)	0.10	42.00
Eb	5/7/2013	John Murray	Review Application for Employment Counsel (.8); Interoffice T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.90	603.00
Eb	5/7/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting J. Murray regarding employment application (.1); revise same and supporting pleadings (.3); correspondence M. Brown regarding same (.1)	0.50	210.00
G	5/7/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding disclosure of information (.1); correspondence to H. Binder and R. Harris regarding same (.2)	0.30	201.00
G	5/7/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation multiple correspondences R. Franklin, R. Harris and S. Anhalt regarding nondisclosure agreement and committee requests for documents, and regarding responses to committee requests (.6)	0.60	252.00
Ga	5/7/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference H. Binder regarding NDA and C. Brown access to information (.2); telephone conference E. Keller regarding same (.2); interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.50	335.00
Ga	5/7/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to and from S. Anhalt regarding scope of NDA (.2)	0.20	134.00
Ga	5/7/2013	Robert Franklin	Correspondence with S. Anhalt, W. Smith regarding signatures on NDA (.4); draft correspondence to Committee regarding handling of confidential information (.2); draft correspondence to Committee regarding production issues (.2)	0.80	408.00
Ga	5/7/2013	Robert Franklin	Review response to production request and draft correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding same (1.2)	1.20	612.00
Ga	5/7/2013	Robert Franklin	Correspondence with S. Anhalt, H. Binder regarding objections to disclosure of information and solutions thereto (.2); commence review and cataloging of documents produced (.7)	0.90	459.00
L	5/7/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from R. Harris regarding status of payments per cash collateral Order (.1); correspondence to and from M. O'Leary regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
L	5/7/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence R. Harris regarding cash collateral budget and draft correspondence Committee regarding same (.4); analysis and evaluation regarding issues and opposition (.3); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding opposition to motion for use of cash collateral (.1); interoffice conference J. Murray regarding status (.1); draft correspondence to R. Harris regarding issues and requests for information (.4); initial reviews of documents evidencing claims of alleged secured creditors (1.0); commence review and revision of supplemental opposition to motion for use of cash collateral (.6)	2.90	1,479.00
L	5/7/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding cash collateral motion (.1); review and evaluation correspondences J. Ellahie and R. Franklin regarding cash collateral motion (.1); draft and revise opposition to same (2.2); memoranda R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	2.50	1,050.00
A	5/8/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence J. Murray regarding action items, meeting agenda, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.3)	0.30	126.00
Bb	5/8/2013	John Murray	Commence preparation of agenda for 5/10/13 Creditors' Committee meeting (.6)	0.60	402.00
Bc	5/8/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and revise May 1 committee meeting minutes (.3)	0.30	153.00
Bc	5/8/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence R. Franklin and continue preparation of meeting minutes (.3)	0.30	126.00
D	5/8/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence P. Vargas regarding amended Notice of appointment of Creditors' Committee; correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Ea	5/8/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from E. Webb regarding BPM presentation to Creditors' Committee regarding role as financial advisor (.2)	0.20	134.00
Ea	5/8/2013	John Murray	Review presentation materials from BPM and circulate to Creditors' Committee (.2)	0.20	134.00

Eb	5/8/2013	Thomas Hwang	Investigation regarding status of debtor's employment applications (.2); conference and memoranda J. Murray regarding same (.2)	0.40	168.00
Eb	5/8/2013	Thomas Hwang	Revise employment application and revise order regarding same (.2); correspondence Committee regarding same; conference J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
G	5/8/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and respond to correspondence S. Anhalt and W. Smith regarding response to production of documents (.6); interoffice conference J. Murray regarding procedures for access and use of documents (.2);	0.80	408.00
L	5/8/2013	John Murray	Review Stipulation between Debtor and CCC regarding use of cash collateral (.8); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.2); review objection of United States Trustee regarding same (.2); review Debtor's proposed cash collateral budget (.2); correspondence to R. Harris regarding same (.2); prepare hearing regarding contract motion (.5); correspondence to and from R. Franklin regarding Venkidu security interest (.4)	2.50	1,675.00
L	5/8/2013	Robert Franklin	Review budget and supplemental Hannah Declaration and Committee comments and continue preparation of opposition to cash collateral motion (3.4); conference call S. Anhalt, N. Antonopolous and W. Smith regarding Venkidu Transaction (.4); interoffice conference J. Murray regarding cash collateral hearing and strategy related thereto (.2); analysis and evaluation regarding Venkidu secured claim (.8); review Stipulations for use of cash collateral (.8)	5.60	2,856.00
Bb	5/9/2013	Thomas Hwang	Telephone conference D. Wright regarding case status, regarding committee meeting (.2); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
G	5/9/2013	Robert Franklin	Telephone call S. Kim regarding production of documents relating to OnSpec transaction and review and respond to correspondence regarding same (.3); draft correspondence S. Anhalt regarding production of further documents (.2)	0.50	255.00
Ga	5/9/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and respond to correspondence P. Califano regarding NDA with Alliacense (.2)	0.20	102.00
L	5/9/2013	John Murray	Prepare for hearing regarding Debtor's Motion to use cash collateral (.5); attend same (3.5); analysis and review regarding results of hearing (.5); correspondence to R. Harris regarding informational requests and cash collateral hearing (.9)	5.40	3,618.00
L	5/9/2013	John Murray	Review message from K. Prochnow regarding cash collateral hearing and correspondence to K. Prochnow regarding meeting (.2)	0.20	134.00
L	5/9/2013	Robert Franklin	Prepare for hearing and review recently filed pleadings supporting use of cash collateral (1.3); attend hearing (1.5); post-hearing conferences with R. Harris and J. Ellahie, and with M. Brown, C. Brown and S. Kim (1.0); review and revise cash collateral order (.2)	4.00	2,040.00
L	5/9/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences S. Anhalt and P. Marcoux regarding production of documents, cash collateral budget; review correspondence J. Murray to J. Ellahie, R. Harris regarding cash collateral hearing, regarding adequate protection payments (.1)	0.10	42.00
L	5/9/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation stipulation regarding cash collateral, regarding Vendiku claim (.2); review correspondence R. Franklin regarding same and meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
L	5/9/2013	Thomas Hwang	Correspondence D. Wright regarding cash collateral opposition; review correspondences G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
C	5/10/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference W. Smith regarding fund for ultimate creditor distribution (.2)	0.20	134.00
Ea	5/10/2013	John Murray	Attend Creditors' Committee meeting regarding presentations by K. Prochnow, D. Aguielera and E. Webb (3.5); correspondence to D. Aguilera regarding same (.1); correspondence to E. Webb regarding same (.1)	3.70	2,479.00

Ea	5/10/2013	Robert Franklin	Prepare for committee meeting (.5); attend Committee meeting regarding presentations from K. Prochnow, E. Webb and D. Aguilera (3.5)	4.00	2,040.00
Ea	5/10/2013	Thomas Hwang	Committee meeting, including presentations by K. Prochnow, D. Aguilera, E. Webb (3.5)	3.50	1,470.00
Eb	5/10/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review, finalize employment application and order (.3)	0.30	126.00
G	5/10/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence S. Anhalt, S. Kim and W. Smith regarding production of documents and respond to same (.5); analysis and evaluation regarding same (.3)	0.80	408.00
G	5/10/2013	Robert Franklin	Commence review of OnSpec transaction regarding Venkidu's alleged claim (1.2)	1.20	612.00
Bb	5/11/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from D. Wright regarding telephone conference (.1)	0.10	67.00
C	5/11/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Harris regarding telephone conference regarding repayment plan to creditors (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	5/12/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding strategy going forward (.2); review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding same (.1); review correspondence from K. Beresford regarding same (.1); telephone conference D. Wright regarding same (.8)	1.20	804.00
Bb	5/13/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from D. Wright regarding K. Beresford communications with D. Leckrone (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bc	5/13/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft minutes of May 10 Committee meeting (2.1); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	2.20	924.00
Kb	5/13/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from W. Smith regarding presentation to settlement subcommittee (.2); follow up correspondence to W. Smith regarding same (.3)	0.50	335.00
Kb	5/13/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence W. Smith regarding sub-committee on settlement procedures (.2)	0.20	102.00
L	5/13/2013	Robert Franklin	Review revised cash collateral order and call with R. Harris regarding same (.3)	0.30	153.00
Na	5/13/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from D. Wright regarding negotiations with Debtor regarding payments (.1); correspondence to R. Harris regarding telephone conference regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
Na	5/13/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference D. Wright regarding proposal to Debtor (.2); telephone conference R. Harris regarding same (.5); correspondence to D. Wright regarding same (.2); review multiple correspondence from D. Wright regarding same (.2)	1.10	737.00
A	5/14/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation correspondences R. Franklin, J. Murray regarding case status, meeting agenda items, and memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.3)	0.30	126.00
Bb	5/14/2013	John Murray	Commence preparation of agenda for 5-15-13 Creditors' Committee telephone conference (.5); review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding same (.1)	0.60	402.00
Bb	5/14/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from D. Wright regarding K. Beresford communications with D. Leckrone (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bc	5/14/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and revise minutes of committee meeting (.5)	0.50	255.00
Bc	5/14/2013	Robert Franklin	Review action items and revise agenda for meeting (.5)	0.50	255.00
Bc	5/14/2013	Thomas Hwang	Revise committee meeting minutes (.2)	0.20	84.00
Ec	5/14/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from R. Franklin regarding Debtor employment application (.1); review correspondence to and from attorney Rome-Banks regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
Ec	5/14/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and respond to correspondence S. Kim regarding employment of Ropers firm (.4)	0.40	204.00
Ec	5/14/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding debtor's employment pleadings, regarding unredacted applications (.1); review correspondences S. Kim, R. Franklin regarding Ropers Majeski application (.1); review applications to employ Ropers Majeski and Adelson Hess firms (.2)	0.40	168.00
G	5/14/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence from Committee members regarding pre-petition conduct of Debtor and analysis and evaluation regarding same (1.4)	1.40	714.00
G	5/14/2013	Robert Franklin	Review documents produced by Debtor and catalog same (3.9)	3.90	1,989.00
Ga	5/14/2013	Robert Franklin	Correspondence P. Califano regarding NDA for Alliacense (.1)	0.10	51.00

I	5/14/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding Debtor's Motion to reject Occam license and correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
I	5/14/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation and analysis regarding Debtor's motion to reject license agreement and related pleadings (1.0); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.8)	1.80	756.00
Kb	5/14/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to and from W. Smith regarding settlement sub committee (.2); review Court Order regarding settlement protocol (.2); correspondence to W. Smith regarding same (.2)	0.60	402.00
Kb	5/14/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review order regarding settlement procedures and correspondences of J. Murray and W. Smith regarding same (.2); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
P	5/14/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from H. Binder regarding negotiations with Debtor's regarding foundation of a Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bb	5/15/2013	John Murray	Prepare for Creditors' Committee telephone conference (.5); attend Creditors' Committee meeting regarding all matters (1.5); draft memorandum regarding post meeting action items (.2)	2.20	1,474.00
Bb	5/15/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence committee members regarding strategy for case (.4); prepare for meeting (.9); attend meeting (1.5)	2.80	1,428.00
Bb	5/15/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences G. Felcyn, K. Beresford, M. Imhoff and S. Kim regarding case strategy and status (.2)	0.20	84.00
Bb	5/15/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting with committee (1.5); meeting J. Murray, R. Franklin, S. Kim, M. Brown, C. Brown regarding follow-up, case strategy (.1); revise minutes from May 10 committee meeting (.1); correspondence to committee members regarding same and regarding motion to reject (.2)	1.90	798.00
C	5/15/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence J. Murray to H. Binder and correspondence from R. Franklin, and provide comments to same; review correspondence G. Felcyn regarding same (.2)	0.20	84.00
G	5/15/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences S. Anhalt regarding production of documents (.1)	0.10	42.00
Ga	5/15/2013	Robert Franklin	Conference M. Brown, C. Brown, S. Kim, J. Murray regarding documents and OnSpec transaction (.4); review documents regarding OnSpec transaction (1.0)	1.40	714.00
I	5/15/2013	John Murray	Review Debtor's Motion to restrict access to Motion regarding Occam (.1); review Court Order regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
P	5/15/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to attorney Binder regarding Debtor's presentation regarding repayment plan (.9)	0.90	603.00
Bb	5/16/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from S. Kim regarding confidentiality of transcripts of Section 341 Meeting of Creditors (.1)	0.10	67.00
I	5/16/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences G. Felcyn and S. Kim regarding motion to reject Occam license (.1); correspondence committee members regarding same (.1); review motion and new filings by debtor regarding same; review Court order regarding same (.2)	0.40	168.00
Bc	5/17/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft minutes for May 15 committee meeting (2.3)	2.30	966.00
Ea	5/17/2013	Robert Franklin	Correspondence with J. Proctor regarding presentation to Committee regarding financial advisor (.3)	0.30	153.00
Ga	5/17/2013	Robert Franklin	Conference P. Califano regarding status of NDA with Alliacense (.1)	0.10	51.00
L	5/17/2013	Thomas Hwang	Investigation regarding scheduling and case status, regarding cash collateral hearing and motion to reject hearing (.1)	0.10	42.00
Na	5/17/2013	Robert Franklin	Conference R. Harris regarding potential of negotiations regarding case (.1)	0.10	51.00
Ba	5/20/2013	John Murray	Team meeting regarding action items (.3)	0.30	201.00
Bb	5/20/2013	John Murray	Commence preparation of agenda for 5-22-13 Creditors' Committee telephone conference (.9)	0.90	603.00
Bb	5/20/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation meeting agenda, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.2)	0.20	84.00
Bc	5/20/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft, revise, finalize minutes from May 15 committee meeting (.3)	0.30	126.00

C	5/20/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from R. Harris regarding Ford dispute (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ea	5/20/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to and from R. Franklin regarding interviewing J. Proctor for forensic accountant position (.2)	0.20	134.00
Ea	5/20/2013	Robert Franklin	Detailed telephone conference with J. Proctor regarding potential presentation to Committee for employment as financial advisor (.4)	0.40	204.00
Ea	5/20/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences R. Franklin regarding debtor's employment pleadings of special counsel, and investigation regarding same (.2); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
G	5/20/2013	Robert Franklin	Continue review and cataloging of documents produced by Debtor (2.3)	2.30	1,173.00
G	5/20/2013	Robert Franklin	Review merger documents, purchase agreements, license agreements, security agreement and related documents regarding Venkidu security interest (1.5)	1.50	765.00
I	5/20/2013	Robert Franklin	Interoffice conference T. Hwang and J. Murray regarding Occam motion, cash collateral and employment applications of Debtor's professionals (.3)	0.30	153.00
I	5/20/2013	Thomas Hwang	Memorandum R. Franklin regarding request for documents and information, regarding Debtor's motion to reject Occam patents (.6); conference R. Franklin regarding same (.1); review correspondence W. Smith regarding same and correspondence G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.80	336.00
Kb	5/20/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from W. Smith regarding subcommittees telephone conference; miscellaneous regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
L	5/20/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting J. Murray and R. Franklin regarding case status, regarding cash collateral and debtor's rejection motion (.2)	0.20	84.00
P	5/20/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from H. Binder regarding negotiations regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1); telephone conference H. Binder regarding same (.5); analysis and evaluation regarding issues raised (.3); correspondence to H. Binder regarding same (.1)	1.00	670.00
Bb	5/21/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation of agenda for 5-22-13 Creditors' Committee meeting (.5)	0.50	335.00
Bb	5/21/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding correspondence from G. Baiye regarding "Array" patents (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bb	5/21/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding N. Antonopoulos (.2); review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding Debtor's Motion to limit creditor access to Creditors' Committee information (.2)	0.40	268.00
Bb	5/21/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding T. Lavelle as expert witness (.1); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.1); correspondence to and from S. Kim regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
Bb	5/21/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence regarding issues and agenda for Committee meeting (.5)	0.50	255.00
C	5/21/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from K. Beresford regarding handouts for meeting with Debtor (.1); correspondence to H. Binder regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
Ea	5/21/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from R. Franklin regarding J. Proctor presentation to Creditors' Committee (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	5/21/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding Venkidu transaction; correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.5)	0.50	335.00
G	5/21/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and analyze Venkidu transaction and draft memorandum regarding same (3.5)	3.50	1,785.00
G	5/21/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review memorandum R. Franklin regarding Venkidu secured claim, merger agreement (.2)	0.20	84.00
Kb	5/21/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from H. Binder and W. Smith regarding telephone conference with subcommittee regarding settlements (.1); correspondence to subcommittee regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00

Kb	5/21/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference H. Binder regarding sub-committee telephone conference with Debtor (.2); correspondence to H. Binder regarding same (.1); correspondence to subcommittee regarding change of date for telephone conference (.1); correspondence to subcommittee regarding cancellation of Wednesday call (.1)	0.50	335.00
Kb	5/21/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from D. Wright regarding meeting with Debtor and subcommittee and scope of agenda (.2)	0.20	134.00
L	5/21/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to J. Ellahie regarding cash collateral issues (.2); telephone conference J. Ellahie regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
A	5/22/2013	John Murray	Review Debtor's Motion to restrict distribution of information (.3)	0.30	201.00
Bb	5/22/2013	John Murray	Prepare for Creditors' Committee meeting (.5); attend same (1.5)	2.00	1,340.00
Bb	5/22/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding N. Antonopolous and correspondence from C. Johnson regarding same (.1); review correspondence from S. Kim regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
Bb	5/22/2013	Robert Franklin	Prepare for Committee meeting (1.1); telephone conference with J. Proctor regarding financial advisor presentation (.1); attend meeting (1.5)	2.70	1,377.00
Bb	5/22/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences S. Kim, G. Felcyn, C. Johnson, and G. Kaplan regarding case status and Committee meeting (.1); review correspondence H. Binder regarding meeting with Debtor and regarding K. Beresford correspondence (.1); attend Committee meeting (1.5); memorandum J. Murray regarding communication to H. Binder, regarding meeting with Debtor (.2)	1.90	798.00
C	5/22/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to H. Binder regarding response to Beresfords email (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ea	5/22/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding Rundquist and Assoc. regarding financial advisor position (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ec	5/22/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence R. Shakoori regarding Agility employment application (.1)	0.10	51.00
F	5/22/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding Monthly Operating Report (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	5/22/2013	Robert Franklin	Detailed telephone conference with S. Anhalt and R. Harris regarding Venkidu security interest (.3)	0.30	153.00
G	5/22/2013	Robert Franklin	Telephone conference with S. Kim regarding production of documents (.1); continue review and cataloging of documents (2.9)	3.00	1,530.00
G	5/22/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and analysis correspondences G. Felcyn and S. Anhalt regarding document request and documents produced regarding motion to reject Occam portfolio (1.2); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	1.30	546.00
Kb	5/22/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from K. Beresford and subcommittee regarding telephone conference with Debtor (.2)	0.20	134.00
Kb	5/22/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from H. Binder regarding subcommittee telephone conference and correspondence to subcommittee regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
L	5/22/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation and analysis Debtor's monthly operating report and cash collateral budgets and orders (.4); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1); review correspondences S. Kim and G. Felcyn regarding same; correspondence S. Kim and G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.60	252.00
P	5/22/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to H. Binder regarding Debtor's presentation regarding Plan of Reorganization (.9)	0.90	603.00
Bb	5/23/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference D. Wright regarding next weeks meetings and today's subcommittee meeting with Debtor (.2)	0.20	134.00
Ec	5/23/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence S. Kim regarding employment of Alliacense as professional for the Debtor and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.3)	0.30	153.00
F	5/23/2013	Thomas Hwang	Correspondence Committee regarding Monthly Operating Report (.1)	0.10	42.00

G	5/23/2013	John Murray	Interoffice telephone conference with R. Franklin regarding Debtor's response regarding Venkidu issues (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	5/23/2013	Robert Franklin	Continue review and cataloging of documents produced by Debtor (3.4); telephone conference with S. Kim regarding same (.1);	3.50	1,785.00
G	5/23/2013	Robert Franklin	Review Debtor's analysis of validity of Venkidu secured claim and draft response to same (.8)	0.80	408.00
G	5/23/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review memorandum R. Franklin and correspondence from R. Harris regarding Venkidu security (.1)	0.10	42.00
I	5/23/2013	Robert Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding Motion to Reject Occam License (.3); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same (.3)	0.60	306.00
I	5/23/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation regarding documents and Debtor's responses, regarding motion to reject and draft report to Committee regarding same (.9); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1); meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.2); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.3)	1.50	630.00
Kb	5/23/2013	John Murray	Conference call subcommittee and Debtor regarding settlement process and expectations (1.6); telephone conference with H. Binder regarding meeting and follow-up meeting (.2); correspondence to subcommittee regarding availability over weekend for emergency meetings (.1); correspondence to S. Kim regarding same (.1); correspondence to H. Binder regarding weekend contact information for emergency conference call (.1)	2.10	1,407.00
Kb	5/23/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from K. Hiensch regarding composition of sub-committee (.1); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.1); correspondence to K. Hiensch regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
Kb	5/23/2013	Robert Franklin	Attend meeting of subcommittee regarding status of litigation and potential settlement negotiations (1.5); conference M. Brown regarding issues (.2)	1.70	867.00
Kb	5/23/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting with sub-committee and Debtor's representatives regarding settlement protocol and status (1.6); review order regarding settlement protocol (.1); draft summary of meeting (1.3)	3.00	1,260.00
P	5/23/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding meeting with Debtor regarding plan (.2); review responses and summary same (.2); review correspondence and message from D. Wright regarding same (.1); correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding meetings of 5/30/13 (.1); correspondence to H. Binder regarding same (.1)	0.70	469.00
A	5/24/2013	John Murray	Review and revise action items memorandum (.5)	0.50	335.00
Bb	5/24/2013	John Murray	Review, analysis and evaluation correspondence from G. Bailey to M. Brown regarding Green Array (.2); correspondence to S. Kim regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
Bb	5/24/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from S. Kim regarding Debtor's counsel's continued involvement in case (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bc	5/24/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from T. Hwang regarding minutes of Creditor's Committee meeting May 22 (.1); correspondence to team regarding minutes of April meetings, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.30	201.00
Bc	5/24/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and revise minutes of Committee meeting (.4)	0.40	204.00
Bc	5/24/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft minutes regarding May 22 meeting (3.1); investigation regarding prior minutes and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	3.20	1,344.00
Ea	5/24/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from E. Webb regarding financial advisor position (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ec	5/24/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Shakoori regarding Agility Application for Employment of Counsel (.1); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
Ec	5/24/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences R. Shakoori, R. Franklin, J. Murray regarding Debtor's employment of Agility (.1); evaluation regarding same (.1); review and evaluation employment application regarding Bragalone (.3)	0.50	210.00

G	5/24/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from attorney Harris regarding Venkidu (.1); analysis and evaluation regarding Debtor's position regarding Venkidu (2.2); correspondence to and from R. Harris regarding same (.1); telephone conference R. Harris regarding same (.5)	2.90	1,943.00
G	5/24/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding J. Neal payments and employment contract (.2)	0.20	134.00
G	5/24/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and catalog documents (.6); correspondence with S. Kim regarding same (.1)	0.70	357.00
G	5/24/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence regarding VNS portfolio and inquiry related to payment for expenses (.3); review VNS license agreement and related documents and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.5)	0.80	408.00
G	5/24/2013	Robert Franklin	Analysis and evaluation Venkidu security interest, review correspondence R. Harris and draft correspondence W. Smith regarding same (.6)	0.60	306.00
G	5/24/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence R. Franklin to S. Anhalt regarding document production and motion to reject executory contracts (.1); review and respond correspondence R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.20	84.00
G	5/24/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation correspondences R. Franklin regarding Venkidu claim, security transaction (.1)	0.10	42.00
Ga	5/24/2013	Robert Franklin	Draft correspondence P. Califano regarding status of NDA from Alliacense (.4)	0.40	204.00
I	5/24/2013	John Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding status of Debtor's response to question regarding Motion to reject Occum contract (.2)	0.20	134.00
I	5/24/2013	Robert Franklin	Draft correspondence S. Anhalt regarding Occam motion and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.5)	0.50	255.00
Kb	5/24/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from D. Wright regarding subcommittee weekend call (.1)	0.10	67.00
Kb	5/24/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to and from S. Kim regarding information needed to evaluate settlement proposals (.2); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
Kb	5/24/2013	John Murray	Review and revise notes of subcommittee meeting with Debtor (.4); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.50	335.00
Kb	5/24/2013	Robert Franklin	Draft correspondence to H. Binder regarding information requested to evaluate potential settlements of IP litigation (.5)	0.50	255.00
Kb	5/24/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and revise minutes of first meeting of subcommittee and Debtor regarding settlement protocol (.4)	0.40	204.00
Kb	5/24/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft, revise summary report of Sub-Committee meeting with Debtor (1.6); meeting J. Murray and review comments J. Murray regarding same (.1)	1.70	714.00
L	5/24/2013	Robert Franklin	Interoffice conference regarding cash collateral motion with J. Murray (.3); telephone conference with R. Harris and J. Murray regarding same (.3)	0.60	306.00
P	5/24/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from attorney Binder regarding Debtor's presentation regarding Plan of Reorganization and correspondence to Creditor's Committee regarding same (.2); correspondence to M. O'Leary regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
P	5/24/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from G. Kaplan regarding meeting with Debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bc	5/26/2013	John Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding Creditors' Committee meeting minutes (.3); commence review of minutes and review and revise action items memorandum (1.0)	1.30	871.00
F	5/26/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and respond correspondence P. Marcoux regarding Debtor's Monthly Operating Report (.1)	0.10	42.00
Kb	5/26/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence R. Franklin regarding sub-committee meeting minutes and finalize same (.2)	0.20	84.00

Kb	5/26/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review comments to notes regarding Sub-Committee meeting with Debtor, and finalize same (.3); correspondence Committee members regarding same (.1)	0.40	168.00
Bc	5/27/2013	John Murray	Continue review of minutes and preparation of action item memorandum (3.0)	3.00	2,010.00
F	5/27/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from R. Franklin regarding Debtor's January and February financials (.1)	0.10	67.00
Kb	5/27/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to and from H. Binder regarding re-scheduling subcommittee meeting (.1); correspondence to subcommittee regarding same (.1); review multiple responses from subcommittee regarding same (.2); correspondence to and from S. Kim regarding same (.1)	0.50	335.00
Kb	5/27/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to T. Hwang regarding subcommittee minutes (.1)	0.10	67.00
A	5/28/2013	Robert Franklin	Review action item list and analysis and evaluation regarding same (1.0)	1.00	510.00
A	5/28/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding case strategy and action items (.7); review memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1); meeting R. Franklin regarding case status, regarding document and information requests to Debtor; review correspondence R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.90	378.00
Ba	5/28/2013	John Murray	Team meeting regarding status and action items (.7)	0.70	469.00
Ba	5/28/2013	Robert Franklin	Interoffice conference J. Murray and T. Hwang regarding action items and case strategy (.7)	0.70	357.00
Ba	5/28/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding case status and strategy (.1)	0.10	42.00
Bb	5/28/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding changes in weeks schedule (.1); work out logistics regarding same (.2); correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding Thursday meeting with Debtor (.1)	0.40	268.00
I	5/28/2013	Thomas Hwang	Correspondence Committee regarding Debtor's motion to reject Occam patent portfolio, case status (.5)	0.50	210.00
Kb	5/28/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to subcommittee regarding Wednesday call with Debtor (.1)	0.10	67.00
L	5/28/2013	Robert Franklin	Draft correspondence requesting additional documents regarding line items in cash collateral budget (.6); analysis and evaluation regarding response to motion and issues (.6); draft objection to cash collateral motion (3.0)	4.20	2,142.00
A	5/29/2013	John Murray	Legal research regarding "Markman" hearing and ruling (.5); review Markman ruling by ITC (.5)	1.00	670.00
Bb	5/29/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from K. Beresford regarding obtaining Markman Judgment (.1); correspondence to J. Ottesen and H. Binder regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
Bb	5/29/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from G. Kaplan regarding Committee conference call (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	5/29/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to Committee regarding multiple committee calls on May 30th (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bb	5/29/2013	John Murray	Preparation of agenda for Committee meeting and correspondence to Committee regarding same (.4); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding minutes of Committee meeting of May 22 (.1)	0.50	335.00
Bb	5/29/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review agenda for Committee meeting and minutes; conference J. Murray regarding same (.2)	0.20	84.00
G	5/29/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding requested documents (.1); review correspondence from S. Kim regarding same (.1); review multiple correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding job descriptions (.1)	0.30	201.00
G	5/29/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding job descriptions for senior management, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
G	5/29/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence S. Anhalt regarding further document requests (.2)	0.20	102.00
G	5/29/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review documents and responses from S. Anhalt regarding Committee requests for documents, and regarding monthly operating report information (.2)	0.20	84.00
I	5/29/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding Occum agreement (.1)	0.10	67.00

I	5/29/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to Committee regarding OPL assignment agreement regarding Occam motion to reject (.1); review multiple detailed correspondence to Committee regarding Motion to reject Occam portfolio contract (.4); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same and relation to cash collateral motion (.1)	0.60	402.00
I	5/29/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation regarding assignment agreement between Occam Portfolio LLC and J. Fjelstad, and regarding monthly operating report and proposed payments to Debtor (.4); meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.60	252.00
Kb	5/29/2013	John Murray	Review, analysis and evaluation regarding correspondence to H. Binder regarding information Committee needs to evaluate settlement proposals (.2); attend conference call with debtor and subcommittee regarding status of litigation and settlement (.5);	0.70	469.00
Kb	5/29/2013	Robert Franklin	Attend subcommittee meeting regarding settlement protocol (.3); conference M. Brown regarding same (.1)	0.40	204.00
Kb	5/29/2013	Thomas Hwang	Sub-Committee meeting with Debtor regarding status of settlements (.4)	0.40	168.00
L	5/29/2013	Robert Franklin	Continue preparation of Opposition to cash collateral motion (1.8)	1.80	918.00
G	5/30/2013	Robert Franklin	Review Venkidu secured claim and supporting documents and develop analysis regarding validity thereof (1.4)	1.40	714.00
Ga	5/30/2013	Robert Franklin	Telephone conference with P. Califano regarding status of Alliacense NDA (.1); creditor G. Charles regarding signature on NDA with Debtor (.1)	0.20	102.00
L	5/30/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Harris regarding proposal to Vinkedu regarding cash collateral (.1); interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same (.1); review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding proposal to Venkidu et al. regarding same and correspondence to all regarding same (.2)	0.40	268.00
L	5/30/2013	Robert Franklin	Continue preparation of opposition to cash collateral motion (1.2); detailed telephone conference R. Harris regarding adequate protection Stipulation (.2); draft correspondence J. Ellahie regarding same (.1)	1.50	765.00
L	5/30/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence R. Franklin and legal research regarding use of cash collateral and regarding fraudulent conveyance matters (1.2); meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1); review and revise opposition regarding cash collateral motion (1.1); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	2.50	1,050.00
P	5/30/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Harris regarding Debtor's Plan of Reorganization; correspondence to Committee regarding same (.1); review same (.2); multiple correspondence to/from Committee regarding further meeting regarding debtor's proposed Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.50	335.00
P	5/30/2013	Robert Franklin	Review power point presentation regarding conceptual Plan of Reorganization prepared by Debtor and various documents referred to in power point (1.4); attend presentation of plan by the Debtor (2.5)	3.90	1,989.00
P	5/30/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting with Debtor's representatives and Committee regarding Debtor's reorganization plan and case status (2.5); review presentation materials regarding same (.1); meeting J. Murray, R. Franklin, P. Marcoux, S. Kim, M. Brown and C. Brown regarding same (.1); prepare summary report regarding Debtor's presentation and review notes regarding same (.4); review correspondence G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	3.20	1,344.00
Bb	5/31/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with C. Hoge regarding ITC rulings and settlement prospects (.2); correspondence to committee regarding developments in ITC litigation and possible convening of subcommittee (.1); correspondence to/from K. Beresford regarding same (.2); review correspondence from S. Kim, C. Johnson, D. Wright, G. Kaplan and C. Brown regarding same (.2);	0.70	469.00

Bb	5/31/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from G. Felcyn of May 10, 2013 regarding strategy going forward (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bb	5/31/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to committee regarding Tuesday conference call (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bb	5/31/2013	Robert Franklin	Draft correspondence to Committee members regarding status (.4)	0.40	204.00
Bc	5/31/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from C. Cavoza regarding preparation of minutes of committee meetings (.2)	0.20	134.00
G	5/31/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence of May 11, 2013 from P. Marcoux regarding debtor misconduct (.2)	0.20	134.00
Ga	5/31/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to G. Charles regarding NDA (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ga	5/31/2013	Robert Franklin	Review proposed NDA from Alliacense and revise same (.4); draft correspondence Committee members regarding same (.2)	0.60	306.00
Kb	5/31/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from W. Smith regarding meeting with subcommittee to discuss Dell settlement (.5); correspondence to subcommittee regarding same (.1); review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding possible recusal regarding conflict (.1)	0.70	469.00
Kb	5/31/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to C. Hoge regarding subcommittee informational requirements regarding proposed settlements (.2)	0.20	134.00
L	5/31/2013	John Murray	Analysis and evaluation multiple correspondence from R. Harris regarding proposal to Venkidu regarding cash collateral and adequate protection payments (.4); multiple telephone conferences with R. Harris regarding same (.3); review correspondence from R. Harris regarding same (.1); interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding objection to cash collateral motion regarding payments to Vinkedu (.1); review, analysis and evaluation correspondence from J. Ellahie regarding same (.2); review correspondence to J. Ellahie regarding same (.1); review correspondence from R. Harris regarding same (.1); regarding correspondence from R. Harris regarding new proposal; interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same; respond to same (.3); review correspondence from R. Harris regarding same (.1); review correspondence from J. Ellahie regarding same (.1)	1.80	1,206.00
L	5/31/2013	Robert Franklin	Interoffice conference with J. Murray regarding cash collateral budget and issues regarding negotiation of stipulated order (.3); multiple detailed telephone conferences R. Harris and J. Murray regarding same (.6); telephone conference with R. Harris regarding status of cash collateral negotiations (.1); review and analyze proposals and respond (.4); review and revise opposition to cash collateral motion and prepare for filing (1.2)	2.60	1,326.00
Na	5/31/2013	Robert Franklin	Further correspondence R. Harris regarding status of negotiations (.1)	0.10	51.00
P	5/31/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding debtor's Plan of Reorganization (.2); review correspondence from K. Beresford regarding same and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.40	268.00
P	5/31/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft summary report regarding Debtor's May 30 presentation on plan (1.8)	1.80	756.00
U	5/31/2013	John Murray	Legal research regarding O'Donnell, et. al. v. Tristar Esperanza Properties, LLC regarding Section 510(b) subordination of claims (.3)	0.30	201.00
A	6/1/2013	John Murray	Review and organize files and review and revise action items memorandum (1.3)	1.30	871.00
Bb	6/1/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to committee regarding agenda for committee call of June 4, 2013 (.2)	0.20	134.00
Ga	6/1/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding Alliacense NDA (.1); review correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding same (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
Ga	6/1/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from committee and debtor regarding Alliacense NDA (.2)	0.20	134.00
Ga	6/1/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence D. Wright regarding NDA with Alliacense (.1); review and revise NDA (.4)	0.50	255.00