

Kb	6/1/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from subcommittee regarding conference call with debtor regarding proposed Dell settlement (.2); review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding slides regarding Dell settlement (.2); conference call debtor's representative and subcommittee regarding proposed settlement with Dell (1.0); correspondence to debtor regarding subcommittee's decision regarding same (.1); review correspondence from H. Binder regarding same (.1)	1.60	1,072.00
Kb	6/1/2013	Robert Franklin	Attend sub-committee meeting regarding potential settlement (1.0)	1.00	510.00
Kb	6/1/2013	Thomas Hwang	Telephone conference meeting with Sub-Committee and Debtor (1.0)	1.00	420.00
L	6/1/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from R. Harris, J. Ellahie and S. Anhalt regarding negotiation of cash collateral order (.3); correspondence to committee regarding terms of resolution of cash collateral issues (2.1); correspondence to R. Harris regarding same (.2)	2.60	1,742.00
P	6/1/2013	Thomas Hwang	Continue preparation of summary report regarding Debtor's May 30 presentation on plan (1.2)	1.20	504.00
A	6/2/2013	John Murray	Review recent correspondence and review and revise action items memorandum (.9)	0.90	603.00
Ga	6/2/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence regarding Alliacense NDA (.2); review and revise same and correspondence with D. Leckrone regarding same (.5)	0.70	357.00
Kb	6/2/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding subcommittee call and written presentation (.2); correspondence to subcommittee regarding same (.1.); multiple correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding letter to Dell regarding committee's approval of settlement (.2); correspondence to D. Leckrone regarding same (.2); review correspondence from S. Kim regarding disposition of license proceeds (.1)	0.80	536.00
Kb	6/2/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from C. Hoge regarding conference call regarding Ford (.2)	0.20	134.00
L	6/2/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to /from G. Kaplan regarding cash collateral order (.6); review correspondence between R. Harris and J. Ellahie regarding same (.2)	0.80	536.00
L	6/2/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences J. Murray, M. Brown, G. Kaplan regarding cash collateral issues, status of negotiations with Debtor and S. Venkidu (.1)	0.10	42.00
P	6/2/2013	Thomas Hwang	Continue preparation of summary report regarding Debtor's May 30 presentation on plan (.5); memorandum R. Franklin, J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.60	252.00
Ba	6/3/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items (.1)	0.10	42.00
Ga	6/3/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from R. Franklin regarding Alliacense NDA (.2)	0.20	134.00
Ga	6/3/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence M. Brown regarding Alliacense NDA and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.4)	0.40	204.00
Kb	6/3/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from C. Hoge regarding Ford and status of ITC settlements (.2)	0.20	134.00
L	6/3/2013	John Murray	Correspondence R. Harris regarding cash collateral order (.1); telephone conference with R. Harris regarding same (.1); interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same (.1); review form of order regarding use of cash collateral (.5); multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding same (.2); multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	1.20	804.00
L	6/3/2013	Robert Franklin	Review status of agreement on use of cash collateral (.4) review and revise order for use of cash collateral with multiple calls and emails exchanging comments (1.0); conference call with R. Harris, S. Anhalt and D. Hannah regarding finalization of order and calculation of amounts authorized (.4); analysis and evaluation regarding same (.1)	1.90	969.00

P	6/3/2013	John Murray	Prepare for committee meeting regarding debtor's proposed Plan of Reorganization (.4); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.2); review correspondence from K. Beresford regarding same (.1); review memorandum regarding debtor's presentation regarding Plan of Reorganization (.5); correspondence to committee regarding plan issues (.3)	1.50	1,005.00
A	6/4/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding objection to debtor's 1102(b)(3) Motion (.2)	0.20	134.00
A	6/4/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation and analysis Debtor's motion regarding 1102(b)(3), and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.8)	0.80	336.00
Bb	6/4/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from M. Imhoff regarding communications from debtor and willingness to assist in restructure (.1); review multiple correspondence from D. Wright regarding communications with M. Imhoff (.1)	0.20	134.00
Bb	6/4/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding attendance at same (.1); attend same (1.2)	1.30	871.00
Bb	6/4/2013	Robert Franklin	Prepare for Committee meeting (.3); attend meeting (1.3)	1.60	816.00
Bb	6/4/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting with Committee (1.2)	1.20	504.00
Bc	6/4/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation for committee meeting (.3)	0.30	201.00
Bc	6/4/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and revise minutes of meeting (.4)	0.40	204.00
D	6/4/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from J. Wesolowski regarding crackdown on patent trolls (.2)	0.20	134.00
G	6/4/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding financial information (.1)	0.10	67.00
Kb	6/4/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from C. Johnson regarding Dell settlement (.1); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same (.1); review correspondence to committee regarding debtor's written presentation to subcommittee and security regarding same (.1); review multiple correspondence to/from S. Kim and S. Anhalt regarding license proceeds and direct payments to counsel (.2); review correspondence H. Binder regarding security of settlement information (.1)	0.60	402.00
Kb	6/4/2013	Thomas Hwang	Correspondence Committee regarding S. Anhalt email, regarding Subcommittee meeting; exchange correspondence C. Johnson regarding same (.1); review correspondences S. Kim, S. Anhalt regarding payment stream to other entities (.1)	0.20	84.00
L	6/4/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Harris regarding cash collateral budget and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2); continue preparation for hearing on debtor's motion to use cash collateral (.2); attend same; post-hearing meeting with R. Harris regarding form of order (2.7); review multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding form of order regarding cash collateral (.2)	3.30	2,211.00
L	6/4/2013	Robert Franklin	Review versions of cash collateral final order (.4); draft correspondence and telephone conference with R. Harris regarding same (.3); prepare for and attend hearing on motion and conference with R. Harris regarding Ford controversy and finalization of cash collateral order (2.8)	3.50	1,785.00
P	6/4/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding debtor's proposed Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	67.00
P	6/4/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence regarding notes on debtor's presentation regarding Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.20	134.00
P	6/4/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences J. Murray and R. Franklin, and revise report regarding Debtor's presentation on plan (.1); correspondence to Committee regarding same (.1)	0.20	84.00
S	6/4/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding claims (.1); correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
S	6/4/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence J. Murray and S. Kim regarding Proof of Claim, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00

A	6/5/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding debtor's Section 1102(b)(3) motion (.1); interoffice conference R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.1); correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
A	6/5/2013	Robert Franklin	Analysis and evaluation of Sec. 1102(b) motion (.3); review, revise and finalize opposition to same (.4)	0.70	357.00
A	6/5/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft, revise, and finalize opposition regarding Debtor's motion regarding section 1102(b)(3) (2.2); memorandum R. Franklin and J. Murray regarding same (.1)	2.30	966.00
Bb	6/5/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding conference call with K. Beresford and D. Wright regarding developments (.2); review multiple correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding Alliacense (.2)	0.40	268.00
Bb	6/5/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding next committee meeting (.1); correspondence to committee regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
Bb	6/5/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding conference call regarding recent developments (.2)	0.20	134.00
Ga	6/5/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence form K. Beresford regarding Alliacense NDA (.1); review correspondence from D. Wright regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
Ga	6/5/2013	Robert Franklin	Review status of signatures to Alliacense NDA (.2)	0.20	102.00
Kb	6/5/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from H. Binder regarding meeting with subcommittee regarding developments at ITC (.1); correspondence to committee regarding same (.1); review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding resignation from subcommittee (.1); correspondence to committee regarding same (.1)	0.40	268.00
L	6/5/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/fr K. Beresford regarding hearing on motion to use cash collateral, etc. (.1)	0.10	67.00
P	6/5/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with H. Binder rregarding Plan of Reorganization, etc. (.2); correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
P	6/5/2013	Robert Franklin	Review proposed outline of Plan of Reorganization and draft memorandum summarizing same and issues for Committee to react (2.9)	2.90	1,479.00
P	6/5/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence J. Murray regarding case status, Debtor's proposed plan; meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1); memoranda R. Franklin regarding same, regarding preparation of summary to Committee (.1); review and analysis memorandum summary from R. Franklin (.1)	0.30	126.00
S	6/5/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to S. Kim regarding Proof of Claim (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	6/6/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from committee members regarding availability for next subcommittee meeting with debtor and next committee meeting (.2); correspondence to/from M. Brown regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
Bb	6/6/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with Keith Beresford and D. Wright regarding communications from debtor's representatives, claims and Objections to Claim (.6)	0.60	402.00
C	6/6/2013	Robert Franklin	Telephone call W. Smith regarding 1102(b) motion (.1)	0.10	51.00
G	6/6/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding production of documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
P	6/6/2013	John Murray	Review and revise memorandum to committee summarizing issues regarding Plan of Reorganization (.5)	0.50	335.00
P	6/6/2013	Robert Franklin	Telephone conference with W. Smith regarding Plan of Reorganization and plan template (.3)	0.30	153.00
A	6/7/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to C. Cavazos regarding debtor's 1102(b)(3) motion (.1); review correspondence to/from S. Kim and R. Franklin regarding hearing regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
A	6/7/2013	Robert Franklin	Review action item list (.4)	0.40	204.00
Ec	6/7/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to /from C. Cavazos regarding Roper's Application for Employment of Counsel (.2)	0.20	134.00

Ec	6/7/2013	Robert Franklin	Review order setting hearing for Ropers Application and correspondence with S. Kim regarding same (.2)	0.20	102.00
G	6/7/2013	Robert Franklin	Review status of production of documents (1.0); correspondence with S. Anhalt regarding same (.1)	1.10	561.00
G	6/7/2013	Robert Franklin	Review materials submitted by Committee members relative to pre-petition conduct by Debtor (1.2)	1.20	612.00
J	6/7/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (1.5)	1.50	1,005.00
P	6/7/2013	John Murray	Review memorandum regarding committee's response to debtor's proposal regarding Plan of Reorganization (.2); interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same (.2); review correspondence to committee regarding same (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.60	402.00
P	6/7/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and revise Memorandum regarding Debtor's proposed plan of reorganization (.5); interoffice conference J. Murray regarding same (.3); finalize same and send to Committee for comment (.9)	1.70	867.00
P	6/7/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review memorandum R. Franklin regarding Debtor's proposed plan and Committee responses (.1)	0.10	42.00
Bc	6/8/2013	Thomas Hwang	Prepare minutes for June 3 meeting (1.0)	1.00	420.00
Kb	6/8/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from H. Binder, K. Beresford and S. Anhalt regarding conference call to discuss Marvell settlement (.2)	0.20	134.00
Kb	6/9/2013	John Murray	Conference call with subcommittee and debtor regarding proposed settlement with Marvel (1.0); conference call with subcommittee regarding same (.3); multiple correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding same (.2); correspondence to subcommittee regarding same (.1); multiple correspondence to/from K. Beresford regarding same (.2); multiple telephone conferences with M. Brown regarding same (.1); correspondence to D. Wright regarding same (.1); multiple correspondence to/from debtor regarding same (.2); multiple telephone conferences with H. Binder regarding same (.2); correspondence to subcommittee regarding same (.1); review multiple correspondence from K. Beresford regarding same (.1); correspondence to debtor regarding same (.1); review correspondence from H. Binder regarding same (.1); review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding correspondence confirming committee approval of Marvell settlement (.1); correspondence to D. Leckrone regarding same (.2)	3.10	2,077.00
Kb	6/9/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding questions for debtor regarding settlement considerations (.1)	0.10	67.00
Kb	6/9/2013	John Murray	Review message from C. Johnson regarding service on subcommittee; correspondence to/from C. Johnson regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Kb	6/9/2013	Thomas Hwang	Telephone conference Debtor and Subcommittee regarding Fast Logic settlement (.7); telephone conference Subcommittee regarding same (.3)	1.00	420.00
A	6/10/2013	Robert Franklin	Interoffice conference J. Murray regarding Section 1102(b) motion and application to employ Ropers and Adelson firms (.1); analysis and evaluation regarding status of action items (.3); review and revise minutes of 6/4/13 Committee meeting (.5)	0.90	459.00
Bb	6/10/2013	John Murray	Prepare agenda for committee meeting of June 13 (.3)	0.30	201.00
Bc	6/10/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from T. Hwang and R. Franklin regarding minutes of June 4 committee meeting (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bc	6/10/2013	Thomas Hwang	Prepare, revise minutes for June 3 meeting (2.1); memoranda R. Franklin and J. Murray regarding same (.1)	2.20	924.00
Ec	6/10/2013	John Murray	Interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding debtor's Application for Employment of Counsel regarding Ropers (.1)	0.10	67.00

Ga	6/10/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding Alliacense NDA (.1); review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
Ga	6/10/2013	Robert Franklin	Review status of signatures on Alliacense NDA and draft correspondence Committee regarding same (.3); draft correspondence G. Charles regarding signature on Debtor NDA (.1)	0.40	204.00
J	6/10/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (1.4)	1.40	938.00
Kb	6/10/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding correspondence from committee regarding approval of Marvell settlement (.1); correspondence to D. Leckrone, et al. regarding same (.1); correspondence to subcommittee regarding information for future settlements (.1); regarding correspondence from D. Wright regarding same (.1) correspondence to H. Binder regarding same (.2)	0.60	402.00
Kb	6/10/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence regarding settlement presentation meeting (.3)	0.30	153.00
L	6/10/2013	John Murray	Review revised Order regarding cash collateral and interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same (.2); review correspondence to R. Harris regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
L	6/10/2013	Robert Franklin	Correspondence with R. Harris regarding cash collateral (.1); review and revise order and send to R. Harris with comments (1.2)	1.30	663.00
S	6/10/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding Proofs of Claim (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	6/10/2013	Thomas Hwang	Correspondences Committee members regarding Proofs of Claims (.1)	0.10	42.00
C	6/11/2013	Robert Franklin	Telephone conference with W. Smith regarding hearing on Sec. 1102(b) motion (.1); prepare for same (.2)	0.30	153.00
Ec	6/11/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding Ropers Application for Employment of Counsel; correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ec	6/11/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding Roper's response to the Court's request for more information and respond to same (.2); telephone conference with K. Curry regarding same (.2); preparation for hearing (.1); detailed telephone conference with W. Smith regarding same (.2)	0.70	357.00
J	6/11/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with B. Pionk regarding project billing categories for Application for Compensation (.3)	0.30	201.00
Kb	6/11/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding proceeds of Dell license and Marvell settlement (.1)	0.10	67.00
Kb	6/11/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from K. Beresford regarding replacement of subcommittee member (.1); multiple correspondence to/from S. Kim regarding next committee meeting (.1)	0.20	134.00
P	6/11/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding comments on debtor's Plan of Reorganization and correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	6/11/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from S. Kim regarding Brown's Proof of Claim (.1); correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
A	6/12/2013	Robert Franklin	Interoffice conference with J. Murray regarding Sec. 1102(b) motion (.1); prepare for hearing (.4); attend hearing (1.2)	1.70	867.00
A	6/12/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation Order regarding Debtor's 1102(b) motion and memoranda R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
Ec	6/12/2013	John Murray	Interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding debtor's applications to employ Ropers firm and Adleson firm (.2); attend hearing regarding same (1.5)	1.70	1,139.00
Ec	6/12/2013	Robert Franklin	Interoffice conference with J. Murray regarding hearing (.1); prepare for hearing (.4); attend hearing on Ropers/Adelson application for employment (1.2); correspondence with K. Curry regarding results of hearing (.1)	1.80	918.00

Kb	6/12/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from K. Beresford regarding replacing member of subcommittee (.1); multiple correspondence to/from C. Johnson and G. Felcyn regarding same (.2); correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding need for subcommittee meeting (.1); correspondence to subcommittee regarding same (.1)	0.50	335.00
L	6/12/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding cash collateral order (.1); review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
L	6/12/2013	Robert Franklin	Correspondence with R. Harris regarding cash collateral order and review same (.3)	0.30	153.00
S	6/12/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation correspondence and regarding Proof of Claim from D. Andrews (.2); telephone conference with D. Andrews regarding same (.1); evaluation regarding same (.3)	0.60	252.00
Bb	6/13/2013	John Murray	Attend committee conference call regarding all matters (1.0)	1.00	670.00
Bb	6/13/2013	Robert Franklin	Prepare for meeting with Committee (.8); attend meeting (1.0)	1.80	918.00
Bb	6/13/2013	Thomas Hwang	Attend Committee meeting (1.0)	1.00	420.00
C	6/13/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from H. Binder and R. Harris regarding status (.2)	0.20	134.00
Ec	6/13/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation and analysis employment application and retainer agreement of Bragalone Conroy and Farnan LLP (.8); draft summary memorandum regarding same (.8)	1.60	672.00
G	6/13/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding production of documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	6/13/2013	Robert Franklin	Review status of production of documents and draft correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding same (.4)	0.40	204.00
Ga	6/13/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding Alliacense NDA (.1)	0.10	67.00
Kb	6/13/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding recomposition of subcommittee (.1)	0.10	67.00
Kb	6/13/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from C. Johnson regarding service on the subcommittee (.1)	0.10	67.00
Kb	6/13/2013	Thomas Hwang	Correspondence H. Binder, R. Harris regarding subcommittee membership (.1)	0.10	42.00
L	6/13/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding cash collateral order (.2)	0.20	134.00
L	6/13/2013	Robert Franklin	Correspondence with R. Harris regarding form of cash collateral order (.2) review drafts and comment (.3)	0.50	255.00
L	6/13/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review Debtor's proposed cash collateral order (.1)	0.10	42.00
P	6/13/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	67.00
P	6/13/2013	Robert Franklin	Review plan presentation (.5); incorporate Committee's initial comments into memorandum summarizing Committee's response to presentation and review and revise same (1.7)	2.20	1,122.00
S	6/13/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding proofs of claim (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	6/13/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review Proof of Claim of M. and C. Brown and correspondences from S. Kim (.3)	0.30	126.00
J	6/14/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (.8)	0.80	536.00
J	6/14/2013	Robert Franklin	Continue preparation of application for compensation (1.3)	1.30	663.00
L	6/14/2013	Robert Franklin	Telephone conference R. Harris regarding cash collateral order and Fastlogic settlement (.2)	0.20	102.00
P	6/14/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from committee members regarding response to debtor's proposed Plan of Reorganization (.3)	0.30	201.00
P	6/14/2013	Robert Franklin	Review plan presentation materials (1.0); review comments from Committee members regarding draft of response to Debtor and incorporate into same (1.4)	2.40	1,224.00
P	6/14/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review memorandum from R. Franklin and Committee correspondences regarding comments to same, regarding Debtor's plan provisions (.2)	0.20	84.00
S	6/14/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding claims (.1)	0.10	67.00
A	6/17/2013	Robert Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding status of action items (.3)	0.30	153.00
Ba	6/17/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items (.1)	0.10	42.00

Kb	6/17/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding subcommittee meeting with Debtor (.2)	0.20	134.00
L	6/17/2013	Robert Franklin	Review revised cash collateral budget (.4); detailed telephone conference R. Harris regarding same (.3); analysis and evaluation regarding same (.4)	1.10	561.00
S	6/17/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from P. Marcoux regarding Proof of Claim (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ec	6/18/2013	Thomas Hwang	Prepare summary regarding employment application of special counsel (.3)	0.30	126.00
G	6/18/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt financing statements (.1)	0.10	67.00
L	6/18/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding cash collateral order (.1); review correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding revised cash collateral budget (.2); correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.40	268.00
L	6/18/2013	Robert Franklin	Review cash collateral order (.2); correspondence with J. Murray and R. Harris regarding issues and corrections to budget (.5)	0.70	357.00
Bc	6/19/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding minutes of committee meeting; review correspondence to committee regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bc	6/19/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft, revise minutes for June 13 meeting (2.3)	2.30	966.00
C	6/19/2013	Robert Franklin	Telephone conference with R. Harris regarding status of Ford settlement talks (.1); review offer (.1)	0.20	102.00
F	6/19/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding sending May invoice to Debtor for Monthly Operating Report (.2)	0.20	134.00
Kb	6/19/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Harris regarding Ford license proposal (.1); multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same (.2); review correspondence to committee regarding same (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.50	335.00
Kb	6/19/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review memorandum R. Franklin regarding proposal of settlement, regarding Ford matter; review correspondence G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
L	6/19/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding cash collateral budget (.2)	0.20	134.00
L	6/19/2013	Robert Franklin	Detailed telephone conference with R. Harris regarding cash collateral budget and issues revolving around carve-outs for Ropers and Hess (.3); review budget (.2)	0.50	255.00
Ba	6/20/2013	Thomas Hwang	Conference J. Murray regarding case status and outstanding action items	0.10	42.00
Bb	6/20/2013	John Murray	Prepare agenda for committee meeting; correspondence to committee regarding same (.5)	0.50	335.00
Bc	6/20/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding minutes of committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bc	6/20/2013	Thomas Hwang	Correspondence J. Murray regarding meeting minutes	0.10	42.00
C	6/20/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding his conversations with R. Harris regarding status of various matters (.1); correspondence to R. Harris regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
Ec	6/20/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding analysis and evaluation of Debtor's Applications for Employment of Counsel (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ec	6/20/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding summary of Debtor's counsels' Applications for Employment of Counsel (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ec	6/20/2013	Thomas Hwang	Memorandum J. Murray regarding employment of Bragalone and Farnam firms (.3)	0.30	126.00
F	6/20/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to H. Binder regarding committee attorney's fees and costs for Debtor's Monthly Operating Report (.1)	0.10	67.00
F	6/20/2013	Thomas Hwang	Correspondence H. Binder regarding fees and expenses of Committee counsel (.1)	0.10	42.00
Kb	6/20/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from C. Johnson regarding dispute regarding Ford license proceeds (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	6/20/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Andrews regarding Beresford Proof of Claim (.1)	0.10	67.00

Ba	6/21/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to team regarding S. Kim's draft correspondence to United States Trustee regarding debtor's conduct (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ba	6/21/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to team regarding S. Kim's correspondence to UST regarding Debtor's defalcations (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	6/21/2013	John Murray	Prepare for committee meeting (.3); review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding conversations with debtor's counsel regarding status for update to committee (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding Ford payment dispute (.2); attend committee meeting (1.3)	1.90	1,273.00
Bb	6/21/2013	Thomas Hwang	Attend meeting with Committee (1.2); continue discussion with C. Brown, M. Brown, P. Marcoux, J. Murray; meeting J. Murray regarding same, regarding action items (.1)	1.30	546.00
Bc	6/21/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding revised minutes of committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bc	6/21/2013	Thomas Hwang	Exchange correspondences M. Brown regarding meeting minutes; correspondence Committee regarding same (.1); revise meeting minutes (.1); prepare minutes of June 21 meeting (1.9)	2.10	882.00
F	6/21/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to committee regarding Debtor's Monthly Operating Reports (.2)	0.20	134.00
F	6/21/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation regarding Debtor's Monthly Operating Report for May and amendment for April (.4); exchange correspondences R. Shakoori regarding same and regarding employment pleadings (.2); memorandum J. Murray regarding same; correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.70	294.00
L	6/21/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence regarding wire transfer regarding carve out from cash collateral budget; correspondence M. O'Leary regarding same; correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bc	6/23/2013	Thomas Hwang	Prepare minutes of Committee meeting (.3)	0.30	126.00
Bc	6/24/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding minutes of committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bc	6/24/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding minutes of committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bc	6/24/2013	Thomas Hwang	Prepare, finalize minutes of Committee meeting (.3); memoranda J. Murray regarding same; correspondence to Committee regarding same (.1)	0.40	168.00
D	6/24/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation regarding correspondence S. Kim to E. Keller, and regarding information regarding Debtor and insider conduct (.3)	0.30	126.00
G	6/24/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence form S. Anhalt regarding production of documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	6/24/2013	Robert Franklin	Review status of production of documents from Debtor and correspondence with S. Kim regarding 2006-2010 financials (.8)	0.80	408.00
Ga	6/24/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding Alliacense NDA(.1)	0.10	67.00
Ga	6/24/2013	Robert Franklin	Review status of Alliacense NDA and draft correspondence to Committee members regarding signatures (.3)	0.30	153.00
Ga	6/24/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences R. Franklin regarding Alliacense Non-Disclosure Agreement; investigation regarding status of same (.2); correspondence G. Charles regarding same; memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
I	6/24/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Harris regarding payment to OnSpec (.1); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
L	6/24/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Harris regarding Vinkedu adequate protection payment (.1); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
M	6/24/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding mediation, etc. (.2)	0.20	134.00
P	6/24/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to H. Binder and R. Harris regarding Debtor's response to committee comments regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	67.00
P	6/24/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding Debtor's Plan of Reorganization (.1); correspondence to/from M. Brown regarding same (.1); correspondence to committee regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00

S	6/24/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation Proof of Claim from M. Imhoff; correspondence M. Imhoff regarding same (.3); evaluation Proof of Claim K. Beresford (.1); evaluation Proof of Claim and correspondences from P. Marcoux; memorandum R. Franklin regarding same, regarding nondisclosure agreement (.3)	0.70	294.00
Bb	6/25/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding correspondence from G. Kaplan (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.1); review correspondence from C. Johnson regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
Bb	6/25/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding committee meeting and strategy going forward (.2); telephone conference with D. Wright regarding notice of committee meetings (.1); correspondence to committee regarding next committee meeting (.1)	0.40	268.00
Bb	6/25/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding committee meeting (.1); correspondence to committee regarding next meeting (.1)	0.20	134.00
Bc	6/25/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding meeting minutes (.1)	0.10	67.00
F	6/25/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding debtor's amended schedules (.1)	0.10	67.00
F	6/25/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation Debtor's filings, amended schedules (.2); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
G	6/25/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding employee job descriptions (.1); review correspondence from R. Harris regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
J	6/25/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (1.3)	1.30	871.00
L	6/25/2013	John Murray	Review Debtor's revised cash collateral budget (.4); correspondence to R. Harris regarding same (.1)	0.50	335.00
L	6/25/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding revised cash collateral budget (.2)	0.20	134.00
M	6/25/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from C. Brown regarding mediation with Debtor (.1)	0.10	67.00
O	6/25/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to committee regarding Debtor's request for an extension of the exclusivity period (.4); correspondence to/from G. Kaplan regarding same (.2); review correspondence from C. Johnson regarding same (.1); regarding correspondence from K. Curry regarding same (.1); telephone conference with H. Binder regarding same (.2); correspondence to committee regarding same (.1); review correspondence from committee members regarding same (.1); telephone conference with H. Binder regarding same (.1); correspondence to H. Binder regarding same (.1)	1.40	938.00
O	6/25/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences J. Murray, G. Kaplan, C. Johnson regarding communications with Debtor's counsel, regarding plan exclusivity (.1)	0.10	42.00
P	6/25/2013	John Murray	Review Debtor's response to committee's comments regarding Plan of Reorganization (1.0); attend committee meeting regarding same (.8); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same (.2); correspondence to H. Binder and R. Harris regarding same (.2); telephone conference with H. Binder regarding same (.2)	2.40	1,608.00
P	6/25/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting Committee regarding Debtor's plan and response to Committee comments (.8); exchange correspondences G. Kaplan regarding same (.1); memorandum J. Murray regarding follow-up meeting (.1)	1.00	420.00
P	6/25/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation and analysis Debtor's plan and response to Committee's comments, and prepare memorandum regarding same (1.8); review correspondences G. Felcyn, C. Brown, G. Kaplan, P. Marcoux regarding same (.1)	1.90	798.00
S	6/25/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to P. Marcoux regarding settlement agreement regarding Proof of Claim (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	6/25/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation Proof of Claim from M. Imhoff; correspondence M. Imhoff regarding same (.2); correspondences P. Marcoux regarding Proof of Claim (.1)	0.30	126.00

Bb	6/26/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding rescheduling committee meeting due to G. Kaplan's absence. (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	6/26/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding debtor's financial projections (.1); Multiple correspondence to/from committee members regarding postponement of committee meeting (.2)	0.30	201.00
Bb	6/26/2013	Thomas Hwang	Correspondences Committee regarding scheduling of meeting and case status; review correspondences regarding same; conference J. Murray regarding same (.3)	0.30	126.00
J	6/26/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (.5)	0.50	335.00
O	6/26/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from K. Beresford, M. Imhoff and C. Johnson regarding extension of time regarding exclusivity (.1)	0.10	67.00
P	6/26/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with H. Binder regarding meeting to discuss Plan of Reorganization (.1); review Debtor's proposal regarding Plan of Reorganization (1.9); review Plan of Reorganization (1.6); correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding projections (.1); telephone conference with R. Harris regarding same (.1)	3.80	2,546.00
P	6/26/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation memorandum from J. Murray regarding issues with Debtor's plan and Committee requests; memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.3); draft memorandum regarding confirmation issues and Debtor's plan (2.9)	3.20	1,344.00
S	6/26/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from D. Andrews regarding Beresford Proof of Claim (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	6/26/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review Proofs of Claims from Committee members; review and respond correspondence D. Andrews regarding same (.2)	0.20	84.00
Bb	6/27/2013	John Murray	Miscellaneous regarding next week's meetings (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.1); review correspondence to/from M. Imhoff regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
Bb	6/27/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences M. Imhof, G. Felcyn regarding scheduling and correspondence G. Felcyn, C. Johnson regarding same (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.20	84.00
Bc	6/27/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation notes and correspondence M. Brown regarding meeting minutes; revise meeting minutes (.3); correspondence G. Felcyn regarding same; correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.40	168.00
F	6/27/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to V. Chial regarding May invoice for Debtor's Monthly Operating Report (.2)	0.20	134.00
O	6/27/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Harris regarding request for extension of exclusivity period (.1)	0.10	67.00
P	6/27/2013	John Murray	Continue review of Debtor's Plan of Reorganization (.6); review memorandum from T. Hwang regarding Debtor's Plan of Reorganization (.3)	0.90	603.00
P	6/27/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding revised Plan of Reorganization (.2); review correspondence from R. Harris regarding Monday meeting regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.30	201.00
P	6/27/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Harris regarding Monday meeting regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	67.00
P	6/27/2013	Thomas Hwang	Continue preparation of memorandum regarding Debtor's proposed plan and confirmation issues (.6); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1); analysis and evaluation regarding revised Plan, comments and correspondence from R. Harris regarding same (.4)	1.10	462.00
Bb	6/28/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from C. Brown regarding TPL's gross receipts (.1); regarding correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.1); review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding same (.1); multiple correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding same (.2); review correspondence from C. Brown to G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.60	402.00
J	6/28/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (.3)	0.30	201.00

P	6/28/2013	John Murray	Commence review of revised Plan of Reorganization and correspondence to H. Binder and R. Harris regarding same (2.0); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same (.2)	2.20	1,474.00
P	6/28/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences C. Brown, P. Marcoux, G. Felcyn regarding Debtor's plan (.1); memorandum J. Murray regarding same, regarding licensing activity (.1); review and evaluation correspondence from J. Murray regarding Debtor's plan (.2); meeting J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.50	210.00
Bc	6/30/2013	Thomas Hwang	Prepare minutes for Committee meeting; memorandum J. Murray regarding same	2.00	840.00
G	6/30/2013	Robert Franklin	Review status of production of documents, signatures on Alliacense NDA, amended Schedules and OnSpec payment regarding Venkidu (.6)	0.60	306.00
P	6/30/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence regarding Debtor's proposed plan of reorganization (.6)	0.60	306.00
Bb	7/1/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to committee regarding meeting agenda (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	7/1/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding minutes of committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	7/1/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding strategy going forward and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding committee conference call (.1)	0.30	201.00
Bc	7/1/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding minutes of committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
I	7/1/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding OnSpec payment (.1)	0.10	67.00
J	7/1/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (1.1)	1.10	737.00
P	7/1/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from H. Binder regarding correspondence of June 28th regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1); conference H. Binder and R. Harris regarding Plan of Reorganization (2.0)	2.10	1,407.00
P	7/1/2013	Robert Franklin	Review proposed Plan of Reorganization and analysis and evaluation regarding same; prepare for meeting with H. Binder and R. Harris (2.3); conference J. Murray, T. Hwang, H. Binder and R. Harris regarding proposed Plan of Reorganization (2.0); review and revise memorandum to Committee summarizing Debtor's response (1.3)	5.60	2,856.00
P	7/1/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, R. Franklin, H. Binder, R. Harris regarding Debtor's plan and issues (2.0); draft summary memorandum to Committee regarding same (1.3); review comments R. Franklin regarding same; meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	3.40	1,428.00
U	7/1/2013	Robert Franklin	Legal research regarding Section 510(b) and potential of mandatory subordination of 13% claimants (1.0)	1.00	510.00
Bb	7/2/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from committee members regarding coordination of next meeting date (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bb	7/2/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from C. Johnson regarding C. Hoge attendance at committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ea	7/2/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding scope of forensic accountant's investigation and revise correspondence to H. Binder regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
F	7/2/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding April and May fees and costs for debtor's Monthly Operating Report (.2)	0.20	134.00
G	7/2/2013	Robert Franklin	Draft correspondence R. Harris regarding job descriptions for Debtor's employees (.1)	0.10	51.00

P	7/2/2013	John Murray	Review summary of meeting with H. Binder and R. Harris regarding debtor's Plan of Reorganization (.5); correspondence to H. Binder regarding same (.1); correspondence to committee regarding same (.1); review correspondence from H. Binder regarding same and correspondence to committee regarding same (.1); review correspondence from M. Imhoff regarding same (.1); review correspondence from P. Marcoux (.1); attend committee conference call regarding debtor's Plan of Reorganization (1.5); commence preparation of correspondence to H. Binder regarding committee's response to debtor's position regarding Plan of Reorganization (2.0); multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.3); review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding interpretation of Plan of Reorganization (.1)	4.90	3,283.00
P	7/2/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence H. Binder regarding Debtor's position on Plan of Reorganization and Committee concerns (.1); prepare for Committee meeting regarding same (.3); attend Committee meeting (1.5); review and revise correspondence to Debtor regarding Committee's response regarding Plan of Reorganization (.5)	2.40	1,224.00
P	7/2/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review memorandum J. Murray regarding Debtor's Plan and negotiations; correspondence Committee regarding meeting logistics (.1); review correspondences M. Imhoff and P. Marcoux regarding same (.1); meeting with Committee regarding Debtor's Plan of Reorganization (1.5); evaluation and provide comments to correspondence to Debtor's counsel regarding plan and case status; memoranda J. Murray regarding same (.7)	2.40	1,008.00
A	7/3/2013	Robert Franklin	Review status conference statement (.3)	0.30	153.00
Bb	7/3/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn, M. Brown, M. Imhof, G. Kaplan regarding availability for next committee meeting (.1); correspondence to remaining committee members regarding same (.1); correspondence to/from P. Marcoux regarding telephone conference to discuss various matters (.1); telephone conference with P. Marcoux regarding administrative expenses and negotiation strategy with the debtor (.2)	0.50	335.00
Ea	7/3/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to J. Proctor regarding presentation to committee regarding serving as committee forensic accountant (.3); correspondence to A. Rundquist regarding same (.2)	0.50	335.00
Ea	7/3/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding potential forensic accountants (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ea	7/3/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation memorandum J. Murray and correspondences from Committee regarding forensic accountant and communication to Debtor regarding same (.3)	0.30	126.00
G	7/3/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to debtor regarding Alliacense financial statements (.1); review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding job descriptions (.1); review correspondence from M. Leckrone re production of documents (.1); correspondence to T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.40	268.00
G	7/3/2013	Robert Franklin	Review materials from S. Kim regarding evidence of fraudulent transfers (.3)	0.30	153.00
Ga	7/3/2013	Robert Franklin	Correspondence with G. Charles regarding Alliacense NDA (.1); correspondence with P. Califano and M. Leckrone regarding same and production of documents (.2)	0.30	153.00
P	7/3/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from K. Beresford, M. Imhof re correspondence to H. Binder regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1); review correspondence from K. Curry, P. Marcoux and K. Beresford regarding comments on correspondence to H. Binder (.2); continue preparation of correspondence to H. Binder and multiple correspondence to Committee regarding same (.9); review correspondence from P. Marcoux approving correspondence to H. Binder (.1); correspondence to/from B. Kirkendall regarding purpose of correspondence to H. Binder (.1); review further multiple correspondence from committee members regarding correspondence to H. Binder (.2); revise correspondence regarding same (.3)	1.90	1,273.00

Ga	7/5/2013	Robert Franklin	Review status of Alliacense NDA and draft correspondence M. Imhoff regarding same (.3)	0.30	153.00
J	7/5/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (.1)	0.10	67.00
P	7/5/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from M. Imhoff regarding correspondence to H. Binder re committee's position regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	7/5/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding filing of Proofs of Claim (.2); correspondence to T. Hwang regarding same (.1); review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.40	268.00
S	7/5/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation Proof of Claim and correspondences from P. Marcoux; correspondences P. Marcoux regarding same (.3)	0.30	126.00
P	7/6/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Harris regarding committee's position regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	7/6/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and respond to correspondence P. Marcoux regarding Proof of Claim (.1)	0.10	42.00
Ba	7/8/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items (.1)	0.10	42.00
Ba	7/8/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items; review and respond R. Becker regarding case status and chapter 7 trustee (.1)	0.10	42.00
Bb	7/8/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding Friday committee meeting (.1); correspondence to committee regarding same (.1); review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
Ea	7/8/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to Rundquist regarding presentation to committee regarding forensic accountant position (.1); review correspondence to J. Proctor regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
Ea	7/8/2013	Thomas Hwang	Telephone conference with L. Chung regarding forensic accountant and meeting with Committee; correspondence L. Chung regarding same; review correspondence R. Franklin to J. Proctor regarding same (.2)	0.20	84.00
G	7/8/2013	Robert Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding documents to be produced (.2)	0.20	102.00
Ga	7/8/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to P. Califano and M. Leckrone regarding NDA and production of documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ga	7/8/2013	Robert Franklin	Review status of signatures to Alliacense NDA (.2); draft correspondence P. Califano and M. Leckrone regarding same (.2)	0.40	204.00
P	7/8/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Harris regarding meeting after court on Wednesday regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	67.00
P	7/8/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence R. Harris regarding Committee correspondence regarding Debtor's plan (.1)	0.10	42.00
Ea	7/9/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin and J. Proctor regarding interview with J. Proctor for forensic accountant position (.1); review correspondence to J. Proctor regarding same (.1); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding communicating to committee regarding same (.1); review communication to committee regarding same (.1); multiple correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding communicating with candidates (.2)	0.60	402.00
Ea	7/9/2013	Robert Franklin	Correspondence and telephone conferences with J. Proctor regarding presentation to Committee (.6)	0.60	306.00
Ea	7/9/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and respond correspondences L. Chung regarding potential retention as accountant; call to L. Chung regarding same (.2); memoranda J. Murray and R. Franklin regarding same (.2); conference J. Murray regarding same, and review correspondence from J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.50	210.00
A	7/10/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from M. Brown regarding Chapter 11 Status Conference (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ea	7/10/2013	Robert Franklin	Correspondence with J. Proctor regarding presentation to Committee (.1)	0.10	51.00

Ea	7/10/2013	Thomas Hwang	Telephone conference with L. Chung regarding interview of accountants, case status (.1); telephone conference with P. Wahlquist regarding same (.3); correspondence P. Wahlquist regarding same (.1); correspondence to Committee regarding same (.1)	0.60	252.00
L	7/10/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to R. Harris regarding July payment of carve out (.2)	0.20	134.00
O	7/10/2013	John Murray	Prepare for hearing on exclusivity Motion (.3); attend same (1.2)	1.50	1,005.00
P	7/10/2013	John Murray	Prepare for meeting with R. Harris regarding negotiations regarding Plan of Reorganization (.2); attend same (1.0)	1.20	804.00
S	7/10/2013	John Murray	Multiple interoffice conference with T. Hwang regarding claims bar date (.1)	0.10	67.00
A	7/11/2013	John Murray	Attend Chapter 11 Status Conference (2.5)	2.50	1,675.00
Bb	7/11/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to committee regarding meeting agenda (.7)	0.70	469.00
Bb	7/11/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review agenda from J. Murray regarding meeting; conferences J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
Bc	7/11/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft minutes for July 2 meeting (3.3)	3.30	1,386.00
Ea	7/11/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence P. Wahlquist regarding accountant candidacy; memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same; meeting J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
L	7/11/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Harris regarding carve out payment (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	7/12/2013	Robert Franklin	Prepare for and attend committee meeting (2.1)	2.10	1,071.00
Bb	7/12/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting with Committee (1.7)	1.70	714.00
Bc	7/12/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding revised minutes of last meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bc	7/12/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences M. Brown, G. Felcyn regarding minutes for July 2 meeting, and revise same (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same, regarding accountant interviews for July 12 meeting (.1); draft minutes for July 12 meeting (1.8); meetings and memorandum to J. Murray regarding same (.1)	2.10	882.00
Ea	7/12/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to J. Proctor regarding retention as committee forensic accountant (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ea	7/12/2013	Robert Franklin	Draft correspondence J. Proctor re result of committee meeting, request for further information and next steps (.4)	0.40	204.00
Ea	7/12/2013	Thomas Hwang	Prepare conflicts information and correspondence J. Proctor regarding same and regarding case parties (.4)	0.40	168.00
P	7/12/2013	John Murray	Prepare for committee meeting, review debtor's response to committee input regarding Plan of Reorganization, and review minutes of last committee meeting (.6); attend committee conference call regarding negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (1.7); correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding conference call (.1); telephone conference with D. Wright regarding negotiations with D. Leckrone (.3); review correspondence from R. Harris re committee meeting (.1); preparation of response to R. Harris regarding committee's response to debtor's response to committee' demands (1.3); multiple interoffice conferences with T. Hwang regarding meeting minutes (.1); review same (.3)	4.50	3,015.00
Bb	7/15/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding strategy going forward (.2)	0.20	134.00
Ea	7/15/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from J. Proctor re Application for Employment of Forensic Accountant (.2)	0.20	134.00
Ea	7/15/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation and exchange correspondences J. Proctor regarding employment (.3); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.40	168.00
G	7/15/2013	Robert Franklin	Correspondence M. Leckrone re status of production of documents (.2); correspondence with G. Felcyn regarding budget concerns and draft further document request to Debtor regarding same (.4)	0.60	306.00
Ga	7/15/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to P. Califano regarding Aliasence NDAs and production of documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ga	7/15/2013	Robert Franklin	Correspondence with M. Brown regarding signature on NDA (.1)	0.10	51.00

Na	7/15/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding meetings with debtor; correspondence to committee regarding same (.3); review correspondence from K. Curry regarding same (.1); telephone conference with D. Wright regarding same (.2)	0.60	402.00
Na	7/15/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence D. Wright regarding results of conversation with D. Leckrone (.2)	0.20	102.00
P	7/15/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to R. Harris regarding committee's concerns regarding debtor's Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.20	134.00
P	7/15/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences G. Felcyn, R. Franklin, D. Wright regarding Debtor's plan and negotiations, regarding case strategy (.1)	0.10	42.00
S	7/15/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences regarding B. Kirkendall, regarding Proof of Claim; correspondence R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
Ea	7/16/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence Committee members regarding focus of forensic accountant investigation (.3)	0.30	153.00
G	7/16/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding committee request for information (.2)	0.20	134.00
G	7/16/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding investigation (.1); regarding correspondence from D. Wright regarding telephone call (.1); review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding production of documents (.1); review correspondence from S. Kim regarding investigation of debtor (.1); correspondence to committee regarding correspondence from committee members (.1); review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding investigation (.1)	0.60	402.00
G	7/16/2013	Robert Franklin	Correspondence with R. Harris regarding production of documents (.1)	0.10	51.00
G	7/16/2013	Robert Franklin	Review documents produced to date by Debtor and update index of documents - correspondence with Committee regarding same (2.1)	2.10	1,071.00
Ga	7/16/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding Alliasence NDA (.1); correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same (.1);	0.20	134.00
Ga	7/16/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from C. Brown regarding NDA (.1)	0.10	67.00
L	7/16/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from E. Keller regarding cash collateral Stipulation (.1)	0.10	67.00
Na	7/16/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding status of negotiation with debtor (.3); review multiple correspondence to/from committee regarding same (.2)	0.50	335.00
Na	7/16/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Harris regarding negotiations with debtor (.2)	0.20	134.00
Na	7/16/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence R. Harris regarding progress of settlement talks (.2)	0.20	102.00
S	7/16/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from S. Kim regarding filing of Proofs of Claim (.2); review multiple correspondence regarding proofs of claim (.2)	0.40	268.00
S	7/16/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding Proofs of Claim (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	7/16/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences R. Franklin, J. Murray, S. Kim regarding Proof of Claim and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
A	7/17/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding action items from committee meeting (.2)	0.20	134.00
A	7/17/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation regarding action items, and memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same, regarding minutes (.3)	0.30	126.00
Bc	7/17/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding minutes of committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bc	7/17/2013	Robert Franklin	Review July 12 minutes and status of action items (.5)	0.50	255.00
Bc	7/17/2013	Thomas Hwang	Prepare minutes of July 12 meeting (1.7)	1.70	714.00
Ea	7/17/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from T. Hwang, R. Franklin and J. Proctor regarding Employment of forensic accountant and respond (.2)	0.20	134.00

Ea	7/17/2013	John Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding message from D. Aguilera re forensic account position (.1); multiple correspondence to/from team regarding same (.1); correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding Employment regarding J. Proctor (.1)	0.30	201.00
Ea	7/17/2013	Thomas Hwang	Legal research and evaluation regarding retention of forensic accountant and contract employees (.4); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.2); correspondence J. Proctor regarding same (.1)	0.70	294.00
G	7/17/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding production of documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	7/17/2013	Robert Franklin	Correspondence with Committee regarding investigation (.3); detailed telephone conference R. Harris regarding document production and protocol (.4); review hard copies of documents received from S. Kim (.4); review Volume 1 of trial transcript from alter ego trial regarding potential evidence for motion to appoint trustee (1.5)	2.60	1,326.00
Ga	7/17/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding M. Brown Alliacense NDA (.1); review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding Alliacense NDA for M. Brown and Dorsey & Whitney (.1); review multiple correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding same (.1); review correspondence from C. Brown regarding Alliacense NDA (.1)	0.40	268.00
Ga	7/17/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence regarding Alliacense NDA signatures and confirm full execution (.4)	0.40	204.00
P	7/17/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.20	134.00
S	7/17/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review Proof of Claim and attention to filing of same; telephone conference with B. Kirkendall regarding Proof of Claim (.5)	0.50	210.00
Bb	7/18/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from committee members over last 4 days; correspondence to committee regarding same (1.5)	1.50	1,005.00
Bb	7/18/2013	John Murray	Prepare for committee meeting (.6)	0.60	402.00
Bc	7/18/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding minutes of last committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bc	7/18/2013	John Murray	Review minutes of last committee meeting (.3)	0.30	201.00
Ea	7/18/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to D. Aguilera regarding forensic accountant position (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ea	7/18/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to team regarding forensic accountant Application for Employment (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	7/18/2013	Robert Franklin	Review trial transcripts regarding alter ego trial (6.0)	6.00	3,060.00
Ga	7/18/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding Dorsey & Whitney's executed NDA (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ja	7/18/2013	John Murray	Review amendment to Rule 2016 statement filed by Binder & Malter (.1); correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same (.1); correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding Rule 2016 statement (.1)	0.30	201.00
Na	7/18/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to D. Wright regarding expected call from D. Leckrone (.1)	0.10	67.00
Na	7/18/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Harris regarding conference call to discuss outstanding issues (.2); review correspondence from R. Harris regarding same (.1); telephone conference with R. Harris regarding same (.1)	0.40	268.00
P	7/18/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright to D. Leckrone regarding negotiations regarding Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.20	134.00
P	7/18/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with R. Harris regarding negotiations regarding Plan of Reorganization (.5); correspondence to committee regarding same (.4); correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding same (.1); correspondence to D. Wright regarding communications with D. Leckrone (.1)	1.10	737.00
S	7/18/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from team and committee regarding Proofs of Claim (.2)	0.20	134.00

S	7/18/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to G. Kaplan regarding Proof of Claim (.1); review correspondence to G. Felcyn regarding Proof of Claim (.1); correspondence to/from T. Hwang re confirmation that G. Kaplan and G. Felcyn will file their own Proofs of Claim (.1)	0.30	201.00
S	7/18/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Bloomer regarding B. Kirkendall claim (.1); review multiple correspondence to/from team regarding Proofs of Claim (.1); multiple correspondence to/from team regarding Proofs of Claim (.1); correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding Kirkendall Proof of Claim (.1); multiple correspondence to/from team regarding Farella's and PTSC Proofs of Claim (.2)	0.60	402.00
S	7/18/2013	Thomas Hwang	Analysis and evaluation regarding Proofs of Claims (.4); correspondences G. Felcyn, C. Johnson and G. Kaplan regarding same (.1)	0.50	210.00
Bb	7/19/2013	John Murray	Prepare for committee meeting (.3); attend same (1.8)	2.10	1,407.00
Bb	7/19/2013	Robert Franklin	Prepare for Committee meeting (.3); attend Committee meeting (1.8); interoffice conference T. Hwang and J. Murray regarding action items and minutes (.2)	2.30	1,173.00
Bb	7/19/2013	Thomas Hwang	Attend meeting Committee (1.8); review correspondences from D. Wright regarding case status and negotiations (.1); review correspondences J. Murray regarding same (.1)	2.00	840.00
Bc	7/19/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding minutes of last committee meeting (.1); review correspondence to committee regarding minutes of last meeting (.1)	0.20	134.00
Bc	7/19/2013	Thomas Hwang	Memorandum J. Murray regarding July 12 meeting minutes; correspondence Committee members regarding same; evaluation memorandum R. Franklin regarding same, regarding action items (.2); draft minutes regarding creditor meeting of July 19, 2013 (2.7); telephone conference with R. Franklin regarding creditor meeting of July 19, 2013; memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	3.00	1,260.00
G	7/19/2013	Robert Franklin	Review Volume 3 of alter ego trial transcript and statement of decision regarding alter ego trial (1.5)	1.50	765.00
Na	7/19/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from D. Wright regarding communications from D. Leckrone (.2); telephone conference with R. Harris regarding meeting of non-lawyer parties (.2)	0.40	268.00
S	7/19/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding Proof of Claim (.1)	0.10	67.00
P	7/20/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (.5)	0.50	335.00
Ea	7/21/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from J. Proctor re employment as forensic accountant (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	7/22/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to committee regarding next committee conference call (.1); review multiple correspondence from committee members regarding availability for same (.1)	0.20	134.00
Bb	7/22/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding executive salaries (.1); review correspondence from C. Brown regarding the hearing project (.1)	0.20	134.00
Bc	7/22/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from T. Hwang regarding minutes of last committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bc	7/22/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence M. Brown regarding July 12 meeting minutes; revise same; correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
Ea	7/22/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from T. Hwang and R. Franklin regarding Employment of forensic accountant (.2)	0.20	134.00
Ea	7/22/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding Employment of forensic accountant (.2)	0.20	134.00
Ea	7/22/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence J. Proctor regarding employment and contractors (.1); review and respond correspondences J. Murray regarding same; review correspondence R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.20	84.00
F	7/22/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding June fees and costs for Monthly Operating Report (.1); correspondence to committee regarding June fees and costs (.2)	0.30	201.00

F	7/22/2013	John Murray	Review June Monthly Operating Report (.3); correspondence to committee regarding same (.1); correspondence to T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.50	335.00
F	7/22/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding timing of debtor's Monthly Operating Report (.1)	0.10	67.00
F	7/22/2013	Robert Franklin	Review Monthly Operating Report for June 2013 (.5)	0.50	255.00
Na	7/22/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright re conference call with debtor (.1); correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding her participation in "no lawyers" meeting with committee (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding communications with J. Neal regarding salaries (.1); review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding same (.1)	0.40	268.00
Na	7/22/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence regarding Committee's meeting with debtor (.2)	0.20	102.00
Na	7/22/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences P. Marcoux, D. Wright, G. Felcyn regarding negotiations with debtor; correspondence G. Felcyn regarding same, regarding Monthly Operating Report (.1)	0.10	42.00
P	7/22/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from M. Brown regarding tenure of committee under debtor's proposed Plan of Reorganization (.1); review correspondence to/from D. Wright and S. Anhalt regarding information needed by committee for conference call with debtor (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding debtor's financial projections (.1); review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.40	268.00
S	7/22/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to committee re Proofs of Claim (.2);	0.20	134.00
S	7/22/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to T. Hwang regarding analysis and evaluation of priority claims (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	7/22/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to T. Hwang regarding analysis and evaluation of priority claims (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	7/22/2013	Robert Franklin	Review Proofs of Claims filed by Committee members (.5)	0.50	255.00
Bb	7/23/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from committee regarding availability for committee meeting (.2)	0.20	134.00
F	7/23/2013	John Murray	Review debtor's supplement to Monthly Operating Report and correspondence to committee regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
P	7/23/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding debtor's financial information (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding committee's comments regarding debtor's Plan of Reorganization (.1); conference call with D. Wright and G. Felcyn regarding meeting with debtor (.2); telephone conference with D. Wright regarding same (.1)	0.50	335.00
G	7/24/2013	Robert Franklin	Review financial statements (.6)	0.60	306.00
S	7/24/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation and analysis regarding Schedules, Amended Schedules and Proofs of Claims, and priority claims; prepare report regarding same (1.4)	1.40	588.00
Bb	7/25/2013	John Murray	Interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding committee conference call (.1); correspondence to committee regarding conference call (.1); prepare for committee conference call (.3); attend same (1.8)	2.30	1,541.00
Bb	7/25/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence regarding status of negotiation with Debtor and prepare for Committee meeting (1.0); attend creditor meeting (1.8)	2.80	1,428.00
Bb	7/25/2013	Thomas Hwang	Memoranda J. Murray regarding Committee meetings and meeting minutes; investigation regarding same (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1); meeting with Committee (1.8); conference J. Murray regarding same (.1); review memorandum J. Murray regarding post-meeting discussions (.1); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.3)	2.50	1,050.00
Bc	7/25/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding status of minutes of committee meetings (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bc	7/25/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft minutes of July 25, 2013 creditor meeting (1.5)	1.50	630.00
Na	7/25/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to D. Wright regarding report regarding meeting with debtor (.1); review report from D. Wright regarding negotiations with debtor (.2)	0.30	201.00

Na	7/25/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from K. Beresford regarding participation in committee meeting (.1); telephone conference with R. Harris regarding same (.4); telephone conference with D. Wright regarding same (.2); telephone conference with D. Wright regarding negotiations with debtor and continuance of committee call (.2); multiple correspondence to committee regarding same (.2); correspondence to D. Wright regarding telephone conference after meeting with debtor (.1)	1.20	804.00
Na	7/25/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences and notes from D. Wright regarding discussions with Debtor (.2)	0.20	84.00
P	7/25/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with R. Harris regarding delay in filing Plan of Reorganization (.2); correspondence to committee regarding same (.1); review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding summary of committee comments regarding debtor's Plan of Reorganization (.1) review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.1); review correspondence from K. Beresford regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.60	402.00
S	7/25/2013	John Murray	Review summary of priority claims (.1); interoffice conference with R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.2)	0.30	201.00
S	7/25/2013	John Murray	Interoffice conference R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding analysis of claims (.2)	0.20	134.00
S	7/25/2013	Robert Franklin	Initiate claims review and preparation of claims matrix (2.6)	2.60	1,326.00
S	7/25/2013	Thomas Hwang	Continue preparation of priority claims matrix and report, and research 507(a)(4) regarding same (.3); memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.1); meeting R. Franklin regarding preparation of claims analysis (.1); meeting R. Franklin, J. Murray regarding same (.1); evaluation regarding same, regarding claims register (.1)	0.70	294.00
Bc	7/26/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft minutes of July 25 meeting (2.0)	2.00	840.00
Ea	7/26/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and respond correspondence J. Proctor regarding employment of accountant (.1)	0.10	42.00
Kb	7/26/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from J. Neal regarding meeting of the settlement subcommittee (.1); telephone conference with J. Neal regarding same (.1); correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding composition of settlement subcommittee (.1); correspondence to settlement subcommittee conference call (.1); review multiple responses from subcommittee regarding same (.1); multiple correspondence to/from J. Neal regarding same (.1)	0.60	402.00
Na	7/26/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to D. Wright regarding conference call with debtor (.1); review correspondence from D. Leckrone regarding negotiations with committee (.1); telephone conference with R. Harris regarding same (.1); correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding same (.1)	0.40	268.00
P	7/26/2013	John Murray	Commence revisions to debtor's Plan of Reorganization (.7)	0.70	469.00
P	7/26/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (.3); correspondence to D. Wright regarding shortening time for notice of the hearing on approval of the disclosure statement (.2)	0.50	335.00
P	7/26/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation regarding Debtor's proposed plan, and regarding discussion from Committee meeting (.4)	0.40	168.00
S	7/26/2013	Robert Franklin	Review claims and continuation preparation of claims matrix (3.0)	3.00	1,530.00
S	7/26/2013	Thomas Hwang	Continue preparation of claims matrix (2.6)	2.60	1,092.00
T	7/26/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with R. Harris regarding Objections to Claims (.2)	0.20	134.00
S	7/27/2013	Thomas Hwang	Continue preparation of claims matrix (.7)	0.70	294.00
C	7/28/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Afhalt regarding alleged demand for Attorneys' fees (.2); multiple correspondence to R. Harris regarding same (.3); multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding debtor's misrepresentation regarding attorneys' fees (.3); correspondence to committee regarding same (.1); review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding same (.1)	1.00	670.00

Ea	7/28/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from J. Proctor regarding employment as forensic accountant (.1)	0.10	67.00
P	7/28/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Harris regarding Alliacense contract and Plan of Reorganization (.1); correspondence to T. Hwang regarding legal research regarding same (.1); review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding classification of claims (.2)	0.40	268.00
P	7/28/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences J. Murray, R. Harris, G. Kaplan, P. Marcoux and C. Brown regarding negotiations with Debtor, regarding plan provisions; memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.2)	0.20	84.00
Pa	7/28/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from R. Harris regarding proposed Stipulation for Order Shortening Time regarding notice of hearing on approval of Disclosure Statement (.2); correspondence to R. Harris regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
S	7/28/2013	Thomas Hwang	Continue preparation of claims matrix (.8); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.90	378.00
T	7/28/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding claims analysis and Objections to Claims, and forward to committee (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bb	7/29/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to committee regarding agenda for committee call (.2); correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding tomorrow's committee meeting (.1)	0.30	201.00
Bc	7/29/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding minutes of last committee meeting (.1); review correspondence from T. Hwang to committee regarding minutes of meetings and correspondence to T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
Bc	7/29/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence J. Murray regarding meeting minutes and correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
C	7/29/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding her statement about attorneys' fees (.1); multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding same (.2); correspondence to S. Anhalt and R. Harris regarding same (.1); telephone conference with W. Smith regarding sale of chips for stock (.1)	0.50	335.00
G	7/29/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from debtor/Alliacense regarding production of documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	7/29/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding production of documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	7/29/2013	Robert Franklin	Correspondence with M. Leckrone and Committee regarding status of production of Alliacense documents (.2)	0.20	102.00
Kb	7/29/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence and analysis from S. Anhalt regarding settlement with Brother International (.2); correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding participation in subcommittee meeting (.1); review correspondence from J. Neal regarding conference call with subcommittee (.1); correspondence to all attendees regarding same (.1); attend subcommittee meeting with debtor regarding negotiation with Brother (.3); attend subcommittee call to discuss proposal (.5); correspondence to debtor regarding same (.2); review correspondence from S. Anhalt in response and correspondence to subcommittee regarding same (.1); multiple correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding confirmation of committee approval of Brother settlement(.1); correspondence to D. Leckrone regarding same (.1)	1.80	1,206.00
Kb	7/29/2013	Robert Franklin	Conference call regarding settlement proposal and approval (.9)	0.90	459.00
Kb	7/29/2013	Thomas Hwang	Subcommittee telephone conference with with Debtor regarding potential settlement (.4); telephone conference with Subcommittee regarding same (.5)	0.90	378.00
Na	7/29/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with with D. Wright regarding negotiations with debtor (.2); review multiple correspondence from committee members regarding meeting with debtor without counsel and analysis regarding same (.2); review correspondence from G. Felcyn to P. Marcoux regarding same (.1)	0.50	335.00

P	7/29/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with H. Binder regarding negotiations regarding Plan of Reorganization and S. Anhalt allegations (.3); correspondence to committee regarding same (.1)	0.40	268.00
Q	7/29/2013	Thomas Hwang	Legal research regarding Sec. 365 and ride through doctrine (.7); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.6)	1.30	546.00
S	7/29/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding summary of claims (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	7/29/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding claims analysis (.1); correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding claims matrix (.1)	0.20	134.00
S	7/29/2013	Robert Franklin	Continue preparation of claims matrix (1.7); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same and finalize same for Committee meeting (.5)	2.20	1,122.00
S	7/29/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and revise claims matrix analysis (.4); meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1); memoranda R. Franklin and J. Murray regarding same (.1); analysis and evaluation Debtor's claims analysis report (.4); correspondence Committee regarding claims matrices (.1); update and finalize claims matrix; meeting J. Murray regarding same (.3)	1.40	588.00
V	7/29/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding debtor's request that committee waive right to review and object to claims and pursue litigation against insiders (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	7/30/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding committee meeting (.2); correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding agenda for committee meeting (.1); attend committee conference call (2.0); review memoranda from D. Wright, provide comments and correspondence to committee regarding same (.5); review memoranda from G. Felcyn, provide comments and correspondence to committee regarding same (.3)	3.10	2,077.00
Bc	7/30/2013	Thomas Hwang	Prepare minutes regarding creditor meeting of July 30, 2013 (3.3); exchange memorandum R. Franklin regarding same and correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	3.40	1,428.00
G	7/30/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding production of documents (.1); review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding third party litigation and correspondence to committee regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
G	7/30/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt and summary of litigation support expenses (.1)	0.10	42.00
I	7/30/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation correspondences W. Smith, K. Curry regarding proposed sale (.1)	0.10	42.00
Kb	7/30/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from W. Smith regarding iListen transaction, correspondence to W. Smith regarding same, correspondence to committee regarding same, and review correspondence from K. Curry and C. Johnson regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
Na	7/30/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding report of negotiations with debtor (.1); review correspondence and memorandum from D. Wright regarding negotiations with debtor (.4)	0.50	335.00
P	7/30/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding memorandum regarding revised Plan of Reorganization and mark-up of Plan of Reorganization (.4); multiple correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding Plan of Reorganization regarding waiving right to object to claims and correspondence to committee regarding same (.3); review G. Felcyn's revisions to Plan of Reorganization and add comments to same (1.1)	1.80	1,206.00
P	7/30/2013	Robert Franklin	Prepare for Committee meeting, review financials and plan mark-up (.4)	0.40	204.00
P	7/30/2013	Robert Franklin	Review memoranda and plan mark-up by D. Wright and G. Felcyn regarding status of negotiations and alternate proposals (1.3); attend Committee meeting (2.0); draft, review and revise minutes of creditor meeting of July 30, 2013 (1.5)	4.80	2,448.00

P	7/30/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences G. Felcyn, J. Murray, D. Wright regarding negotiations with Debtor (.1); review and evaluation plan term proposals and summary reports regarding same (.2); prepare for Committee meeting and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.2); meeting with Committee (2.0); review correspondences and comments from J. Murray regarding Committee status report and plan markup (.2)	2.70	1,134.00
S	7/30/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding claims analysis (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	7/30/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and investigation regarding correspondence M. Imhoff and claims matrices (.1); correspondence M. Imhoff regarding same (.1)	0.20	84.00
Bb	7/31/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding appeals in Brown v. TPL (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bc	7/31/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding minutes of committee meeting; review same (.5)	0.50	335.00
Bc	7/31/2013	Robert Franklin	Review minutes of July 29 meeting (.4); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.50	255.00
Bc	7/31/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting R. Franklin regarding meeting minutes and comments to Debtor's plan (.1); revise minutes and prepare redline; correspondence Committee regarding same (.2)	0.30	126.00
C	7/31/2013	John Murray	Review further correspondence from S. Anhalt, analysis and evaluation regarding same, and correspondence to committee regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
G	7/31/2013	Robert Franklin	Review of appellate brief regarding facts in support of alter ego allegations and fraudulent conveyance (.3)	0.30	153.00
G	7/31/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and respond correspondence S. Kim regarding nondisclosure agreements (.1); investigation regarding same (.1); evaluation regarding nondisclosure agreements and review correspondences R. Franklin and J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
Ga	7/31/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from S. Kim regarding Brown's retention of counsel and propriety of NDA (.2); correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same (.1); review correspondence to/from S. Kim regarding same (.1)	0.40	268.00
Ga	7/31/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence S. Kim regarding adding bankruptcy counsel to Alliacense and Debtor NDA's, analysis and evaluation regarding issues and respond thereto (.5)	0.50	255.00
Kb	7/31/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from W. Smith regarding iLearn transaction, correspondence to committee regarding same, review committee comments regarding same, correspondence to W. Smith regarding same (.6); review multiple correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding same, correspondence to/from committee regarding same, correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding same (.5)	1.10	737.00
Na	7/31/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation and analysis regarding correspondences G. Felcyn and D. Wright regarding communications to Debtor, regarding status report and creditor fund alternative proposal, and memorandum J. Murray and R. Franklin regarding same (1.0)	1.00	420.00
P	7/31/2013	John Murray	Review voice mail from R. Harris regarding status of committee comments regarding Plan of Reorganization and correspondence to R. Harris regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
P	7/31/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding J. Murray's recommendations to committee regarding negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1); review multiple correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00

P	7/31/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization and memorandum regarding same, and correspondence to/from committee regarding same (.4); review G. Felcyn's memorandum regarding terms of Plan of Reorganization (.2); review correspondence from D. Wright to debtor regarding negotiations of Plan of Reorganization (.1); review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding same (.1); review correspondence from T. Hwang and R Franklin regarding markups to memorandum re Plan of Reorganization, and correspondence to committee regarding same (.3); review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding Plan of Reorganization and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	1.30	871.00
P	7/31/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding recommendations to committee regarding negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	67.00
P	7/31/2013	Robert Franklin	Review revised memoranda regarding status of Plan negotiations and position papers, analysis and evaluation regarding issues and correspondence J. Murray regarding same (.5)	0.50	255.00
P	7/31/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation markup to Debtor's plan, and review comments from G. Kaplan (.2)	0.20	84.00
Pa	7/31/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding order regarding motion for Order Shortening Time regarding hearing on approval of Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	67.00
I	8/1/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from M. Imhoff regarding iListen transaction and correspondence to M. Imhoff regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
P	8/1/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1); review multiple correspondence from the committee regarding same (.1); multiple correspondence to the committee regarding same (.2); correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (.3); review correspondence from S. Kim regarding same and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding elements of her proposal regarding the debtor's Plan of Reorganization (.1); review response from G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	1.10	737.00
P	8/1/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence among members of Committee regarding response to Debtor concerning plan negotiations (.4)	0.40	204.00
P	8/1/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences D. Wright, B. Kirkendall, P. Marcoux, S. Kim, G. Felcyn, J. Murray regarding negotiations with Debtor and regarding plan provisions (.5); draft, revise language and comments to Committee memorandum to Debtor (.8); review memorandum R. Franklin regarding same; conference R. Franklin regarding same; meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.3); memoranda J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.3); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	2.10	882.00
U	8/1/2013	Robert Franklin	Legal research regarding legal standards required for subordination of 13%ers claims (.4)	0.40	204.00
U	8/1/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and revise draft memorandum regarding subordination of 13ers claims and interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same (.6); analysis and evaluation regarding classification issues (.6); draft correspondence Committee regarding status of memorandum (.1)	1.30	663.00
Bb	8/2/2013	Robert Franklin	Detailed telephone conference with D. Wright regarding status report (.4)	0.40	204.00
Bb	8/2/2013	Robert Franklin	Interoffice conferences T. Hwang regarding status report (.4); conference call D. Wright, J. Murray and T. Hwang regarding status report and strategic considerations, revisions to status report (.6)	1.00	510.00
Bb	8/2/2013	Thomas Hwang	Analysis and evaluation Committee meeting and memorandum J. Murray regarding same, regarding action items (1.3)	1.30	546.00

Bc	8/2/2013	Robert Franklin	Review minutes of 7.30.13 Committee meeting and prepare bullet points of items discussed (.7); analysis and evaluation issues (.2)	0.90	459.00
G	8/2/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris and C. Johnson regarding request for Dell license agreement (.2)	0.20	134.00
I	8/2/2013	Thomas Hwang	Memorandum R. Franklin regarding request for Dell license agreement; review correspondence C. Johnson, R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
Na	8/2/2013	Robert Franklin	Review alternate proposal to be sent to TPL representatives by subcommittee (.4); revise same and draft correspondence with G. Felcyn regarding same (.4)	0.80	408.00
Na	8/2/2013	Thomas Hwang	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding memorandum to Debtor and case status (.2); review and revise memorandum to Debtor (.4); memoranda and meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1); correspondence to D. Wright regarding same (.2); review and evaluate correspondences G. Felcyn, P. Marcoux, C. Johnson, M. Brown, D. Wright and R. Franklin regarding communications to Debtor, regarding Committee proposal (.4) review memoranda R. Franklin regarding Committee proposal (.2); telephone conference with J. Murray, R. Franklin, D. Wright regarding memorandum to Debtor and case strategy (.6)	2.10	882.00
P	8/2/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from and among committee members regarding memorandum to debtor (1.2); review proposed memorandum to be sent to the debtor regarding negotiations of the Plan of Reorganization (.3); telephone conference with D. Wright regarding negotiations with debtor (.2); review correspondence from R. Harris regarding status of negotiations (.1); review correspondence from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding topics discussed at last committee meeting and correspondence to committee regarding same (.3); review most recent memorandum from D. Wright and G. Felcyn regarding negotiations with debtor (.2)	2.30	1,541.00
P	8/2/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding status of negotiations with committee regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	67.00
I	8/4/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from committee regarding iListen transaction (.2)	0.20	134.00
P	8/4/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to D. Wight regarding communications with debtor regarding negotiations regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	8/5/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn, K. Curry and R. Franklin regarding statute of limitations regarding Objections to Claims, fraudulent conveyance litigation, and tolling agreements (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bb	8/5/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence K. Curry regarding statutes of limitation regarding avoidance actions (.1); analysis and evaluation regarding same and respond (.6)	0.70	357.00
G	8/5/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to R. Harris and S. Anhalt regarding request for Dell Contract (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	8/5/2013	Robert Franklin	Correspondence R. Harris regarding production of license agreement (.1)	0.10	51.00
I	8/5/2013	John Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding debtor's proposed transaction with iListen (.4); correspondence to/from committee regarding same (.2)	0.60	402.00
I	8/5/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation regarding memoranda R. Franklin and J. Murray regarding questions and responses to G. Felcyn (.3); review correspondences Committee members regarding proposed sale of iListen hearing aid chip sale (.1)	0.40	168.00
J	8/5/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (.5)	0.50	335.00
L	8/5/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to H. Binder and R. Harris regarding payment of August carve out (.1)	0.10	67.00

Na	8/5/2013	Thomas Hwang	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding negotiations with Debtor and regarding scheduling (.2); correspondence Committee regarding same; memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1); review correspondences P. Marcoux, C. Johnson regarding same; correspondences C. Johnson regarding same (.1)	0.40	168.00
P	8/5/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding status of negotiations with debtor (.1); correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding classification of claims (.2); correspondence to/from G. Felcyn to confirmation standards and objections to Plan of Reorganization (.1); correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding questions regarding Plan of Reorganization (.4); correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding classification of claims under Plan of Reorganization(.2); correspondence to committee regarding debtor's intention to file Plan of Reorganization on Friday (.1); correspondence to R. Harris regarding status of negotiation regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1); telephone conference with R. Harris regarding same (.1); telephone conference with D. Wright regarding conference call to discuss negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (.2); review correspondence to committee regarding same (.1); review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding same (.1)	1.70	1,139.00
Pa	8/5/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review Court filings regarding Disclosure Statement hearing and order setting hearing; review correspondence J. Murray regarding scheduling of Plan of Reorganization filing (.1)	0.10	42.00
Bb	8/6/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding update regarding Brown litigation and agenda for committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
J	8/6/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (1.4)	1.40	938.00
P	8/6/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization, correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same, review marked up Plan of Reorganization, and memorandum regarding same (.4); conference call with D. Wright and G. Felcyn regarding same (.9); telephone conference with H. Binder regarding same (.4); commence preparation of memorandum to committee regarding all outstanding issues regarding Plan of Reorganization (.6); multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.2); correspondence to D. Wright and G. Felcyn regarding same (.1); multiple correspondence from R. Franklin regarding issues regarding Plan of Reorganization and multiple correspondence to D. Wright regarding same (.2); multiple correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding communication to committee regarding issues re Plan of Reorganization (.2); correspondence to committee regarding same (.4); multiple correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding telephone conference with D. Leckrone regarding "gross revenue" concept for Plan of Reorganization (.2); review correspondence from D. Wright to committee regarding conversations with D. Leckrone (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	3.80	2,546.00
P	8/6/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence and attachments of mark up of Plan of Reorganization and status reports and claims matrices from D. Wright (1.0); conference call D. Wright, G. Felcyn, T. Hwang and J. Murray regarding status of negotiations and strategy related thereto (.9); interoffice conference J. Murray and T. Hwang regarding same (.1); detailed telephone conference D. Wright regarding result of call with J. Neal (.2); review and revise memorandum to Committee regarding negotiating points (.3); correspondence with D. Wright regarding status memorandum (.2); review minutes to confirm Committee decisions (.2)	2.90	1,479.00

P	8/6/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences and claims report, plan comments and summary memorandum from G. Felcyn and D. Wright regarding discussions with Debtor (.3); telephone conference with J. Murray, R. Franklin, G. Felcyn and D. Wright regarding same (.9); correspondence to Committee regarding scheduling of meeting and case status; review correspondence S. Kim regarding same (.1); review and provide comments to J. Murray, regarding outline of issues regarding plan (.4); review correspondences D. Wright, J. Murray, R. Franklin, and G. Felcyn regarding discussions with Debtor and D. Leckrone regarding plan proposals; memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1); analysis regarding Debtor's projections and memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.3)	2.10	882.00
S	8/6/2013	Robert Franklin	Continue preparation of claims matrix (.2)	0.20	102.00
G	8/7/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from G. Felcyn, C. Johnson and T. Hwang regarding request for Dell license (.2)	0.20	134.00
G	8/7/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and respond correspondences G. Felcyn, C. Johnson regarding Dell license agreement (.1)	0.10	42.00
I	8/7/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to G. Felcyn regarding contacting debtor regarding iListen transaction (.1)	0.10	67.00
O	8/7/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding extension of exclusivity period (.1); multiple telephone conferences with D. Wright regarding negotiations with debtor and extension of exclusivity (.2)	0.30	201.00
P	8/7/2013	John Murray	Prepare for committee meeting regarding negotiations with Debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (.4); correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding recent developments regarding negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1); telephone conference with D. Wright regarding same (.3); attend committee meeting regarding Plan of Reorganization (1.2); prepare outline of committee position regarding Plan of Reorganization (1.7); telephone conference with H. Binder regarding status of negotiations regarding Plan of Reorganization (.2); review and revise summary outline per committee input and review correspondence from committee regarding same (1.0); review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding outline and correspondence to D. Wright and G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	5.00	3,350.00
P	8/7/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with H. Binder regarding negotiations regarding Plan of Reorganization (.3); review message from D. Wright and correspondence to D. Wright regarding proposal to debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.40	268.00
P	8/7/2013	Robert Franklin	Attend Committee meeting and analysis and evaluation regarding issues (1.3)	1.30	663.00
P	8/7/2013	Thomas Hwang	Telephone conference with Committee regarding Plan of Reorganization (1.2); review correspondences D. Wright and J. Murray, and prepare for same (.1); review correspondence J. Murray regarding bullet point outline of plan issues, and memoranda J. Murray regarding same (.4); review correspondences G. Felcyn, S. Kim, K. Beresford, G. Kaplan regarding same and regarding affiliate entities of Debtor (.2)	1.90	798.00
Bb	8/8/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from M. Brown regarding committee mailing list (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	8/8/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin, S. Anhalt, C. Johnson, G. Felcyn and H. Binder regarding the Dell license (.1)	0.10	67.00
O	8/8/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from committee members regarding agreement to extend exclusivity (.2); multiple telephone calls with H. Binder regarding exclusivity, cash collateral budget and mediation (.5); telephone conference with R. Harris regarding exclusivity and cash collateral budget (.6); correspondence to/from D. Wright and S. Anhalt regarding confirmation to debtor of committee's willingness to extend exclusivity and extend cash collateral budget (.3); correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding same (.1)	1.70	1,139.00
O	8/8/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Harris regarding Stipulation to extend exclusivity (.1); correspondence to/from T. Tran regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00

P	8/8/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from M. Imhoff regarding proposal to debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1); review correspondence from M. Brown regarding same (.1); correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding proposal to debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1); correspondence to H. Binder and R. Harris regarding same (.1); review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding same and multiple correspondence to/from D. Wright and G. Felcyn regarding same regarding adding ChipScale to the list (.2); multiple correspondence to H. Binder and R. Harris regarding joint Plan of Reorganization (.2); correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding benefits of joint plan (.1); correspondence to committee regarding meeting of August 9th (.1)	1.00	670.00
P	8/8/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding his conversations with S. Anhalt regarding continued negotiations, extending exclusivity, and new dates for hearings on Disclosure Statement and confirmation of Plan of Reorganization (.2); correspondence to committee regarding same (.1); review multiple correspondence from H. Binder regarding need for conference call regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.40	268.00
P	8/8/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences D. Wright, G. Felcyn, P. Marcoux, K. Beresford, M. Imhof regarding negotiations with Debtor (.1)	0.10	42.00
Pa	8/8/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Harris regarding new schedule for Disclosure Statement hearing and confirmation hearing (.1); review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding budget and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.30	201.00
Pa	8/8/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding debtor's projections (.2)	0.20	134.00
A	8/9/2013	John Murray	Review and organize files and review and revise action items (1.5)	1.50	1,005.00
Bb	8/9/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from M. Brown regarding committee mailing list and correspondence to G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ec	8/9/2013	John Murray	Miscellaneous regarding debtor's Application to Employ Edward P. Heller as Special Counsel Nunc Pro Tunc (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	8/9/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding Dell license agreement and correspondence to/from committee regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
L	8/9/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding budget, review budget and correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding same (.2); review court docket regarding orders granting use of cash collateral and budgets (.7); correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding August carve out payment (.1)	1.00	670.00
O	8/9/2013	John Murray	Review proposed Stipulation regarding extension of exclusivity period and correspondence to R. Harris regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
P	8/9/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding need for committee meeting today regarding negotiations with Debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1); correspondence to committee regarding same and review multiple responses regarding same (.2); review correspondence from D. Wright regarding expected feed back from debtor regarding committee's proposals regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.40	268.00
A	8/10/2013	John Murray	Review and organize all files and review and revise action item memorandum (2.2)	2.20	1,474.00
O	8/10/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Harris regarding exclusivity Stipulation (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bc	8/11/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft minutes from August 7 Committee meeting (1.4)	1.40	588.00