

O	8/12/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Harris regarding exclusivity Stipulation, revise same and correspondence to R. Harris regarding same (.8); correspondence to/from C. Cavazos regarding same (.1); correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding same and review revised Stipulation (.2); review multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris and T. Tran regarding same (.1)	1.20	804.00
P	8/12/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to Committee regarding conference call regarding Debtor Plan of Reorganization (.1); telephone conference with D. Wright regarding negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization and correspondence to committee regarding going forward with committee meeting in the morning to discuss same (.2)	0.30	201.00
L	8/13/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding August carve out, correspondence to M. O'Leary regarding same (.1); multiple correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding August carve out (.1)	0.20	134.00
P	8/13/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding report of negotiations with Debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1); compare proposal to debtor with earlier draft (.5); review correspondence and attachments from D. Wright regarding debtor's response to committee plan proposal (.5); attend committee meeting regarding debtor's response to committee's proposal regarding Plan of Reorganization (2.1); commence preparation of annotated memorandum regarding committee deliberations regarding debtor's response to committee's proposal regarding Plan of Reorganization (2.9); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding re-circulation of minutes to committee (.1); multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding circulation of debtor's April 29 projections (.1)	6.30	4,221.00
P	8/13/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence D. Wright and attachments thereto regarding status of negotiation of Plan of Reorganization (.8)	0.80	408.00
P	8/13/2013	Robert Franklin	Attend Committee meeting regarding Debtor Plan of Reorganization (2.1)	2.10	1,071.00
S	8/13/2013	Robert Franklin	Prepare claims matrix for discussion with Committee regarding proposed classifications (4.4)	4.40	2,244.00
S	8/13/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences S. Kim, C. Johnson, G. Felcyn regarding insider claims (.1); memorandum R. Franklin, J. Murray regarding claim of R. Neilsen (.1)	0.20	84.00
U	8/13/2013	John Murray	Interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding subordination of 13%ers claims (.1); legal research regarding same and correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	0.30	201.00
A	8/14/2013	John Murray	Organize notes and review and revise action items (.5)	0.50	335.00
Bb	8/14/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to committee members regarding responses from members regarding availability for committee conference call (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding ALJ Essex Issues Notice Of Initial Determination (.1)	0.20	134.00
Bc	8/14/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding minutes of 8/13/13 (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bc	8/14/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft minutes from August 7 Committee meeting (1.5)	1.50	630.00
G	8/14/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding Dell license agreement, review correspondence to G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
J	8/14/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to committee regarding July fees and costs (.2); correspondence to R. Harris regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
L	8/14/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from M. O'Leary regarding cash collateral careout payments (.2); analysis and evaluation regarding court orders regarding use of cash collateral (.5)	0.70	469.00
Na	8/14/2013	Robert Franklin	Detailed telephone conferences with D. Wright (.4); review annotation to settlement discussion point memorandum (.2); conference call J. Murray, G. Felcyn and D. Wright regarding settlement negotiations (.5); interoffice conference J. Murray regarding claims matrix (.1)	1.20	612.00

P	8/14/2013	John Murray	Finalize memorandum regarding committee's position regarding negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization and correspondence to committee regarding same and availability for a committee conference call to discuss(.8); review multiple correspondence from committee members regarding same (.2); multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding conference call with D. Wright and G. Felcyn regarding claims matrix and negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (.2); attend same (.5); multiple correspondence to/from S. Anhalt and R. Harris regarding forecasts and availability for conference call regarding same (.3); correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding definition of "gross receipts" for purposes of Plan of Reorganization (.2)	2.20	1,474.00
S	8/14/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding claims matrix and review claims matrix (.4)	0.40	268.00
G	8/15/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding Dell license (.1)	0.10	67.00
M	8/15/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with R. Harris regarding mediation and negotiations regarding Plan of Reorganization (.5); multiple correspondence to/from T. Tran regarding conference call with Judge Montali regarding mediation, correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same (.1); correspondence to/from P. Marcoux regarding same, review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.1); telephone conference with D. Wright regarding mediation and substantive areas of disagreement with Debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (.6)	1.30	871.00
P	8/15/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding definition of gross revenue regarding Plan of Reorganization (.3); review correspondence from M. Imhoff regarding committee conference call and correspondence to committee regarding same (.1); review revised memorandum from D. Wright regarding negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization and correspondence to committee regarding same (.8); review multiple correspondence from committee members regarding same (.1); correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding preparation of committee meeting minutes (.1); correspondence to committee regarding committee meeting tomorrow (.1); review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization and correspondence from S. Kim regarding same and debtor's failure to produce documents, correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.2); telephone conference with D. Wright regarding delivery of proposal to debtor and committee call tomorrow (.1)	1.80	1,206.00
P	8/15/2013	Robert Franklin	Review definition of gross revenues, licensing agreements, analysis and evaluation regarding same and correspondence with G. Felcyn and D. Wright regarding same (1.4); review draft of settlement update status (.2)	1.60	816.00
P	8/15/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation regarding updates to outline of negotiation points, claims analysis and distribution waterfall (.3)	0.30	126.00
S	8/15/2013	Robert Franklin	Review Proofs of Claim of employees (2.0)	2.00	1,020.00
F	8/16/2013	Robert Franklin	Draft correspondence G. Felcyn regarding Stmt. of Financial Affairs & Schedules (.3)	0.30	153.00
Kb	8/16/2013	John Murray	Review further correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding requests of settlement subcommittee, correspondence to subcommittee regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
Kb	8/16/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding meeting of settlement subcommittee (.1); multiple correspondence to/from settlement subcommittee regarding same and commence preparation of response to S. Anhalt (.7); correspondence to/from S. Kim regarding same (.1); correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding meeting of subcommittee, correspondence to subcommittee regarding same (.2)	1.10	737.00

Kb	8/16/2013	Thomas Hwang	Conferences J. Murray regarding settlement subcommittee (.1); investigation regarding same, regarding communications to S. Anhalt (.1); review correspondences S. Anhalt regarding potential settlement (.1)	0.30	126.00
M	8/16/2013	John Murray	Prepare for conference call with J. Montali regarding mediation, draft outline of issues, and correspondence to committee regarding same (2.0); multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris and T. Tran regarding call in number for conference call with J. Montali regarding mediation (.1)	2.10	1,407.00
M	8/16/2013	John Murray	Review comments from R. Franklin regarding issues to discuss with J. Montali (.2); review correspondence from M. Brown regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
M	8/16/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding call today regarding mediation (.1); review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding same (.1); attend mediation planning session with J. Montali (.5); correspondence to/from settlement subcommittee regarding availability for mediation, correspondence to H. Binder and R. Harris regarding same (.1)	0.80	536.00
Na	8/16/2013	Robert Franklin	Review materials from G. Felcyn and D. Wright regarding settlement negotiation with Debtor (.3); attend Committee call regarding same (1.7)	2.00	1,020.00
P	8/16/2013	John Murray	Review earlier correspondence to committee regarding terms insisted by committee in Debtor's Plan of Reorganization (.4)	0.40	268.00
P	8/16/2013	John Murray	Attend committee conference call regarding negotiations with Debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (1.7)	1.70	1,139.00
P	8/16/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding proposal to debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization and multiple responses from committee members (.2)	0.20	134.00
S	8/16/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding Leckrone's children's claims (.1)	0.10	67.00
Kb	8/17/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with settlement subcommittee and debtor's representatives regarding settlement and license agreement with Kyocera (.9); correspondence to D. Leckrone regarding same (.3)	1.20	804.00
Bc	8/19/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft minutes for August 13 Committee meeting (.3)	0.30	126.00
Ec	8/19/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding debtor's Applications for Employment of Counsel regarding Alliacense lawyers and Nevada counsel, correspondence to H. Binder regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
G	8/19/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding debtor's production of Alliacense documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
Kb	8/19/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from P. Marcoux, G. Felcyn, C. Johnson and D. Wright regarding Kyocera license (.1); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.1); review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding correspondence regarding Kyocera consent, multiple correspondence to C. Cavazos regarding same (.2)	0.40	268.00
M	8/19/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding mediation date (.1); correspondence to settlement subcommittee regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
P	8/19/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to committee summarizing committee's position regarding debtor's Plan of Reorganization (2.7); review, analysis and evaluation regarding D. Wright's correspondence regarding on-going strategy regarding negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (.2); review, analysis and evaluation correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding plan provisions, correspondence to committee regarding same (.3)	3.20	2,144.00
P	8/19/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation and analysis claims matrices and correspondences S. Anhalt, G. Felcyn regarding same, regarding Plan of Reorganization and subordination issues (.3); review memorandum J. Murray regarding outline of Committee's position on plan issues; memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.40	168.00
S	8/19/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding claims matrix (.2)	0.20	134.00

S	8/19/2013	Robert Franklin	Review claims matrix prepared by Debtor and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.9)	0.90	459.00
U	8/19/2013	Robert Franklin	Legal research regarding Sec. 510(b) (1.0)	1.00	510.00
Bc	8/20/2013	Thomas Hwang	Prepare minutes from August 13 Committee meeting (3.7)	3.70	1,554.00
Ec	8/20/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding Applications for Employment of Counsel for Alliacense lawyers representing TPL in the US PTO, Nevada attorneys representing TPL in its efforts to seek third party discovery against GreenArrays in the Moore v. TPL litigation, correspondence to H. Binder regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
G	8/20/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to P. Califano regarding production of Alliance documents (.1); review multiple correspondence to/from P. Marcoux, G. Felcyn and S. Kim regarding flow of funds regarding Dell License and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.30	201.00
G	8/20/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence P. Marcoux regarding Alliacense payments on Dell License (.2); review Alliacense Services Agreement and notes of explanation of compensation and correspondence with P. Marcoux regarding same (.6)	0.80	408.00
Kb	8/20/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding Kyrocera license agreement and miscellaneous regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
L	8/20/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Harris regarding October carve out (.1)	0.10	67.00
M	8/20/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with H. Binder regarding mediation and status of negotiations (.6); multiple correspondence to/from J. Montali regarding same (.2); correspondence to/from settlement subcommittee (.1)	0.90	603.00
P	8/20/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to committee regarding committee conference call regarding debtor Plan of Reorganization(.1); review correspondence from M. Brown regarding outline of committee's position on issues regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1); review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding committee meeting, correspondence to committee regarding same (.1); review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding same (.1)	0.40	268.00
U	8/20/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding treatment of 13%ers (.1); review correspondence to/from G. Felcyn and S. Anhalt regarding subordination of claims, etc., review multiple correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same, correspondence to/from C. Brown regarding same (.2)	0.30	201.00
U	8/20/2013	Robert Franklin	Legal research regarding subordination under Sec. 510(b) (2.0)	2.00	1,020.00
Bc	8/21/2013	Thomas Hwang	Prepare minutes from August 13 Committee meeting (1.5); memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	1.60	672.00
F	8/21/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review Monthly Operating Report and Amended Monthly Operating Report (.2); correspondences Committee regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
M	8/21/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding mediation dates (.1); correspondence to/from J. Montali regarding mediation (.1); review correspondence from H. Binder regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
P	8/21/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding summary of debtor's position regarding debtor's Plan of Reorganization (.1); review correspondence from D. Wright regarding need for committee meeting (.1)	0.20	134.00
U	8/21/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding analysis of 13%ers claims (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ec	8/22/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from S. Kim and G. Felcyn regarding debtor's application to engage special counsel and need to obtain court authority to engage Alliacense's counsel (.2)	0.20	134.00
Ec	8/22/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences G. Felcyn, S. Kim, J. Murray regarding Alliacense and employment of professionals (.1)	0.10	42.00

F	8/22/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation correspondence G. Felcyn regarding Monthly Operating Report; review correspondences B. Franklin, S. Anhalt, R. Harris, P. Califano regarding document requests and Alliacense (.1)	0.10	42.00
G	8/22/2013	Robert Franklin	Review Alliacense Services Agreement and draft correspondence requesting further information and documents from TPL (.7); review correspondence R. Harris and S. Anhalt regarding same (.1); correspondence with P. Califano regarding Alliacense documents (.1)	0.90	459.00
P	8/22/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to D. Wright and G. Felcyn regarding status of draft communication to debtor regarding committee's position regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	67.00
U	8/22/2013	Robert Franklin	Draft memorandum regarding 13%ers claims (3.5)	3.50	1,785.00
Bc	8/23/2013	Thomas Hwang	Prepare minutes regarding August 16 meeting (3.8)	3.80	1,596.00
G	8/23/2013	Robert Franklin	Detailed telephone conference with S. Anhalt regarding document production request (.5)	0.50	255.00
U	8/23/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and revise memorandum on subordination issues (4.0)	4.00	2,040.00
Bc	8/24/2013	Thomas Hwang	Prepare minutes regarding August 16 meeting (.5)	0.50	210.00
F	8/25/2013	Thomas Hwang	Investigation regarding Monthly Operating Reports of Debtor and amended reports, regarding Court docket; review June and July Monthly Operating Reports (.2); review and respond correspondence G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
Bc	8/26/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding minutes of last 2 meetings, and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
F	8/26/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding Debtor's Monthly Operating Reports (.2)	0.20	134.00
Ga	8/26/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from debtor's counsel requesting NDAs, settlement regarding same, and correspondence to/from C. Cavazos regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Kb	8/26/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from debtor and committee regarding meeting of settlement subcommittee (.4)	0.40	268.00
Kb	8/26/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding meeting of settlement subcommittee (.1)	0.10	67.00
U	8/26/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and revise memorandum regarding subordination of claims (5.5)	5.50	2,805.00
G	8/27/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Califano regarding production of documents regarding Alliacense (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bc	8/28/2013	Thomas Hwang	Prepare meeting minutes from August 16 meeting (.4)	0.40	168.00
D	8/28/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence M. Ralston regarding case status inquiries and memorandum J. Murray regarding same; investigation regarding creditor Shore Chan (.2)	0.20	84.00
Ec	8/28/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation and analysis employment application and related documents regarding E. Heller (.4); memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.7)	1.10	462.00
Ec	8/28/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation and analysis Henneman employment application and related documents (.3); memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.3)	0.60	252.00
P	8/28/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from M. Brown regarding status of settlement sub-committee and next committee meeting (.1); correspondence to D. Wright regarding status of communication to debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1); correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding status of settlement sub-committee and next committee meeting (.1); multiple correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding communications to debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.50	335.00
S	8/28/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and analysis statement of GreenArrays and Proof of Claim of GreenArrays, and memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same, regarding assignment of patents (.4)	0.40	168.00



Ba	8/29/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from M. Brown regarding committee review of committee meeting minutes and correspondence to team regarding same (.1); review multiple correspondence from committee members regarding same (.1); correspondence to T. Hwang regarding review of committee meeting minutes and preparation of action item memorandum (.1); review correspondence to committee regarding same (.1)	0.40	268.00
Bb	8/29/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding fewer committee meetings (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bc	8/29/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences G. Felcyn, M. Brown, P. Marcoux, and revise Minutes from prior meetings (.3); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1); draft minutes for August 16 meeting (3.4)	3.80	1,596.00
D	8/29/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding inquiry from M. Ralston regarding status of case (.1); legal research regarding same (.2); multiple correspondence to/from debtor's camp regarding same (.1)	0.40	268.00
D	8/29/2013	Thomas Hwang	Memorandum J. Murray regarding inquiry from M. Ralston, regarding creditor Shore Chan (.1); draft correspondence M. Ralston regarding case status, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.3); conference with J. Murray regarding same; memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1); review correspondence H. Binder regarding same; review Court Order regarding sec. 1102(b)(3) (.1); respond correspondence M. Ralston regarding case status (.1)	0.70	294.00
G	8/29/2013	Robert Franklin	Correspondence G. Felcyn regarding Alliacense financial statements (.1)	0.10	51.00
G	8/29/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences P. Califano and R. Franklin regarding production of documents from Alliacense (.1)	0.10	42.00
P	8/29/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from D. Wright regarding status of negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization, correspondence to committee regarding same; review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
U	8/29/2013	Robert Franklin	Revise and finalize memorandum regarding subordination issues (3.3)	3.30	1,683.00
U	8/29/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review memorandum R. Franklin regarding claims subordination issues (.1)	0.10	42.00
A	8/30/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding action items of all parties, pending hearings and case matters (2.0)	2.00	840.00
Bc	8/30/2013	Thomas Hwang	Continue preparation of minutes for August 16 meeting (.9); review correspondence M. Brown regarding minutes and revise minutes for July 25 meeting (.2); review correspondence G. Felcyn regarding meeting minutes and correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	1.20	504.00
P	8/30/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding status of negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (.5)	0.50	335.00
U	8/30/2013	Robert Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding subordination and interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same (.2); review memorandum regarding action items and respond to same (.3)	0.50	255.00
Bc	9/1/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and respond correspondence M. Brown regarding meeting Minutes, and revise Minutes for August 16 meeting; correspondence Committee regarding same (.2)	0.20	84.00
Ba	9/3/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from committee members regarding approval of minutes (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ba	9/3/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items	0.10	42.00
Ec	9/3/2013	John Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding debtor's Applications to employ Henneman & Associates and E. Heller, multiple correspondence to committee regarding same, interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding objection to applications, correspondence to committee regarding same, correspondence to H. Binder and R. Harris same, interoffice conference C. Cavazos regarding same, multiple correspondence to/from S. Kim regarding GreenArrays (1.7)	1.70	1,139.00

Ec	9/3/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting J. Murray regarding Debtor's employment applications, regarding E. Heller and Henneman and Associates (.1); analysis and evaluation, and legal research regarding same (1.8); draft Opposition regarding same (5.3); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	7.30	3,066.00
G	9/3/2013	Robert Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding status of document requests (.2)	0.20	102.00
Kb	9/3/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding disposition of Amazon settlement funds (.1)	0.10	67.00
Kb	9/3/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding conference call with settlement subcommittee regarding Amazon and correspondence to/from subcommittee regarding same (.1); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.1); prepare for conference call with debtor regarding Amazon settlement (.2); correspondence to sub committee regarding post-meeting call (.1); attend conference call with subcommittee and debtor regarding settlement with Amazon (.4); telephone conference with subcommittee regarding same (.2); multiple correspondence to/from debtor regarding extent of proposed license (.2); review correspondence from K. Beresford regarding same (.1); review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding Amazon and correspondence to subcommittee regarding same (.1); commence preparation of correspondence to D. Leckrone regarding subcommittee's approval of Amazon settlement (.2)	1.70	1,139.00
A	9/4/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence J. Murray regarding case status and action items, and evaluation Meeting minutes regarding same (.3); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.2); conference with J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.60	252.00
Ec	9/4/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from S. Kim regarding debtor's employment applications (.1); correspondence to/S. Kim regarding GreenArrays (.1)	0.20	134.00
Ec	9/4/2013	John Murray	Review and revise objection to debtor's applications to employ special counsel (.6); interoffice conference with T. Hwang regarding same (.1); review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding same (.1)	0.80	536.00
Ec	9/4/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to T. Hwang regarding communicating with court regarding filing objection to debtor's applications to employ special counsel (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ec	9/4/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and revise Opposition to application to employ attorney Heller (.6)	0.60	306.00
Ec	9/4/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review comments from R. Franklin, P. Marcoux, J. Murray, S. Kim, M. Brown, and G. Kaplan, and revise Limited Opposition regarding employment applications for E. Heller and Henneman and Associates (2.7); legal research regarding same (.6); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1); meetings J. Murray regarding same (.1); correspondence T. Bracegirdle regarding same (.1)	3.60	1,512.00
G	9/4/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Califano regarding production of documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	9/4/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from committee and debtor regarding Alliacense production of documents, analysis and evaluation regarding strategy regarding same, review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
G	9/4/2013	Robert Franklin	Correspondence P. Califano regarding Alliacense response to discovery requests (.2)	0.20	102.00
I	9/4/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with L. Stenfeldt regarding client interest in patents (.2)	0.20	134.00
Kb	9/4/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding a meeting with the settlement subcommittee (.1); multiple correspondence to/from the settlement subcommittee regarding same, correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.2); multiple correspondence to/from J. Otteson regarding same (.1); correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding same (.1); review correspondence from R. Harris regarding same (.1); correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding whether subcommittee can act with two members, and multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.3)	0.90	603.00

Kb	9/4/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from K. Beresford regarding communications with debtor regarding Amazon (.2); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding Amazon, review correspondence from M. Brown regarding same, correspondence to F. Felcyn regarding same (.1); correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding same (.1)	0.40	268.00
Kb	9/4/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding her questions / concerns regarding Amazon proposal, review correspondence from C. Johnson regarding same (.1); review correspondence from K. Beresford to debtor regarding same (.1); review correspondence between K. Beresford and S. Anhalt regarding Amazon proposal, and attachment, and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2); review correspondence from M. Brown regarding same (.1)	0.50	335.00
Kb	9/4/2013	Robert Franklin	Review Bylaws and settlement protocol order regarding procedures to obtain Creditor Committee approval (.3)	0.30	153.00
Kb	9/4/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence J. Murray and R. Harris regarding potential settlement, regarding settlement subcommittee (.1); evaluation order regarding settlement procedures and Committee bylaws (.2); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.40	168.00
L	9/4/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding payment of September carve out (.1)	0.10	67.00
P	9/4/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to committee regarding meeting regarding debtor Plan of Reorganization (.1); multiple correspondence to/from committee members regarding same (.2); draft correspondence to D. Wright and G. Felcyn regarding negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (1.1); review minutes of committee meeting regarding same (.2); multiple correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding same (.2); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	1.90	1,273.00
Bb	9/5/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to committee regarding committee meeting and agenda (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bb	9/5/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences J. Murray, P. Marcoux regarding case status and strategy, regarding scheduling; memorandum J. Murray regarding same review correspondence R. Franklin regarding license and demand for documents	0.10	42.00
Ec	9/5/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from P. Macroux regarding further objection to debtor's employment applications (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ec	9/5/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from K. Beresford regarding debtor's employment applications and correspondence to committee regarding same (.1); review multiple correspondence from committee members regarding committee's objection to debtor's employment applications; level of professional fees in the case, and correspondence to committee regarding same (.8); review correspondence from S. Kim regarding same, review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding same, review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.2); review correspondence from court clerk regarding same (.1); review correspondence to committee regarding same and correspondence to committee regarding same (.1)	1.30	871.00
Ec	9/5/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence Committee members regarding employment application of Heller (.3)	0.30	153.00
Ec	9/5/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences G. Felcyn, K. Beresford, S. Kim, G. Kaplan, J. Murray regarding Debtor's employment motions (.1); prepare redline to Committee limited opposition and correspondence Committee regarding same (.2); review and respond correspondences T. Bracegirdle regarding same (.2)	0.50	210.00
G	9/5/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from committee regarding the Dell license (.1); review multiple correspondence to/from debtor regarding delivery of Kyocera license (.1); review correspondence to/from G. Felcyn, review correspondence S. Anhalt regarding production of documents re Alliacense (.2)	0.40	268.00



G	9/5/2013	Robert Franklin	Correspondence S. Anhalt regarding production of documents(.2); correspondence with P. Marcoux regarding production of licences (.1);	0.30	153.00
Kb	9/5/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from K. Beresford, G. Felcyn and M. Brown regarding regarding Amazon (.1); review correspondence from K. Beresford regarding attendance at subcommittee conference call (.1); review debtor's slides regarding settlements with Acer and Amazon (.2); conference call with debtor and settlement subcommittee regarding Amazon and Acer settlements (.7); conference call settlement subcommittee regarding same, and correspondence to/from K. Beresford regarding same (.3); telephone conference with H. Binder regarding same (.3); telephone conference with S. Anhalt regarding same (.2); multiple correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding same (.2); correspondence to committee regarding committee conference call (.1)	2.20	1,474.00
P	9/5/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (.3)	0.30	201.00
Bb	9/6/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding list of TPL related entities (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	9/6/2013	John Murray	Review ITC ruling, analysis and evaluation regarding same, and multiple correspondence to/from committee regarding same (.4)	0.40	268.00
Bb	9/6/2013	Robert Franklin	Review ITC ruling and correspondence among Committee members (.3); correspondence Committee regarding same (.2)	0.50	255.00
Bb	9/6/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review ruling from ITC, and review correspondences S. Kim, C. Johnson regarding same; meeting R. Franklin regarding same	0.20	84.00
Bc	9/6/2013	Thomas Hwang	Prepare meeting minutes for September 6 meeting (3.3)	3.30	1,386.00
C	9/6/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding contact with members of the committee (.2); correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
C	9/6/2013	Robert Franklin	Correspondence R. Harris regarding ITC ruling (.1)	0.10	51.00
Ec	9/6/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from S. Anhalt re conference call regarding debtor's employment of Nevada counsel (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	9/6/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding call with S. Anhalt regarding Patriot's and Moore's agreement to waive 2.5% advances they are entitle to under the Moore settlement agreement (.2); review correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding Alliacense (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding employee bonus compensation claims, and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2); review correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding the Alliacense Incentive Compensation Plan referred to in the employment contracts (.1)	0.60	402.00
G	9/6/2013	Robert Franklin	Review Felcyn memorandum regarding employment contracts and draft correspondence S. Anhalt regarding request for further documents (.8)	0.80	408.00
G	9/6/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences S. Anhalt regarding Alliacense; evaluation regarding Alliacense employee billing information	0.20	84.00
Kb	9/6/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence J. Murray to S. Anhalt regarding contacts with subcommittee, regarding Green Arrays issue; memorandum J. Murray regarding same	0.10	42.00
M	9/6/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from S. Kim regarding mediation (.1)	0.10	67.00
M	9/6/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to H. Binder and J. Montali regarding mediation and the addition of additional committee members and invitations to potentially subordinated claimants (.2); correspondence to/from S. Kim regarding mediation session, review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00

P	9/6/2013	John Murray	Prepare for conference call with committee regarding negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization, objections to debtor's employment Applications, and strategy going forward (.1); attend committee conference call regarding negotiations with Debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (1.5); interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	1.80	1,206.00
P	9/6/2013	Robert Franklin	Review materials circulated by G. Felcyn regarding negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (.4); attend Committee meeting regarding same (1.5)	1.90	969.00
P	9/6/2013	Thomas Hwang	Committee meeting regarding debtor Plan of Reorganization (1.6); review correspondences and documents from G. Felcyn regarding same, regarding negotiations with Debtor (.2)	1.80	756.00
Pa	9/6/2013	John Murray	Review court docket regarding court's dropping scheduled hearing regarding Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	9/6/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding chart summarizing status of claims (.2)	0.20	134.00
S	9/6/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation correspondence S. Kim regarding Browns claim, position for basis of claim	0.10	42.00
U	9/6/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding subordination of claims of 13%ers, correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding memorandum regarding subordination of claims of 13%ers (.2)	0.20	134.00
U	9/6/2013	Robert Franklin	Interoffice conference with J. Murray regarding action items and subordination issue (.2); correspondence S. Kim regarding Brown claim (.2); review and revise Memorandum (1.0)	1.40	714.00
C	9/7/2013	John Murray	Correspondence H. Binder and R. Harris regarding conference call with debtor and committee regarding ITC ruling (.1);	0.10	67.00
G	9/7/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence and document production from M. Leckrone regarding document requests, regarding Alliacense (.1)	0.10	42.00
Bc	9/8/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft meeting minutes for September 6 meeting	0.40	168.00
Ba	9/9/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items	0.10	42.00
Bb	9/9/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from M. Imhoff regarding unavailability for committee meetings and proxy to D. Wright (.1); correspondence to committee regarding next committee conference call (.1)	0.20	134.00
Bc	9/9/2013	John Murray	Review minutes of committee meeting and correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bc	9/9/2013	Thomas Hwang	Continue preparation of minutes from September 6 meeting (1.3); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	1.50	630.00
C	9/9/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding communications with S. Anhalt (.2)	0.20	134.00
C	9/9/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with S. Anhalt regarding email of Sept. 6 (.6); telephone conference with R. Harris regarding emails (.2); correspondence to H. Binder and R. Harris regarding same (.1)	0.90	603.00
Ec	9/9/2013	John Murray	Review voicemail from R. Harris regarding committee's objection to employment applications and correspondence to T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ec	9/9/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and revise draft of proposed Stipulation re employment application of Heller and interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same (.5)	0.50	255.00
Ec	9/9/2013	Thomas Hwang	Correspondence Committee regarding application for employment of counsel (.3); meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1) memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1); Franklin regarding same (.3); review Committee objections and memorandum R. Shakoori regarding Debtor proposal regarding same (.2); review and analysis correspondence conference with R. Harris regarding same (.1); telephone Shakoori regarding same (.2); memorandum J. Henneman (.1); telephone conference with R. Harris regarding employment applications of Heller and review correspondence R. Harris regarding same (1.4)	2.80	1,176.00

C	9/10/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from H. Binder regarding meeting with committee regarding ITC ruling, interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same and review correspondence to H. Binder regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
C	9/10/2013	Robert Franklin	Correspondence with H. Binder regarding presentation of ITC ruling (.1);	0.10	51.00
D	9/10/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with W. Tanoma regarding status of case and purchase of claims (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ec	9/10/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence form T. Hwang regarding committee objection to employment Applications (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ec	9/10/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from committee members regarding resolution of objection to debtor's employment applications (.1); correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding same, correspondence to committee regarding same (.2); review multiple correspondence to/from R. Shakoori regarding same (.2); review multiple correspondence from T. Hwang and committee members regarding resolution of objection to debtor's employment applications (.2); review correspondence from R. Harris regarding special setting application regarding debtor's employment applications, review pleading regarding same, review order regarding same (.2)	0.90	603.00
Ec	9/10/2013	Robert Franklin	Review responses to questions raised in Heller application (.3)	0.30	153.00
Ec	9/10/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences Committee members regarding Heller employment application, Debtor's proposal; correspondence Committee regarding same (.1); correspondence R. Shakoori regarding same (.3); review and edit to Application to continue hearing on same and Order regarding Application to continue and to specially set hearing (.3); correspondences R. Shakoori regarding same (.1); review Order regarding hearing on employment motions and review and respond correspondence R. Shakoori regarding same (.1); review correspondence R. Shakoori regarding same, regarding negotiation points (.1); correspondences Committee regarding same, regarding status of negotiations (.2)	1.20	504.00
F	9/10/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Shakoori regarding Attorneys fees and costs, correspondence to V. Chial regarding same, telephone conference with V. Chial regarding same, correspondence to T. Hwang regarding same, telephone conference with T. Hwang regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
F	9/10/2013	Thomas Hwang	Analysis and evaluation regarding Dorsey fees and costs per Debtor's request (.2); correspondence R. Shakoori regarding same (.2)	0.40	168.00
L	9/10/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to H. Binder regarding status of carve out payment (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	9/11/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding committee conference call with debtor regarding ITC ruling, review correspondence to H. Binder regarding same (.1); review correspondence to/from P. Marcoux regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
Bc	9/11/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence G. Felcyn regarding meeting minutes and revise same (.2); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
C	9/11/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding S. Anhalt contact with members of the committee (.2); correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.1); review correspondence from H. Binder regarding committee meeting, multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	0.50	335.00
C	9/11/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence J. Murray regarding Debtor's counsel's communications with Committee members; memorandum J. Murray regarding same	0.10	42.00
Ec	9/11/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and respond correspondence S. Kim regarding Debtor's employment applications, regarding Heller	0.10	42.00
J	9/11/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (1.2)	1.20	804.00

Bb	9/12/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to committee regarding committee meeting on September 13 (.2); interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same, correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same (.1); prepare agenda for committee conference call, prepare for call (.3)	0.60	402.00
Bb	9/12/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from M. Brown regarding committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	9/12/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence J. Murray regarding Committee meeting and agenda; memorandum J. Murray regarding meeting minutes	0.10	42.00
Bc	9/12/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding minutes of September 6th committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ec	9/12/2013	Thomas Hwang	Exchange correspondence R. Shakoori regarding employment of Heller and Henneman	0.10	42.00
U	9/12/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding legal research regarding subordination of 13%ers' claims, review memorandum regarding same, legal research regarding same, correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same, review correspondence from S. Kim regarding same (2.6)	2.60	1,742.00
U	9/12/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review memorandum and comments from J. Murray regarding subordination of claims issues	0.10	42.00
Bb	9/13/2013	John Murray	Conference call with committee and debtor regarding ITC ruling, conference call committee regarding same, etc. (1.5)	1.50	1,005.00
Ec	9/13/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from committee regarding objections to employment applications (.4)	0.40	268.00
Ec	9/13/2013	Robert Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding Heller application and request for information related thereto and draft correspondence R. Shakoori regarding same (.6)	0.60	306.00
Ec	9/13/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review comments from Committee meeting and memorandum to Committee regarding employment applications of Heller and Henneman, regarding issues and action items for Committee consideration (.4); review and respond correspondence R. Shakoori regarding same (.1); review and respond correspondence G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.60	252.00
G	9/13/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding document request (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	9/13/2013	Robert Franklin	Draft correspondence S. Anhalt regarding status of production of document request (.1)	0.10	51.00
L	9/13/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with R. Harris regarding cash collateral motion and exclusivity (.1)	0.10	67.00
P	9/13/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding status of negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization, review analysis regarding same, correspondence to D. Wright regarding same (.5)	0.50	335.00
P	9/13/2013	Robert Franklin	Prepare for and attend Committee meeting (2.5)	2.50	1,275.00
P	9/13/2013	Robert Franklin	Initial review of revised memorandum from D. Wright regarding status of negotiation of Plan of Reorganization (.3)	0.30	153.00
P	9/13/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence and memoranda from D. Wright regarding negotiations with Debtor, regarding Committee meeting (.1); Committee meeting (1.4); meeting R. Franklin, J. Murray regarding same (.1)	1.60	672.00
U	9/13/2013	John Murray	Conference R. Franklin regarding legal research regarding subordination of 13%ers (.5)	0.50	335.00
U	9/13/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and revise subordination memorandum (1.0)	1.00	510.00
Bb	9/15/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from C. Johnson regarding committee conference call (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bc	9/15/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft minutes for September 13 meeting (3.7); correspondence Committee regarding same; correspondence J. Murray regarding same (.1)	3.80	1,596.00
D	9/15/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from W. Tanona regarding purchase of claims and correspondence to committee regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ec	9/15/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding conference call to discuss employment Applications, cash collateral and status of September carve out payment (.1); review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding employment Applications (.2)	0.30	201.00

Ec	9/15/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review comments G. Kaplan regarding Debtor's employment of Heller and Henneman	0.10	42.00
L	9/15/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to H. Binder regarding September carve out payment (.1)	0.10	67.00
O	9/15/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Harris regarding Stipulation to extend the exclusivity period and status of payment of September carve out (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	9/16/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding attendance at committee meeting (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding Holland & Knight counsel (.1); review correspondence from S. Kim regarding patent ownership, review correspondence to committee regarding same, regarding multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding same, review multiple correspondence from R. Franklin regarding patent counsel analysis (.2)	0.40	268.00
Bb	9/16/2013	Robert Franklin	Prepare for Committee meeting (.3); attend Committee meeting (2.0)	2.30	1,173.00
Bc	9/16/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding minutes of September 13 committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bc	9/16/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from C. Cavazos regarding minutes of committee meetings (.1); correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding minutes of September 13th committee meeting (.1)	0.20	134.00
C	9/16/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with R. Harris regarding Stipulation to extend exclusivity, cash collateral, September carve out payment and employment applications, correspondence to R. Harris regarding carve out (.2); correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same (.1); interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.40	268.00
Ec	9/16/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to T. Hwang regarding communicating with R. Harris regarding employment Applications (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ec	9/16/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding objection to Heller / Henenman employment Applications (.1); review correspondence to committee regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
Ec	9/16/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence and voicemail message R. Harris, and correspondence J. Murray regarding employment of Heller and Henneman (.1); telephone conferences R. Harris regarding same (.3); review and respond correspondence R. Harris regarding same; meeting J. Murray regarding same (.1); prepare outline of issues regarding same and correspondence Committee regarding same (1.5)	2.00	840.00
G	9/16/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding calculation of employee incentive compensation claims and list of affiliate entities, multiple correspondence to committee regarding same (.2); review correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding Thunderbird Technologies agreement, correspondence to committee regarding same; review multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding same (.2); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding Alliacense contracts (.1)	0.50	335.00
G	9/16/2013	Robert Franklin	Review new documents produced by Debtor (.5); correspondence with S. Anhalt regarding same (.1); draft correspondence M. Leckrone regarding production of Alliacense documents (.1); correspondence with with Committee regarding developments, status and further requests for production of documents (.2); review agreement between Debtor and Thunderbird Technologies and multiple correspondence with S. Anhalt and G. Felcyn regarding same (.3)	1.20	612.00
L	9/16/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Harris regarding September carve out payment (.1)	0.10	67.00
O	9/16/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding motion to extend exclusivity and cash collateral (.1)	0.10	67.00
P	9/16/2013	John Murray	Prepare for committee conference call, review correspondence and attachments from D. Wright regarding status of negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (.5); attend same (2.0)	2.50	1,675.00
P	9/16/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding outline of status of negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization, review outline (.2)	0.20	134.00



P	9/16/2013	Robert Franklin	Correspondence and interoffice conference E. Bachand regarding consequences, if any, of proposal that plan agent be appointed to hold membership interest of Debtor LLC with the patent office (.3)	0.30	153.00
P	9/16/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence and documents from D. Wright regarding status of negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization, regarding Committee meeting (.1); attend Committee meeting (2.0)	2.10	882.00
U	9/16/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and revise memorandum to include discussion of classification issues and effect of subordination issue on same (2.8)	2.80	1,428.00
Ba	9/17/2013	Robert Franklin	Team meeting regarding status (.1)	0.10	51.00
Ba	9/17/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items (.1)	0.10	42.00
Bb	9/17/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding D. Leckrone compensation agreement (.1); review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding ITC rulings (.2)	0.30	201.00
Bb	9/17/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding D. Leckrone's motives in light of ITC ruling, correspondence to committee regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	9/17/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and respond to multiple correspondence G. Felcyn regarding D. Leckrone's claim and employment agreement (.6); correspondence with S. Kim regarding Assignment Agreement between Brown and TPL and analysis and evaluation regarding same in preparing for meeting (.3); correspondence B. Kirkendall regarding same (.1)	1.00	510.00
Bc	9/17/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft minutes from September 16 meeting	2.40	1,008.00
Ec	9/17/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review proposed stipulation and order, regarding continuation of hearings on Heller and Henneman employment applications (.3); finalize same; correspondence R. Shakoori regarding same (.2); review and respond correspondence T. Bracegirdle regarding hearing on employment motions (.1); review Order regarding same (.1)	0.70	294.00
J	9/17/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from B. Pionk regarding time summaries (.1); correspondence to H. Binder and R. Harris regarding interim Applications for Compensation (.1)	0.20	134.00
L	9/17/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with R. Harris regarding September carve out payment (.1)	0.10	67.00
Na	9/17/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding Brown's concern's regarding the negotiation process with the debtor and correspondence to committee regarding same (.1); review multiple correspondence to/from committee members regarding point person for negotiation with debtor, correspondence to committee regarding same (.2); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same and respond (2.0); correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.3)	2.60	1,742.00
P	9/17/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review multiple correspondences from Committee members regarding Committee strategy and negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (.2); memorandum J. Murray regarding response to same (.3); review memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1); investigation regarding same, regarding action items (.7)	1.30	546.00
U	9/17/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and revise subordination memorandum and include classification issues (2.5)	2.50	1,275.00
Bb	9/18/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation of correspondence to G. Felcyn regarding her correspondence of September 17 (.4); review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding same (.1); review correspondence from K. Beresford regarding emails and D. Wright's continued involvement (.1); correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding K. Beresford's email address (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding agenda item regarding payments by debtor to Alliacense, correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.80	536.00

Bb	9/18/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review outline of Committee issues and memorandum from J. Murray (.1); conference J. Murray regarding case status; review correspondence J. Murray regarding same (.1); review correspondences G. Kaplan, P. Marcoux, K. Beresford regarding case strategy (.1)	0.30	126.00
Bc	9/18/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft minutes from September 16 meeting (2.3); conference J. Murray regarding same; correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	2.40	1,008.00
Ec	9/18/2013	Thomas Hwang	Investigation regarding Alliacense and Heller invoices (.1)	0.10	42.00
G	9/18/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding payments to Alliacense by TPL and by PDS (.1); review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding Alliacense billings (.1)	0.20	134.00
G	9/18/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence G. Felcyn regarding Committee agenda items, Alliacense, and memorandum J. Murray regarding payments to and services of Alliacense (.3)	0.30	126.00
J	9/18/2013	John Murray	Analysis and evaluation August invoice and correspondence to committee regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
M	9/18/2013	John Murray	Miscellaneous regarding mediation brief; correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding mediation agreement (.2)	0.20	134.00
M	9/18/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to H. Binder regarding status of mediation confidentiality agreement (.1)	0.10	67.00
P	9/18/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding minutes of committee meeting of September 16 and chart of points of contention in negotiations with with debtor (.1); commence preparation of spreadsheet regarding status of negotiations with with debtor, correspondence to D. Wright And G. Felcyn regarding same (1.1); multiple correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding same (.1); review multiple correspondence to committee regarding minutes of committee meeting of September 16th (.1)	1.40	938.00
P	9/18/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from M. Brown regarding negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization and next committee conference call (.1)	0.10	67.00
U	9/18/2013	Robert Franklin	Prepare for and attend detailed telephone conference with B. Kirkendall regarding 13%er claim (.4); analysis and evaluation regarding same (.5); continued legal research regarding definition of "investment contract" (2.1);detailed telephone conference with S. Kim regarding Brown claim and insider 13%er claims (.5); continue preparation of memorandum (2.3)	5.80	2,958.00
Bb	9/19/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from committee members regarding availability to participate on committee conference call (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	9/19/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding Fast Logic documents (.1); review correspondence from M. Leckrone regarding production of documents , correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same, review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
L	9/19/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to H. Binder regarding status of payment of September carve out (.1)	0.10	67.00
P	9/19/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding summary of issues in negotiations with debtor, correspondence to T. Hwang regarding same (.2); telephone conference with D. Wright regarding same (.6); conference T. Hwang regarding modifications to issue summary pursuant to request of D. Wright (.1)	0.90	603.00
P	9/19/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding negotiations with debtor, correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
P	9/19/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences D. Wright, J. Murray regarding negotiation points with Debtor, case status (.1); meetings J. Murray regarding same (.1); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1); prepare outline chart regarding same (1.2); correspondences D. Wright regarding same (.1)	1.60	672.00
S	9/19/2013	John Murray	Interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding status of analysis of TPL employment contracts and statute of limitations (.1); correspondence to committee regarding next committee conference call (.1)	0.20	134.00

S	9/19/2013	John Murray	Review detailed correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding employee incentive compensation claims, review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding same, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
U	9/19/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding memorandum regarding subordination issues (.1)	0.10	67.00
U	9/19/2013	Robert Franklin	Continued legal research regarding "investment contract" (4.8); review and revise memorandum regarding subordination and classification issues (3.0)	7.80	3,978.00
U	9/19/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting R. Franklin regarding subordination and classification of claims issues	0.10	42.00
Bb	9/20/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from D. Wright and G. Felcyn regarding committee conference call (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bc	9/20/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and respond correspondence M. Imhof regarding September 16 minutes; correspondence Committee regarding same (.1); revise same (.1)	0.20	84.00
Bc	9/20/2013	Thomas Hwang	Prepare minutes for September 20 Committee meeting (.2)	0.20	84.00
G	9/20/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence M. Leckrone and financial documents produced by Alliacense (.1)	0.10	42.00
L	9/20/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding cash collateral budget and cash collateral hearing (.1)	0.10	67.00
M	9/20/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to H. Binder and R. Harris regarding mediation (.1)	0.10	67.00
M	9/20/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to H. Binder regarding postponement of mediation (.1)	0.10	67.00
Na	9/20/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence D. Wright regarding status of negotiation (.5); attend Committee meeting regarding status of negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (2.0)	2.50	1,275.00
Na	9/20/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence and documents from D. Wright regarding Committee negotiations with Debtor (.2); meeting J. Murray regarding same, regarding preparation for mediation (.1); attend Committee meeting regarding negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (2.0)	2.30	966.00
P	9/20/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from D. Wright regarding status of negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization with attachments (.5); attend conference call with committee regarding same (2.0)	2.50	1,675.00
P	9/20/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to committee regarding status of negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization, correspondence to committee regarding conference call regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	9/20/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence and memorandum from G. Felcyn regarding employment incentive contracts (.5)	0.50	255.00
U	9/20/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to committee regarding memorandum regarding subordination issues (.1)	0.10	67.00
U	9/20/2013	Robert Franklin	Legal research regarding subordination (.7)	0.70	357.00
Bc	9/21/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding committee minutes (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bc	9/21/2013	Thomas Hwang	Memorandum J. Murray regarding meeting minutes, regarding discussions regarding administrative costs (.2)	0.20	84.00
G	9/21/2013	Thomas Hwang	Investigation regarding Debtor's projections and financial information (.2)	0.20	84.00
L	9/21/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from team regarding cash collateral hearing (.1)	0.10	67.00
M	9/21/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to H. Binder and R. Harris regarding continuance of mediation (.1)	0.10	67.00
M	9/21/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding debtor's projections regarding mediation brief (.2)	0.20	134.00
M	9/21/2013	Thomas Hwang	Memorandum J. Murray regarding Debtors' projections and mediation statement (.2)	0.20	84.00
Ba	9/23/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items; meeting J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding mediation brief (.1)	0.10	42.00
Bc	9/23/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft meeting minutes for September 20 meeting (1.4)	1.40	588.00
F	9/23/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding debtor's Monthly Operating Report (.1)	0.10	67.00

F	9/23/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation regarding Debtor's Monthly Operating Report for August 2013, and memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.2); review and respond correspondence R. Franklin regarding same, regarding settlements by Debtor (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.40	168.00
G	9/23/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding S. Kim letter regarding debtor's conduct (.1)	0.10	67.00
L	9/23/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Harris regarding payment of September carve out, review debtor's Monthly Operating Report regarding cash balance, and review cash collateral order (.3); correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding next cash collateral hearing (.1)	0.40	268.00
M	9/23/2013	John Murray	Commence preparation of settlement conference brief (4.3); multiple correspondence to/from team regarding same (.5); review correspondence from H. Binder regarding settlement conference confidentiality agreement, review and revise same, and multiple conferences and correspondence with R. Franklin regarding same (.5); correspondence to/from S. Kim regarding same (.1); review correspondence to H. Binder regarding same (.1)	5.50	3,685.00
M	9/23/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding mediation brief, feasibility of debtor's Plan of Reorganization and forecasts (.2)	0.20	134.00
M	9/23/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from committee regarding mediation confidentiality agreement (.1); multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding committee's mediation brief (.2); multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding debtor's mediation brief and debtor's Monthly Operating Report (.2)	0.50	335.00
M	9/23/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and revise confidentiality agreement for use at mediation (.3); review and respond to correspondence H. Binder regarding same (.2); review schedules and draft insert for mediation brief (1.5)	2.00	1,020.00
Pa	9/23/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding debtor's forecasts (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	9/23/2013	Thomas Hwang	Investigation regarding priority claims; review claims matrix regarding same; review memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	0.20	84.00
U	9/23/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation of memorandum regarding subordination (5.0); Review revisions to memorandum regarding subordination and interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same (.7)	5.70	3,819.00
U	9/23/2013	Robert Franklin	Review comments from J. Murray and review and revise memorandum regarding subordination (3.2)	3.20	1,632.00
U	9/23/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review memoranda R. Franklin and J. Murray regarding issues of classification and subordination, regarding debtor's treatment of 13% claims (.2)	0.20	84.00
Bc	9/24/2013	Thomas Hwang	Prepare minutes for September 20 meeting	2.10	882.00
G	9/24/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from M. Leckrone regarding production of documents regarding Allicense (.1)	0.10	67.00

M	9/24/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from committee regarding mediation brief (.2); continue preparation of mediation brief and correspondence to committee regarding same (1.0); correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.1); review correspondence from S. Kim regarding mediation brief (.2); correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding mediation brief, review correspondence from S. Kim regarding same, correspondence to committee regarding same (.2); review multiple correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding mediation confidentiality agreement, review same, multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same, correspondence to/from M. Brown regarding same, review revisions to same; review multiple correspondence to H. Binder regarding same (.3); multiple telephone conferences with D. Wright regarding mediation brief, mediation session and participants (.2); interoffice conference R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding minutes of committee meeting regarding participants in mediation session, regarding minutes regarding same, correspondence to D. Wright regarding same (.2); interoffice conference R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding mediation brief, mediation session and employee compensation analysis (.2); continue preparation of mediation brief (1.6)	4.20	2,814.00
M	9/24/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding mediation brief (.1)	0.10	67.00
M	9/24/2013	Robert Franklin	Interoffice conference T. Hwang and J. Murray regarding mediation brief and action items (.2); correspondence to and from H. Binder and Committee regarding execution of confidentiality agreement (.2)	0.40	204.00
M	9/24/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences J. Murray and Committee members regarding mediation brief (.2); evaluation regarding same and provide comments and revisions to same (3.7); memoranda J. Murray regarding same (.1); meetings J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	4.20	1,764.00
O	9/24/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from R. Penhallegon regarding Stipulation to extend exclusivity (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	9/24/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding G. Felcyn's analysis of employee compensation claims, interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same (.2); review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding analysis and evaluation of employee compensation agreements and correspondence to T. Hwang regarding same (.3)	0.50	335.00
S	9/24/2013	Robert Franklin	Draft correspondence and review materials to T. Hwang regarding analysis of employee incentive compensation claims (.7)	0.70	357.00
S	9/24/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation memoranda from R. Franklin, G. Felcyn regarding investigation into employee compensation claims	0.20	84.00
U	9/24/2013	John Murray	Review, analysis and evaluation correspondence from R. Franklin regarding memorandum regarding subordination of claims (.2); interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	0.40	268.00
U	9/24/2013	John Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding correspondence from R. Franklin regarding memorandum regarding subordination issues (.1)	0.10	67.00
U	9/24/2013	Robert Franklin	Further legal research and revision of subordination and classification memorandum (9.0)	9.00	4,590.00
U	9/24/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review memoranda R. Franklin regarding issues of classification and subordination	0.10	42.00
Bc	9/25/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding minutes of September 16th committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bc	9/25/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding minutes of September 16 and 20 committee meetings (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bc	9/25/2013	Thomas Hwang	Prepare minutes for September 20 meeting (1.9); revise minutes for September 16 meeting (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	2.10	882.00



M	9/25/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux and M. Imhoff regarding revisions to mediation brief (.1); revise mediation brief and correspondence to committee regarding same (.8); miscellaneous regarding logistics of service and filing of mediation brief, interoffice conference C. Cavazos regarding same, correspondence to H. Binder and R. Harris regarding same (.7); multiple correspondence to/from correspondence to committee regarding mediation, Confidentiality Agreement, and attendance at mediation, correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same (.5); correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding mediation confidentiality agreement, correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding same, review correspondence from D. Wright regarding same (.2); review correspondence from K. Beresford regarding mediation brief and correspondence to committee regarding same, review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.2); review correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding mediation brief, multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same, revise brief regarding same, multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding same (.5); miscellaneous regarding mediation action items (.2); correspondence to committee regarding cut off for comments on mediation brief (.1); review multiple correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding revisions to mediation brief, review same (.4); review correspondence from B. Kirkendall regarding participants at mediation, review multiple correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding same, review correspondence from C. Johnson regarding same (.2); telephone conference with D. Wright regarding mediation strategy, participants and negotiations with prior to mediation (.3); review multiple correspondence from H. Binder	5.50	3,685.00
M	9/25/2013	John Murray	Monitor committee regarding signatures on mediation confidentiality agreement (.1)	0.10	67.00
M	9/25/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and revise mediation brief (.3); review Debtor's mediation brief (.6); detailed telephone conference Randy Michelson regarding attendance at mediation (.2); interoffice conference J. Murray regarding same (.1)	1.20	612.00
M	9/25/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences G. Felcyn, G. Kaplan and J. Murray regarding mediation brief and investigation regarding same, regarding employment compensation claims (.2); memoranda J. Murray regarding same (.2); revise mediation brief (1.3); memoranda J. Murray regarding same, regarding assumed contracts (.3); review Debtor's mediation brief (.2)	2.20	924.00
O	9/25/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding inquiries from debtor's counsel regarding exclusivity Stipulation (.1); multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding exclusivity Stipulation (.2); review Stipulation and Order regarding same (.2)	0.50	335.00
O	9/25/2013	Thomas Hwang	Memoranda J. Murray regarding Debtor's motion to extend plan exclusivity	0.10	42.00
S	9/25/2013	Thomas Hwang	Investigation regarding claims matrix and Debtor's characterization of claims and amounts, and memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.4)	0.40	168.00
S	9/25/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation memoranda G. Felcyn regarding investigation into employee compensation claims (.2)	0.20	84.00
M	9/26/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from committee members regarding mediation confidentiality agreement (.1); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding circulation of mediation brief to committee, review correspondence to committee regarding same (.1); review multiple correspondence from D. Wright regarding mediation and planning schedule, correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding same, review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding same (.2)	0.40	268.00
O	9/26/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Harris regarding Stipulation to extend exclusivity, review correspondence to E. Keller regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00

P	9/26/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence D. Wright regarding status of negotiations; review correspondence J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
S	9/26/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to T. Hwang regarding status of analysis of employee incentive compensation claims (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	9/26/2013	Thomas Hwang	Analysis and evaluation of employee claims; review Debtor's documents regarding same, and legal research regarding same (4.1); draft memorandum regarding same (2.8); meetings R. Franklin regarding same (.3); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1); review memorandum R. Franklin regarding same, regarding subordination (.1)	7.40	3,108.00
U	9/26/2013	Robert Franklin	Legal research regarding equitable subordination of insider claims, review employment agreements and draft insert for memorandum regarding employee compensation claims (5.0); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same (.3); detailed telephone conference D. Wright regarding same (.2)	5.50	2,805.00
M	9/27/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding committee's mediation brief, correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same, review correspondence to committee regarding same (.1); analysis and evaluation debtor's mediation brief regarding subordination of claims of 13%ers (.2)	0.30	201.00
M	9/27/2013	Robert Franklin	Detailed telephone conference D. Wright regarding mediation (.2)	0.20	102.00
M	9/27/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences G. Kaplan regarding mediation brief, J. Murray and P. Marcoux regarding insider claims (.1); correspondence Committee regarding mediation brief (.1)	0.20	84.00
S	9/27/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding employee incentive program (.1); correspondence to/from Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
S	9/27/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding status of memorandum regarding employee incentive claims (.1); correspondence to G. Felcyn regarding analysis of employee incentive compensation claims, multiple correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding same (.2)	0.30	201.00
S	9/27/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and revise memorandum regarding potential objections to Employee Compensation Claims (2.2)	2.20	1,122.00
S	9/27/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation of employee claims and revise, finalize memorandum regarding same (.6); memoranda R. Franklin regarding same (.8); review correspondences J. Murray, G. Felcyn regarding same and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	1.50	630.00
U	9/27/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation of of memorandum regarding subordination of claims of 13%ers (1.2); correspondence to committee regarding same (.3)	1.50	1,005.00
U	9/27/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding memorandum regarding 13%ers subordination issues and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
G	9/28/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris, P. Califano and R. Franklin regarding Alliacense production of documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	9/28/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences R. Franklin, P. Califano, R. Harris regarding Alliacense and production of documents, regarding employee claims	0.10	42.00
A	9/30/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from team regarding Chapter 11 Status Conference; review court docket and calendar regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bc	9/30/2013	Thomas Hwang	Revise September 20 meeting minutes (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same, and exchange correspondences S. Kim regarding same (.1)	0.20	84.00
G	9/30/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and respond to correspondence S. Anhalt regarding production of documents (.7); analysis and evaluation regarding connection between Alliacense and TPL (.6)	1.30	663.00
M	9/30/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from J. Montali regarding client participation in mediation, review correspondence from H. Binder regarding same, correspondence to committee regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00

M	9/30/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding mediation schedule (.1)	0.10	67.00
M	9/30/2013	Robert Franklin	Detailed telephone conference D. Wright regarding mediation (.3); review correspondence and draft response to S. Anhalt regarding statement in mediation statement (.5)	0.80	408.00
M	9/30/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review Debtor's status conference statement (.1); review correspondences J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same; memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.20	84.00
S	9/30/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding employee incentive compensation claims, correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
S	9/30/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding employee incentive compensation agreements, correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	9/30/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence regarding Felcyn's analysis of compensation claims (.4); review Mac Leckrone Proof of Claim and draft response to S. Kim regarding basis of claim (.7)	1.10	561.00
S	9/30/2013	Thomas Hwang	Analysis and evaluation correspondences from S. Anhalt and R. Franklin regarding employee claims and Alliacense documents, and Alliacense incentive program document, and memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.4); review correspondences J. Murray, R. Franklin and G. Felcyn regarding analysis of employee compensation claims and investigation regarding same (.2); review correspondence S. Kim and J. Murray regarding M. Leckrone claim and review memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1); investigation regarding same and memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.80	336.00
Bb	10/1/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding HTC trial and distribution from PDS (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	10/1/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from M. Brown regarding attendance at committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bc	10/1/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding minutes of September 20 meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	10/1/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding Allicensce claim and Alliacense incentive program, correspondence to committee regarding same, review correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding same, review multiple correspondence from T. Hwang regarding same, correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
G	10/1/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding memorandum regarding employee incentive claims (.1); review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding M. Leckrone's incentive compensation agreement (.1)	0.20	134.00
G	10/1/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding Alliance consulting agreement, etc. (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	10/1/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence S. Anhalt regarding production of documents relating to employment agreements (.2)	0.20	102.00
M	10/1/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from H. Binder, S. Kim, R. Michaelson, J. Montali regarding mediation (.2)	0.20	134.00
M	10/1/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence R. Michelson to Judge Montali and emails H. Binder and R. Michelson regarding same (.4)	0.40	204.00
Na	10/1/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to committee regarding committee meeting regarding negotiations with Debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	67.00
O	10/1/2013	John Murray	Review entered order extending exclusivity (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	10/1/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding employee incentive compensation claims (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	10/1/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to committee regarding correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding analysis of employee incentive compensation claims, review same (.2)	0.20	134.00
S	10/1/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and analysis correspondence and documents from S. Anhalt regarding employee claims	0.10	42.00
Bb	10/2/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from committee members regarding next committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00

G	10/2/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding Alliacense documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	10/2/2013	Robert Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding alter ego claims and substantive consolidation (.5)	0.50	255.00
G	10/2/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and legal research regarding alter ego theory and memorandum regarding same (.4); review correspondence from J. Murray and memorandum from G. Kaplan regarding same (.2)	0.60	252.00
L	10/2/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding cash collateral budget and hearing (.1)	0.10	67.00
M	10/2/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from H. Binder regarding mediation, investigation regarding same, multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same, interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same, review correspondence from R. Michelson regarding same, review correspondence from J. Montali regarding same, multiple telephone conferences with S. Kim regarding same, correspondence to committee regarding same (.5); telephone conference with H. Binder regarding same (.5); review correspondence from S. Kim regarding Debtor's mediation brief (.2); review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding correspondence from D. Montali regarding mediation regarding Ahcom v. Smeeding, correspondence to committee regarding same in light of calls for consolidation of debtor and Alliacense (.2); telephone conference with D. Wright regarding status of mediation (.1)	1.50	1,005.00
M	10/2/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from B. Kirkendall regarding mediation (.1); regarding correspondence from S. Kim regarding debtor's statements in mediation brief and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2); review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding mediation (.1)	0.40	268.00
M	10/2/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from H. Binder, R. Michaelson and J. Montali regarding mediation (.2)	0.20	134.00
M	10/2/2013	Robert Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding Brown submission to settlement conference Judge (.4)	0.40	204.00
M	10/2/2013	Robert Franklin	Finalize correspondence S. Anhalt regarding statements in mediation brief (.4)	0.40	204.00
M	10/2/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences H. Binder and J. Murray regarding mediation, communication from C. Brown and M. Brown, and memoranda regarding same; review meeting minutes regarding same (.3)	0.30	126.00
M	10/2/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences P. Marcoux and B. Kirkendall regarding same, regarding mediation (.1); review memorandum from S. Kim regarding Debtor's mediation brief (.1)	0.20	84.00
S	10/2/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding employee incentive compensation program, correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same, review correspondence from C. Brown regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	10/2/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding Alliacense's claim (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	10/2/2013	Robert Franklin	Continue review of Proof of Claim of M. Davis and correspondence with S. Anhalt regarding calculations and supporting documents (.9)	0.90	459.00
S	10/2/2013	Robert Franklin	Review Felcyn memorandum regarding calculation of employment claims (.7); finalize memorandum regarding viability of employee claims (.9)	1.60	816.00
S	10/2/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences R. Franklin, C. Brown, S. Anhalt regarding employee claims (.1); meeting R. Franklin regarding same, regarding memorandum of same (.1)	0.20	84.00
A	10/3/2013	Robert Franklin	Attend Status Conference (1.5)	1.50	765.00
Ba	10/3/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding jury verdict (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ba	10/3/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence R. Franklin regarding HTC litigation and case status; meeting R. Franklin regarding same, regarding status conference (.2)	0.20	84.00
C	10/3/2013	Robert Franklin	Conference J. Otteson regarding jury verdict in HTC trial (.1)	0.10	51.00

Ec	10/3/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding hearing on debtor's Applications for Employment of Counsel (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ec	10/3/2013	Robert Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding status of Heller Application (.1)	0.10	51.00
Ec	10/3/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review memorandum from J. Murray regarding employment of Heller and Henneman (.1); investigation regarding hearing and status of same (.1)	0.10	42.00
G	10/3/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding Alliacense production of documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
M	10/3/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding mediation and correspondence to committee regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	10/3/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from R. Franklin and S, Anhalt regarding Alliacense Proof of Claim (.2)	0.20	134.00
S	10/3/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence S. Anhalt regarding intercompany debts and offset and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.3)	0.30	153.00
S	10/3/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation correspondences R. Franklin, S. Anhalt and related documents, regarding Alliacense claim and offset (.2)	0.20	84.00
Bb	10/4/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding article regarding jury verdict, review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding same, review article (.2)	0.20	134.00
G	10/4/2013	Robert Franklin	Review status of production of documents (1.0)	1.00	510.00
M	10/4/2013	Robert Franklin	Review record of negotiations and minutes regarding status of issues for mediation (2.5)	2.50	1,275.00
Bb	10/5/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding HTC jury verdict and K. Prochnow's offer to make presentation to committee regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	10/6/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding Monday conference call and Tuesday committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
M	10/6/2013	John Murray	Review voicemail message from H. Binder regarding mediation and correspondence to H. Binder regarding same (.1); review multiple correspondence from J. Montali regarding mediation and multiple correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.2)	0.30	201.00
Ba	10/7/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items (.1)	0.10	42.00
Bb	10/7/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding contact information (.1); correspondence from D. Wright regarding committee meeting, correspondence to committee regarding same, review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding same, correspondence to committee regarding call in number for committee meeting (.2)	0.30	201.00
Bb	10/7/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from committee members regarding start time for committee meeting (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bb	10/7/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding committee meeting, multiple correspondence to/from committee members regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bb	10/7/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from D. Sciarrino regarding presentation to committee regarding the results of the TPL v HTC case, correspondence to committee regarding same, review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same; review correspondence from C. Brown regarding same, telephone conference with K. Prochnow regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
Bb	10/7/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences P. Marcoux, D. Sciarrino, C. Brown regarding HTC ruling, regarding C. Moore and meeting; review correspondences regarding Committee meeting (.1)	0.10	42.00
M	10/7/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with H. Binder regarding jury verdict and mediation (.2)	0.20	134.00
M	10/7/2013	John Murray	Prepare response to D. Montali's multiple inquires regarding mediation, multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang (2.1); review debtor's response to J. Montali's inquiries (.2)	2.30	1,541.00
M	10/7/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and respond to questions posed by Judge Montali in preparation for mediation (5.8)	5.80	2,958.00



M	10/7/2013	Thomas Hwang	Analysis and evaluation correspondences and questions from Hon. D. Montali regarding case status and mediation; review memoranda R. Franklin regarding same and memorandum J. Murray and R. Franklin regarding same (1.0); meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1); review Committee responses to questions from Hon. D. Montali regarding case status and mediation (.1)	1.20	504.00
Bb	10/8/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from committee members regarding committee meeting (.1); multiple correspondence to/from committee members regarding K. Prochnow presentation to committee regarding jury verdict, multiple correspondence to/from K. Prochnow regarding same (.2)	0.30	201.00
Bb	10/8/2013	John Murray	Prepare for committee meeting, prepare agenda for same (.5); attend same (5.0)	5.50	3,685.00
Bb	10/8/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding Scientific Patriot website (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	10/8/2013	Robert Franklin	Prepare for and attend Committee meeting regarding mediation (5.5)	5.50	2,805.00
Bb	10/8/2013	Thomas Hwang	Prepare for Committee meeting (.1)	0.10	42.00
Bb	10/8/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting with Committee (3.4); meeting Committee, K. Prochnow and D. Sciarrino regarding case status, regarding ITC and HTC rulings (1.2)	4.60	1,932.00
G	10/8/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding information from debtor (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	10/8/2013	Thomas Hwang	Analysis and evaluation correspondences and documents from S. Anhalt regarding employee compensation claims and regarding proposed distribution scheme, Alliacense fees and rates (.4)	0.40	168.00
M	10/8/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to committee regarding correspondence to J. Montali regarding mediation, multiple correspondence to/from S. Kim regarding same, review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding same, review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
M	10/8/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to G. Felcyn regarding correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding D. Leckrone's change of position regarding subordination of his secured claim (.1)	0.10	67.00
M	10/8/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding revised projections, review, analysis and evaluation of revised projections (.3)	0.30	201.00
M	10/8/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from M. Brown regarding mediation (.1)	0.10	67.00
M	10/8/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences Committee and memoranda to Hon. D. Montali regarding mediation and negotiation issues (.1)	0.10	42.00
S	10/8/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding calculation of employee incentive compensation claims (.2)	0.20	134.00
S	10/8/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding incentive compensation agreement (.2)	0.20	134.00
S	10/8/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation issues regarding employee incentive claims and employment of counsel by Debtor (.4)	0.40	168.00
S	10/8/2013	Thomas Hwang	Memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding employee compensation claims (.4)	0.40	168.00
L	10/9/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding cash collateral budget, review same, review correspondence to committee regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
M	10/9/2013	John Murray	Prepare for mediation, attend same (11.7)	11.70	7,839.00
M	10/9/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to committee regarding mediation (.1)	0.10	67.00
M	10/9/2013	Robert Franklin	Prepare for and attend mediation (10.0)	10.00	5,100.00
M	10/10/2013	John Murray	Review, analysis and evaluation regarding correspondence from J. Montali regarding mediation (.2); multiple correspondence to/from committee members regarding mediation and negotiations with debtor (.1); attend mediation (9.5); multiple correspondence to R. Franklin regarding summary of negotiations with debtor (.2);	10.00	6,700.00
M	10/10/2013	Robert Franklin	Attend mediation (9.5)	9.50	4,845.00

M	10/10/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences G. Felcyn and D. Montali regarding mediation and status of negotiations (.1); review and evaluation Debtor's term sheets, and comments from P. Marcoux, G. Felcyn regarding same (.3)	0.40	168.00
M	10/11/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to R. Franklin regarding preparation of chart of issues in mediation (.3); telephone conference with D. Wright regarding action items (.2); correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding case action items (.2)	0.70	469.00
M	10/11/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding follow-up with G. Felcyn regarding negotiations with debtor, correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding same, review multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn and S. Anhalt regarding same (.2); correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding summary of issues regarding negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization, review correspondence to subcommittee regarding same (.1); review correspondence from H. Binder regarding NDAs (.1); multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding conference call with debtor regarding negotiations regarding Plan of Reorganization, review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding same (.1); correspondence to team regarding action items (.1)	0.60	402.00
M	10/11/2013	Robert Franklin	Draft memorandum updating status of negotiations (4.7); detailed telephone conferences with D. Wright regarding same (.2); detailed telephone conference P. Marcoux regarding alternatives to settlement (.1)	5.00	2,550.00
M	10/11/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review memorandum from R. Franklin and J. Murray, correspondences from Hon. D. Montali and J. Murray, and outline of negotiation points, regarding mediation and status of negotiations	0.20	84.00
M	10/12/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding conference call with clients regarding projections and Alliacense information (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding conference call with debtor regarding same (.1); correspondence to/from D. Montali regarding status of negotiations with debtor (.1); correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding NDAs (.1)	0.40	268.00
G	10/13/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin, G. Felcyn, S. Kim and S. Anhalt regarding forecasts and production of documents regarding Alliacense (.2)	0.20	134.00
M	10/14/2013	John Murray	Miscellaneous regarding committee confidentiality agreements regarding mediation, correspondence to H. Binder regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
M	10/14/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Kaplan, G. Felcyn and D. Wright regarding summary of negotiations with debtor (.3)	0.30	201.00
M	10/14/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences from R. Franklin, S. Anhalt, H. Binder, J. Murray, G. Felcyn regarding case status and negotiations with Debtor (.1); meeting J. Murray regarding same (.1); telephone conferences with D. Wright regarding negotiations with Debtor, case status and plan scenarios (.5); review and evaluation memoranda D. Wright, G. Felcyn, G. Kaplan regarding summary of negotiations with Debtor, and update chart outline regarding same (1.3)	2.00	840.00
M	10/14/2013	Thomas Hwang	Correspondence D. Wright, G. Felcyn, G. Kaplan regarding mediation (.2)	0.20	84.00
Ec	10/15/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from committee regarding Applications for Employment of Counsel regarding Heller and Henneman (.2)	0.20	134.00
Ec	10/15/2013	Thomas Hwang	Telephone conference with R. Shakoori regarding employment applications of Heller and Henneman (.1); evaluation regarding case status and correspondence Committee regarding same (.4); correspondence R. Shakoori regarding same (.1)	0.60	252.00
M	10/15/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from D. Montali, H. Binder and committee members regarding status of negotiations with with debtor, respond to same (.3)	0.30	201.00

M	10/15/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from H. Binder and S. Anhalt regarding executed NDAs regarding mediation, correspondence to/from committee regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
M	10/15/2013	Thomas Hwang	Multiple telephone conferences with D. Wright regarding case status, regarding negotiation points and plan issues (.4); review correspondences G. Kaplan regarding same; evaluation outline regarding plan issues and parties' positions on same (.1)	0.50	210.00
M	10/15/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences Hon. D. Montali, H. Binder, G. Felcyn, J. Murray regarding status of negotiations, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.3)	0.30	126.00
Ec	10/16/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from committee regarding Application for Employment of Counsel regarding Heller and Henneman, and continuance of hearing pending negotiations with debtor (.3)	0.30	201.00
Ec	10/16/2013	Thomas Hwang	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding Heller and Henneman employment applications (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same (.3); exchange correspondences R. Shakoori regarding same, regarding Committee proposal (.4); review correspondences from Committee and correspondence G. Kaplan regarding same (.2); review and revise stipulation to continue hearing on employment applications (.3);	1.20	504.00
F	10/16/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from R. Shakoori regarding September fees and costs for Monthly Operating Report (.1)	0.10	67.00
M	10/16/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from S. Anhalt and D. Wright regarding status of committee term sheet, review correspondence to committee regarding same, review correspondence to H. Binder regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
M	10/16/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Montali regarding mediation (.1); review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding mediation NDA, correspondence to T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
M	10/16/2013	Thomas Hwang	Multiple telephone conferences with D. Wright regarding status of negotiations with Debtor, regarding summary of parties' positions (.7); correspondence G. Felcyn regarding same (.1); meeting P. Marcoux regarding same (.2); review correspondences J. Murray, P. Marcoux regarding mediation and confidentiality agreement; correspondence S. Anhalt regarding same (.1); correspondences G. Kaplan, G. Felcyn, D. Wright regarding summary table of negotiation points (.2); revise same (.6); correspondence H. Binder, R. Harris regarding same (.2)	2.10	882.00
F	10/17/2013	Thomas Hwang	Analysis regarding professional fees and review and respond correspondence R. Shakoori regarding same, regarding Debtor's Monthly Operating Report (.2)	0.20	84.00
M	10/17/2013	Thomas Hwang	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding case status, negotiations with Debtor (.1); review correspondences and correspondence to D. Wright regarding same (.1); review correspondences and waterfall sample from G. Felcyn, and correspondence to G. Felcyn regarding same (.2)	0.40	168.00
M	10/17/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence Hon. D. Montali regarding mediation and case status, and correspondence D. Wright, G. Felcyn, G. Kaplan regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
G	10/18/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding requested information (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	10/18/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation correspondence S. Anhalt and documents produced regarding information requested by Committee (.2)	0.20	84.00
M	10/18/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from T. Hwang, debtor and J. Montali regarding status of mediation and conference call regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00

M	10/18/2013	Thomas Hwang	Telephone conferences D. Wright regarding negotiations with Debtor, case status and strategy (.2); review correspondences R. Harris and Hon. D. Montali, and evaluation memorandum D. Wright regarding same, and correspondences D. Montali, R. Harris, H. Binder regarding same (.4); correspondences D. Wright, G. Kaplan, G. Felcyn regarding same (.2)	0.80	336.00
M	10/19/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1); multiple correspondence to T. Hwang regarding conference call regarding mediation and communications to committee regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
M	10/19/2013	Thomas Hwang	Telephone conference D. Wright regarding negotiations with Debtor, case status and strategy (.3); correspondences Committee regarding case status (.1)	0.40	168.00
Ba	10/21/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting R. Franklin regarding case status (.1); meeting S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items (.1)	0.20	84.00
Bb	10/21/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding debtor's projected revenues and strategy going forward (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ec	10/21/2013	John Murray	Review notice of continued hearing regarding Applications for Employment of Counsel regarding Heller and Henneman (.1)	0.10	67.00
F	10/21/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from debtor's counsel regarding debtor's September Monthly Operating Report and correspondence to committee regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
F	10/21/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review Debtor's Monthly Operating Report (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.20	84.00
G	10/21/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding production of documents and correspondence to committee regarding same, review correspondence from G. Felcyn to S. Anhalt regarding debtor's revenue projections (.2)	0.20	134.00
G	10/21/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence A. Anhalt regarding request for documents, regarding patents, and correspondence Committee regarding same (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.20	84.00
M	10/21/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding conference call with J. Montali regarding status of negotiations between debtor and committee regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1); review correspondence to committee regarding debtor's term sheet and committee response requested by J. Montali (.1)	0.20	134.00
M	10/21/2013	Robert Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding status of negotiation (.4); prepare for and attend conference call with Judge Montali (.6)	1.00	510.00
M	10/21/2013	Thomas Hwang	Correspondence Committee regarding call with Hon. D. Montali; review and respond correspondence S. Kim regarding same (.1); telephone conference with D. Wright regarding case status and negotiations (.3)	0.40	168.00
M	10/21/2013	Thomas Hwang	Telephone conference with Hon. J. Montali, H. Binder, R. Harris, R. Franklin regarding negotiations, mediation and case status (.5); prepare for same (.2); conference R. Franklin regarding same (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.90	378.00
G	10/22/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence between S. Anhalt and G. Felcyn regarding debtor's projections, review multiple correspondence from T. Hwang and R. Franklin regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
G	10/22/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation correspondences S. Anhalt, G. Felcyn regarding Alliacense and analysis of patent prosecution costs (.1); memorandum R. Franklin, J. Murray regarding same, regarding case status; review memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	0.30	126.00
M	10/22/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from debtor's counsel regarding updated term sheet (.1)	0.10	67.00