

M	10/22/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and monitor email correspondence regarding negotiation of plan terms (.6); draft correspondence H. Binder and R. Harris regarding action items (.2); detailed telephone conference D. Wright regarding status (.3)	2.10	1,071.00
M	10/22/2013	Thomas Hwang	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding case status and conference with with Hon. D. Montali (.3)	0.30	126.00
L	10/23/2013	Robert Franklin	Review cash collateral budget for Nov-February (.3)	0.30	153.00
L	10/23/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence from R. Harris and proposed cash collateral budget (.1); investigation regarding same, and memoranda R. Franklin regarding same (.3)	0.40	168.00
M	10/23/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding mediation (.1)	0.10	67.00
M	10/23/2013	Robert Franklin	Correspondence to Committee regarding status of negotiation (.2); continue review of emails regarding amendment (.7)	0.90	459.00
M	10/23/2013	Thomas Hwang	Telephone conferences with D. Wright regarding status of negotiations with Debtor subcommittee (.2)	0.20	84.00
O	10/23/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from committee regarding debtor's request for an extension of the exclusivity period (.2)	0.20	134.00
O	10/23/2013	Thomas Hwang	Telephone conference with R. Harris regarding plan exclusivity (.1); correspondence Committee regarding plan exclusivity (.1); correspondences G. Kaplan, R. Harris regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
P	10/23/2013	John Murray	Review, analysis and evaluation regarding correspondence from D. Wright regarding negotiations with N. Antonopoulos regarding Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bb	10/24/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding conversation with K. Prochnow regarding MMP patents (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	10/24/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from committee regarding debtor's summary of outstanding issues (.2)	0.20	134.00
Ec	10/24/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review status of negotiations regarding Heller and Henneman employment, and call to J. Wesolowski regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
L	10/24/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from R. Harris regarding cash collateral budget, review correspondence to committee regarding same, review budget (.2)	0.20	134.00
L	10/24/2013	Robert Franklin	Review response from R. Harris regarding line items on cash collateral budget (.1); draft correspondence Creditors Committee regarding approval of cash collateral budget (.2)	0.30	153.00
M	10/24/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence D. Wright regarding mediation and related attachments (.4)	0.40	204.00
M	10/24/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences D. Wright, R. Franklin regarding negotiations with N. Antonopoulos (.1); investigation regarding same, and memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.20	84.00
M	10/24/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review Debtor's term sheet outline; memoranda R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	0.20	84.00
O	10/24/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from committee regarding debtor's request for extension of exclusivity period, correspondence to committee; telephone conference to discuss same (.2)	0.20	134.00
O	10/24/2013	Robert Franklin	Correspondence with Creditors Committee regarding plan exclusivity extension request (.2); correspondence T. Hwang regarding requirement of motion to extend exclusivity (.1); review correspondences from committee members regarding extension (.3)	0.60	306.00

O	10/24/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence R. Harris regarding plan exclusivity and correspondences Committee regarding same (.1); review correspondences R. Franklin, G. Kaplan, C. Brown, S. Kim regarding same; correspondence Committee regarding same (.2); review correspondences R. Harris, R. Franklin regarding same, regarding cash collateral budget, regarding scheduling of hearings; review stipulation regarding shortened time for hearing; memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	0.50	210.00
Bb	10/25/2013	Thomas Hwang	Memorandum R. Franklin regarding case status and scheduling, and correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
D	10/25/2013	Thomas Hwang	Telephone conference with J. Wesolowski regarding case status (.3)	0.30	126.00
M	10/25/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding conference call do discuss debtor's term sheet (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding debtor's term sheet (.1)	0.20	134.00
M	10/25/2013	Robert Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding status of negotiation and scenarios (.9)	0.90	459.00
M	10/25/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review comments to Debtor's term sheet and correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
O	10/25/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from H. Binder regarding debtor's request for extension of exclusivity (.1); review multiple correspondence to/from committee regarding debtor's request for extension of exclusivity and debtor's motion in relation thereto, and multiple correspondence to/from committee regarding conference call to discuss same (.2)	0.30	201.00
O	10/25/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and respond to correspondence R. Harris regarding plan exclusivity (.2); detailed telephone conference R. Harris regarding same (.2); detailed telephone conference H. Binder regarding negotiation and exclusivity (.3)	0.70	357.00
O	10/25/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences R. Harris regarding plan exclusivity; review correspondences Committee regarding same, regarding case strategy (.1); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1); telephone conferences with D. Wright regarding same (.4); telephone conference with R. Franklin regarding same (.3); review Debtor's motion regarding plan exclusivity (.1)	1.00	420.00
O	10/26/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding debtor's request for extension of exclusivity (.1)	0.10	67.00
P	10/26/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from M. Imhoff regarding conference call to discuss status of negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	67.00
P	10/27/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding negotiations with debtor regarding Plan of Reorganization, review correspondence to committee regarding conference call to discuss same (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	10/28/2013	Robert Franklin	Prepare for meeting with Creditors Committee (1.5); meeting (1.6)	3.10	1,581.00
Bb	10/28/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review memorandum G. Felcyn and Debtor's term sheet, and prepare for meeting with Committee (.2); meeting with Committee (1.7)	1.90	798.00
L	10/28/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from committee regarding debtor's proposed cash collateral budget and objection to motion to use cash collateral (.2)	0.20	134.00
M	10/28/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from K. Beresford regarding conference call regarding debtor's term sheet regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1); review multiple correspondence to/from committee regarding response to debtor's most recent term sheet (.2)	0.30	201.00
M	10/28/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence H. Binder and Judge Montali regarding the mediation and correspondence with Committee members regarding same (.4)	0.40	204.00
M	10/28/2013	Robert Franklin	Draft response to Debtor's term sheet (1.4); correspondence with Committee members regarding response to term sheet (.2); telephone conference with D. Wright regarding same (.1)	1.70	867.00
M	10/28/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences Hon. D. Montali, H. Binder, R. Franklin, G. Kaplan, G. Felcyn regarding mediation and negotiations; meetings R. Franklin regarding same (.3)	0.30	126.00

O	10/28/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from committee regarding debtor's request for extension of exclusivity, and correspondence between H. Binder and J. Montali regarding same (.2); review court orders shortening time regarding hearings on debtor's motion to extend exclusivity and motion to use cash collateral (.1); review debtor's motion to extend exclusivity (.2)	0.50	335.00
O	10/28/2013	Robert Franklin	Telephone conference R. Harris regarding exclusivity motion (.1)	0.10	51.00
O	10/28/2013	Robert Franklin	Detailed telephone conference H. Binder regarding extension of exclusivity motion (.2)	0.20	102.00
O	10/28/2013	Thomas Hwang	Legal research regarding plan exclusivity and termination of same (.9); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.3); meeting R. Franklin regarding same, regarding case status (.1)	1.30	546.00
R	10/28/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding motion to appoint a trustee (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	10/29/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from S. Anhalt and R. Harris regarding production of documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	10/29/2013	Robert Franklin	Telephone conference with G. Felcyn regarding production of documents (.1)	0.10	51.00
L	10/29/2013	Robert Franklin	Conference call with R. Harris, S. Anhalt and D. Hannah regarding cash collateral budget (.3); review and respond to multiple correspondence R. Harris regarding preliminary cash collateral hearing and budget issues (.5)	0.80	408.00
M	10/29/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding responding to debtor's most recent term sheet and strategy going forward (.1); review multiple correspondence to/from committee regarding response to debtor's term sheet (.2)	0.30	201.00
M	10/29/2013	Robert Franklin	Draft correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding Judge Montali's request to revisit mediation (1.1)	1.10	561.00
M	10/29/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and revise response to term sheet (.9); multiple correspondence to Creditors Committee members regarding same (.3); detailed telephone conference G. Felcyn regarding term sheet revisions and alternative strategies suggested by K. Prochnow (.2)	1.40	714.00
M	10/29/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences R. Franklin, G. Kaplan, B. Kirkendall, P. Marcoux, D. Wright regarding mediation, case strategy and negotiations (.2); review memorandum R. Franklin regarding same; meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
O	10/29/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from committee regarding debtor's motion to extend exclusivity and response to J. Montali regarding same (.4)	0.40	268.00
G	10/30/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence between G. Felcyn and S. Anhalt regarding requested information (.1)	0.10	67.00
L	10/30/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from committee regarding hearings on debtor's motion to use cash collateral and extend exclusivity (.1)	0.10	67.00
L	10/30/2013	Robert Franklin	Review cash collateral issues and detailed telephone conferences and correspondence with R. Harris regarding same (.7)	0.70	357.00
M	10/30/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from committee regarding committee response to debtor's latest term sheet, correspondence to J. Montali regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
M	10/30/2013	Robert Franklin	Finalize Response to term sheet and correspondence to Judge Montali (1.1); detailed telephone conference R. Harris regarding same (.2)	1.30	663.00
M	10/30/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation memorandum R. Franklin to Hon. J. Montali regarding term sheet; review withdrawal of motion to extend exclusivity; meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	0.20	84.00
O	10/30/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from M. Imhoff regarding debtor's motion to extend exclusivity (.1); review debtor's withdrawal of exclusivity motion (.1)	0.20	134.00
O	10/30/2013	Robert Franklin	Draft opposition to motion to extend exclusivity (1.2)	1.20	612.00

Bb	10/31/2013	Robert Franklin	Detailed telephone conference with G. Felcyn regarding strategy in removing management (.2); detailed telephone conference D. Wright regarding status and strategy (.4)	0.60	306.00
D	10/31/2013	Robert Franklin	Conference J. Wesolowski regarding case (.5)	0.50	255.00
L	10/31/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding debtor's motion to use cash collateral (.2)	0.20	134.00
L	10/31/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and respond to correspondence G. Felcyn regarding cash collateral hearing (.2); prepare for hearing (.5); attend hearing on motion (2.0)	2.70	1,377.00
L	10/31/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences R. Franklin, G. Felcyn regarding cash collateral budget; meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
P	10/31/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from committee regarding debtor's Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	67.00
P	10/31/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement of Debtor (.2); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
Bb	11/1/2013	Robert Franklin	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding status (.1); detailed telephone conference C. Hoge regarding developments at Patriot and D. Leckrone conduct (.3); draft status report to J. Murray (.5)	0.90	459.00
L	11/1/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding cash collateral hearing (.1)	0.10	67.00
L	11/1/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting R. Franklin regarding case status; review Court minute entry regarding use of cash collateral (.1)	0.10	42.00
M	11/1/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from P. Marcoux regarding executed mediation NDA, correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Ba	11/4/2013	John Murray	Interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding status, competing plan, motion for appointment of trustee, etc. (.4)	0.40	268.00
Ba	11/4/2013	Robert Franklin	Interoffice conference J. Murray regarding status of TPL case (.4)	0.40	204.00
Bb	11/4/2013	John Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding communications to committee regarding monthly fees and costs, and correspondence to committee regarding September fees and costs (.3)	0.30	201.00
Ba	11/5/2013	John Murray	Interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding committee meeting (.1); interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding conference call with G. Felcyn and C. Johnson regarding PDS and Alliacense, review correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding same, review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.2); correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding competing Plan of Reorganization, motion to appoint Trustee, motion to terminate exclusivity (.2)	0.50	335.00
F	11/5/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding fees re Monthly Operating Report (.1)	0.10	67.00
L	11/5/2013	Robert Franklin	Review budget and analysis and evaluation regarding Opposition to cash collateral motion (.5); draft correspondence R. Harris regarding information requested (.8)	1.30	663.00
Pa	11/5/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding objection to Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	67.00
Pa	11/5/2013	Robert Franklin	Initial review of Debtor's Disclosure Statement (1.8)	1.80	918.00
Bb	11/6/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to G. Felcyn and C. Johnson regarding conference call regarding correspondence from D. Leckrone regarding PDS and Alliacense (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	11/6/2013	John Murray	Conference call G. Felcyn, D. Wright and C. Johnson regarding motion to terminate exclusivity, Objection to cash collateral motion, creditor plan, mediation, etc. (.7); interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	0.90	603.00
G	11/6/2013	Robert Franklin	Draft Request for Production of Documents to Alliacense (.6)	0.60	306.00
L	11/6/2013	Robert Franklin	Prepare for call with G. Felcyn (.2); conference call J. Murray, G. Felcyn, C. Johnson, D. Wright regarding opposition to cash collateral and motion to terminate exclusivity and supporting evidence (.8); analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	1.20	612.00

L	11/6/2013	Robert Franklin	Review Monthly Operating Reports and other evidence preparatory to filing Opposition to motion to use cash collateral (.8); commence preparation of opposition to cash collateral motion(.2)	1.00	510.00
Pa	11/6/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to team regarding objection to debtor's Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	67.00
Pa	11/6/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from team regarding objection to Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	67.00
Pa	11/6/2013	Robert Franklin	Review debtor's Disclosure Statement (.7)	0.70	357.00
Ec	11/8/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review reply to opposition regarding employment of Henneman and Heller (.2); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1); review correspondence C. Brown regarding same, and investigation regarding correspondence from C. Brown (.1)	0.40	168.00
G	11/8/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding requested documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	11/8/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence S. Anhalt regarding responses to Committee's informational requests and correspondence to Committee regarding same (.6)	0.60	306.00
G	11/8/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence S. Anhalt regarding responses to Committee questions (.1)	0.10	42.00
L	11/8/2013	Robert Franklin	Review cash collateral issues and expense line items with Committee's comments thereto (.7); draft Opposition to cash collateral motion (.8); detailed telephone conference R. Harris regarding same (.2)	1.70	867.00
L	11/8/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences D. Wright, J. Murray regarding cash collateral, case strategy (.1)	0.10	42.00
Nb	11/8/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with H. Binder regarding status and resolution of outstanding issues (.5)	0.50	335.00
P	11/8/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation and analysis report from D. Sciarrino, C. Moore regarding Debtor's plan (.2)	0.20	84.00
Bb	11/9/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from committee and debtor's counsel regarding informational requests, cash collateral Motion, objections thereto, cash collateral budgets, motions to convert, terminate exclusivity and appoint trustee, employment applications (objection and reply), Debtor's Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement, objections thereto (1.3)	1.30	871.00
L	11/10/2013	John Murray	Review detailed correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding grounds for objecting to cash collateral Motion (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bc	11/11/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft minutes for October 28 meeting (2.9)	2.90	1,218.00
D	11/11/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding communications from K. Prochnow, and investigation regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
I	11/11/2013	Robert Franklin	Review voice mail from K. Prochnow and research issue re executory contracts raised by him and respond (.4)	0.40	204.00
Nb	11/11/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding TPL's current position on negotiations, review multiple responses and correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding conference call regarding same (.3) telephone conference with H. Binder regarding consequences of no resolution of negotiations, potential new offer, etc. (.5); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding inquiry from K. Prochnow (.1); multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding conference call regarding communications with H. Binder (.2)	1.10	737.00
O	11/11/2013	Robert Franklin	Review minutes and background for motion to terminate exclusivity (1.6); detailed telephone conference D. Wright regarding same (.2)	1.80	918.00
P	11/11/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences J. Murray, C. Johnson, G. Felcyn, G. Kaplan, P. Marcoux regarding plan and communications from H. Binder	0.20	84.00
Ba	11/12/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items (.1)	0.10	42.00
Bb	11/12/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences J. Murray regarding case status; correspondence Committee regarding meeting (.1); Committee meeting (.8); meeting R. Franklin, J. Murray regarding case status (.1)	1.00	420.00
Bc	11/12/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft meeting minutes for October 28 meeting (.4)	0.40	168.00

Ec	11/12/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding hearings regarding Heller and Henneman Applications for Employment of Counsel, etc. (.1); review correspondence from R. Shakoori regarding continuance of hearing regarding Heller and Henemann Applications for Employment of Counsel (.1)	0.20	134.00
Ec	11/12/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation regarding Debtor's application to employ Heller and Henneman, related briefs (.1); telephone conference with, call to R. Shakoori regarding same (.1); review stipulated application and proposed order (.2); meetings J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.1); correspondence R. Shakoori regarding same (.2)	0.70	294.00
Kb	11/12/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding conference call with licensing subcommittee regarding Acer, multiple correspondence to/from subcommittee regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
L	11/12/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding continuance of final cash collateral hearing and hearings on employment Applications of Heller and Henneman (.2)	0.20	134.00
L	11/12/2013	Robert Franklin	Review comments of committee, cash collateral budget, information from Debtor and draft opposition to cash collateral motion (3.5)	3.50	1,785.00
Nb	11/12/2013	John Murray	Attend Creditors Committee conference call regarding negotiation with debtor (.8); interoffice conference R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.90	603.00
Nb	11/12/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding conference call to discuss debtor's recent proposal (.2)	0.20	134.00
Nb	11/12/2013	John Murray	Multiple telephone conferences with H. Binder regarding outstanding issues and Creditors Committee strategy going forward (.5); interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding summary of outstanding issues in negotiations with Creditors Committee , analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.70	469.00
Nb	11/12/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding potential settlement, subcommittee meeting (.1); review correspondence H. Binder regarding Debtor proposal and meeting J. Murray regarding same (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
D	11/13/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding correspondence from Shore, Chan & DePumpo regarding status of case (.1)	0.10	67.00
D	11/13/2013	Robert Franklin	Detailed telephone conference with K. Prochnow regarding status (.2)	0.20	102.00
D	11/13/2013	Thomas Hwang	Telephone conference with M. Raiston regarding case status (.2); review correspondence M. Ralson regarding same, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.2)	0.40	168.00
Ec	11/13/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Shakoori regarding continuance of Heller/Henneman hearing (.1)	0.10	67.00
Kb	11/13/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from licensing subcommittee regarding conference call with Debtor to discuss settlement with Acer (.2); multiple correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding licensing subcommittee conference call regarding Acer (.1); review materials received from debtor regarding proposed transaction with Acer, attend conference call with debtor and licensing subcommittee regarding same (1.4); conference call subcommittee regarding same (.5); telephone conference with H. Binder regarding same (.2); correspondence to D. Leckrone regarding Creditors Committee's approval of Acer licensing transaction, correspondence to TPL regarding same, miscellaneous regarding same (.3)	2.70	1,809.00
Kb	11/13/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding subcommittee approval of Acer transaction (.1)	0.10	67.00
L	11/13/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from H. Binder and R. Harris regarding continuance of cash collateral hearing (.1)	0.10	67.00
L	11/13/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from H. Binder and R. Harris regarding continuance of cash collateral hearing (.2)	0.20	134.00

Nb	11/13/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding preparation for next committee conference call regarding debtor's latest proposal (.2); review correspondence from K. Beresford regarding Creditors Committee conference call and debtor's latest offer (.1)	0.30	201.00
Nb	11/13/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences S. Anhalt, J. Murray, G. Felcyn, K. Beresford regarding settlement proposal and regarding Debtor's plan proposal (.3); telephone conference with D. Wright regarding same (.1); correspondence to Committee regarding same (.1)	0.50	210.00
P	11/13/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from committee regarding Debtor's latest proposal regarding regarding Plan of Reorganization, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.3); multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding conference call regarding Debtor's recent proposal (.2)	0.50	335.00
Bb	11/14/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from K. Beresford and M. Imhoff regarding availability for Creditors Committee conference call (.1)	0.10	67.00
D	11/14/2013	Robert Franklin	Correspondence creditor regarding status of case (.2)	0.20	102.00
M	11/14/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from D. Montali and H. Binder regarding mediation (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	11/15/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding conversion of case to chapter 7, review correspondence from M. Brown and C. Brown regarding mediation (.1)	0.10	67.00
D	11/15/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding inquiry from Shore Chan regarding status of case (.1)	0.10	67.00
M	11/15/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding mediation (.2); correspondence to J. Montali regarding mediation (.1)	0.30	201.00
D	11/16/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding inquiry from Shore Chan (.2)	0.20	134.00
M	11/16/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from G. Kaplan regarding mediation, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bb	11/18/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding conference call (.1); correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding agenda for conference call, prepare same (1.5); prepare for and attend Creditors Committee conference call (.9); correspondence to/from P. Marcoux regarding Creditors Committee conference call (.1); correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding minutes of Creditors Committee meeting (.1)	2.70	1,809.00
Bb	11/18/2013	Robert Franklin	Prepare for Committee meeting (.5); attend meeting (.9); interoffice conference J. Murray regarding action items (.1)	1.50	765.00
Bc	11/18/2013	Robert Franklin	Draft minutes (2.5)	2.50	1,275.00
L	11/18/2013	John Murray	Review court docket regarding entry of cash collateral order (.1); telephone conference with R. Harris regarding cash collateral hearing (.2); multiple correspondence to/from correspondence R. Harris and T. Bracegirdle regarding continued hearing regarding cash collateral (.1); review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding objection to cash collateral motion, review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding same (.1)	0.50	335.00
M	11/18/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to J. Montali regarding mediation (.1); correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding mediation term sheet (.1); review correspondence from D. Wright regarding approach to negotiations with Debtor, review correspondence from K. Beresford regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
O	11/18/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding ETA on Motion to terminate exclusivity and continuance of Disclosure Statement hearing (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	11/19/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding memorandum to Creditors Committee regarding confirmation standards (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bc	11/19/2013	John Murray	Finalize minutes of committee conference call, correspondence to committee regarding same (.9)	0.90	603.00

F	11/19/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding October fees and costs for Monthly Operating Report, correspondence to/from V. Chial regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Kb	11/19/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding proposed settlement with AMD regarding Fast Logic, multiple correspondence to/from committee regarding same (.4); correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding court order regarding settlements (.1); multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn and D. Wright regarding conference call to discuss response to S. Anhalts's proposed settlement with AMD regarding Fast Logic (.2); conference call G. Felcyn and D. Wright regarding same (.2); review court order regarding settlement procedures regarding proposed settlements with infringers (.2); correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding committee's response to proposed settlement with AMD regarding Fast Logic, correspondence to committee regarding same (.3)	1.40	938.00
Kb	11/19/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding settlement with SK Hynix (.1)	0.10	67.00
Kb	11/19/2013	Robert Franklin	Review settlement protocol order for upcoming conference (.2)	0.20	102.00
L	11/19/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding cash collateral hearing (.2)	0.20	134.00
L	11/19/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Harris regarding form of cash collateral order, review same (.3); review message from D. Wright regarding objection to cash collateral Motion (.1)	0.40	268.00
L	11/19/2013	Robert Franklin	Review comments from Committee members regarding draft of opposition to use of cash collateral (.4)	0.40	204.00
Nb	11/19/2013	John Murray	Prepare counter offer to debtor, review notes and prior correspondence regarding same, correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding same (1.2)	1.20	804.00
O	11/19/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding communications with R. Harris regarding motion to terminate exclusivity, Order Shortening Time regarding same, and continuance of Disclosure Statement hearing (.2)	0.20	134.00
O	11/19/2013	Robert Franklin	Legal research and draft motion to terminate exclusivity (3.4)	3.40	1,734.00
Pa	11/19/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding due date for objection to Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	67.00
Kb	11/20/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding licensing agreements, correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Kb	11/20/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding Debtor's request for consent to license to AMD and Hynix, multiple correspondence to/from K. Beresford, P. Marcoux, S. Anhalt, B. Kirkendall, G. Felcyn, M. Brown and G. Kaplan regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
Kb	11/20/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences Committee members, S. Anhalt and J. Murray regarding proposed settlements by debtor	0.10	42.00
L	11/20/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding objection to Debtor's continued use of cash collateral (.1)	0.10	67.00
Nb	11/20/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding comments on counter offer to debtor, interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
O	11/20/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding motion to terminate exclusivity (.1)	0.10	67.00
O	11/20/2013	Robert Franklin	Continue preparation of motion to terminate exclusivity (4.2)	4.20	2,142.00
P	11/20/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with K. Hiensch regarding Fijitsu and debtor's Plan of Reorganization (.3)	0.30	201.00
P	11/20/2013	John Murray	Finalize correspondence to Debtor's counsel regarding Creditors Committee's counter proposal regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	67.00
F	11/21/2013	Robert Franklin	Review October Monthly Operating Report (.5)	0.50	255.00

Kb	11/21/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding concern that debtor will consummate licenses without committee's consent, correspondence to debtor's counsel regarding same (.1); multiple conference calls with D. Wright regarding debtor's position regarding licensing (.4)	0.50	335.00
O	11/21/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding motion to terminate exclusivity (.1); review multiple correspondence to/from K. Beresford regarding motion to terminate exclusivity and D. Leckrone's history of non-payment (.1); review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding debtor's refusal to stipulate to termination of exclusivity (.1); review correspondence from M. Brown regarding motion to terminate exclusivity (.1)	0.40	268.00
O	11/21/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and revise and finalize pleadings on Motion to Terminate Exclusivity (4.1); detailed telephone conference with R. Harris regarding same (.2); detailed telephone conference with J. Wesolowski regarding same (.2)	4.50	2,295.00
Kb	11/22/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from K. Beresford regarding Debtor's request for subcommittee conference call (.2)	0.20	134.00
O	11/22/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding motion to terminate exclusivity, Order Shortening Time regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
O	11/22/2013	Robert Franklin	Review order shortening time regarding Motion to terminate exclusivity (.2); correspondence Creditors Committee regarding same (.1)	0.30	153.00
P	11/22/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding Debtor's new Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement, correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
P	11/22/2013	Robert Franklin	Review Plan of Reorganization (November 22, 2013) filed by Debtor and correspondence Creditors Committee regarding same (.6)	0.60	306.00
O	11/24/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding motion to terminate exclusivity and Debtor's Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	67.00
Ba	11/25/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items (.1)	0.10	42.00
Pa	11/25/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding taking Disclosure Statement hearing off calendar, review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.1); review multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding insufficiency of Notice of Disclosure Statement hearing, objection to Disclosure Statement (.1); review Debtor's summary of changes to Disclosure Statement (.2); review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding motion to take hearing on debtor's Disclosure Statement off calendar (.1)	0.50	335.00
Pa	11/25/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding insufficiency of Notice of Disclosure Statement hearing, objection to Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	67.00
Pa	11/25/2013	Robert Franklin	Correspondence R. Harris regarding new Disclosure Statement and Plan (.2); review redlined plan and disclosure statement filed by the Debtor (.3); analysis and evaluation regarding same and necessity of re-noticing Disclosure Statement hearing (.5); interoffice conferences T. Hwang regarding same (.3)	1.30	663.00
Pa	11/25/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation and analysis Debtor's Disclosure Statement and Plan of Reorganization, and statements regarding same (.6); legal research regarding amended Disclosure Statement and regarding notice issues (.8); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.2); meetings R. Franklin regarding same (.2); review correspondences G. Kaplan, R. Franklin, R. Harris regarding same (.1); draft objection to Disclosure Statement and legal research regarding same (5.1)	7.00	2,940.00
Q	11/25/2013	Robert Franklin	Detailed telephone conference P. Marcoux regarding Committee plan (.2)	0.20	102.00

Kb	11/26/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding ON Semiconductor proposed settlement, correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
P	11/26/2013	Thomas Hwang	Correspondence S. Kim, R. Michelsen regarding Debtor's Disclosure Statement and Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	42.00
Pa	11/26/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding request to take hearing on debtor's Disclosure Statement off calendar, review correspondence to R. Harris regarding same (.1); review correspondence to/from S. Kim regarding debtor's new Disclosure Statement (.1); review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding comments to Debtor's new Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.30	201.00
Pa	11/26/2013	Robert Franklin	Draft request for continuance of Disclosure Statement hearing due to filing of new Disclosure Statement (1.4); draft Declaration in support thereof and proposed Order (.6); correspondence R. Harris regarding same (.1); review and revise and finalize all pleadings in support (1.0)	3.10	1,581.00
Pa	11/26/2013	Robert Franklin	Draft Opposition to approval of Disclosure Statement (3.2); detailed telephone conference R. Michelson regarding same (.2); correspondence Creditors Committee regarding same (.1)	3.50	1,785.00
Pa	11/26/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft objection to Disclosure Statement and legal research regarding same (6.2); memoranda R. Franklin regarding same, regarding request to continue hearing on Disclosure Statement (.2)	6.40	2,688.00
U	11/26/2013	Thomas Hwang	Correspondence S. Kim regarding subordination memorandum; investigation and review memorandum (.1)	0.10	42.00
L	11/27/2013	Robert Franklin	Finalize objection to use of cash collateral (1.1)	1.10	561.00
P	11/27/2013	John Murray	Review multiple from G. Felcyn regarding debtor's Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.20	134.00
Pa	11/27/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding objection to debtor's Disclosure Statement (.1); review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding court order denying motion to take hearing on debtor's Disclosure Statement off calendar, correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
Pa	11/27/2013	Robert Franklin	Continue preparation of Opposition to Disclosure Statement (5.4); correspondence with Committee members regarding same (.3)	5.70	2,907.00
Pa	11/27/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meetings R. Franklin regarding Debtor's Disclosure Statement and Plan of Reorganization, and regarding hearing on Disclosure Statement (.4); review Debtor's opposition to request to continue hearing (.2); draft reply to Debtor's opposition (2.3); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1); review Court order regarding same (.1); conference R. Franklin regarding same (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1); evaluation of local rules and bankruptcy rules regarding filing deadlines, regarding objection to Disclosure Statement, and legal research regarding same (.3); meeting and memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	3.70	1,554.00
U	11/27/2013	Thomas Hwang	Correspondence S. Kim regarding subordination memorandum, and meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
Kb	11/28/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to H. Binder and R. Harris regarding debtor's compliance with court's order regarding settlements (.1)	0.10	67.00
Pa	11/28/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding hearings on 12/4-5 (.1); review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding objection to debtor's Disclosure Statement (.1); review correspondence from R. Michelson regarding Brown's objection to debtor's Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.30	201.00
Q	11/28/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from G. Kaplan and C. Brown regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	67.00

Q	11/28/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences G. Kaplan, P. Marcoux, G. Felcyn regarding proposed Plan of Reorganization and case strategy	0.10	42.00
Kb	11/29/2013	John Murray	Analysis and evaluation debtor's multiple requests for subcommittee meeting regarding proposed settlements, review correspondence regarding same, review court's order regarding same, correspondence to H. Binder and R. Harris regarding same (1.5)	1.50	1,005.00
Kb	11/29/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to H. Binder and R. Harris regarding debtor's compliance with court's order re settlements (.3)	0.30	201.00
Pa	11/29/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences G. Felcyn, C. Brown, D. Wright and M. Imhof regarding Debtor's Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	42.00
Q	11/29/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from M. Imhoff, D. Wright and P. Marcoux regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	67.00
Pa	11/30/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding hearings of 12/4-5 (.1)	0.10	67.00
Pa	11/30/2013	Robert Franklin	Continue preparation of objection to Disclosure Statement (2.8)	2.80	1,428.00
Pa	11/30/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and revise Objection to Debtor's Disclosure Statement (4.1); memoranda R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	4.20	1,764.00
Q	11/30/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to M. Imhoff and C. Brown regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.1); review correspondence to/from G. Felcyn and P. Marcoux regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.20	134.00
L	12/1/2013	John Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding cash collateral order entered on 11/25, compare to earlier versions (.2)	0.20	134.00
Pa	12/1/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding objection to debtor's Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	67.00
Pa	12/1/2013	Robert Franklin	Continue preparation of and review and revise objection to Disclosure Statement (3.5)	3.50	1,785.00
Pa	12/1/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and revise Objection to Debtor's Disclosure Statement (3.0); memoranda R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	3.10	1,302.00
Kb	12/2/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from R. Franklin and P. Marcoux regarding ChipScale settlement (.1)	0.10	67.00
Kb	12/2/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence P. Marcoux and R. Franklin regarding Chipscale settlement agreement and Debtor payments, and review and evaluation settlement agreement (.2)	0.20	84.00
L	12/2/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding debtor's compliance with cash collateral order (.3); review multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and Creditors Committee regarding objection to debtor's cash collateral motion and Disclosure Statement (.2); review consent of Creditors Committee regarding cash collateral motion (.1)	0.60	402.00
L	12/2/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding payment of carve-out, and memoranda J. Murray regarding same (.2); review cash collateral order regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
Pa	12/2/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and revise objection to Disclosure Statement and comments by Committee members (2.1); detailed telephone conferences with D. Wright regarding same (.5); finalize objection to Disclosure Statement (1.0)	3.60	1,836.00
Pa	12/2/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences G. Kaplan, S. Kim regarding Objection to Disclosure Statement, and revise same (1.5); meetings R. Franklin regarding same (.2); meetings S. Bloomer regarding same (.4); review objections filed by Browns and Fujitsu (.2)	2.30	966.00
Q	12/2/2013	John Murray	Review, analysis and evaluation correspondence from D. Wright regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.20	134.00
Ba	12/3/2013	John Murray	Interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding this week's motions (.2)	0.20	134.00

Ec	12/3/2013	Thomas Hwang	Analysis and evaluation pleadings regarding Debtor's employment application of Heller and Henneman, and legal research regarding same (.9); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.4)	1.30	546.00
L	12/3/2013	John Murray	Review consent of CCC to cash collateral Motion (.1)	0.10	67.00
O	12/3/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding debtor's opposition to motion to terminate exclusivity (.1)	0.10	67.00
Q	12/3/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review drafts of Committee plan and Debtor's plan (.3); review correspondences R. Franklin and G. Felcyn, and correspondences G. Felcyn regarding same (.2)	0.50	210.00
Ec	12/4/2013	Robert Franklin	Prepare for hearing on Heller and Henneman application (1.3); attend hearing (.5)	1.80	918.00
Ec	12/4/2013	Thomas Hwang	Memorandum R. Franklin regarding employment application of Henneman and Heller (.1); meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
L	12/4/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding hearings (.1); attend hearing (telephonically) debtor's cash collateral motion and employment applications (1.8); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding form of cash collateral Order (.1); correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding hearing, correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (1.7)	3.70	2,479.00
L	12/4/2013	Robert Franklin	Prepare for cash collateral hearing and review Reply brief (1.5); attend hearing (.5)	2.00	1,020.00
L	12/4/2013	Robert Franklin	Draft correspondence Creditors Committee regarding 12-4 hearings regarding cash collateral, etc. (.3)	0.30	153.00
L	12/4/2013	Thomas Hwang	Attend (telephonically) hearing on cash collateral and employment applications of Heller and Henneman (1.1); review and analysis budget and Debtor's reply regarding cash collateral (.2); review correspondence G. Felcyn regarding same, and review memoranda J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	1.40	588.00
O	12/4/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding debtor's opposition to motion to terminate exclusivity (.2)	0.20	134.00
O	12/4/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences P. Marcoux, G. Felcyn regarding motion to terminate exclusivity (.1); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same, regarding Debtor's nonpayment of post-petition debts, regarding Monthly Operating Reports (.2)	0.30	126.00
Q	12/4/2013	Thomas Hwang	Revise drafts Plan of Reorganization, regarding Committee comments (.1);	0.10	42.00
Kb	12/5/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding litigation settlements (.3)	0.30	201.00
Kb	12/5/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences J. Murray, R. Harris regarding settlements (.1); review and evaluation order regarding settlement procedures (.2)	0.30	126.00
Pa	12/5/2013	John Murray	Attend hearing regarding approval of debtor's Disclosure Statement and Creditors Committee Motion to terminate exclusivity, multiple communications with R. Franklin regarding same (2.0); review multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding Court order granting motion to terminate exclusivity and next Creditors Committee conference call (.1)	2.10	1,407.00
Pa	12/5/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt re forecasts, etc., review forecasts, review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.2); multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris, R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding description of potential actions against insiders to include in debtor's Disclosure Statement (.2);	0.40	268.00
Pa	12/5/2013	Robert Franklin	Prepare for hearings on Motion to terminate exclusivity and objection to Disclosure Statement (4.0); attend hearings (3.3); interoffice conference T. Hwang and J. Murray regarding results and action items (.4); detailed telephone conference D. Wright regarding same (.4); review file for potential causes of action (.3); review correspondence S. Anhalt regarding financial projections (.4)	8.80	4,488.00

Pa	12/5/2013	Thomas Hwang	Attend (telephonically) hearing on Disclosure Statement and motion to terminate exclusivity (.9); exchange correspondences S. Kim regarding same; meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1); meetings R. Franklin regarding same (.2); meetings J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.3)	1.50	630.00
Pa	12/5/2013	Thomas Hwang	Memorandum R. Franklin regarding causes of action, Debtor's Disclosure Statement (.5); meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.60	252.00
Q	12/5/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding Brown's treatment under Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	67.00
Q	12/5/2013	Thomas Hwang	Prepare drafts of Plan of Reorganization, regarding Committee comments (1.0); correspondences Committee regarding same (.1); draft outlines of key provisions regarding same (.3)	1.40	588.00
O	12/6/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft Order regarding motion to terminate exclusivity (.5); correspondence R. Harris regarding same (.1); miscellaneous regarding same (.2)	0.80	336.00
Pa	12/6/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang to R. Harris regarding Debtor's Disclosure Statement and list of potential litigation (.1)	0.10	67.00
Pa	12/6/2013	Thomas Hwang	Correspondence R. Harris regarding Disclosure Statement, and regarding preserved actions and Debtor's projections (.7); memoranda R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.80	336.00
Q	12/6/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding committee conference call regarding committee Plan of Reorganization (.1); review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding committee Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.30	201.00
Q	12/6/2013	Thomas Hwang	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding case status, Plan of Reorganization (.1); draft outline summary regarding same (.3); correspondence Committee regarding same, regarding scheduling; memoranda J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.50	210.00
Qa	12/8/2013	Thomas Hwang	Correspondence to Committee regarding scheduling and meeting on Disclosure Statement and Plan of Reorganization; correspondence J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same	0.10	42.00
Ba	12/9/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, R. Franklin, S. O'Neill regarding case status and action items (.1)	0.10	42.00
Kb	12/9/2013	John Murray	Commence preparation of correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding debtor's consummation of settlements without Creditors Committee consent, commence preparation of correspondence to R. Harris regarding same, correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (1.2); review multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding Creditors Committee conference call (.1)	1.30	871.00
Kb	12/9/2013	Thomas Hwang	Analysis and evaluation settlement procedures pleadings and orders, and review correspondences J. Murray and R. Franklin regarding Debtor's settlements (.4); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.3)	0.70	294.00
Q	12/9/2013	Robert Franklin	Interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding contents of competing plan and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.5); review correspondence Creditors Committee relative to points to be made in competing plan and analysis and evaluation regarding same and Disclosure Statement (1.3)	1.80	918.00
Q	12/9/2013	Thomas Hwang	Correspondence Committee regarding scheduling and meeting; correspondence D. Wright regarding same; review correspondences Committee members regarding same (.1); memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same, regarding Committee's draft Plan of Reorganization (.1); meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
Bb	12/10/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding scheduling Creditors Committee conference call (.1); correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding interoffice conference regarding Creditors Committee conference call (.1)	0.20	134.00

Kb	12/10/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding Debtor's violation of court order (1.8); correspondence to R. Harris regarding same (1.6); review, analysis and evaluation correspondence from H. Binder regarding same (.8)	4.20	2,814.00
Kb	12/10/2013	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence regarding settlement protocol and analysis and evaluation regarding settlements not approved by Creditors Committee (1.0)	1.00	510.00
Kb	12/10/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences Committee members and J. Murray regarding case status, scheduling, Plan of Reorganization and Debtor's settlements (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1); review and analyze correspondence H. Binder and M. Brown regarding Debtor's settlements (.1)	0.40	168.00
Pa	12/10/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding debtor's revised Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement, correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding same, (.1); review multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding Debtor's misstatement of facts in Disclosure Statement (.1); review correspondence from Binder & Malter regarding errata to debtor's Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement, review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same, review correspondence from J. Wesolowski regarding same (.2)	0.40	268.00
Pa	12/10/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences R. Franklin, V. Torres, P. Marcoux, G. Felcyn and J. Murray regarding Debtor's amended Disclosure Statement and Plan of Reorganization (.1); review same and errata thereto (.3); review hearing transcripts regarding Disclosure Statement (.3)	0.70	294.00
Q	12/10/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization, review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding same, review draft of Plan of Reorganization (1.0)	1.00	670.00
Q	12/10/2013	Robert Franklin	Review draft of committee plan (.4)	0.40	204.00
Q	12/10/2013	Thomas Hwang	Analysis and evaluation Committee draft Plan of Reorganization and draft summary outline regarding same (3.0); memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	3.20	1,344.00
Qa	12/10/2013	Robert Franklin	Commence preparation of Disclosure Statement (1.7); prepare checklist of issues (.8)	2.50	1,275.00
S	12/10/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from S. Kim regarding Brown claim (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	12/11/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding agenda for Creditors Committee conference call, review detailed agenda and short form agenda re same (.2); multiple interoffice conferences with R. Franklin regarding communications with M. Brown (.3); prepare for Creditors Committee conference call, interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same, attend same (2.1); review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding minutes of Creditors Committee conference call, review minutes (.4)	3.00	2,010.00
Bb	12/11/2013	Robert Franklin	Prepare for meeting with Creditors Committee (2.0); attend meeting (1.6); interoffice conference T. Hwang and J. Murray regarding action items (.2)	3.80	1,938.00
Bb	12/11/2013	Thomas Hwang	Committee meeting (1.6); meeting R. Franklin, J. Murray regarding same (.2)	1.80	756.00
P	12/11/2013	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation and analysis Debtor's amended Plan of Reorganization (.5); draft summary regarding same (3.3)	3.80	1,596.00
Pa	12/11/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from Creditors Committee members regarding inaccuracies in debtor's Disclosure Statement (.1); review correspondence from R. Harris regarding redline of Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement, review same, review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.5)	0.60	402.00
Q	12/11/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding correspondence from K. Prochnow regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization, review same (.4)	0.40	268.00

Q	12/11/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review memoranda R. Franklin regarding Committee Plan of Reorganization issues and Committee meeting (.2)	0.20	84.00
R	12/11/2013	Thomas Hwang	Legal research regarding appointment of trustee, civil contempt (.7)	0.70	294.00
Bb	12/12/2013	John Murray	Review, analysis and evaluation regarding correspondence from M. Brown regarding Creditors Committee concerns (.3); review minutes of last committee meeting, review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.2)	0.50	335.00
J	12/12/2013	John Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding Application for Compensation (.1)	0.10	67.00
Pa	12/12/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Harris regarding "meet and confer" regarding Creditors Committee objection to debtor's Disclosure Statement, correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
Pa	12/12/2013	Robert Franklin	Review Debtor's revised Disclosure Statement and Plan of Reorganization (2.0); commence preparation of objection to Disclosure Statement (.9)	2.90	1,479.00
Q	12/12/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	67.00
Q	12/12/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meeting R. Franklin regarding Committee Plan of Reorganization (.1); Review and analysis correspondence P. Marcoux and proposed plan of K. Prochnow (.3); draft Committee Plan of Reorganization (2.2)	2.60	1,092.00
R	12/12/2013	John Murray	Commence preparation of motion for appointment of trustee and Order to Show Cause regarding contempt (2.3); multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding legal research regarding trustee motion, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.7)	3.00	2,010.00
R	12/12/2013	Thomas Hwang	Legal research regarding appointment of trustee and contempt (2.3); memoranda regarding same (1.0)	3.30	1,386.00
Bb	12/13/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to committee regarding status, correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (1.3); attend Creditors Committee conference call regarding same, post-call meeting with R. Franklin regarding same (1.0)	2.30	1,541.00
Bb	12/13/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and revise correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding status (.4)	0.40	204.00
Bb	12/13/2013	Robert Franklin	Meeting with Creditors Committee regarding miscellaneous issues and Plan of Reorganization (1.0)	1.00	510.00
Bb	12/13/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence M. Brown and memoranda from R. Franklin and J. Murray regarding same (.1); attend Committee meeting (1.0)	1.10	462.00
Pa	12/13/2013	Robert Franklin	Continue preparation of Opposition to December Disclosure Statement and Creditors Committee's Disclosure Statement (6.0)	6.00	3,060.00
Q	12/13/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft Plan of Reorganization (5.8); meetings R. Franklin regarding same (.1); analysis and evaluation projections and correspondences R. Franklin, and memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.4)	6.30	2,646.00
R	12/13/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation of motion for appointment of trustee and Order to Show Cause regarding contempt (4.5); correspondence to team regarding Motion for Order Shortening Time (.1)	4.60	3,082.00
Pa	12/14/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from Creditors Committee regarding availability (.1); review multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding objection to debtor's Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.20	134.00
Pa	12/14/2013	Robert Franklin	Continue preparation of objection to Debtor's Disclosure Statement (1.4)	1.40	714.00
Q	12/14/2013	Thomas Hwang	Legal research and analysis regarding Committee Plan of Reorganization and draft same (9.0)	9.00	3,780.00
R	12/14/2013	John Murray	Commence preparation of motion for Order Shortening Time regarding trustee /contempt motion (1.7); commence preparation of Declaration in support of trustee /contempt motion (.5); multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding trustee /contempt motion (1.5); correspondence to/from P. Marcoux regarding same (.1); correspondence to/from S. Kim regarding same (.1); continue preparation of trustee/contempt motion (.5)	4.40	2,948.00

R	12/14/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences Committee members and J. Murray, regarding case strategy and trustee motion (.1); review trustee motion (.1); memoranda J. Murray regarding same (.3)	0.50	210.00
Kb	12/15/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding settlements (.1)	0.10	67.00
Q	12/15/2013	Thomas Hwang	Legal research and analysis regarding Plan of Reorganization and draft same (4.7); memoranda R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	4.80	2,016.00
Qa	12/15/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding Committee's Disclosure Statement and Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.20	134.00
Qa	12/15/2013	Robert Franklin	Continue draft of Disclosure Statement (4.0)	4.00	2,040.00
Qa	12/15/2013	Thomas Hwang	Continue preparation of creditor Disclosure Statement (2.5)	2.50	1,050.00
R	12/15/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation of trustee/contempt motion (6.7); multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding same (.6) review multiple correspondence from D. Wright regarding same, correspondence to D. Wright regarding same and regarding Creditors Committee's Plan of Reorganization (.2)	7.50	5,025.00
R	12/15/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding trustee/contempt Motion (.6); multiple correspondence to/from S. Kim regarding state court litigation transcripts (.2); correspondence to G. Felcyn and S. Kim regarding their Declarations in support of trustee/contempt Motion (.1)	0.90	603.00
R	12/15/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft insert to trustee motion, regarding Alliacense (1.0); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	1.10	462.00
Pa	12/16/2013	Robert Franklin	Detailed conference call with R. Harris and S. Anhalt regarding "meet and confer" conference for Debtor's Disclosure Statement hearing (.6); continue preparation of objection to Disclosure Statement (.9)	1.50	765.00
Q	12/16/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and revise creditor Plan of Reorganization (1.2)	1.20	612.00
Q	12/16/2013	Robert Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding Committee Plan of Reorganization and classification issues (.7); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same (.2); review and revise Plan of Reorganization (.4); draft correspondence Creditors Committee regarding same (.2)	1.50	765.00
Q	12/16/2013	Thomas Hwang	Telephone conferences R. Franklin regarding Plan of Reorganization (.4); revise same (2.2); memoranda R. Franklin regarding same (.2); review and analysis correspondences R. Franklin, S. Kim, M. Brown, G. Felcyn regarding classification issues, regarding Plan of Reorganization (.2); review correspondence G. Felcyn and correspondence R. Franklin regarding same (.1); review and respond to correspondences M. Brown regarding Plan of Reorganization (.2)	3.30	1,386.00
Qa	12/16/2013	Robert Franklin	Continue preparation of Committee's Disclosure Statement (2.2)	2.20	1,122.00
Qa	12/16/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft Disclosure Statement (1.0)	1.00	420.00
R	12/16/2013	John Murray	Review, analysis and evaluation correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding trustee/contempt motion, correspondence to G. Kaplan regarding same; correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding same (.6); multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding trustee/contempt motion, revise Motion per Creditors Committee's comments (4.9); preparation of JWM Declaration in support of motion (.8); multiple correspondence to/from team regarding same, multiple interoffice conferences team regarding same (.7); preparation of motion, declaration and order shortening time for hearing on trustee/contempt motion (2.0); review multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee and team regarding Creditors Committee's Plan of Reorganization (.3)	9.30	6,231.00

R	12/16/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and revise Motion to appoint a trustee (1.6); draft Declaration of Sallie Kim (.3); draft Declaration of Gloria Felcyn (.3); review and revise same (.1); review Declarations of Cliff Flowers and Carl Johnson (.4); multiple correspondence and telephone conference with C. Hoge, AC. Johnson regarding same (.4); finalize Motion, prepare exhibits, multiple correspondence S. Kim regarding exhibits (1.8)	4.90	2,499.00
R	12/16/2013	Robert Franklin	Detailed telephone conference with D. Wright regarding Motion to appoint a Chapter 11 Trustee (.4)	0.40	204.00
R	12/16/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and revise trustee motion, and legal research regarding same (.7); review correspondences G. Kaplan, G. Felcyn, D. Wright regarding same; memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.80	336.00
D	12/17/2013	John Murray	Telephone conference with S. McNutt regarding Agility's compensation (.2)	0.20	134.00
Pa	12/17/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding objection to Debtor's Disclosure Statement, review multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding same, multiple interoffice conferences with R. Franklin regarding same, prepare for hearing regarding same (.8)	0.80	536.00
Pa	12/17/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation for hearing on approval of debtor's Disclosure Statement (2.0)	2.00	1,340.00
Pa	12/17/2013	John Murray	Review objection by Fujitso to debtor's Disclosure Statement; review Brown's first and second objections to debtor's Disclosure Statement (.4); prepare for hearing regarding debtor's Disclosure Statement (1.5)	1.90	1,273.00
Pa	12/17/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and revise objection to Debtor's Disclosure Statement (2.2); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same (.2); finalize same (.7)	3.10	1,581.00
Pa	12/17/2013	Thomas Hwang	Revise objection to Debtor's Disclosure Statement, and review comments from Committee regarding same (1.6); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	1.70	714.00
Q	12/17/2013	John Murray	Interoffice conference R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding ` Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.2); multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
Q	12/17/2013	John Murray	Legal research regarding rules of evidence (.2); legal research regarding Section 1125(b) (.2)	0.40	268.00
Q	12/17/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meetings R. Franklin regarding creditor Plan of Reorganization (.2); meeting R. Franklin, J. Murray regarding same (.2); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.5); review and analysis comments from Committee to same; draft, revise same (2.5)	3.40	1,428.00
Qa	12/17/2013	Robert Franklin	Continue preparation of Creditors Committee's Disclosure Statement (1.2); analysis and evaluation regarding Plan of Reorganization (1.2); interoffice conference T Hwang regarding same (.4); interoffice conference J. Murray and T. Hwang regarding same (.2); review and revise Plan of Reorganization (.2); review and revise Disclosure Statement (.8); correspondence and telephone conference with Committee members regarding status and comments (.4)	4.40	2,244.00
Qa	12/17/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft, revise Disclosure Statement (3.8)	3.80	1,596.00
R	12/17/2013	John Murray	Analysis and evaluation message from K. Prochnow regarding motion for Order Shortening Time regarding trustee motion (.1)	0.10	67.00
R	12/17/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to H. Binder regarding debtor's response to trustee motion, review same (.7)	0.70	469.00
Kb	12/18/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding correspondence from K. Beresford regarding settlements, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
Kb	12/18/2013	Thomas Hwang	Investigation regarding settlement procedures order and meeting regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
Pa	12/18/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation for hearing regarding debtor's Disclosure Statement (2.8); attend hearing regarding same (2.8)	5.60	3,752.00

Pa	12/18/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding debtor's reply to Opposition to Disclosure Statement (.1); review correspondence to/from G. Kaplan regarding debtor's Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement (.1); correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding deadlines for Objections to debtor's Disclosure Statement (.1); review multiple correspondence from G. Felcyn, C. Johnson and D. Wright regarding hearing on debtor's Disclosure Statement, review court's minute order regarding same (.2); correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding hearing dates and deadlines, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2); correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding action items (.2)	0.90	603.00
Pa	12/18/2013	Robert Franklin	Prepare for hearing on December 9 regarding Debtor's Disclosure Statement (2.5); attend hearing (2.0); interoffice conference J. Murray and T. Hwang regarding action items (.2); analysis and evaluation regarding same and draft action item list (.5)	5.20	2,652.00
Pa	12/18/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review Debtor's response to Committee objection to Disclosure Statement and meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.3)	0.30	126.00
Pa	12/18/2013	Thomas Hwang	Meetings J. Murray and R. Franklin regarding hearing on objection to disclosure statement and motion to appoint trustee (.2); review correspondences J. Murray and R. Franklin regarding same, regarding case action items; review correspondences J. Murray, H. Binder regarding briefing schedule (.1)	0.30	126.00
Q	12/18/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding correspondence from C. Hoge regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Q	12/18/2013	Thomas Hwang	Correspondence Committee regarding Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	42.00
R	12/18/2013	John Murray	Review debtor's response to trustee/contempt motion, correspondence to committee regarding same (.8)	0.80	536.00
R	12/18/2013	John Murray	Analysis and evaluation post hearing logistics (1.1)	1.10	737.00
R	12/18/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review Debtor's statement and filings regarding motion to appoint trustee, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.2)	0.20	84.00
S	12/18/2013	John Murray	Review multiple notices of claim transfer regarding Shore Chan claim (.1)	0.10	67.00
F	12/19/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding fees and costs for November Monthly Operating Report, interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same, review correspondence to R. Shakoori regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
F	12/19/2013	Thomas Hwang	Correspondence J. Murray regarding Debtor Monthly Operating Report, regarding professional fees; meeting J. Murray regarding same (.1); investigation regarding same, and review and respond correspondence R. Shakoori regarding same (.3)	0.40	168.00
O	12/19/2013	Thomas Hwang	Exchange correspondence R. Harris regarding Order on Motion to Terminate exclusivity (.1); review Order and prepare redline to same (.1); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
Qa	12/19/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/ from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding notice of hearing regarding Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.1); review multiple correspondence from R. Franklin regarding exhibits to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (projections) (.1); review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding motion for plan procedure and solicitation order (.1)	0.30	201.00
Qa	12/19/2013	Robert Franklin	Review Notice of Hearing on Disclosure Statement (.2); multiple correspondence and telephone conference with R. Harris regarding same (.3); draft action item list (.5); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding Exhibits to Disclosure Statement (.2)	1.20	612.00

Qa	12/19/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft, revise notice of hearing regarding creditor's Disclosure Statement (1.0); review local and bankruptcy rules regarding same (.3); meetings R. Franklin, J. Murray regarding same (.2); review correspondences R. Franklin, J. Murray, R. Harris, R. Bracegirdle regarding same, and review Court orders regarding same (.3); attention to preparation of service lists, and attention to service and filing issues; multiple meetings S. Bloomer, C. Cavazos regarding same (1.1); telephone conference with R. Shakoori regarding same (.1); review correspondence R. Franklin regarding Disclosure Statement and exhibits, and meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	3.10	1,302.00
R	12/19/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from R Harris regarding transcript of hearing regarding dates and deadlines fixed by court, review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding same, review correspondence to/from court Clerk regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
R	12/19/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft, revise notice of hearing regarding motion to appoint trustee (.5); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same; meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.60	252.00
Bc	12/20/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft meeting minutes for December 13 meeting (1.8)	1.80	756.00
F	12/20/2013	John Murray	Review debtor's Monthly Operating Report, analysis and evaluation regarding same, review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same, review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
F	12/20/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation Monthly Operating Report (.1)	0.10	42.00
Nb	12/20/2013	John Murray	Conference H. Binder regarding consensual plan (2.0)	2.00	1,340.00
Pa	12/20/2013	John Murray	Review debtor's notice of hearing regarding Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	67.00
Pa	12/20/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding review of hearing CD, preparation of action item memorandum regarding same, and summary of objections to debtor's Disclosure Statement dealt with by court and to be excluded from further objections, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Pa	12/20/2013	Robert Franklin	Review CD of the December Disclosure Statement hearing and review and revise action item memorandum (1.5)	1.50	765.00
Qa	12/20/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from C. Cavazos regarding notice of hearing regarding Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement and trustee motion (.1);	0.10	67.00
Qa	12/20/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review notice regarding creditor Disclosure Statement and notice regarding motion to appoint trustee, and attention to filing and service of same (.2); review action item list, and correspondences J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding Disclosure Statement (.1); meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.40	168.00
F	12/21/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding November Monthly Operating Report (.1)	0.10	67.00
Q	12/21/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding review of Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bc	12/23/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft meeting minutes for December 13 meeting	0.90	378.00
D	12/23/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence R. Neilson and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
P	12/23/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from V. Torres regarding Debtor's revised Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	67.00
Q	12/23/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding rejection of Core Flash and Fast Logic executory contracts, etc. (.2); review correspondence from K. Hiensch regarding Fujitsu and Creditors Committee's Plan of Reorganization, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2);	0.40	268.00

Q	12/23/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and potential settlement with debtor (.2); review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding inquiry R. Neilson regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement (.1); review multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement (.2)	0.50	335.00
Qa	12/23/2013	Thomas Hwang	Attention regarding service and filing of Disclosure Statement and notice regarding same, regarding motion to appoint trustee; meetings S. Bloomer regarding same (.5)	0.50	210.00
Qa	12/23/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review Disclosure Statement and draft supplemental language to same (.4)	0.40	168.00
R	12/23/2013	Thomas Hwang	Analysis and evaluation regarding motion for trustee and Plan of Reorganization and regarding correspondence from J. Murray, regarding case status and action items, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (1.9)	1.90	798.00
U	12/23/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from team regarding legal research regarding subordination and re characterization of insider claims (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bb	12/24/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding MMP, PDS and Alliacense (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	12/24/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding Alliacense and Patriot, analysis and evaluation regarding same, involuntary bankruptcy against Alliacense, substantive consolidation (.2)	0.20	134.00
D	12/24/2013	John Murray	Review message from S. McNutt regarding Agility, telephone conference with S. McNutt regarding same (.1); review correspondence from creditor V. Currington, correspondence to T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
O	12/24/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding Order terminating exclusivity (.1)	0.10	67.00
R	12/24/2013	John Murray	Review message from C. Johnson regarding Declaration regarding threats from D. Leckrone, miscellaneous regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
D	12/26/2013	John Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding correspondence form R. Neilson regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	67.00
D	12/26/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence J. Murray regarding R. Neilson, and review and respond correspondence R. Neilson regarding Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement (.2)	0.20	84.00
J	12/26/2013	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from V. Chial regarding Application for Compensation, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
O	12/26/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding order granting motion to terminate exclusivity (.1)	0.10	67.00
O	12/26/2013	Thomas Hwang	Memorandum J. Murray regarding order, regarding motion to terminate exclusivity (.1)	0.10	42.00
J	12/27/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (.9); multiple correspondence to V. Chial regarding same (.1)	1.00	670.00
Q	12/27/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft amended Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.20	84.00
Qa	12/27/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft amended Disclosure Statement (.4)	0.40	168.00
R	12/27/2013	John Murray	Review Court docket regarding C. Moore's Motion to appoint Trustee, etc. (.1)	0.10	67.00
Qa	12/29/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft amended Disclosure Statement	1.20	504.00
Bb	12/30/2013	John Murray	Review detailed correspondence from C. Hoge regarding Alliacense, review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
J	12/30/2013	John Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (2.3); correspondence to H. Binder regarding negotiations on Applications for Compensation, review court calendar regarding same, legal research regarding service of notice regarding same (.2)	2.50	1,675.00

P	12/30/2013	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding Debtor's Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement and C. Moore's motion for appointment of trustee (.1)	0.10	67.00
P	12/30/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding Debtor's revised Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement (.1); correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding review of hearing CD; objection to debtor's Disclosure Statement and preparation of memorandum regarding action items (.1); review and revise action items memorandum (.2)	0.40	268.00
P	12/30/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review Debtor's amended Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement, and correspondence Committee regarding same (.2); correspondence V. Torres regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
Pa	12/30/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding objection to debtor's Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	67.00
Q	12/30/2013	John Murray	Preparation of memorandum regarding Plan of Reorganization action items (.3); correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding confirmation procedures motion (.1)	0.40	268.00
Q	12/30/2013	John Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization regarding treatment of secured creditors, subordination, etc. (.4); correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding plan procedures / solicitation motion (.1)	0.50	335.00
Q	12/30/2013	Robert Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding plan issues and rejection of executory contracts (.2) review correspondence K. Heinsh regarding Fujitsu issues (.1); review correspondence G. Felcyn regarding projections and Alliacense issue (.2); review action items (.4)	0.90	459.00
Q	12/30/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft amended Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.20	84.00
Qa	12/30/2013	Thomas Hwang	Draft amended Disclosure Statement (2.1)	2.10	882.00
R	12/30/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review Motion of C. Moore regarding appointment of trustee (.2); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
A	12/31/2013	Robert Franklin	Review and revise action item list (.5); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same (.2)	0.70	357.00
Q	12/31/2013	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding current version of Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement, miscellaneous regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
Q	12/31/2013	Thomas Hwang	Review and respond correspondence D. Wright regarding Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement (.1); meetings R. Franklin regarding Plan of Reorganization (.2); review and evaluation action items (.1)	0.40	168.00
A	1/2/2014	John Murray	Review detailed memorandum from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding issues and action items, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
Bb	1/2/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding implications of ITC ruling, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2); review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding replacement of management (.1)	0.30	201.00
I	1/2/2014	Robert Franklin	Review executory contracts issues and telephone conference with G. Felcyn regarding same (.5)	0.50	255.00
J	1/2/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from H. Binder regarding Applications for Compensation (.1)	0.10	67.00
P	1/2/2014	Thomas Hwang	Meetings R. Franklin regarding Committee's Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement (.2); review correspondences G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
Q	1/2/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Q	1/2/2014	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.3)	0.30	201.00
Q	1/2/2014	Robert Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding issues and action items and draft memorandum regarding same creditor Plan of Organization (2.6); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same (.2)	2.80	1,428.00

Q	1/2/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review memorandum R. Franklin regarding Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement, regarding case strategy and issues, and regarding motion for contempt and appointment of trustee, and memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.3); legal research regarding same (.2)	0.50	210.00
R	1/2/2014	John Murray	Telephone conference with S. Caplan regarding Motion for appointment of Trustee, etc. (.3); review correspondence from K. Prochnow to H. Binder regarding C. Moore's joinder in motion to appoint trustee, etc. (.1)	0.40	268.00
R	1/2/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from K. Prochnow regarding telephone conference with H. Binder regarding Order Shortening Time regarding C. Moore Motion for appointment of trustee (.1)	0.10	67.00
R	1/2/2014	Robert Franklin	Review evidentiary issues for trustee motion (.3); correspondence with and detailed telephone conference K. Prochnow regarding Moore's Motion to appoint Chapter 11 Trustee (.5)	0.80	408.00
Bb	1/3/2014	Robert Franklin	Detailed telephone conference David Wright regarding action items and status of hearings (.4)	0.40	204.00
I	1/3/2014	Robert Franklin	Review commercialization agreements with MCM and HSM and Alliacense (.2); draft correspondence G. Felcyn regarding same (.3); analysis and evaluation regarding executory contracts (.5); review license agreements (.9)	1.90	969.00
Q	1/3/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding new management candidate (.1)	0.10	67.00
Q	1/3/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences R. Franklin, G. Felcyn regarding Plan of Reorganization and regarding Fast Logic and CoreFlash portfolios	0.20	84.00
I	1/5/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from K. Hiensch regarding Fujitsu, miscellaneous regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
J	1/5/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding timing of Applications for Compensation, review court's calendar regarding same, analysis and evaluation re same (.3)	0.30	201.00
Pa	1/5/2014	Robert Franklin	Draft objection to Debtor's December 23 Disclosure Statement (1.3)	1.30	663.00
A	1/6/2014	John Murray	Draft memorandum regarding action items (1.6)	1.60	1,072.00
Ba	1/6/2014	Robert Franklin	Review action item memo from J. Murray (.3); interoffice conference J. Murray and T. Hwang regarding same (2.0);	2.30	1,173.00
Ba	1/6/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review memoranda J. Murray regarding case action items, trustee and contempt motion, Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement (.2); meeting J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (2.0)	2.20	924.00
I	1/6/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding inquiry from K. Hiensch regarding Fujitsu (.1); correspondence to K. Hiensch regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
J	1/6/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to V. Chial regarding project billing categories for Application for Compensation, mock up pro forma regarding same, continue preparation of project billing categories' (.3)	0.30	201.00
J	1/6/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to V. Chial regarding Application for Compensation (.5)	0.50	335.00
Nb	1/6/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding potential settlement discussions, miscellaneous regarding same (.6); multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding potential settlement discussions, miscellaneous regarding same (.1); draft outline of potential settlement proposal, correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (1.4); draft talking points regarding potential settlement (.2)	2.30	1,541.00
Nb	1/6/2014	John Murray	Preparation of outline of topics to discuss with G. Felcyn and H. Binder regarding competing Plans of Reorganization; correspondence to each regarding same (2.1); telephone conference with H. Binder regarding possible consensual Plan of Reorganization (.4); commence preparation of outline regarding same, correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.8)	3.30	2,211.00
Nb	1/6/2014	Robert Franklin	Review potential proposal to Debtor and analysis and evaluation regarding same and draft response to J. Murray regarding issues (.5)	0.50	255.00

Nb	1/6/2014	Thomas Hwang	Memorandum J. Murray regarding potential negotiation points with Debtor, and review and evaluation correspondences J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.5)	0.50	210.00
R	1/6/2014	John Murray	Preparation of action item memorandum regarding Motion for appointment of Trustee and confirmation hearings (1.5); attend interoffice conference R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (2.0)	3.50	2,345.00
R	1/6/2014	John Murray	Draft correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding review of trustee motion and Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.20	134.00
R	1/6/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation Debtor's opposition C. Moore joinder motion, regarding appointment of trustee	0.10	42.00
Bb	1/7/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding motion for order approving compensation to Creditors Committee members as consultants (.1);	0.10	67.00
Bb	1/7/2014	Robert Franklin	Correspondence with Committee regarding input on topics (.3)	0.30	153.00
I	1/7/2014	John Murray	Review detailed correspondence from K. Heinsch regarding Fujitsu license and Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Nb	1/7/2014	John Murray	Prepare for telephone conference with G. Felcyn regarding action items going forward and costs attendant thereto, and potential negotiations with debtor toward a consensual plan (.5); telephone conference with D. Wright regarding action items and strategy going forward (.5)	1.00	670.00
Nb	1/7/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from N. Antonoplis regarding potential settlement, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
P	1/7/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from V. Torres regarding debtor's Plan of Reorganization, correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
P	1/7/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review and respond correspondence V. Torres regarding Debtor's Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement, and correspondence Committee regarding same	0.10	42.00
Pa	1/7/2014	Robert Franklin	Review redlined Disclosure Statement and continue preparation of objection to same (.4)	0.40	204.00
Q	1/7/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding fiduciaries under Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization, correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.2); multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization, new management and settlement, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2); review multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding projections regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2); correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding action items regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.1); review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding issues regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2); review correspondence from D. Wright regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	1.10	737.00
Q	1/7/2014	Robert Franklin	Review plan projections and correspondence with G. Felcyn regarding same (.8); correspondence with G. Felcyn regarding executory contracts to be assumed or rejected (.2); correspondence T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	1.10	561.00
Q	1/7/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review memoranda R. Franklin and J. Murray regarding case action items and regarding Committee Plan of Reorganization and objection to Debtor's Disclosure Statement (.2); memorandum R. Franklin, J. Murray regarding action items (.4)	0.60	252.00
Q	1/7/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences D. Wright, J. Murray regarding Committee Plan of Reorganization, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same	0.10	42.00

R	1/7/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to/from S. Caplan regarding Patriot, review correspondence from S. Caplan to C. Flowers regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
R	1/7/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding additional evidence regarding trustee motion (.1)	0.10	67.00
A	1/8/2014	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from T. Bracegirdle regarding continuance of Status Conference, correspondence to S. Bloomer regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
I	1/8/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from L. McDowell regarding Toshiba license and Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	67.00
Nb	1/8/2014	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence with G. Felcyn and N. Antonopoulus regarding settlement ideas (.3)	0.30	153.00
Q	1/8/2014	John Murray	Review detailed correspondence from S. Kim, G. Felcyn and R. Franklin regarding D. Leckrone and PDS regarding capital call issue(.2); review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding projections regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization, review projections (.3)	0.50	335.00
Q	1/8/2014	Robert Franklin	Continue review of projections and detailed telephone conference G. Felcyn regarding same (.7)	0.70	357.00
Q	1/8/2014	Robert Franklin	Review ITC decision (.2); analysis and evaluation regarding power of Creditors Committee representative on PDS Management Committee and restoration of seat to D. Leckrone and review correspondence with S. Kim and G. Felcyn regarding same (.5)	0.70	357.00
V	1/8/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding consent to Order Shortening Time regarding Creditors Committee motion for authority to bring actions, correspondence to team regarding same (.1); multiple correspondence to team regarding actions against insiders (.8)	0.90	603.00
V	1/8/2014	John Murray	Review continuance from H. Binder regarding Order Shortening Time regarding standing motion, multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
V	1/8/2014	Robert Franklin	Legal research regarding standing (2.3)	2.30	1,173.00
V	1/8/2014	Thomas Hwang	Meetings J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items, regarding subordination and recharacterization of claims (.1); review memoranda J. Murray and R. Franklin regarding same (.1); legal research regarding subordination and regarding derivative standing and memoranda J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (2.6); draft motion for derivative standing (1.6)	4.40	1,848.00
A	1/9/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from T. Bracegirdle regarding continuance of Status Conference (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	1/9/2014	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin, G. Felcyn and P. Marcoux regarding implications of ITC ruling and PDS capital call (.2)	0.20	134.00
G	1/9/2014	Robert Franklin	Draft Application for Rule 2004 Examination (1.2)	1.20	612.00
I	1/9/2014	Robert Franklin	Detailed telephone conference with E. Friedman regarding Hewlett Packard license (.2)	0.20	102.00
Pa	1/9/2014	John Murray	Review Creditors Committee Opposition to debtor's Disclosure Statement (.3)	0.30	201.00
Pa	1/9/2014	Robert Franklin	Continue preparation of objection to December 23 Disclosure Statement (1.5); correspondence with G. Felcyn and Creditors Committee regarding same (.2); detailed telephone conference with G. Felcyn regarding PDS Management Committee (.2); finalize objection (.5)	2.40	1,224.00
Pa	1/9/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review and analysis correspondences R. Franklin, G. Felcyn, S. Kim and P. Marcoux regarding objection to Disclosure Statement, Debtor allegations and financial projections (.3); review and revise objection to Disclosure Statement (.9)	1.20	504.00

Q	1/9/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from G. Charles regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement (.1); review multiple correspondence to/from P. Marcoux and G. Felcyn regarding projections regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2); review multiple correspondence to/from C. Curry, G. Felcyn and G. Kaplan regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization regarding Alliacense involvement going forward, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.50	335.00
Q	1/9/2014	Robert Franklin	Detailed telephone conference with G. Felcyn regarding projections (.2); correspondence with Creditors Committee regarding same (.2); review correspondence with P. Marcoux and G. Felcyn regarding same (.2)	0.60	306.00
Q	1/9/2014	Thomas Hwang	Correspondence G. Charles regarding Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement	0.10	42.00
R	1/9/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding debtor's Opposition to Trustee motion, review same (.5); review Court order denying debtor's motion to file documents under seal (.1); review correspondence from V. Torres regarding debtor's Opposition to Trustee motion, Declaration of D. Leckrone, review multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn, P. Marcoux and R. Franklin regarding same (.2); review correspondence from S. Kim regarding Creditors Committee members contacts with debtor (.1)	0.90	603.00
R	1/9/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation Debtor's opposition to Motion to Appoint Trustee (.2); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
V	1/9/2014	Thomas Hwang	Legal research regarding derivative standing (.5); draft motion for derivative standing (2.2); meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	2.80	1,176.00
Nb	1/10/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding settlement with debtor, review correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Q	1/10/2014	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization, classification, Disclosure Statement and PDS (.3)	0.30	201.00
R	1/10/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux and enclosed declaration of D. Leckrone regarding Leckrone's communications with Creditors Committee members (.3) telephone conference with K. Prochnow regarding trustee motion (.2); analysis and evaluation regarding multiple correspondence from S. Caplan regarding D. Leckrone conduct (.3); review response, correspondence from creditor, commene preparation of reply (2.5)	3.30	2,211.00
R	1/10/2014	John Murray	Review Court Order denying C. Moore Motion for Order Shortening Time regarding joinder regarding Trustee motion (.1); review, analysis and evaluation Declaration of D. Leckrone regarding receipt of confidential Creditors Committee communications, correspondence to/from C. Hoge, R. Franklin regarding same, correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.2); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding debtor's Opposition to trustee motion (.1); review debtor's motion to file documents under seal regarding trustee motion (.2)	0.60	402.00
R	1/10/2014	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence P. Marcoux regarding D. Leckrone receiving inside information from one or more committee members (.1); review Leckrone Declaration filed in state court (.3); correspondence with and detailed telephone conference with P. Marcoux regarding same and status of Committee Plan of Reorganization (.4); interoffice conference J. Murray regarding Leckrone Declaration (.1); review Opposition by Debtor to Motion (1.1); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	2.10	1,071.00

R	1/10/2014	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation motion to appoint trustee (.2); review correspondences P. Marcoux, G. Felcyn, M. Imhof regarding communications with D. Leckrone and Debtor opposition to motion to appoint trustee (.1); investigation regarding same, and review D. Leckrone pleadings filed in state court action regarding same (.2)	0.50	210.00
V	1/10/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding Order Shortening Time regarding standing motion (.1)	0.10	67.00
V	1/10/2014	Thomas Hwang	Draft motion for derivative standing (2.8); meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	2.90	1,218.00
J	1/11/2014	John Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (4.0); analysis and evaluation regarding hearing dates for Application for Compensation, correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding same (.2)	4.20	2,814.00
J	1/11/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to V. Chial regarding Application for Compensation (.1)	0.10	67.00
L	1/11/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to H. Binder regarding debtor's compliance with cash collateral order regarding payments of carve outs (.1)	0.10	67.00
Q	1/11/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding discussions regarding projections regarding Plan of Reorganization and availability for conference call regarding same, miscellaneous regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
R	1/11/2014	John Murray	Continue review of Debtor's Opposition to motion for appointment of Trustee (1.2); continue preparation for hearing on motion to appoint Trustee (.9);	2.10	1,407.00
V	1/11/2014	Thomas Hwang	Draft motion for derivative standing	3.10	1,302.00
G	1/12/2014	Robert Franklin	Draft Application for Rule 2004 Examination of Alliacense (.8); draft proposed order (.2); review December 23 Disclosure Statement draft Production of Documents (1.3);	2.30	1,173.00
J	1/12/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding scheduling hearing on professionals Applications for Compensation (.1);correspondence to V. Chial regarding Application for Compensation (.1)	0.20	134.00
Q	1/12/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding conference call regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization regarding projections (.1)	0.10	67.00
R	1/12/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. MArcox regarding D. Leckrone's conduct (.1); review and revise Motion regarding standing, multiple correspondence to/from correspondence from T. Hwang regarding same (.2)	0.30	201.00
V	1/12/2014	Thomas Hwang	Draft motion for derivative standing (2.8); draft motion for Order Shortening Time (.5)	3.30	1,386.00
G	1/13/2014	Robert Franklin	Review and revise application for Rule 2004 Examination and production of documents (.3)	0.30	153.00
I	1/13/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from L. McDowell regarding Toshiba license and Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement, review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding same, review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.2); review multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding discussion of licenses in Disclosure Statement (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding assumption of licenses (.1)	0.40	268.00
I	1/13/2014	Thomas Hwang	Telephone conference with L. McDowell regarding Plan of Reorganization and treatment of executory contracts (.1); memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.1); analysis and evaluation correspondence L. McDowell regarding same (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same (.2)	0.50	210.00
J	1/13/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to V. Chial regarding Application for Compensation (.3); telephone conference with V. Chial regarding same (.2); continue preparation of Application for Compensation, correspondence to V. Chial regarding same (1.5)	2.00	1,340.00
J	1/13/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to V. Chial regarding Application for Compensation (.2)	0.20	134.00
Nb	1/13/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding negotiations with debtor (.1)	0.10	67.00

Nb	1/13/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn and D. Wright regarding settlement with debtor (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn, R. Franklin regarding conference call regarding settlement with debtor (.1); correspondence to H. Binder regarding settlement (.1)	0.30	201.00
Nb	1/13/2014	Robert Franklin	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding settlement negotiation (.1)	0.10	51.00
Q	1/13/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from P. Marcoux, D. Wright and G. Felcyn regarding conference call regarding Creditors Committee's Plan of Reorganization (.2); conference call G. Felcyn, P. Marcoux and D. Wright regarding modifications to Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (1.0); interoffice conference R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	1.30	871.00
Q	1/13/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from P. Marcoux, D. Wright, G. Felcyn and R. Franklin regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization , analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding revised forecasts regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.3); review correspondence from C. Brown regarding post-confirmation composition of Board of Directors (.1)	0.70	469.00
Q	1/13/2014	Robert Franklin	Conference call with D. Wright, P. Marcoux, G. Felcyn and J. Murray regarding revisions to plan, projections and post-confirmation business plan (1.0); interoffice conference T. Hwang and J. Murray regarding same (.1); review revised projections (.1)	1.20	612.00
Q	1/13/2014	Thomas Hwang	Telephone conference with G. Felcyn, D. Wright, P. Marcoux regarding Plan of Reorganization and case status (1.0); meeting R. J. Murray, Franklin regarding same; conference with R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	1.10	462.00
R	1/13/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding reply to debtor's response to motion of appoint trustee (.1); interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same (.1); review correspondence from S. Kim regarding same, correspondence to committee regarding same (.1); continue preparation of reply to debtor's Opposition to motion for appointment of trustee (.8)	1.10	737.00
R	1/13/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding reply to Opposition to trustee motion and telephone conference with G. Felcyn and D. Wright and P. Marcoux (.1); further correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding reply to debtor's Opposition to trustee motion, review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.3); review correspondence from M. Brown regarding Creditors Committee members contact with debtor (.1); review correspondence from S. Kim regarding same (.1); review correspondence from B. Kirkendall regarding recent Creditors Committee communications (.1); multiple correspondence to/from C. Hoge regarding supplemental Declaration of C. Johnson regarding debtor's Opposition to trustee motion, review correspondence from C. Johnson regarding same, review Declaration (.2); review supplemental Declaration of G. Felcyn regarding same, correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.2); correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding debtor's litigation settlements (.1)	1.20	804.00
R	1/13/2014	Robert Franklin	Interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding reply to opposition to Trustee motion and motion for standing to assert claims (.5)	0.50	255.00
R	1/13/2014	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence C. Hoge regarding reply to opposition (.2); review supplemental declarations of G. Felcyn and C. Johnson (.3)	0.50	255.00
R	1/13/2014	Thomas Hwang	Analysis and evaluation Debtor's opposition to Trustee motion, memorandum from J. Murray and related documents, and legal research regarding same	1.80	756.00