

V	1/13/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding standing motion (.1); review multiple correspondence to/from J. Wesolowski and T. Hwang regarding motion for Order Shortening Time regarding standing motion (.2)	0.30	201.00
V	1/13/2014	Robert Franklin	Review and revise Motion for standing (2.1)	2.10	1,071.00
V	1/13/2014	Thomas Hwang	Draft, revise, finalize motion for derivative standing and review comments to same (1.0); draft motion for Order Shortening Time and supporting pleadings (1.7); correspondences J. Wesolowski regarding ex parte Motion for Order Shortening Time (.2); telephone conference with J. Wesolowski regarding same (.1); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1); meeting J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	3.20	1,344.00
Bb	1/14/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to/from P. Marcoux regarding no right of Creditors Committee members to receive compensation, legal research regarding same (.5)	0.50	335.00
I	1/14/2014	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from Creditors Committee regarding assumption of licenses under Plan of Reorganization, review correspondence from L. McDowell regarding same (.2); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding rejection of Alliacense / TPL agreement (.1)	0.30	201.00
I	1/14/2014	Robert Franklin	Detailed telephone conference with E. Friedman regarding HP license (.2); correspondence with E. Friedman, L. Botts and K. Hiensch regarding same (.2)	0.30	153.00
I	1/14/2014	Thomas Hwang	Correspondence L. McDowell regarding Plan of Reorganization and treatment of executory contracts (.1); review correspondence R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.20	84.00
J	1/14/2014	John Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (.5)	0.50	335.00
Nb	1/14/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to H. Binder regarding negotiations with debtor (.2); telephone conference with H. Binder regarding same (.2)	0.40	268.00
Nb	1/14/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding settlement discussions with N. Antonopolous (.2); review correspondence from M. Brown regarding same, etc., analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2); review correspondence from H. Binder regarding settlement (.1); correspondence to G. Felcyn regarding not spending time regarding settlement until after hearing regarding motion to appoint trustee (.1)	0.60	402.00
Q	1/14/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux and D. Wright regarding forecasts supporting Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.1); review correspondence regarding D. Sciarrino regarding MMP sale forecasts (.1)	0.20	134.00
R	1/14/2014	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from Creditors Committee members regarding contact with debtor (.2); review correspondence from K. Prochnow regarding argument regarding motion for appointment of trustee, review brief regarding same (.3); correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.1); review Declaration of C. Johnson in support of reply to debtor's Opposition to trustee motion (.1); review Court Order regarding debtor's motion to file documents under seal (.1)	0.80	536.00
R	1/14/2014	Thomas Hwang	Meeting R. Franklin regarding Debtor's opposition to Trustee motion (.1); Draft reply to Debtor's opposition to Trustee motion (8.8); correspondences S. Kim regarding same (.2); analysis and evaluation correspondences and documents from K. Curry and S. Kim regarding same (.5); review correspondence and information from K. Prochnow regarding same (.5); memoranda R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	10.30	4,326.00
T	1/14/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding Objections to Claims of insiders (.1)	0.10	67.00
V	1/14/2014	John Murray	Review Court Order denying motion for Order Shortening Time regarding standing motion (.1)	0.10	67.00
A	1/15/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from C. Johnson and team regarding prior correspondence regarding J. Neal (.2)	0.20	134.00

G	1/15/2014	Robert Franklin	Detailed telephone conference with P. Califano regarding Rule 2004 Examination (.2)	0.20	102.00
I	1/15/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from L. McDowell regarding Toshiba license (.1); review correspondence from K. Heinsch regarding Fujitsu license (.1); review correspondence from E. Friedman regarding HP license (.1)	0.30	201.00
I	1/15/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation correspondences L. MacDowell, K. Heinsch, E. Friedman regarding Plan of Reorganization and executory contracts	0.20	84.00
I	1/15/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation correspondences L. MacDowell, K. Heinsch, E. Friedman regarding Plan of Reorganization and executory contracts	0.20	84.00
J	1/15/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding monthly invoices, review summary regarding same, multiple correspondence to/from C. Cavazos regarding same (.3); continue preparation of Application for Compensation, interoffice conference C. Cavazos regarding same (2.0)	2.30	1,541.00
Q	1/15/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding D. Sciarrino regarding forecasts for MMP licenses (.1); review correspondence from K. Beresford, G. Felcyn, C. Johnson and P. Marcoux regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and TPL management, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.30	201.00
R	1/15/2014	John Murray	Continue preparation of reply to Opposition to trustee motion, multiple correspondence and interoffice conferences with R. Franklin regarding same, review correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding same (2.5); review debtor's evidentiary objection regarding trustee motion (.5); multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding D. Leckrone Declaration regarding receipt of confidential Creditors Committee communications (.1); review exhibits to debtor's Opposition to trustee motion (.2)	3.30	2,211.00
R	1/15/2014	Robert Franklin	Review and revise Reply to opposition to motion for Trustee (6.1); correspondence and telephone conferences with Creditors Committee members regarding same (.5)	6.60	3,366.00
R	1/15/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation comments to reply to Debtor's opposition to Trustee motion, and revise same (2.9); review and evaluation correspondences P. Marcoux, G. Felcyn and K. Beresford regarding same (.3); memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.1); review and investigation correspondences C. Johnson, J. Murray regarding same (.2); draft request for judicial notice in support of same (1.0)	4.50	1,890.00
I	1/16/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from L. McDowell regarding extension of time to object to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement, correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same, review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding same (.2); review objections of HP and Fujitsu to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.2); review Fujitsu's motion to appoint licensee's committee, joinders by Nikon, Blackberry and Alcon to same(.8); review joinder of Direct TV, Mattel and NEC to Fujitsu's objection to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.1)	1.30	871.00
I	1/16/2014	Thomas Hwang	Telephone conference with L. McDowell regarding case status, executory contracts and Plan of Reorganization (.1); review correspondence L. McDowell regarding same, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1); review objections to Disclosure Statement and joinders of objections, and evaluation regarding K. Prochnow regarding same (.1); review correspondences R. Frankling and J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.40	168.00
J	1/16/2014	John Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation, commence preparation of notice of hearing and form of order regarding Application for Compensation (.6); continue preparation of Application for Compensation (6.3)	6.90	4,623.00
Nb	1/16/2014	John Murray	Telephone conference with H. Binder regarding negotiations with debtor (.3); commence preparation of outline of possible settlement (1.4)	1.70	1,139.00

Qa	1/16/2014	John Murray	Review debtor's objection to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement, analysis and evaluation regarding same, review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.6); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding "meet & confer" regarding objection to Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.70	469.00
R	1/16/2014	John Murray	Continue preparation of reply to debtor's Opposition to Trustee motion (.3); multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.40	268.00
R	1/16/2014	John Murray	Review and revise reply (.8); review multiple correspondence from T. Hwang regarding reply, Declarations, review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.1)	0.90	603.00
R	1/16/2014	Thomas Hwang	Draft, revise Reply to Opposition to Motion to appoint trustee, and legal research and evaluation of comments, correspondences J. Murray, R. Franklin to same (1.7); memoranda J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.1); revise request for judicial notice (.1); draft R. Franklin Declaration (.3); continue preparation of same (.5); prepare redline and correspondence Committee regarding same (.2)	2.90	1,218.00
A	1/17/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding meeting regarding action items (.1)	0.10	67.00
A	1/17/2014	Robert Franklin	Review status of action items (.5); team meeting regarding same (.7)	1.20	612.00
I	1/17/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from K. Heinsch regarding Fujitsu license, review correspondence to T. Hwang regarding same, review correspondence to/from J. Wesolowski regarding same, review memorandum from T. Hwang regarding same, review multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.4); review correspondence to Fujitsu regarding objection to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.50	335.00
I	1/17/2014	Robert Franklin	Review Fujitsu objection to Disclosure Statement and draft correspondence K. Hiensch regarding same (1.3)	1.30	663.00
I	1/17/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review and analysis objections to Disclosure Statement by Fujitsu, and memoranda R. Franklin regarding proposed resolutions of same (1.7); review correspondences R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	1.80	756.00
J	1/17/2014	John Murray	Continue preparation of of Application for Compensation (1.0)	1.00	670.00
Q	1/17/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding T. Lavelle CV, review same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Qa	1/17/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding notifying court regarding intent to proceed with Disclosure Statement hearing (.1)	0.10	67.00
Qa	1/17/2014	Robert Franklin	Review Debtor's objection and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.3); correspondence with Creditors Committee regarding objections and status of hearing (.4)	0.70	357.00
Qa	1/17/2014	Thomas Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding Disclosure Statement hearing, Trustee Motion hearing and case action items and strategy	0.70	294.00
Qa	1/17/2014	Thomas Hwang	Call to T. Bracegirdle regarding Disclosure Statement hearing (.1)	0.10	42.00
R	1/17/2014	John Murray	Prepare for hearing regarding Trustee Motion (4.6); interoffice conference R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.7)	5.30	3,551.00
R	1/17/2014	John Murray	Review multiple joinders to debtor's Opposition to trustee motion, correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding same, review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding same, review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
R	1/17/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review joinders to TPL opposition to Motion to Appoint Trustee, and correspondence from R. Franklin regarding same; correspondence Committee regarding same	0.20	84.00
I	1/18/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from K. Prochnow regarding Fujitsu motion to appoint licensees' committee, sanctions, legal research regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00

Q	1/18/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding T. Lavelle's CV, review correspondence from P. Marcoux, G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
Q	1/18/2014	Thomas Hwang	Correspondence Committee regarding potential management	0.10	42.00
R	1/18/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from M. Brown regarding attendance at hearing on motion to appoint trustee (.1)	0.10	67.00
R	1/18/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding parties joining in debtor's Opposition to trustee motion (.1)	0.10	67.00
Q	1/19/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright and P. Marcoux regarding T. Lavelle (.1)	0.10	67.00
R	1/19/2014	John Murray	Continue preparation for hearing on trustee motion (4.3); correspondence to/from Creditors Committee members regarding attendance at hearing on trustee motion (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding argument regarding trustee motion, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2); review correspondence from M. Brown regarding identity of parties joining in debtor's Opposition to trustee motion (.1); correspondence to S. Caplan regarding trustee motion (.1)	4.80	3,216.00
I	1/20/2014	John Murray	Review objection of Toshiba to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	67.00
P	1/20/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from V. Torres regarding debtor's revised Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement, review Court docket regarding same, miscellaneous regarding same, review multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris and V. Torres regarding same, review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Pa	1/20/2014	Robert Franklin	Review revised Debtor Disclosure Statement (.4); correspondence with Creditors Committee regarding same (.2); telephone conference with R. Harris regarding same (.1)	0.70	357.00
Q	1/20/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding T. Lavelle and C. Bostick (.2)	0.20	134.00
R	1/20/2014	John Murray	Continue preparation for hearing on trustee motion, preparation of action item memorandum regarding same, multiple correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (4.5)	4.50	3,015.00
R	1/20/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from M. Imhoff regarding joinders (.1)	0.10	67.00
R	1/20/2014	John Murray	Review Venkidus response to trustee motion (.1); review Creditors Committee response to debtor's evidentiary objections to trustee motion (.3)	0.40	268.00
R	1/20/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences P. Marcoux, G. Felcyn, G. Kaplan, M. Imhof, S. Kim, D. Wright regarding joinders in opposition to trustee motion and regarding potential manager for company (.2); review and evaluation memoranda J. Murray regarding trustee motion (.2)	0.40	168.00
Bb	1/21/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from P. Marcoux, G. Felcyn and M. Brown regarding impact of ITC ruling (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bb	1/21/2014	Robert Franklin	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding status (.1)	0.10	51.00
F	1/21/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Shakoory regarding Monthly Operating Report, correspondence to T. Hwang regarding same, miscellaneous regarding same (.2); review debtor's Monthly Operating Report, analysis and evaluation regarding same, review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.4)	0.60	402.00
F	1/21/2014	Thomas Hwang	Exchange correspondences R. Shakoory regarding Monthly Operating Report; correspondence J. Murray regarding same (.2); review same (.2); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.50	210.00

I	1/21/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding Catapult issues regarding assumption and assignment of IP licenses (.2); review multiple correspondence to/from K. Heinsch regarding Fujitsu license regarding Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement, review multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding revisions of language in Disclosure Statement regarding same (.2); review multiple correspondence to/from E. Friedman regarding HP license and Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.1); review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding Fujitsu Motion for appointment of licensees' committee (.1); review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding resolution of licensees' objections to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.2); review joinders to Fujitsu's objection to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.2); multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding licensees and objections to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.2)	1.20	804.00
I	1/21/2014	Robert Franklin	Review Fujitsu objection (1.2); legal research regarding pass through of executory contracts (1.4); telephone conferences with E. Friedman regarding HP objection (.3); detailed telephone conference with K. Hiensch regarding Fujitsu objection (.4); review Apple objection (.1); analysis and evaluation regarding responses to objection (.5)	3.90	1,989.00
I	1/21/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences E. Friedman regarding treatment of licenses and Hewlett Packard objection (.1); evaluation and analysis memorandum from R. Franklin and revisions to Disclosure Statement regarding treatment of licenses and Fujitsu objection, and memoranda R. Franklin regarding same (.8); meetings R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	1.10	462.00
Nb	1/21/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding settlement discussions with N. Antonopolous, review power point regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Q	1/21/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences R. Franklin regarding treatment of licenses, and assumption and assignment issues, and legal research regarding same (.3); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1); memorandum R. Franklin regarding comments to Disclosure Statement and Plan of Reorganization and investigation regarding same (.1)	0.50	210.00
Qa	1/21/2014	John Murray	Interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding objections to Disclosure Statement (.2)	0.20	134.00
Qa	1/21/2014	Robert Franklin	Review Debtor's objection to disclosure statement and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.3) draft memorandum regarding status status report (1.4)	1.70	867.00
R	1/21/2014	John Murray	Continue preparation for hearing on trustee motion (6.9); telephone conference with S. Caplan regarding same (.2)	7.10	4,757.00
R	1/21/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding hearing presentation regarding trustee motion (.2); review multiple joinders in debtor' Opposition to trustee motion, preparation of memorandum regarding same (.2); review court docket regarding debtor's submission of exhibits under seal, correspondence to/from H. Binder, V. Torres and R. Franklin regarding same (.2); multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding motion practice and live testimony (.2); continue preparation of hearing presentation on trustee motion regarding request for judicial notice (.2)	1.00	670.00
R	1/21/2014	Robert Franklin	Review and draft response to evidentiary objections (2.0)	2.00	1,020.00
R	1/21/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation memoranda J. Murray regarding Trustee motion, and memoranda J. Murray regarding same (.5); research local rules regarding same (.1); conference J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.70	294.00
R	1/21/2014	Thomas Hwang	Finalize reply to Debtor's evidentiary objections (.3); revise same, and memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.40	168.00
T	1/21/2014	Thomas Hwang	Draft Objection to Claim of D. Hannah, and legal research and analysis of claim regarding same	1.50	630.00
V	1/21/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding hearing on standing motion (.1)	0.10	67.00

I	1/22/2014	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from K. Heinsch regarding Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.2)	0.20	134.00
I	1/22/2014	Robert Franklin	Review language suggested by Fujitsu for inclusion into the plan (.5)	0.50	255.00
I	1/22/2014	Thomas Hwang	Analysis and evaluation objections and proposed edits to Plan of Reorganization from Fujitsu, and memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (1.7)	1.70	714.00
Qa	1/22/2014	John Murray	Review statement of status of objections to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.2)	0.20	134.00
Qa	1/22/2014	Robert Franklin	Draft status report to Court regarding objections to Disclosure Statement (3.0); detailed telephone conference R. Harris regarding objection (.2); detailed telephone conference J. Wesolowski regarding status of objections (.3)	3.50	1,785.00
Qa	1/22/2014	Thomas Hwang	Attention to filing of statement regarding objections to Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	42.00
R	1/22/2014	John Murray	Continue preparation for hearing on trustee motion, multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same (1.9); review court's order striking pleadings, correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same, interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same (.4)	2.30	1,541.00
R	1/22/2014	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence regarding response to debtor's objections to Creditors Committee's Declarations, review response and multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same (.2); review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding T. Kirkendall joinder to debtor's Opposition to trustee motion (.1); review correspondence from K. Prochnow regarding joinders, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2); review statement of position of CCC regarding trustee motion, miscellaneous regarding same (.2); review correspondence from C. Johnson regarding M. Leckrone's joinder, review correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding same (.1); review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding debtor's communications with United States Trustee regarding settlements (.1)	0.90	603.00
R	1/22/2014	Robert Franklin	Review Court order regarding late filed pleadings (.2); detailed telephone conference R. Michelson regarding status of objections (.2)	0.40	204.00
R	1/22/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review joinders to opposition regarding motion to appoint trustee and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.4); correspondence Committee regarding Alliacense joinder (.2); telephone conference with J. Wesolowski regarding case status, regarding motion to appoint trustee (.2); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.2); review Order regarding hearing on same, matters at issue (.1); attention to filing of responses to evidentiary objections, and review same; conference S. Bloomer regarding same (.3)	1.40	588.00
T	1/22/2014	Thomas Hwang	Draft Objection to Claim of D. Hannah (.2); draft Notice of same (.5); draft Objection to Claim of J. Neal, and evaluation of Proof of Claim (.3)	1.00	420.00
A	1/23/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding new dates and deadlines (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	1/23/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding judgment against D. Leckrone (.1)	0.10	67.00
F	1/23/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence J. Murray and investigation regarding administrative expenses and Monthly Operating Report	0.20	84.00
I	1/23/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from L. Engel regarding "meet & confer" regarding Fujitsu objection to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement, interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same (.1); review correspondence to/from R. Franklin and K. Heinsch regarding Fujitsu objection to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.1); review correspondence from C. Hoge regarding Fujitsu and Alliacense executory contracts (.1)	0.30	201.00
I	1/23/2014	Robert Franklin	Correspondence with K. Hiensch regarding additional concerns by Fujitsu and requesting Alliacense Services Agreement (.3); draft correspondence C. Hoge regarding same (.3)	0.60	306.00

J	1/23/2014	John Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (.2)	0.20	134.00
Q	1/23/2014	John Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and "swamping" of classes (.2); correspondence to/from E. Darda and J. Mikhailevich regarding legal research regarding 11129(a)(10) (.1)	0.30	201.00
Q	1/23/2014	Robert Franklin	Interoffice conference T. Hwang and J. Murray regarding confirmation issues (.4)	0.40	204.00
Qa	1/23/2014	Robert Franklin	Prepare for hearing on Disclosure Statement and Trustee Motion (1.8); conference with L. Engel, attend hearing and post-hearing conferences (3.2); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding action items (.5)	5.50	2,805.00
R	1/23/2014	John Murray	Prepare for hearing regarding trustee motion, attend same, conference committee members regarding same (3.0)	3.00	2,010.00
R	1/23/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence to Creditors Committee re results of hearing on trustee motion, etc. (.2)	0.20	134.00
R	1/23/2014	Robert Franklin	Draft correspondence Creditors Committee regarding results of hearings (.5)	0.50	255.00
R	1/23/2014	Thomas Hwang	Meeting R. Franklin regarding case status and scheduling, regarding hearing on Motion to appoint trustee and Disclosure Statements (.3); meeting J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.3)	0.60	252.00
S	1/23/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding administration of expense claims (.1)	0.10	67.00
V	1/23/2014	Thomas Hwang	Draft Notice regarding motion for derivative standing	0.40	168.00
Bb	1/24/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from K. Beresford and G. Felcyn regarding P. Marcoux Judgment against D. Leckrone (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	1/24/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding absence and proxy (.1)	0.10	67.00
I	1/24/2014	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from J. Wesolowski, L. Engel and R. Harris regarding status of Fujitsu objection to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	67.00
I	1/24/2014	Robert Franklin	Correspondence with C. Hoge regarding Licensee's proposed language for Disclosure Statement (.2); analysis and evaluation regarding same (.4)	0.60	306.00
J	1/24/2014	John Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding logistics of hearing regarding Application for Compensation on March 26th (.3); legal research regarding court and United States Trustee revised guidelines for Applications for Compensation (project billing categories, master time summary, etc.), multiple correspondence to/from J. Wesolowski regarding same (1.1);	1.40	938.00
J	1/24/2014	John Murray	Preparation of memorandum regarding project billing regarding Application for Compensation (.5)	0.50	335.00
Nb	1/24/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding settlement discussions (.1); creview correspondence from T. Hwang regarding summary of settlement negotiations with debtor (.3)	0.40	268.00
Nb	1/24/2014	Thomas Hwang	Memorandum J. Murray regarding history of negotiations with Debtor, regarding status of negotiation points (1.0)	1.00	420.00
P	1/24/2014	Erin Darda	Emails with J. Murray, J. Mikhailevich, T. Hwang and R. Franklin regarding plan confirmation research	0.30	90.00
P	1/24/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from E. Darda and J. Mikhailevich regarding legal research regarding not counting insiders' plan acceptances in context other than 1129(a)(10) (.8);	0.80	536.00
Q	1/24/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding distribution of plans and disclosure statements with summary comparison (.1)	0.10	67.00
Q	1/24/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review memorandum J. Murray regarding plan voting issues, and review and respond correspondence E. Darda regarding same	0.10	42.00
R	1/24/2014	John Murray	Miscellaneous regarding calendar items from hearing of Jan 23 (.3); Review CD of hearing on trustee (1.5)	1.80	1,206.00

R	1/24/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Caplan regarding trustee motion (.1); review correspondence to/from P. Marcoux regarding summary of Jan 23 hearing (.1); correspondence to S. Caplan regarding need for more evidence regarding trustee motion (.2);	0.40	268.00
R	1/24/2014	Robert Franklin	Detailed telephone conference with D. Wright regarding results of 1/23 hearing and agenda for Creditors Committee meeting (.3)	0.30	153.00
R	1/24/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review Court minute orders regarding Committee Motion to appoint trustee, Disclosure Statement dates and Committee standing Motion, and review memoranda J. Murray regarding same (.4)	0.40	168.00
V	1/24/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding notice of hearing on standing motion (.1); review correspondence from S. Bloomer regarding notice parties regarding standing motion, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.30	201.00
V	1/24/2014	Thomas Hwang	Draft, revise Notice regarding Motion for standing (.6), and investigation regarding service parties (.5); memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	1.20	504.00
A	1/25/2014	John Murray	Continue preparation of action item memorandum (1.2)	1.20	804.00
G	1/25/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding Rule 2004 Examination of Alliacense (.1)	0.10	67.00
Q	1/25/2014	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee members regarding PDS, cash collateral and Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.3)	0.30	201.00
R	1/25/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright telephone conference to discuss results of hearing, settlement discussions and statement going forward (.1); review multiple correspondence from S. Caplan regarding trustee motion (.2)	0.30	201.00
Nb	1/26/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn and D. Wright regarding settlement with debtor (.4); correspondence to D. Wright regarding telephone conference to discuss settlement, etc.(.1)	0.50	335.00
R	1/26/2014	John Murray	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding results of hearing regarding trustee motion, status of settlement discussions with debtor, debtor's conduct, candidates for new manager, etc. (.6)	0.60	402.00
R	1/26/2014	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from S. Caplan regarding trustee motion (.2)	0.20	134.00
Ba	1/27/2014	Robert Franklin	Interoffice conferences J. Murray regarding action items and response to request for information (.5)	0.50	255.00
Bb	1/27/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding committee call, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bb	1/27/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from B. Kirkendall regarding Creditors Committee meeting (.1); review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding Creditors Committee meeting agenda (.4)	0.50	335.00
Bb	1/27/2014	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation regarding case status and outstanding matters, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same, regarding agenda items for Committee meeting (1.4)	1.40	588.00
Bc	1/27/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review and revise meeting minutes (.4)	0.40	168.00
F	1/27/2014	Thomas Hwang	Analysis and evaluation Monthly Operating Reports, Disclosure Statement, employment applications and other pleadings regarding administrative claims and professional fees, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same	1.10	462.00
I	1/27/2014	John Murray	Review motions to appear pro hac vice and notice of appearance of L. McDowell and J. Swenson for Toshiba (.1)	0.10	67.00
Nb	1/27/2014	John Murray	Telephone conference with H. Binder regarding settlement (.6)	0.60	402.00
Nb	1/27/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding history of settlement negotiations with debtor (.1)	0.10	67.00
P	1/27/2014	Erin Darda	Research regarding plan confirmation and section 1129(a)	2.30	690.00

P	1/27/2014	John Murray	Interoffice conference with R. Franklin regarding effective date of debtor's Plan of Reorganization, correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same, correspondence to J. Mikhailevich regarding legal research regarding same (.5)	0.50	335.00
P	1/27/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding bankruptcy estates administrative expenses and feasibility of debtor's Plan of Reorganization, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.4)	0.40	268.00
Q	1/27/2014	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from M. Brown regarding D. Sciarrino (.1);	0.10	67.00
Q	1/27/2014	Thomas Hwang	Analysis and evaluation regarding service of Disclosure Statement and Plan of Reorganization matters, and investigation regarding same (.5)	0.50	210.00
Q	1/27/2014	Thomas Hwang	Analysis regarding Plan of Reorganization, regarding voting issues, and legal research regarding same	0.60	252.00
T	1/27/2014	Thomas Hwang	Draft Objection to Claim of J. Neal	1.10	462.00
V	1/27/2014	Thomas Hwang	Analysis and evaluation regarding notice and motion for derivative standing (.3)	0.30	126.00
Ba	1/28/2014	Thomas Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items (.1)	0.10	42.00
Bb	1/28/2014	John Murray	Review recent meeting minutes and developments, prepare agenda (annotated and unannotated) for Creditors Committee meeting, review and revise action item memorandum (3.2); correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding agenda for committee meeting (.2)	3.40	2,278.00
Bb	1/28/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from M. Imhoff regarding Creditors Committee conference call (.1); multiple correspondence to/from correspondence Creditors Committee regarding minutes, review same (.4); continue preparation of agenda for Creditors Committee conference call, multiple correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same, correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.3)	0.80	536.00
Bb	1/28/2014	Thomas Hwang	Conference J. Murray regarding Committee meetings and meeting minutes, and correspondence Committee regarding same (.2); investigation regarding Committee meetings, and telephone conference with Global Crossing regarding same (1.0); memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.2); telephone conference with D. Wright regarding same (.1); analysis and evaluation meeting agenda and case issues; legal research and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.8)	2.30	966.00
J	1/28/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding Applications for Compensation (.2)	0.20	134.00
Nb	1/28/2014	John Murray	Review and summarize history of settlement discussions (1.9); multiple correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding same (.2)	2.10	1,407.00
Nb	1/28/2014	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn and N. Antonopolous regarding settlement (.6); review multiple correspondence from T. Hwang 're history of settlement discussions, review same (.8); correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding settlement regarding releases (.1); correspondence to S. Kim regarding telephone conference to discuss settlement regarding releases (.1)	1.60	1,072.00
Nb	1/28/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences J. Murray and H. Binder regarding negotiations and case status, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same	0.20	84.00
P	1/28/2014	Erin Darda	Research regarding plan confirmation and section 1129(a)	1.40	420.00
Q	1/28/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from K. Prochnow regarding business plan regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
V	1/28/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding notice parties regarding standing motion (.1)	0.10	67.00
V	1/28/2014	Thomas Hwang	Correspondence Committee regarding Motion for derivative standing (.3); miscellaneous of same (.3)	0.60	252.00
Bb	1/29/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding annotated agenda for Creditors Committee conference call (.1)	0.10	67.00

Bb	1/29/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding agenda for Creditors Committee conference call (.3)	0.30	201.00
Bb	1/29/2014	Robert Franklin	Review status of case and review and revise agenda for Committee meeting (1.0)	1.00	510.00
I	1/29/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding Motion to appoint licensees' committee, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
I	1/29/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to/from H. Binder and R. Franklin regarding resolution of licensees' issues and Creditors Committee Disbursing Agent, review multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin, K. Heinsch and E. Friedman regarding same, correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.2); review correspondence from L. Stenfeldt regarding Sony license and Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.1); correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding debtor's position regarding Motion for appointment of licensee committee (.1)	0.40	268.00
I	1/29/2014	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence E. Friedman and K. Hiensch regarding suggested language resolving objection of counter parties to license contracts (.2); review and revise language (.6)	0.80	408.00
I	1/29/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review memorandum J. Murray regarding plan and executory contracts issues, and legal research and analysis license agreements and licenses (1.0); memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.2); review correspondences J. Murray, R. Franklin, H. Binder, K. Hiensch, E. Friedman regarding licensee issues (.2)	1.40	588.00
Nb	1/29/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding possible settlement scenario (2.0); telephone conference with H. Binder regarding same (.2)	2.20	1,474.00
Nb	1/29/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding outline of settlement proposal (.1)	0.10	67.00
Nb	1/29/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation memorandum J. Murray regarding proposed negotiation points	0.10	42.00
R	1/29/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Caplan regarding Intelliasys BEC, review Bahamian Supreme Court docket regarding same, correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.3); review correspondence from K. Beresford regarding standing motion and debtor's assignment of patents, review assignments, correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.4)	0.70	469.00
R	1/29/2014	Robert Franklin	Respond to inquiry from J. Murray regarding Intelliasys (BEC)	0.50	255.00
T	1/29/2014	Thomas Hwang	Draft Objection to Claim of Janet Neal and legal research regarding same (1.8); draft notice of same (.2); draft Objection to Claim Dwayne Hannah (.2); analysis and evaluation regarding 13% claims, regarding Objections to Claim (.2)	2.40	1,008.00
V	1/29/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from M. Brown regarding standing motion (.1)	0.10	67.00
V	1/29/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding service parties for standing motion (.1)	0.10	67.00
V	1/29/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation correspondences K. Beresford, M. Brown and evaluation and investigation Debtor pleadings regarding potential parties to derivative actions, and prepare service list regarding motion for derivative standing (1.9); memoranda J. Murray regarding same, regarding ownership of entities (.2)	2.10	882.00
Ba	1/30/2014	Thomas Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding plan and case issues and action items (.2)	0.20	84.00
Bb	1/30/2014	John Murray	Conference call with Creditors Committee regarding status and strategy going forward (1.3); interoffice conference R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.2)	1.50	1,005.00
Bb	1/30/2014	Robert Franklin	Prepare for Committee meeting (1.2); attend committee meeting (1.3); interoffice conference J. Murray and T. Hwang regarding same (.2)	2.70	1,377.00
Bb	1/30/2014	Thomas Hwang	Committee meeting (1.3)	1.30	546.00

I	1/30/2014	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin, K. Heinsch, E. Friedman, L. Stenfeldt, A. Lewis, L. McDowell and J. Wesolowski regarding resolution of licensees' objection to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.2)	0.20	134.00
I	1/30/2014	Robert Franklin	Review and provide comments regarding language in Disclosure Statement regarding licensees (1.5); correspondence with licensees' counsel regarding same (.2); review and revise Disclosure Statement (4.0)	5.70	2,907.00
I	1/30/2014	Thomas Hwang	Analysis and evaluation regarding correspondences and proposed amendments to Plan of Reorganization from K. Hiensch, E. Friedman, and draft revisions and comments regarding same (.8); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.90	378.00
Nb	1/30/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to H. Binder regarding settlement, correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.5); telephone conference with H. Binder regarding same (.8)	1.30	871.00
Nb	1/30/2014	John Murray	Analysis and evaluation message from C. Flowers regarding settlement proposal regarding MMP and Alliacense (.2); review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding D. Wright's position on settlement proposal (.1)	0.30	201.00
Nb	1/30/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review memoranda J. Murray regarding negotiation points and regarding case issues, and prepare for Committee meeting (.2)	0.20	84.00
Nb	1/30/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation correspondences J. Murray regarding negotiation points, correspondence to H. Binder	0.20	84.00
P	1/30/2014	Erin Darda	Emails with J. Murray regarding insider voting memorandum; continue research regarding same	1.60	480.00
P	1/30/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding legal research regarding 1129(a)(10) issues, analysis and evaluation regarding same, correspondence to/from E. Darda regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
Q	1/30/2014	Thomas Hwang	Memorandum J. Murray regarding confirmation and voting issues (.3)	0.30	126.00
T	1/30/2014	Thomas Hwang	Draft Objection to Claim of J. Leckrone, and legal research regarding same and regarding recharacterization issues	2.00	840.00
I	1/31/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from K. Heinsch to J. Wesolowski regarding resolution of licensees' objection to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement, miscellaneous regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
J	1/31/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to V. Chial regarding pro forma for January (.1)	0.10	67.00
Nb	1/31/2014	John Murray	Telephone conference with H. Binder regarding debtor's response regarding settlement prospects (.4); review correspondence from Creditors Committee regarding settlement regarding release of Alliacense, multiple correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding same (.2)	0.60	402.00
Nb	1/31/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences from K. Beresford, M. Imhoff, G. Kaplan, K. Curry regarding settlement negotiation points; review memorandum R. Franklin regarding same; memorandum J. Murray regarding same	0.20	84.00
P	1/31/2014	Erin Darda	Emails with J. Murray regarding insider voting memorandum	0.10	30.00
P	1/31/2014	Erin Darda	Draft memorandum regarding insider voting issues	3.80	1,140.00
P	1/31/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to/from E. Darda regarding legal research regarding 1129(a)(10) (.2)	0.20	134.00
P	1/31/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation memorandum E. Darda regarding voting of claims and confirmation	0.20	84.00
Q	1/31/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding settlement and Alliacense's continued involvement, correspondence to H. Binder regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Qa	1/31/2014	Robert Franklin	Review Debtor's Disclosure Statement and continue preparation of revised Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (2.5)	2.50	1,275.00

T	1/31/2014	Thomas Hwang	Draft Objection to Claim of J. Leckrone (.4); draft Notice of same (.3); draft Objection to Claim of M. Davis, and analysis of claim regarding same (1.9)	2.60	1,092.00
J	2/1/2014	John Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (.2)	0.20	134.00
Nb	2/1/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from H. Binder regarding settlement proposal, analysis and evaluation regarding same, correspondence to/from Creditors Committee members regarding same, correspondence to H. Binder regarding same, review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding same (.7)	0.70	469.00
Nb	2/1/2014	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from G. Felcyn and G. Kaplan regarding settlement negotiations, Alliacense, PDS and debtor's efforts in regard thereto (.2); review correspondence from C. Johnson regarding conference call regarding negotiations with debtor (.1)	0.30	201.00
Nb	2/1/2014	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation correspondences H. Binder and J. Murray regarding negotiation points (.1)	0.10	42.00
Q	2/1/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding classification issue (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	2/1/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding Alliacense administrative claim (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	2/1/2014	Thomas Hwang	Investigation regarding Alliacense claim and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.2)	0.20	84.00
D	2/2/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Caplan regarding Trustee motion, Patriot and J. Neal residence, review attachment (.2)	0.20	134.00
Nb	2/2/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding settlement discussions, insiders vs. non-insiders, family members vs. non-family members, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding settlement negotiations and non-insider employees (.1)	0.30	201.00
Nb	2/2/2014	Thomas Hwang	Evaluation correspondences H. Binder and J. Murray regarding negotiation points and investigation regarding insider parties (.1); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.20	84.00
Ba	2/3/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding minutes of last meeting, review minutes, analysis and evaluation regarding same, action items (.3)	0.30	201.00
Ba	2/3/2014	Thomas Hwang	Meetings R. Franklin regarding case status and action items (.2)	0.20	84.00
Bc	2/3/2014	Thomas Hwang	Draft meeting minutes for February 3 meeting (3.5)	3.50	1,470.00
G	2/3/2014	Thomas Hwang	Analysis and evaluation regarding Proofs of Claim, Stmt. of Financial Affairs and Schedules and Debtor's third-party expense payments; prepare report regarding same (.5)	0.50	210.00
I	2/3/2014	Robert Franklin	Prepare for meeting with counsel for licensees (.3); conference call A. Lewis, K. Hiensch, L. Stenfield, L. McDowell and E. Friedman regarding language for Disclosure Statement (.8); continue preparation of revisions to Disclosure Statement (2.4)	3.50	1,785.00
J	2/3/2014	John Murray	Review excel summary of fees incurred to date, compare to January analysis (.2); continue preparation of project billing (1.2); legal research regarding guidelines regarding Application for Compensation (.5)	1.90	1,273.00
J	2/3/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from V. Chial regarding fees, costs and rates (.1)	0.10	67.00
Nb	2/3/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding settlement discussions with debtor (.2); prepare for conference call with Creditors Committee regarding same (.3); attend same (1.2); correspondence to R. Harris regarding settlement discussions and face to face meeting (.1)	1.80	1,206.00
Nb	2/3/2014	John Murray	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding negotiations with debtor (.2)	0.20	134.00
Nb	2/3/2014	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from Creditors Committee members, R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding Creditors Committee conference call regarding negotiations with debtor (.1)	0.10	67.00
Nb	2/3/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence for R. Harris regarding settlement discussions (.1)	0.10	67.00

Nb	2/3/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to G. Felcyn regarding telephone conference (.1); correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding settlement proposal regarding H. Binder correspondence of 2/1/14, miscellaneous regarding same, correspondence to H. Binder regarding same (.2)	0.30	201.00
P	2/3/2014	Robert Franklin	Review claims matrix and analysis and evaluation regarding voting issues (1.3)	1.30	663.00
Q	2/3/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation correspondence R. Franklin regarding voting and classification (.2); evaluation and analysis regarding same and regarding Proofs of Claim, and prepare report regarding same (.4)	0.60	252.00
R	2/3/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Good regarding correspondence from S. Caplan regarding Trustee motion (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	2/3/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding administrative claims, review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding summary of same, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Ba	2/4/2014	Robert Franklin	Review minutes of Committee meeting regarding settlement strategy and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.5)	0.50	255.00
G	2/4/2014	Thomas Hwang	Analysis and evaluation regarding Proofs of Claim, Stmt. of Financial Affairs and Schedules and Debtor's third-party expense payments; prepare report regarding same	0.20	84.00
J	2/4/2014	John Murray	Continue review of billings regarding preparation of Application for Compensation (2.5)	2.50	1,675.00
Q	2/4/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding classes of claims, confirmation issues, estimation of claims, legal research regarding same, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.6)	0.60	402.00
Q	2/4/2014	Thomas Hwang	Analysis and legal research regarding voting and estimation of claims regarding confirmation of competing plans, and evaluation regarding Proof of Claim and creditor joinders (1.6); prepare report regarding voting of claims (3.5); memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.4)	5.50	2,310.00
Qa	2/4/2014	Robert Franklin	Review and revise February 14 Disclosure Statement (3.1)	3.10	1,581.00
Qa	2/4/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review and analysis revisions to Committee Disclosure Statement	0.10	42.00
Bb	2/5/2014	John Murray	Review detailed correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding commercialization of patents, analysis and evaluation regarding same, multiple correspondence to/from P. Marcoux regarding same (.4)	0.40	268.00
Bc	2/5/2014	John Murray	Review and revise minutes of 2/2/14 meeting, correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (1.3)	1.30	871.00
I	2/5/2014	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from licensees' counsel L. Stenfeldt, A. Lewis, K. Heinsch and R. Franklin regarding treatment of licensees under Creditors Committee's Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.20	134.00
J	2/5/2014	John Murray	Multiple interoffice conferences with T. Hwang and S. Bloomer regarding logistics of Application for Compensation and service thereof (.3)	0.30	201.00
J	2/5/2014	Thomas Hwang	Meetings J. Murray and S. Bloomer regarding preparation of Application for Compensation (.2); review correspondences J. Murray and S. Bloomer, and correspondences S. Bloomer regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
Nb	2/5/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Harris regarding information needed for settlement analysis and evaluation regarding non-insider employees' position regarding same, review status of settlement negotiations regarding same (.2); correspondence to the Brown's regarding settlement negotiations with the debtor and their position regarding the treatment of their claim, review mediation file regarding same (.6)	0.80	536.00
Q	2/5/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding revisions to Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement regarding treatment of licenses, ride though same, consequences if rejection (.2)	0.20	134.00
Q	2/5/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review, revise and draft amended Plan of Reorganization of Committee (.6); evaluation regarding licensee objections and proposed language, and review correspondences R. Franklin, J. Murray, K. Hiensch, G. Kaplan and A. Lewis regarding same, regarding motion to appoint licensing committee (.2)	0.80	336.00

Qa	2/5/2014	Robert Franklin	Review and revise Committee's Disclosure Statement and draft correspondence Licensee's counsel regarding same (2.0); review selected commercialization contracts and analysis and evaluation regarding rejection of commercialization agreements and respond to G. Kaplan's inquiry regarding same (1.6); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding conforming changes in Committee's Plan of Reorganization (.3); correspondence with K. Hiensch regarding changes (.2)	4.10	2,091.00
Qa	2/5/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review, revise and draft amended Disclosure Statement of Committee (5.2); memoranda R. Franklin regarding same (.2);	5.40	2,268.00
A	2/6/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to G. Felcyn and C. Johnson regarding Leckrone ownership interest in Patriot, review correspondence from C. Johnson regarding same, correspondence to/from S. O'Neill, R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same, review correspondence from C. Flowers regarding same, review Stmt. of Financial Affairs & Schedules regarding same, review List of 20 Largest Unsecured Creditors, review claims docket, investigation regarding same (1.2)	1.20	804.00
A	2/6/2014	Robert Franklin	Review SEC document (.4); analysis and evaluation regarding potential conflict (.7)	1.10	561.00
Bb	2/6/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding commercialization of patent portfolios, analysis and evaluation regarding same, multiple correspondence to/from P. Marcoux regarding same, conference call to discuss same, review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding same (.1); review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding multiple patent portfolios, commercialization agreements regarding same, and debtor's rejection of same (.1)	0.20	134.00
Bb	2/6/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation correspondences J. Murray and P. Marcoux regarding new management and Alliacense work product (.1)	0.10	42.00
Bc	2/6/2014	Thomas Hwang	Draft Committee meeting minutes (.7)	0.70	294.00
D	2/6/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to J. Wesolowski regarding hypothetical question regarding case (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	2/6/2014	Thomas Hwang	Investigation regarding Patriot Scientific SEC filings and memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.2); review correspondences J. Murray, C. Flowers, C. Johnson regarding stock ownership, and legal research regarding related issues (.5)	0.70	294.00
I	2/6/2014	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from J. Wesolowski, K. Heinsch and R. Harris regarding licensee's objection to Disclosure Statement and continuance of licensees' motion for a committee, correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same, review correspondence from L. Engel regarding upstream licenses (.2)	0.20	134.00
Nb	2/6/2014	John Murray	Telephone conference with R. Harris regarding settlement negotiations (.2); multiple correspondence to/from P. Marcoux regarding settlement proposal to debtor, multiple telephone calls with P. Marcoux and D. Wright regarding same (1.2); review, analysis and evaluation correspondence from P. Marcoux, regarding minutes of 2/4/14 Creditors Committee conference call and review and revise settlement proposal to debtor (3.6); review comments from R. Franklin and T. Hwang and review and revise settlement proposal (.7); review notes and annotate settlement proposal (.3)	6.00	4,020.00
Nb	2/6/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding negotiation of Plan of Reorganization and subordination of insider claims (.2)	0.20	134.00
Nb	2/6/2014	John Murray	Continue preparation of settlement proposal and review correspondence from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (1.1)	1.10	737.00
Nb	2/6/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to D. Wright and P. Marcoux regarding settlement proposal to debtor (.1)	0.10	67.00
Nb	2/6/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding negotiations with debtor regarding Alliacense accrued fees and emphasis of negotiation (.1)	0.10	67.00

Nb	2/6/2014	Robert Franklin	Telephone call with D. Wright and J. Murray re revisions to proposal (.2); conference call D. Wright, P. Marcoux and J. Murray regarding same (.4); analysis and evaluation regarding Debtor's Plan of Reorganization and negotiating points (.8)	1.40	714.00
Nb	2/6/2014	Robert Franklin	Conference call J. Murray and D. Wright regarding business plan of NewCo (.2)	0.20	102.00
Nb	2/6/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation memoranda J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding negotiation points, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.3)	0.30	126.00
Q	2/6/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to team regarding Creditors Committee immunity (.1)	0.10	67.00
Q	2/6/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization, insider claims, multiple classification and subordination of same, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
Q	2/6/2014	John Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and ownership of reorganize debtor, liquidating trust plan agent, sale of portfolios, waiver of insider claims and court jurisdiction (.3)	0.30	201.00
Q	2/6/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review, revise and draft amended Plan of Reorganization (3.6); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	3.70	1,554.00
Qa	2/6/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding revised Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	67.00
Qa	2/6/2014	Robert Franklin	Continue revisions to Committee Disclosure Statement and draft correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (1.5)	1.50	765.00
Qa	2/6/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review, revise and draft amended Disclosure Statement of Committee (.4)	0.40	168.00
S	2/6/2014	John Murray	Review, analysis and evaluation regarding Patriot's claim (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	2/6/2014	Thomas Hwang	Prepare report regarding insiders and affiliate claims, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.8)	0.80	336.00
Bb	2/7/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding agreement among Patriot, PDS, Alliacense, TPL and others, correspondence to G. Felcyn regarding same, review correspondence from C. Flowers regarding same, telephone conference with P. Marcoux regarding same, review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding same, review agreements (1.1); multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding same and regarding Judgment, review correspondence from C. Flowers regarding same (.1); review correspondence from C. Flowers regarding Leckrone shareholder interest in Patriot (.1); review detailed correspondence from R. Franklin regarding claims of insiders and excess portfolios (.3)	1.60	1,072.00
Bb	2/7/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to/from P. Marcoux regarding Alliacense / PDS accounting (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	2/7/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee members regarding next Creditors Committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
Bb	2/7/2014	Robert Franklin	Prepare for Monday meeting with Creditors Committee (.2)	0.20	102.00
Bc	2/7/2014	Thomas Hwang	Draft Committee meeting minutes (3.8); correspondence G. Felcyn, C. Johnson regarding same (.1); revise and finalize minutes from prior meetings (.2); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	4.20	1,764.00
D	2/7/2014	Thomas Hwang	Analysis and evaluation correspondence and proposal from K. Prochnow (.2); investigation and evaluation regarding Charles Moore stipulated judgment (.3)	0.50	210.00
G	2/7/2014	Robert Franklin	Review and respond to correspondence P. Marcoux regarding Alliacense contract (.8)	0.80	408.00
I	2/7/2014	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris, L. Engel, K. Heinsch and J. Wesolowski regarding continuance of hearing on licensees' motion (.1)	0.10	67.00
Nb	2/7/2014	John Murray	Conference call with P. Marcoux and D. Wright regarding settlement proposal (.4); review and revise same (1.1)	1.50	1,005.00

Nb	2/7/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding settlement and employee compensation claims (.1)	0.10	67.00
Nb	2/7/2014	Robert Franklin	Conference call with D. Wright, P. Marcoux and J. Murray regarding proposal (.5); review and revise settlement proposal (.5)	1.00	510.00
Nb	2/7/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation memorandum J. Murray regarding settlement negotiation points (.1); review correspondences G. Kaplan regarding same (.1); conference with R. Franklin regarding same, regarding employee claims (.1)	0.30	126.00
Q	2/7/2014	John Murray	Review detailed correspondence from K. Prochnow regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.20	134.00
Q	2/7/2014	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence Prochnow regarding Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.20	102.00
Bc	2/8/2014	Thomas Hwang	Draft meeting minutes (.2)	0.20	84.00
Bc	2/9/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding minutes of Jan 30 Creditors Committee conference call, review same, review and revise action items regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
J	2/9/2014	John Murray	Review and revise project billing categories (.2)	0.20	134.00
J	2/9/2014	John Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (1.7)	1.70	1,139.00
Nb	2/9/2014	John Murray	Telephone conference with D Wright regarding settlement, Alliacense claim and treatment of 13%ers (.3); telephone conference with P. Marcoux regarding Alliacense and settlement (.2)	0.50	335.00
Q	2/9/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding conference call to discuss Plan of Reorganization and waiver of claims, correspondence to D. Wright regarding same, correspondence to P. Marcoux regarding same, review correspondence from C. Johnson regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Q	2/9/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and swamping of classes (.1); review correspondence from M. Brown regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization regarding new management and payments to creditors (.1); correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding Brown's claim and confirmation of Plan of Reorganization (.1); review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and waiver of claims (.1)	0.40	268.00
Bb	2/10/2014	Thomas Hwang	Meeting with Committee (.8); meeting J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items (.1)	0.90	378.00
Bc	2/10/2014	Thomas Hwang	Draft meeting minutes	2.40	1,008.00
G	2/10/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding 2012 agreement among PDS, Patriot, Alliacense and TPL (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	2/10/2014	John Murray	Analysis and evaluation multiple correspondence from C. Flowers, G. Felcyn and C. Johnson regarding share ownership in Patriot, correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
G	2/10/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from C. Johnson regarding T. Lavelle and PDS stalemate (.1)	0.10	67.00
I	2/10/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Kaplan, L. McDowell, E. Friedman, A. Lewis and P. Marcoux regarding questions regarding and questions concerning Disclosure Statement, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
I	2/10/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from K. Heinsch regarding Disclosure Statement, Plan of Reorganization and 2012 agreement (.1); miscellaneous regarding continuance of licensees' motion for appointment of a committee (.1)	0.20	134.00
I	2/10/2014	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence licensee attorneys regarding revisions to language and response to objection to Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	51.00

Nb	2/10/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding conference call to discuss settlement proposal (.1); conference call with Creditors Committee regarding settlement discussions with debtor (.9); review and revise settlement proposal to debtor, correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (4.5)	5.50	3,685.00
Nb	2/10/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding revisions to settlement proposal (.1); review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding settlement proposal, Alliacense and MMP (.1)	0.20	134.00
Nb	2/10/2014	Robert Franklin	Attend Creditors Committee meeting regarding draft settlement proposal (.9)	0.90	459.00
Nb	2/10/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review and analysis outline of negotiation points, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.7); review and analysis memoranda R. Franklin and J. Murray regarding same, and meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	0.90	378.00
Q	2/10/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from K. Prochnow regarding TPL, MMP and Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	67.00
Q	2/10/2014	John Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and committee immunity, correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Q	2/10/2014	John Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding ability of debtor to swamp class (.2)	0.20	134.00
Q	2/10/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding "confirmable" Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	67.00
Q	2/10/2014	Robert Franklin	Review and respond to correspondence J. Murray regarding confirmation of Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.3)	0.30	153.00
Q	2/10/2014	Thomas Hwang	Legal research and analysis regarding exculpation and immunity of Committee and third parties, regarding Committee Plan (.5); review correspondence J. Murray and R. Franklin regarding confirmation issues, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.60	252.00
Qa	2/10/2014	Robert Franklin	Review Creditors Committee's Disclosure Statement and respond to inquiries from committee (1.0)	1.00	510.00
Qa	2/10/2014	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence G. Kaplan regarding comments to Disclosure Statement draft (.1)	0.10	51.00
S	2/10/2014	Robert Franklin	Review, analyze and prepare summary of insider claims (2.0)	2.00	1,020.00
S	2/10/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation memorandum R. Franklin regarding insider claims, claims allowance and potential objections	0.10	42.00
Bc	2/11/2014	Thomas Hwang	Draft meeting minutes (.4)	0.40	168.00
G	2/11/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from C. Johnson regarding composition of PDS board (.2)	0.20	134.00
J	2/11/2014	John Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (.4); correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding January fees and costs, and summary of fees and costs to date (.2)	0.60	402.00
Nb	2/11/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from M. Brown regarding settlement proposal (.2); correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.1); telephone conference with D. Wright regarding same (.1); correspondence to/from G. Kaplan regarding same, review correspondence from P. Marcoux and C. Brown regarding same, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2); telephone conference with P. Marcoux regarding settlement proposal, PDS and Alliacense (.2); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding settlement proposal and Alliacense contract (.1); finalize settlement proposal and correspondence to R. Harris regarding same (.7); review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding telephone conference with R. Harris regarding settlement proposal and subordination of insider claims (.1)	1.70	1,139.00
Nb	2/11/2014	Robert Franklin	Conference R. Harris regarding subordination of insider claims (.1)	0.10	51.00
Nb	2/11/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences G. Kaplan, J. Murray and M. Brown regarding settlement negotiation points; review correspondence J. Murray regarding proposed negotiation points (.1)	0.10	42.00

Q	2/11/2014	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding revisions to Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement (.1); review detailed correspondence from R. Franklin regarding impairment of classes under Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.30	201.00
Q	2/11/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to/from G. Kaplan regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and treatment of Class 7, review settlement proposal regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Q	2/11/2014	Robert Franklin	Review and amend Plan of Reorganization (4.0)	4.00	2,040.00
Q	2/11/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review Committee Plan of Reorganization and memorandum R. Franklin regarding same, regarding Schedule D debts (.3); review correspondences P. Marcoux, C. Brown regarding Committee Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.40	168.00
Qa	2/11/2014	Robert Franklin	Review comments from G. Kaplan and respond to same (.5); review and revise Disclosure Statement regarding same (.9)	1.40	714.00
G	2/12/2014	John Murray	Review, analysis and evaluation of multiple correspondence from G. Felcyn of 1/31/14 regarding PDS, Alliacense and Agility (.4)	0.40	268.00
G	2/12/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review Patriot-TPL settlement and memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
Nb	2/12/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Harris regarding negotiations with insiders, correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
Q	2/12/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to/from M. Brown regarding treatment under Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.20	134.00
Q	2/12/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from Creditors Committee members regarding committee Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement (.1); correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding plan confirmation and classification regarding insider claimants swamping non-insider claimants, review, analysis and evaluation memorandum regarding same (.8); analysis and evaluation regarding cram down of non-accepting creditors and correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.4)	1.30	871.00
Q	2/12/2014	Robert Franklin	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding changes to Plan of Reorganization (.3)	0.30	153.00
Q	2/12/2014	Robert Franklin	Correspondence with G. Felcyn regarding assumption of PTSC/TPL (.2); review agreement and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.8)	1.00	510.00
Q	2/12/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review multiple correspondences Committee members regarding Plan of Reorganization of Committe (.1); review correspondences G. Felcyn, R. Franklin and C. Flowers regarding Committee Plan of Reorganization and executory contracts (.2)	0.30	126.00
Qa	2/12/2014	Robert Franklin	Conform Disclosure Statement with Plan of Reorganization (.9)	0.90	459.00
Qa	2/12/2014	Robert Franklin	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding the Committee's Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	51.00
V	2/12/2014	John Murray	Commence review of debtor's Opposition to standing motion (.4)	0.40	268.00
V	2/12/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review Debtor opposition to Motion for derivative standing (.2); review opposition of S. Venkidu regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
G	2/13/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Harris regarding Patriot and Alliacense (.1)	0.10	67.00
G	2/13/2014	Robert Franklin	Review MMP agreements and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.8)	0.80	408.00
I	2/13/2014	Robert Franklin	Correspondence with K. Hiensch regarding language requested by Licensees (.3)	0.30	153.00
I	2/13/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences K. Hiensch, R. Franklin regarding licensee objections, amendments to Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	42.00
J	2/13/2014	John Murray	Continue preparation of project billing categories regarding Application for Compensation (.5)	0.50	335.00

Nb	2/13/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding conference call to discuss settlement offer (.1); prepare for same (.3); attend same (.7)	1.10	737.00
Q	2/13/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement, and miscellaneous regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
Q	2/13/2014	Robert Franklin	Review, revise and finalize Plan of Reorganization (1.8)	1.80	918.00
Q	2/13/2014	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence G. Felcyn regarding assumption of 2012 agreement and analysis and evaluation regarding same (1.2)	1.20	612.00
Q	2/13/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences G. Felcyn, P. Marcoux, B. Kirkendall, G. Kaplan, K. Beresford, J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding Committee Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	42.00
Qa	2/13/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement, review exhibits to same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Qa	2/13/2014	Robert Franklin	Review and finalize Disclosure Statement (2.8)	2.80	1,428.00
V	2/13/2014	John Murray	Preliminary review of debtor's and Venkidu's Opposition to standing motion (.4)	0.40	268.00
D	2/14/2014	John Murray	Telephone conference with W. Lewis regarding status of case (.2)	0.20	134.00
G	2/14/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding Rule 2004 Examination of D. Leckrone (.1)	0.10	67.00
I	2/14/2014	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from K. Heinsch and L. Engel regarding disclosure statement and treatment of licensees (.2)	0.20	134.00
I	2/14/2014	Robert Franklin	Correspondence with K. Hiensch regarding licensee's language (.2); review correspondence L. Engel regarding additional request (.2); review license agreements and commercialization agreements and concept of riding through bankruptcy (2.0)	2.40	1,224.00
Nb	2/14/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from creditor committee regarding negotiations with debtor (.2)	0.20	134.00
Nb	2/14/2014	Robert Franklin	Review status of responses from creditor committee regarding proposal (.2)	0.20	102.00
Q	2/14/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris and R. Franklin regarding termination of Alliacense agreement (.2)	0.20	134.00
Q	2/14/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and R. Harris regarding assumption or rejection of Alliacense agreement (.2); review multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn and R. Franklin regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement (.2)	0.40	268.00
Q	2/14/2014	Robert Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding Alliacense and rejection of contract (.3)	0.30	153.00
Qa	2/14/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding Disclosure Statement, forecasts, review same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Qa	2/14/2014	Robert Franklin	Finalize all pleadings re Disclosure Statement and Plan of Reorganization 2.5); review projections and correspondence with G. Felcyn regarding same (.6);	3.10	1,581.00
R	2/14/2014	John Murray	Status report to R. Franklin regarding correspondence from S. Caplan regarding Trustee motion (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	2/14/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding claims analysis (.1)	0.10	67.00
Q	2/16/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and committee exculpation, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
J	2/17/2014	Thomas Hwang	Commence preparation of Application for Compensation (1.5)	1.50	630.00
Qa	2/17/2014	John Murray	Review detailed correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding Creditors Committee's revised Disclosure Statement (.3)	0.30	201.00
Ba	2/18/2014	Thomas Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items (.1)	0.10	42.00
G	2/18/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding Alliacense contract (.2); review correspondence and detailed memorandum from P. Marcoux regarding Alliacense (.9)	1.10	737.00

J	2/18/2014	Thomas Hwang	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (.4)	0.40	168.00
Q	2/18/2014	Robert Franklin	Interoffice T. Hwang regarding classification and treatment issues (.3)	0.30	153.00
Q	2/18/2014	Thomas Hwang	Investigation and evaluation Committee Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.20	84.00
V	2/18/2014	Robert Franklin	Review Debtor's and Venkidu's opposition to standing motion (.5); legal research re standard and cases cited by Debtor (1.4); continue preparation of Reply brief (2.1); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same (.3)	4.30	2,193.00
V	2/18/2014	Thomas Hwang	Draft reply to opposition to motion for derivative standing (7.3); conference R. Franklin regarding same (.1); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	7.50	3,150.00
V	2/18/2014	Thomas Hwang	Meeting R. Franklin regarding motion for derivative standing and Committee Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.20	84.00
J	2/19/2014	John Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation regarding project billing (1.0)	1.00	670.00
P	2/19/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence to/from R. Harris and T. Tran regarding debtor's revised Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement, correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same, review revised Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement, review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.9)	0.90	603.00
Pa	2/19/2014	Robert Franklin	Initial review of Debtor's Disclosure Statement dated February 14, 2014 (1.3); correspondence with R. Harris regarding redline (.1)	1.40	714.00
V	2/19/2014	Robert Franklin	Continue preparation of reply to Debtor's and Venkidu's Opposition (1.5); review and revise Reply (.6); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same (.3)	2.40	1,224.00
V	2/19/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review comments and draft, revise and finalize reply to opposition to motion for derivative standing (3.4); memoranda R. Franklin regarding same (.1); meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	3.70	1,554.00
V	2/19/2014	Thomas Hwang	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation	0.40	168.00
D	2/20/2014	John Murray	Conference call S. Caplan regarding Patriot, PDS, Alliacense and TPL (.3)	0.30	201.00
F	2/20/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence to R. Shakoori regarding January fees and costs for Monthly Operating Report, miscellaneous regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
F	2/20/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review and respond correspondence R. Shakoori regarding Monthly Operating Report (.1)	0.10	42.00
J	2/20/2014	John Murray	Review and revise project billing regarding Application for Compensation (6.0)	6.00	4,020.00
L	2/20/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to H. Binder regarding cash collateral order compliance and carve out (.1)	0.10	67.00
L	2/20/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding expiration of cash collateral order (.1)	0.10	67.00
P	2/20/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation correspondences R. Franklin, G. Felcyn regarding Debtor's Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement	0.10	42.00
Pa	2/20/2014	Robert Franklin	Continue review of debtor's Disclosure Statement and draft summary of changes (1.0)	1.00	510.00
Pa	2/20/2014	Robert Franklin	Correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding summary of amendments to the Debtor's Disclosure Statement (.2)	0.20	102.00
Q	2/20/2014	Thomas Hwang	Prepare redlines of Committee Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement (.1); review exhibit to Committee Disclosure Statement and attention to filing of same (.1); correspondence R. Harris regarding Committee Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement and exhibit to same (.1); draft correspondence Court regarding same and attention to lodging of same (.2)	0.50	210.00
Qa	2/20/2014	John Murray	Review Exhibit A to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.2); review summary of debtor's revisions to Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement, review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same, review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.2); review correspondence to R. Harris regarding revisions to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.50	335.00
F	2/21/2014	John Murray	Review Monthly Operating Report, review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00

F	2/21/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review Monthly Operating Report and memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.2); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
I	2/21/2014	John Murray	Review objections of Apple, HP and Toshiba to Creditors Committee's Disclosure Statement, correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.4); review joinders in same (.2)	0.60	402.00
I	2/21/2014	Robert Franklin	Review objection by Licensees to Disclosure Statement (.5); interoffice conference J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.60	306.00
I	2/21/2014	Robert Franklin	Detailed telephone conference K. Prochnow regarding licensee's objection (.2)	0.20	102.00
I	2/21/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review objections filed by Apple and licensees to Debtor and Committee Disclosure Statements (.2)	0.20	84.00
J	2/21/2014	John Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation regarding preparation of project billing (3.0)	3.00	2,010.00
L	2/21/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to H. Binder regarding cash collateral order and debtor's compliance with carve outs (.1)	0.10	67.00
Nb	2/21/2014	John Murray	Review counter offer from H. Binder and correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.2); correspondence to/from C. Johnson and G. Felcyn regarding same (.1); review multiple correspondence to/from G. Kaplan regarding same (.1); analysis and evaluation regarding counter offer; draft memorandum regarding same (3.5); multiple correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding same (1.0); review multiple correspondence to/from G. Kaplan regarding debtor's Disclosure Statement (.1); review correspondence from R. Harris regarding revised forecast for debtor's Disclosure Statement (.2); review continuance to Creditors Committee regarding objection to debtor's Disclosure Statement, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.3);	5.50	3,685.00
Nb	2/21/2014	Robert Franklin	Review correspondence from H. Binder regarding counter proposal to Creditors Committee settlement offer (.2)	0.20	102.00
Nb	2/21/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation Debtor's counterproposal regarding settlement negotiations (.1); review correspondences J. Murray, G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.20	84.00
Pa	2/21/2014	Robert Franklin	Correspondence with G. Felcyn regarding Debtor's Disclosure Statement, review and respond regarding same (1.5);	1.00	510.00
Pa	2/21/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review and analysis Debtor's Disclosure Statement and Plan of Reorganization, correspondences R. Franklin and G. Felcyn regarding same, and correspondences R. Harris and updated forecasts regarding same; draft objection to Debtor's Disclosure Statement (2.2); meeting R. Franklin regarding same; memoranda R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	2.30	966.00
Qa	2/21/2014	John Murray	Review debtor's objection to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.2)	0.20	134.00
Qa	2/21/2014	Robert Franklin	Review objection by Debtor to Disclosure Statement (.3)	0.30	153.00
Qa	2/21/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review and evaluation objection of Debtor to Committee Disclosure Statement (.2); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
V	2/21/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding standing motion (.1)	0.10	67.00
I	2/22/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding licensees' proposed language for Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	67.00
J	2/22/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to V. Chial regarding Nov and Dec project billing categories (.2); analysis and evaluation regarding hours devoted to preparation of Application for Compensation to date (.1)	0.30	201.00
Nb	2/22/2014	John Murray	Review, analysis and evaluation of debtor's counter proposal regarding settlement, summarize same, multiple correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding same, review correspondence from H. Binder clarifying the debtor's proposal, correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same, correspondence to H. Binder regarding same (3.0);	3.00	2,010.00

Nb	2/22/2014	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from Creditors Committee members regarding conference call regarding debtor's latest proposal (.1)	0.10	67.00
Nb	2/22/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences J. Murray, H. Binder regarding plan negotiations, classification, and investigation regarding same, regarding claims against the estate (.3); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1);	0.40	168.00
Pa	2/22/2014	John Murray	Review C. Moore's objection to debtor's Disclosure Statement, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
Qa	2/22/2014	John Murray	Review objection of debtor to committee's Disclosure Statement (.2); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding revisions to Creditors Committee's Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.30	201.00
S	2/22/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding calculations of claims (.1); review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding J. Neal's incentive compensation claim (.1)	0.20	134.00
Nb	2/23/2014	John Murray	Continue analysis of debtor's proposal regarding subordination of claims and multiple correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding same, correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (3.4); multiple correspondence to/from S. Anhalt and H. Binder regarding conference call to discuss Creditors Committee's latest proposal (.1); multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding conference call regarding debtor's response to committee proposal (.1); correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding calculation of claims per class regarding settlement proposals, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.3)	3.90	2,613.00
Nb	2/23/2014	Thomas Hwang	Analysis and evaluation correspondence J. Murray regarding negotiations with Debtor, regarding classification, and prepare report regarding claims (.3)	0.30	126.00
Ba	2/24/2014	Thomas Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items	0.10	42.00
Bb	2/24/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review ITC ruling and notice of determination regarding '337 investigation and review correspondence P. Marcoux regarding same (.2)	0.20	84.00
D	2/24/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from K. Prochnow regarding ITC ruling, review same, review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
F	2/24/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding debtor's Monthly Operating Report, review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
I	2/24/2014	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from K. Heinsch regarding meet and confer regarding licensee's requested revisions to Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	67.00
I	2/24/2014	Robert Franklin	Conference call with S. Anhalt and R. Harris regarding licensee's objection (.5); analysis and evaluation regarding upstream licensors (.3) conference call with R. Harris, S. Anhalt, L. Engel, K. Hiensch, E. Friedman and A. Lewis regarding licensee objection (.8)	1.60	816.00
J	2/24/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to T. Hwang regarding preparation of Application for Compensation (.1)	0.10	67.00
Nb	2/24/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from H. Binder regarding summary of claims, prepare for conference call with debtor's representatives regarding negotiations regarding Plan of Reorganization, interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding claims summary (.2); commence preparation of comparison summary analysis of Creditors Committee's proposal vs. debtor's response (.7) ; conference call with debtor's representatives regarding debtor's counter proposal (1.2); review and revise summary of debtor's counter proposal and multiple correspondence to/from debtor's team regarding same, correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same, interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same (2.3); review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding negotiations with debtor (.1)	4.50	3,015.00

Nb	2/24/2014	John Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding counter proposal, correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.7)	0.70	469.00
Nb	2/24/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to/from H. Binder and R. Harris regarding settlement negotiations (.1); review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding settlement and 13%ers, review correspondence from R. Harris regarding same (.1); multiple correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding debtor's response to committee's latest proposal (.1)	0.30	201.00
Nb	2/24/2014	Robert Franklin	Detailed conference call with S. Anhalt, H. Binder, R. Harris and J. Murray regarding clarification of settlement proposal and issues relating thereto (1.3)	1.30	663.00
Nb	2/24/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences H. Binder regarding classification and settlement negotiation points, and evaluation and analysis of claims and classification issues, regarding negotiations and settlement proposal (.8); prepare report regarding same (.1); memoranda J. Murray regarding same (.4); telephone conference with J. Murray, R. Franklin, H. Binder, R. Harris, S. Anhalt regarding same (1.2); review and evaluation correspondence J. Murray regarding summary of debtor's position, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.2)	2.70	1,134.00
Pa	2/24/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences G. Felcyn and G. Kaplan regarding Debtor's financial performance and projections, and investigation regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
Q	2/24/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding balloting analysis (.2)	0.20	134.00
Qa	2/24/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from J. Wesolowski regarding status of hearing on Disclosure Statement, regarding correspondence from H. Binder regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
S	2/24/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from H. Binder regarding S. Anhalt's claims analysis, analysis and evaluation regarding same, correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
S	2/24/2014	Robert Franklin	Review claims matrices and prepare response to inquiry from J. Murray regarding claim amounts (2.5)	2.50	1,275.00
C	2/25/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from H. Binder regarding Volvo (.1)	0.10	67.00
I	2/25/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding licenses (.1); review multiple correspondence to/from S. Anhalt and K. Heinsch regarding revisions to Disclosure Statement regarding licensees (.1)	0.20	134.00
I	2/25/2014	Robert Franklin	Draft correspondence and telephone conference with R. Harris regarding licensee objection and continuance of Disclosure Statement hearing date (.2); correspondence with K. Hiensch regarding same (.1); interoffice conference J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.40	204.00
J	2/25/2014	Thomas Hwang	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (3.9)	3.90	1,638.00
L	2/25/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding status of cash collateral order, review correspondence to R. Harris regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Nb	2/25/2014	John Murray	Prepare for Creditors Committee conference call regarding negotiations with debtor, review of debtor's counter proposal, and formation of committee's counter proposal (.9); attend same (1.3); correspondence to H. Binder, et al. regarding counter offer, correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.7)	2.90	1,943.00
Nb	2/25/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt and H. Binder regarding conference call regarding settlement discussions (.1); review, analysis and evaluation correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding committee counter proposal regarding payment to Browns and non-insider 13%ers, interoffice conference R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same, telephone conference with S. Anhalt regarding same (.6); telephone conference with D. Wright regarding continuance of hearing of 2/27/14, multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding same (.3);	1.00	670.00
Nb	2/25/2014	Robert Franklin	Call with Creditors Committee regarding counter proposal to settlement offer by Debtor (1.3)	1.30	663.00

Nb	2/25/2014	Thomas Hwang	Meeting with Committee, J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding negotiations with debtor (1.2); meeting J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	1.30	546.00
Nb	2/25/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences J. Murray and R. Franklin regarding negotiation points with the Debtor, regarding classification issues, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.4); review correspondence S. Anhalt regarding same, and investigation regarding same; memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.2); meetings J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.3); draft correspondence J. Murray regarding same, regarding appeal of Browns judgment (.1)	1.00	420.00
V	2/25/2014	John Murray	Commence preparation for hearing on standing motion (1.6)	0.60	402.00
A	2/26/2014	John Murray	Review notes and review and revise action items memorandum (1.9)	1.90	1,273.00
Bb	2/26/2014	John Murray	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding continuance of Wed. hearings, correspondence to committee regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
C	2/26/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from H. Binder regarding Volvo and MMP (.1)	0.10	67.00
I	2/26/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding IP licenses (.1)	0.10	67.00
I	2/26/2014	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from S. Anhalt and K. Heinsch regarding language in Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement regarding treatment of licensees, MMP (.1)	0.10	67.00
I	2/26/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence H. Binder regarding discussions with licensee parties, regarding correspondence S. Sukduong (.1)	0.10	42.00
J	2/26/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from V. Chial regarding project billing (.4)	0.40	268.00
J	2/26/2014	Thomas Hwang	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation and legal research regarding same	3.40	1,428.00
L	2/26/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding expiration of cash collateral order, review correspondence to R. Harris regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
L	2/26/2014	Robert Franklin	Review status of cash collateral budget and telephone conference with R. Harris regarding same	0.20	102.00
L	2/26/2014	Thomas Hwang	Investigation regarding use of cash collateral, regarding budget; review correspondences R. Franklin, J. Murray regarding same (.1); memoranda J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.20	84.00
Nb	2/26/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from S. Anhalt and H. Binder regarding conference call regarding negotiations (.1); analysis and evaluation regarding need to retain patent lawyer (.2); prepare for and attend telephone conference with debtor's team regarding offer and counter offer regarding settlement (.8); interoffice conference R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.2)	1.30	871.00
Nb	2/26/2014	Robert Franklin	Telephonic conference call with R. Harris, S. Anhalt, J. Murray and T. Hwang regarding clarification of settlement proposal and further negotiation (.8); interoffice conference J. Murray and T. Hwang regarding issues raised in the conference (.2)	1.00	510.00
Nb	2/26/2014	Thomas Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, R. Franklin, H. Binder, R. Harris, S. Anhalt regarding negotiation points (.8); meeting J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	1.00	420.00
Qa	2/26/2014	Robert Franklin	Attend telephonic hearing on the Disclosure Statements and motion to gain standing (.2)	0.20	102.00
Qa	2/26/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondence T. Bracegirdle regarding hearing on Disclosure Statements; conference R. Franklin regarding same (.1); telephone conference with C. Brown regarding same; correspondence Committee regarding same; review correspondences J. Murray, P. Marcoux regarding same (.2)	0.30	126.00
R	2/26/2014	John Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from correspondence to/from team regarding CD of 1/23/14 hearing (.2)	0.20	134.00
Bb	2/27/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux and K. Beresford regarding continuance of hearings (.1)	0.10	67.00
C	2/27/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from H. Binder regarding Volvo, review multiple correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00

I	2/27/2014	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from E. Friedman, K. Heinsch and R. Franklin regarding licensees' requested revisions to Disclosure Statement ((.2)	0.20	134.00
I	2/27/2014	Robert Franklin	Review iterations of licensee requested language regarding consent of patent owners (.4) attend conference call with L. Engel, K. Hiensch, E. Freidman, R. Harris and S. Anhalt regarding negotiation of language of consent by patent owners (.8)	1.20	612.00
J	2/27/2014	John Murray	Continue preparation of project billing categories (1.0)	1.00	670.00
Nb	2/27/2014	John Murray	Review debtor's counter proposal regarding settlement, prepare chart summarizing recent offers and counter offers, correspondence to/from debtor's camp regarding same (2.3); multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.2); Conference call S. Anhalt and R. Harris regarding settlement negotiations (.3); review and revise settlement negotiations summary chart (.4) ; correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding conference call to discuss debtor's latest counter proposal (.1); review debtor's markup of settlement negotiations summary chart, correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding conference call to discuss same, interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same, correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same and Creditors Committee conference call to discuss same (.8)	4.10	2,747.00
Nb	2/27/2014	John Murray	Regarding multiple correspondence from R. Harris regarding settlement negotiations, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Nb	2/27/2014	John Murray	Correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding status of settlement counter offer (.1); review, analysis and evaluation regarding debtor's latest counter offer (.7)	0.80	536.00
Nb	2/27/2014	John Murray	Review detailed memorandum from debtor regarding notes of conference call regarding settlement, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.3); multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding debtor's counter offer (.2); correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding debtor's counter offer (.1)	0.60	402.00
Nb	2/27/2014	Robert Franklin	Review status of settlement negotiations (.5)	0.50	255.00
Nb	2/27/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review and analysis memorandum from J. Murray, Debtor's counterproposal and summary report of negotiation terms with Debtor, and revise same (1.0); memoranda J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.2); conference J. Murray regarding same (.1); telephone conference with R. Harris, S. Anhalt regarding same (.2)	1.50	630.00
S	2/27/2014	Thomas Hwang	Analysis regarding claims and classification and regarding debtor's analysis, and prepare matrix regarding same (1.3); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.3)	1.60	672.00
Bb	2/28/2014	Thomas Hwang	Meeting with Committee regarding negotiations with debtor (.9)	0.90	378.00
Bc	2/28/2014	Thomas Hwang	Draft minutes for February 25 meeting	0.80	336.00
L	2/28/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence to R. Harris regarding continued use of cash collateral (.1)	0.10	67.00

Nb	2/28/2014	John Murray	Review multiple correspondence from creditor committee regarding attendance at Creditors Committee conference call regarding settlement discussions with debtor (.1); prepare for conference call with Creditors Committee regarding settlement negotiations with debtor (.7); correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding other points of negotiations with debtor (.1); multiple correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding calculations of claims regarding settlement and subordination (.4); attend Creditors Committee conference call (.9); correspondence to/from Creditors Committee summarizing decisions made during conference call, multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same, review multiple correspondence from Creditors Committee regarding same (.8); revise summary regarding negotiations with debtor (.2); correspondence to debtor's camp regarding counter proposal (.2); review voice mail from S. Anhalt regarding same, telephone call to S. Anhalt regarding same, correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding same, multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding same (.2); telephone conference with R. Harris regarding counter proposal (.3)	3.90	2,613.00
Nb	2/28/2014	Robert Franklin	Prepare for call with Creditors Committee (.5); conference call with Committee regarding counter proposal (.9)	1.40	714.00
Nb	2/28/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences J. Murray, R. Franklin and Committee members regarding counterproposal to Debtor (.1); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.20	84.00
Nb	2/28/2014	Thomas Hwang	Review correspondences J. Murray, and analysis regarding claims, classification and proposed subordination, and memoranda J. Murray regarding same (.7)	0.70	294.00
R	2/28/2014	John Murray	Review correspondence from C. Hoge regarding trustee motion (.1)	0.10	67.00

A	Total	Total	Total	61.40	35,873.00
Ba	Total	Total	Total	12.60	6,547.00
Bb	Total	Total	Total	190.70	108,818.00
Bc	Total	Total	Total	121.90	54,844.00
C	Total	Total	Total	19.00	9,363.00
D	Total	Total	Total	8.20	4,625.00
Ea	Total	Total	Total	24.60	13,481.00
Eb	Total	Total	Total	16.00	8,995.00
Ec	Total	Total	Total	48.40	23,721.00
F	Total	Total	Total	13.70	7,146.00
G	Total	Total	Total	99.80	53,446.00
Ga	Total	Total	Total	35.60	18,809.00
H	Total	Total	Total	26.30	15,667.00
I	Total	Total	Total	55.50	28,891.00
J	Total	Total	Total	66.60	42,039.00
Ja	Total	Total	Total	0.30	201.00
Ka	Total	Total	Total	43.00	22,756.00
Kb	Total	Total	Total	63.80	38,635.00
L	Total	Total	Total	120.90	67,442.00
M	Total	Total	Total	127.30	72,498.00
Na	Total	Total	Total	22.90	12,650.00
Nb	Total	Total	Total	107.80	66,962.00
O	Total	Total	Total	33.00	18,190.00
P	Total	Total	Total	194.40	108,291.00
Pa	Total	Total	Total	120.40	61,200.00
Q	Total	Total	Total	97.20	47,635.00
Qa	Total	Total	Total	73.40	35,965.00
R	Total	Total	Total	140.10	82,272.00
S	Total	Total	Total	65.80	32,720.00
T	Total	Total	Total	11.10	4,787.00
U	Total	Total	Total	75.60	40,500.00
V	Total	Total	Total	51.50	23,629.00
W	Total	Total	Total	29.60	19,182.00
Total	Total	Total	Total	2,178.40	1,187,780.00
		1,187,780.00	TOTAL		
		(19,182.00)	March- April 2 Pre-Engagement Period		
		1,168,598.00	TOTAL FIRST APPLICATION PERIOD		