1 2 3 4	JOHN WALSHE MURRAY (074823) ROBERT A. FRANKLIN (091653) THOMAS T. HWANG (218678) DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP 305 Lytton Avenue Palo Alto, CA 94301 Telephone: (650) 857-1717	
5	Facsimile: (650) 857-1288 Email: murray.john@dorsey.com Email: franklin.robert@dorsey.com	
6	Email: hwang.thomas@dorsey.com	
7 8	Attorneys for Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors	
9	UNITED STATES BA	NKRUPTCY COURT
10	NORTHERN DISTRIC	CT OF CALIFORNIA
11	SAN JOSE	DIVISION
12	In re:	
13	TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED LLC,	Case No. 13-51589-SLJ-11
14	fka Technology Properties Limited ) Inc., A California Corporation, ) fka Technology Properties Limited, )	Chapter 11
15	A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,	Date: April 9, 2014 Time: 1:30 p.m.
16	Debtor. )	Place: United States Bankruptcy Court 280 S. First Street, Room 3099
17	) 	San Jose, CA 95113 Judge: Honorable Stephen L. Johnson
18		
19	Ехнів	IT "A"
20	T	0
21	FIRST APPLICATION FOR INTERIM COMPENS  Ry ATTORNEYS FOR OFFICIAL COM-	SATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES IMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS
22	BI ATTORNETS FOR OFFICIAL COM	THAT I ELL OT CARD COLLEGE CARD
23.		
24		
25		
26		
27		
28		EXHIBIT COVER

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 1 of 50

**Entered on Docket** May 16, 2013

GLORIA L. FRANKLIN, CLERK **U.S BANKRUPTCY COURT** NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA



JOHN WALSHE MURRAY (074823) ROBERT A. FRANKLIN (091653) **THOMAS T. HWANG (218678)** 2 DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP 305 Lytton Avenue 3 Palo Alto, CA 94301 Telephone: (650) 857-1717 4 Facsimile: (650) 857-1288 Email: murray.john@dorsey.com 5 Email: franklin.robert@dorsey.com Email: hwang.thomas@dorsey.com 6

The following constitutes the order of the court. Signed May 15, 2013

U.S. Bankruptcy Judge

Proposed Attorneys for Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

7

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT

NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA

SAN JOSE DIVISION

ORDER AUTHORIZING EMPLOYMENT OF COUNSEL BY

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS

The EX PARTE APPLICATION BY OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS FOR

ORDER AUTHORIZING EMPLOYMENT OF COUNSEL (the "Application") of the Official Committee Of

Unsecured Creditors (the "Committee") in the bankruptcy case of Technology Properties Limited

employ Dorsey & Whitney LLP ("Dorsey"), as counsel for the Committee, effective nunc pro tunc

to April 3, 2013; it appearing to the Court that Dorsey is disinterested and does not hold or represent

this case is admitted to practice before this Court, that Dorsey's employment is necessary and in the

an interest adverse to the estate, that each of the attorneys of Dorsey who will provide services in

best interests of the Committee and the bankruptcy estate; it further appearing to this Court that

LLC (the "Debtor") having been filed with the Court; the Application requests authorization to

In re: Case No. 13-51589-SLJ-11 TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED LLC, fka Technology Properties Limited Chapter 11 INC., A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION, fka Technology Properties Limited, A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION, [No Hearing Required] Debtor.

17

16

18

19

20

21

22 23

24

25

26

27

28

H:\Client Matters\- F&R\Tech Properties\Pl\Employ\CrCom\Ord v4.docx C#se: 13-51589

Doc# 165

Filed: 05/15/13

ORDER AUTHORIZING EMPLOYMENT OF COUNSEL BY OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS

Page 1 of Entered: 05/16/13 12:08:50

Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Extel BIT A

notice or hearing on the Application is not necessary; and good cause appearing therefor, IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that the Application is approved and that the Committee is authorized to employ Dorsey upon the terms and conditions set forth in the Application effective nunc pro tunc to April 3, 2013, to represent the Committee in this bankruptcy case. \*\*END OF ORDER\*\* ORDER AUTHORIZING EMPLOYMENT OF COUNSEL BY H:\Client Matters\- F&R\Tech Properties\Pl\Employ\CrCom\Ord v4.docx OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS Entered: 05/16/13 12:08:50 Page 2 of Filed: 05/15/13 Case: 13-51589 Doc# 165

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page (

of 50

1	Court Service List
2	None
3	
4	
5	
6 7	
8	
9	
10	
11	
12	
13	
14	
15	
16	
17	
18	
19	
20	
21	
22	
23	
24	
25	
26	
27	
28	TTH:sb 4 H:\Client Matters\- F&R\Tech Properties\P\\Employ\CrCom\Ord v4.docx 3 ORDER AUTHORIZING EMPLOYMENT OF COUNSEL BY OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS
С	se: 13-51589 Doc# 165 Filed: 05/15/13 Entered: 05/16/13 12:08:50 Page 3 of 3
300	13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 4

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 4 of 50

1 2	JOHN WALSHE MURRAY (074823) ROBERT A. FRANKLIN (091653) THOMAS T. HWANG (218678) DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP	
3	305 Lytton Avenue Palo Alto, CA 94301	
4	Telephone: (650) 857-1717 Facsimile: (650) 857-1288	
5	Email: murray.john@dorsey.com Email: franklin.robert@dorsey.com Email: hwang.thomas@dorsey.com	
7 8	Attorneys for Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors	
9	UNITED STATES BA	NKRUPTCY COURT
10	NORTHERN DISTRIC	CT OF CALIFORNIA
11	SAN JOSE	DIVISION
12	In re:	
13	TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED LLC,	Case No. 13-51589-SLJ-11
14	fka Technology Properties Limited ) Inc., A California Corporation, ) fka Technology Properties Limited, )	Chapter 11
15	A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,	Date: April 9, 2014 Time: 1:30 p.m.
16	Debtor.	Place: United States Bankruptcy Court 280 S. First Street, Room 3099
17		San Jose, CA 95113  Judge: Honorable Stephen L. Johnson
18		,
19	Ехнів	тт "В"
20	To	0
21	FIRST APPLICATION FOR INTERIM COMPENS BY ATTORNEYS FOR OFFICIAL COM	SATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES MITTER OF UNSECURED CREDITORS
22	DI ATTORNETS FOR OFFICIAL COM	WITTED OF CHOLOCKED CREDITION
23		
24		
25		
26		
27		
28		
	· ·	EXHIBIT COVER

Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 5 of 50



## PALO ALTO OFFICE 650-857-1717

(Tax Identification No. 41-0223337)

## STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of 4290 Manuela Way Palo Alto CA 94306

March 17, 2014 Invoice No. \*\*\*\*\*

Client-Matter No: 494643-00001

**Technology Properties Limited LLC** 

## For Legal Services Rendered Through February 28, 2014

A		Case Administration		
04/03/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from E. Keller regarding Creditors' Committee organizational meeting (.1); telephone conference with E. Keller regarding same (.2); prepare for organizational meeting (1.6); review and revise memorandum regarding status of case (.3)	2.20	1,474.00
04/03/13	J. Murray	Attend Creditors' Committee meeting (5.5)	5.50	3,685.00
04/04/13	T. Hwang	Evaluation court electronic filing notification guidelines and draft, revise requests for special notice (.6); meetings J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.70	294.00
04/04/13	T. Hwang	Evaluation regarding case developments (.9)	0.90	378.00
04/04/13	R. Franklin	Draft Committee Bylaws (1.2)	1.20	612.00
04/07/13	J. Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding bylaws	0.40	268.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 6 Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 2

A		Case Administration and NDA (.4)		
04/08/13	J. Murray	Organize action items (.5)	0.50	335.00
04/08/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding bylaws and confidentiality agreement (.3)	0.30	201.00
04/09/13	R. Franklin	Review correspondence G. Kaplan regarding bylaws and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.5)	0.50	255.00
04/09/13	J. Murray	Prepare Creditors' Committee directory (.5)	0.50	335.00
04/10/13	J. Murray	Continue preparation of Creditors' Committee bylaws (.8)	0.80	536.00
04/15/13	R. Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding bylaws and NDA	0.20	102.00
04/16/13	R. Franklin	Review and revise Bylaws (2.4)	2.40	1,224.00
04/16/13	R. Franklin	Review committee members comments regarding bylaws' analysis and evaluation regarding same and incorporate as appropriate in revised draft	0.20	102.00
04/17/13	R. Franklin	Review and revise bylaws (.2); finalize Bylaws (.3)	0.50	255.00
04/18/13	R. Franklin	Finalize Bylaws and NDA and forward to Committee for approval	0.40	204.00
04/19/13	R. Franklin	Review status of return of NDA and Bylaws (.4); detailed telephone conference with D. Wright regarding same (.2)	0.60	306.00
04/20/13	J. Murray	Organize action items (1.7)	1.70	1,139.00
04/21/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from R. Franklin regarding status of bylaws and NDA (.1); review correspondence from Creditors' Committee regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
04/22/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondence J. Murray to	0.10	42.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 7 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 3

<b>A</b>	Case Administration  Committee members regarding case status; memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)		
04/22/13 J. Murray	Review docket regarding recent filings and correspondence to S. Bloomer regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
04/23/13 T. Hwang	Evaluation regarding case developments and action items, and prepare memorandum regarding same (.7)	0.70	294.00
04/24/13 T. Hwang	Investigation regarding status conference requirements, court procedures (.3); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.40	168.00
04/24/13 J. Murray	Attend Section 341 Meeting of Creditors (3.2)	3.20	2,144.00
04/25/13 R. Franklin	Review status conference statement by Debtor (.3)	0.30	153.00
04/25/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to C. Cavazos regarding obtaining CD of Section 341 Meeting of Creditors (.1)	0.10	67.00
04/26/13 T. Hwang	Review Debtor's status conference statement (.1)	0.10	42.00
04/26/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from C. Cavazos regarding CD of Section 341 Meeting of Creditors (.1)	0.10	67.00
04/29/13 R. Franklin	Respond to correspondence regarding preparation of directory (.2)	0.20	102.00
04/30/13 R. Franklin	Review and finalize directory (.2)	0.20	102.00
05/03/13 J. Murray	Interoffice conference C. Cavazos regarding transcription of Section 341 Meeting of Creditors (.1)	0.10	67.00
05/08/13 T. Hwang	Review correspondence J. Murray regarding action items, meeting agenda,	0.30	126.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 8 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 4

<b>A</b>	Case Administration and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.3)		
05/14/13 T. Hwang	Review and evaluation correspondences R. Franklin, J. Murray regarding case status, meeting agenda items, and memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.3)	0.30	126.00
05/22/13 J. Murray	Review Debtor's Motion to restrict distribution of information (.3)	0.30	201.00
05/24/13 J. Murray	Review and revise action items memorandum (.5)	0.50	335.00
05/28/13 T. Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding case strategy and action items (.7); review memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1); meeting R. Franklin regarding case status, regarding document and information requests to Debtor; review correspondence R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.90	378.00
05/28/13 R. Franklin	Review action item list and analysis and evaluation regarding same (1.0)	1.00	510.00
05/29/13 J. Murray	Legal research regarding "Markman" hearing and ruling (.5); review Markman ruling by ITC (.5)	1.00	670.00
06/01/13 J. Murray	Review and organize files and review and revise action items memorandum (1.3)	1.30	871.00
06/02/13 J. Murray	Review recent correspondence and review and revise action items memorandum (.9)	0.90	603.00
06/04/13 T. Hwang	Evaluation and analysis Debtor's motion regarding 1102(b)(3), and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.8)	0.80	336.00
06/04/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding objection to debtor's 1102(b)(3) Motion (.2)	0.20	134.00
06/05/13 R. Franklin	Analysis and evaluation of Sec. 1102(b)	0.70	357.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 9 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 5

A		Case Administration		
		motion (.3); review, revise and finalize opposition to same (.4)		
06/05/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding debtor's Section 1102(b)(3) motion (.1); interoffice conference R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.1); correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
06/05/13	T. Hwang	Draft, revise, and finalize opposition regarding Debtor's motion regarding section 1102(b)(3) (2.2); memorandum R. Franklin and J. Murray regarding same (.1)	2.30	966.00
06/07/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to C. Cavazos regarding debtor's 1102(b)(3) motion (.1); review correspondence to/from S. Kim and R. Franklin regarding hearing regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
06/07/13	R. Franklin	Review action item list (.4)	0.40	204.00
06/10/13	R. Franklin	Interoffice conference J. Murray regarding Section 1102(b) motion and application to employ Ropers and Adelson firms (.1); analysis and evaluation regarding status of action items (.3); review and revise minutes of 6/4/13 Committee meeting (.5)	0.90	459.00
06/12/13	R. Franklin	Interoffice conference with J. Murray regarding Sec. 1102(b) motion (.1); prepare for hearing (.4); attend hearing (1.2)	1.70	867.00
06/12/13	T. Hwang	Evaluation Order regarding Debtor's 1102(b) motion and memoranda R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
06/17/13	R. Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding status of action items (.3)	0.30	153.00
07/03/13	R. Franklin	Review status conference statement (.3)	0.30	153.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 10 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 6

A	Case Administration		
07/10/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from M. Brown regarding Chapter 11 Status Conference (.1)	0.10	67.00
07/11/13 J. Murray	Attend Chapter 11 Status Conference (2.5)	2.50	1,675.00
07/17/13 T. Hwang	Evaluation regarding action items, and memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same, regarding minutes (.3)	0.30	126.00
07/17/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding action items from committee meeting (.2)	0.20	134.00
08/09/13 J. Murray	Review and organize files and review and revise action items (1.5)	1.50	1,005.00
08/10/13 J. Murray	Review and organize all files and review and revise action item memorandum (2.2)	2.20	1,474.00
08/14/13 J. Murray	Organize notes and review and revise action items (.5)	0.50	335.00
08/30/13 T. Hwang	Draft memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding action items of all parties, pending hearings and case matters (2.0)	2.00	840.00
09/04/13 T. Hwang	Review correspondence J. Murray regarding case status and action items, and evaluation Meeting minutes regarding same (.3); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.2); conference with J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.60	252.00
09/30/13 J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from team regarding Chapter 11 Status Conference; review court docket and calendar regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
10/03/13 R. Franklin	Attend Status Conference (1.5)	1.50	765.00
12/31/13 R. Franklin	Review and revise action item list (.5); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same (.2)	0.70	357.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 11 of 50



Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*
Page 7

A	Case Administration		
01/02/14 J. Murray	Review detailed memorandum from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding issues and action items, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
01/06/14 J. Murray	Draft memorandum regarding action items (1.6)	1.60	1,072.00
01/08/14 J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from T. Bracegirdle regarding continuance of Status Conference, correspondence to S. Bloomer regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
01/09/14 J. Murray	Review correspondence to/from T. Bracegirdle regarding continuance of Status Conference (.1)	0.10	67.00
01/15/14 J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from C. Johnson and team regarding prior correspondence regarding J. Neal (.2)	0.20	134.00
01/17/14 R. Franklin	Review status of action items (.5); team meeting regarding same (.7)	1.20	612.00
01/17/14 J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding meeting regarding action items (.1)	0.10	67.00
01/23/14 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding new dates and deadlines (.1)	0.10	67.00
01/25/14 J. Murray	Continue preparation of action item memorandum (1.2)	1.20	804.00
02/06/14 R. Franklin	Review SEC document (.4); analysis and evaluation regarding potential conflict (.7)	1.10	561.00
02/06/14 J. Murray	Correspondence to G. Felcyn and C. Johnson regarding Leckrone ownership interest in Patriot, review correspondence from C. Johnson regarding same, correspondence to/from S. O'Neill, R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same, review correspondence from C. Flowers	1.20	804.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 12 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014

Page 8

 $\mathbf{A}$ 

**Case Administration** 

regarding same, review Stmnt. of Financial Affairs & Schedules regarding same, review List of 20 Largest Unsecured Creditors, review claims docket,

investigation regarding same (1.2)

02/26/14 J. Murray

Review notes and review and revise action

1.90 1,273.00

items memorandum (1.9)

Subtotal for

**Case Administration** 

35,873.00

**Case Administration** 

Task	Timekeeper	Rate	Hours	Amount	
Α	John Murray	670	34.40	23,048.00	
Α	Robert Franklin	510	16.50	8,415.00	
Α	Thomas Hwang	420	10.50	4,410.00	
Α	Total		61.40	35,873.00	

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 13 of 50

1 2	JOHN WALSHE MURRAY (074823) ROBERT A. FRANKLIN (091653) THOMAS T. HWANG (218678) DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP	
3	305 Lytton Avenue Palo Alto, CA 94301	
4	Telephone: (650) 857-1717 Facsimile: (650) 857-1288	
5	Email: murray.john@dorsey.com Email: franklin.robert@dorsey.com	
6	Email: hwang.thomas@dorsey.com	
7	Attorneys for Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors	
8	Committee of Onsecured Oreatons	
9	UNITED STATES BA	NKRUPTCY COURT
10	NORTHERN DISTRI	CT OF CALIFORNIA
11	SAN JOSE	DIVISION
12	In re:	
13	TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED LLC, fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED	Case No. 13-51589-SLJ-11
14	INC., A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,	Chapter 11
15	fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED, A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,	Date: April 9, 2014 Time: 1:30 p.m.
16	Debtor.	Place: United States Bankruptcy Court 280 S. First Street, Room 3099
17		San Jose, CA 95113  Judge: Honorable Stephen L. Johnson
18		) Juage. Honorable Stephen 2. volumen
19	Ехни	віт "С"
20	T	O
21	FIRST APPLICATION FOR INTERIM COMPEN	SATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES
22	By Attorneys For Official Con	MMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS
23		
24		
25		
26		
27		
28		
-		EXHIBIT COVER

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 14 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 9

Ba	Internal Communications and Case Management		
04/14/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to T. Hwang regarding action items (.2)	0.20	134.00
05/20/13 J. Murray	Team meeting regarding action items (.3)	0.30	201.00
05/28/13 T. Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding case status and strategy (.1)	0.10	42.00
05/28/13 R. Franklin	Interoffice conference J. Murray and T. Hwang regarding action items and case strategy (.7)	0.70	357.00
05/28/13 J. Murray	Team meeting regarding status and action items (.7)	0.70	469.00
06/03/13 T. Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items (.1)	0.10	42.00
06/17/13 T. Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items (.1)	0.10	42.00
06/20/13 T. Hwang	Conference J. Murray regarding case status and outstanding action items	0.10	42.00
06/21/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to team regarding S. Kim's draft correspondence to United States Trustee regarding debtor's conduct (.1)	0.10	67.00
06/21/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to team regarding S. Kim's correspondence to UST regarding Debtor's defalcations (.1)	0.10	67.00
07/08/13 T. Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items (.1)	0.10	42.00
07/08/13 T. Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items; review and respond R. Becker regarding case status and chapter 7 trustee (.1)	0.10	42.00
08/29/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from M. Brown regarding committee review of committee	0.40	268.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

EXHIBIT C

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 10

Ba		Internal Communications and Case Management meeting minutes and correspondence to team regarding same (.1); review multiple correspondence from committee members regarding same (.1); correspondence to T. Hwang regarding review of committee meeting minutes and preparation of action item memorandum (.1); review correspondence to committee regarding same (.1)		
09/03/13	T. Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items	0.10	42.00
09/03/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from committee members regarding approval of minutes (.1)	0.10	67.00
09/09/13	T. Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items	0.10	42.00
09/17/13	T. Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items (.1)	0.10	42.00
09/17/13	R. Franklin	Team meeting regarding status (.1)	0.10	51.00
09/23/13	T. Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items; meeting J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding mediation brief (.1)	0.10	42.00
10/03/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondence R. Franklin regarding HTC litigation and case status; meeting R. Franklin regarding same, regarding status conference (.2)	0.20	84.00
10/03/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding jury verdict (.1)	0.10	67.00
10/07/13	T. Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items (.1)	0.10	42.00
10/21/13	T. Hwang	Meeting R. Franklin regarding case status (.1); meeting S. O'Neill, R. Franklin	0.20	84.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 16 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 11

Ba		Internal Communications and Case Management		
	e E	regarding case status and action items (.1)		
11/04/13	R. Franklin	Interoffice conference J. Murray regarding status of TPL case (.4)	0.40	204.00
11/04/13	J. Murray	Interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding status, competing plan, motion for appointment of trustee, etc. (.4)	0.40	268.00
11/05/13	J. Murray	Interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding committee meeting (.1); interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding conference call with G. Felcyn and C. Johnson regarding PDS and Alliacense, review correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding same, review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.2); correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding competing Plan of Reorganization, motion to appoint Trustee, motion to terminate exclusivity (.2)	0.50	335.00
11/12/13	T. Hwang	Meeting S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items (.1)	0.10	42.00
11/25/13	T. Hwang	Meeting S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items (.1)	0.10	42.00
12/03/13	J. Murray	Interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding this week's motions (.2)	0.20	134.00
12/09/13	T. Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, R. Franklin, S. O'Neill regarding case status and action items (.1)	0.10	42.00
01/06/14	T. Hwang	Review memoranda J. Murray regarding case action items, trustee and contempt motion, Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement (.2); meeting J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (2.0)	2.20	924.00
01/06/14	R. Franklin	Review action item memo from J. Murray (.3); interoffice conference J. Murray and T. Hwang regarding same (2.0);	2.30	1,173.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 17 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 12

Ba		Internal Communications and Case Management		
01/27/14	R. Franklin	Interoffice conferences J. Murray regarding action items and response to request for information (.5)	0.50	255.00
01/28/14	T. Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items (.1)	0.10	42.00
01/30/14	T. Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding plan and case issues and action items (.2)	0.20	84.00
02/03/14	T. Hwang	Meetings R. Franklin regarding case status and action items (.2)	0.20	84.00
02/03/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding minutes of last meeting, review minutes, analysis and evaluation regarding same, action items (.3)	0.30	201.00
02/04/14	R. Franklin	Review minutes of Committee meeting regarding settlement strategy and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.5)	0.50	255.00
02/18/14	T. Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items (.1)	0.10	42.00
02/24/14	T. Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items	0.10	42.00
Subtotal	for	Internal Communications and Case Management		6,547.00

## **Internal Communications and Case Management**

Task	Timekeeper	Rate	Hours	Amount
Ba	John Murray	670	3.40	2,278.00
Ba	Robert Franklin	510	4.50	2,295.00
Ba	Thomas Hwang	420	4.70	1,974.00
Ba	Total		12.60	6,547.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 18 of 50

1 2 3 4 5 6	JOHN WALSHE MURRAY (074823) ROBERT A. FRANKLIN (091653) THOMAS T. HWANG (218678) DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP 305 Lytton Avenue Palo Alto, CA 94301 Telephone: (650) 857-1717 Facsimile: (650) 857-1288 Email: murray.john@dorsey.com Email: franklin.robert@dorsey.com Email: hwang.thomas@dorsey.com	
7	Attorneys for Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors	
8	Committee of Offisecured Creditors	
9	UNITED STATES BA	NKRUPTCY COURT
10	NORTHERN DISTRI	CT OF CALIFORNIA
11	SAN JOSE	DIVISION
12	In re:	
13	TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED LLC, () fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED ()	Case No. 13-51589-SLJ-11
14	Inc., A California Corporation, fka Technology Properties Limited,	Chapter 11
15	A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,	Date: April 9, 2014 Time: 1:30 p.m.
16	Debtor.	Place: United States Bankruptcy Court 280 S. First Street, Room 3099
1.7		San Jose, CA 95113  Judge: Honorable Stephen L. Johnson
18		
19	Exhib	BIT "D"
20		0
21	FIRST APPLICATION FOR INTERIM COMPEN By Attorneys For Official Com	SATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES  MMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS
22		``
23		
24		
25		
26		
27		
28		EXHIBIT COVER

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 19 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 13

Bb		Communications With Committee		
04/04/13 J	. Murray	Telephone conference with K. Beresford, D. Wright and D. Andrew of Beresford regarding Creditors' Committee meeting and strategy going forward (1.0)	1.00	670.00
04/04/13 J	. Murray	Correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding initial telephone conference and regarding process (.3)	0.30	201.00
04/05/13 J	. Murray	Multiple correspondence to and from G. Kaplan regarding creditors committee contact information (.2)	0.20	134.00
04/06/13 J	. Murray	Correspondence to and from K. Beresford regarding availability and communications with Debtor (.1)	0.10	67.00
04/07/13 J	. Murray	Correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding consent to circulation of electronic mail address (.1); analysis and evaluation regarding Creditors Committee availability for telephone conference (.3); correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding telephone conference (.2)	0.60	402.00
04/08/13 E	E. Darda	Emails with J. Murray, J. Mikhailevich and committee members regarding telephone conference (.4)	0.40	120.00
04/08/13 J	. Murray	Multiple correspondence to team regarding Creditors' Committee telephone conference; Debtor's Motion's, etc (.2)	0.20	134.00
04/08/13 J	. Murray	Correspondence to and from S. Kim regarding questions (.2)	0.20	134.00
04/09/13 E	E. Darda	Emails with J. Murray and committee members regarding telephone conference	0.20	60.00
04/09/13 J	. Murray	Telephone conference D. Wright to discuss Creditors' Committee telephone conference (.3)	0.30	201.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 20 of 50



March 17, 2014

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of

Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001 Page 14 Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\* Bb **Communications With Committee** 04/09/13 J. Murray Prepare for Creditors' Committee 0.50 335.00 telephone conference (.5) 04/09/13 J. Murray Telephone conference Creditors' 1.80 1,206.00 Committee regarding agenda items, etc (1.8)67.00 04/10/13 J. Murray Correspondence to and from Creditors' 0.10 Committee regarding call in information for 4/11/13 telephonic conference call with Debtor (.1) 0.10 67.00 04/10/13 J. Murray Correspondence to and from G. Felcyn regarding meeting with Debtor regarding cash flow (.1) 04/11/13 J. Murray Correspondence to and from S. Kim 0.20 134.00 regarding meeting with Debtor's special IP counsel (.2) 04/11/13 J. Murray 0.20 134.00 Multiple correspondence to and from C. Johnson of Patriot regarding attending Debtor's presentation to Creditors' Committee (.1); review multiple correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same and miscellaneous regarding same (.1)04/11/13 J. Murray Review correspondence from P. Marcoux 0.30 201.00 regarding Creditors' Committee/Debtor's meeting (.1); review multiple correspondence from B. Kirkendall regarding same regarding slides and regarding hearing regarding Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay (.1); review correspondence from M. Imhoff regarding same (.1) 04/13/13 J. Murray Multiple correspondence to and from 0.10 67.00 Creditors' Committee regarding Sunday telephonic conference call (.1) 04/13/13 J. Murray 67.00 0.10 Review correspondence to and from S.

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 21 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 15

Bb		Communications With Committee		
		Kim and K. Beresford regarding registry of potential assets of bankruptcy estate (.1)		
04/14/13	J. Murray	Prepare for Creditors' Committee telephonic conference call (1.0); attend same (1.3)	2.30	1,541.00
04/14/13	E. Darda	Emails with J. Murray regarding committee calls	0.20	60.00
04/15/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference C. Johnson and G. Felcyn regarding mediation between Alliasence and PDS (.5)	0.50	335.00
04/15/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from G. Felcyn regarding telephone conference with Patriot (.1)	0.10	67.00
04/16/13	E. Darda	Emails with J. Murray and K. Beresford regarding committee call and list of unsecured creditors	0.20	60.00
04/16/13	J. Murray	Prepare agenda for Creditors' Committee telephone conference; review all correspondence regarding action items (1.9)	1.90	1,273.00
04/17/13	R. Franklin	Prepare for meeting with Committee (.2); attend Committee meeting (1.8)	2.00	1,020.00
04/17/13	J. Murray	Continue to prepare for Creditors' Committee weekly telephone conference; review correspondence for action items (3.3); attend Creditors' Committee telephone conference (1.8)	5.10	3,417.00
04/17/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding financial advisor (.1)	0.10	67.00
04/17/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference D. Wright regarding communications from D. Lecrone to K. Beresford (.1)	0.10	67.00
04/17/13	E. Darda	Emails with J. Murray, R. Franklin and committee members regarding committee	0.50	150.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 22 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 16

Bb	Communications With Committee conference and Alliacense issues		
04/17/13 E. Darda	Creditors' committee conference	1.70	510.00
04/18/13 E. Darda	Emails with J. Murray, P. Marcoux and R. Franklin regarding relief from stay order, bylaws and NDA	0.40	120.00
04/19/13 J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence from Creditors' Committee members regarding bylaws and NDA (.2); correspondence to and from R. Franklin regarding same (.1); correspondence to H. Binder and R. Harris regarding same (.1)	0.40	268.00
04/20/13 J. Murray	Report to Creditors' Committee regarding week's events (1.3)	1.30	871.00
04/22/13 J. Murray	Continue preparation of correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding recent and scheduled events (.3)	0.30	201.00
04/22/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding schedule, etc (.1)	0.10	67.00
04/22/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to and from S. Kim regarding inquiry from G2 Investments (.1)	0.10	67.00
04/22/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to and from M. Brown regarding Section 341 Meeting of Creditors (.1)	0.10	67.00
04/24/13 J. Murray	Commence preparation of agenda for 4/25/13 Creditors' Committee telephone conference (.3)	0.30	201.00
04/25/13 T. Hwang	Weekly meeting with Committee regarding case status and strategy (1.8); prepare for same; review correspondences regarding same, and review nondisclosure agreement and comments (.2); meeting J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	2.10	882.00
04/25/13 R. Franklin	Attend Creditor Committee meeting (1.8)	1.80	918.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 23 of 50



05/01/13 J. Murray

05/01/13 J. Murray

March 17, 2014

0.20

134.00

Page 17 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001 Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\* **Communications With Committee** Bb Commence review correspondence S. Kim 0.30 153.00 04/25/13 R. Franklin regarding Debtor's actions pre-petition (.3) Review notes, organize and review action 3.40 2,278.00 04/25/13 J. Murray item memorandum and prepare agenda for Creditors' Committee telephone conference call (1.6); attend Creditors' Committee telephone conference call (1.8) Review correspondence from S. Kim 0.20 134.00 04/29/13 J. Murray regarding intra-committee communications (.2)0.70 469.00 Preparation of agenda for Creditors' 04/30/13 J. Murray Committee telephone conference and correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding same (.5); review minutes of last Creditors' Committee telephone conference 1.00 420.00 05/01/13 T. Hwang Review agenda regarding Committee meeting (.1); attend same (.7); meeting P. Marcoux, J. Murray, R. Franklin, M. Brown and C. Brown regarding same and case action items, regarding case history (.2)Prepare for meeting with Committee (.9); 2.20 1,122.00 05/01/13 R. Franklin attend Committee meeting (1.3) 05/01/13 J. Murray Prepare for Creditors' Committee 2.00 1,340.00 telephone conference (.7); attend same (1.3)Correspondence to P. Marcoux regarding 0.10 67.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statemen

Beresford regarding payments to Alliacense (.1); review multiple

same (.1)

K. Prochnow's contact information (.1)

Review multiple correspondence from K.

correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 24 of 50



Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 18

Bb		<b>Communications With Committee</b>		
05/03/13	R. Franklin	Detailed telephone conference with D. Wright regarding status and next steps (.2)	0.20	102.00
05/03/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding next weeks schedule (.1); review correspondence from D. Wright regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
05/08/13	J. Murray	Commence preparation of agenda for 5/10/13 Creditors' Committee meeting (.6)	0.60	402.00
05/09/13	T. Hwang	Telephone conference D. Wright regarding case status, regarding committee meeting (.2); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
05/11/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from D. Wright regarding telephone conference (.1)	0.10	67.00
05/12/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding strategy going forward (.2); review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding same (.1); review correspondence from K. Beresford regarding same (.1); telephone conference D. Wright regarding same (.8)	1.20	804.00
05/13/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from D. Wright regarding K. Beresford communications with D. Leckrone (.2)	0.20	134.00
05/14/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from D. Wright regarding K. Beresford communications with D. Leckrone (.2)	0.20	134.00
05/14/13	J. Murray	Commence preparation of agenda for 5-15-13 Creditors' Committee telephone conference (.5); review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding same (.1)	0.60	402.00
05/15/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences G. Felcyn, K. Beresford, M. Imhoff and S. Kim regarding case strategy and status (.2)	. 0.20	84.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 25 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 19

Bb		<b>Communications With Committee</b>		
05/15/13	T. Hwang	Meeting with committee (1.5); meeting J. Murray, R. Franklin, S. Kim, M. Brown, C. Brown regarding follow-up, case strategy (.1); revise minutes from May 10 committee meeting (.1); correspondence to committee members regarding same and regarding motion to reject (.2)	1.90	798.00
05/15/13	R. Franklin	Review correspondence committee members regarding strategy for case (.4); prepare for meeting (.9); attend meeting (1.5)	2.80	1,428.00
05/15/13	J. Murray	Prepare for Creditors' Committee telephone conference (.5); attend Creditors' Committee meeting regarding all matters (1.5); draft memorandum regarding post meeting action items (.2)	2.20	1,474.00
05/16/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from S. Kim regarding confidentiality of transcripts of Section 341 Meeting of Creditors (.1)	0.10	67.00
05/20/13	J. Murray	Commence preparation of agenda for 5-22-13 Creditors' Committee telephone conference (.9)	0.90	603.00
05/20/13	T. Hwang	Review and evaluation meeting agenda, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.2)	0.20	84.00
05/21/13	R. Franklin	Review correspondence regarding issues and agenda for Committee meeting (.5)	0.50	255.00
05/21/13	J. Murray	Continue preparation of agenda for 5-22-13 Creditors' Committee meeting (.5)	0.50	335.00
05/21/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding correspondence from G. Bailye regarding "Array" patents (.2)	0.20	134.00
05/21/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding N. Antonopoulos (.2); review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding	0.40	268.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 26 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 20

Bb	Communications With Committee  Debtor's Motion to limit creditor access to Creditors' Committee information (.2)		
05/21/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding T. Lavelle as expert witness (.1); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.1); correspondence to and from S. Kim regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
05/22/13 T. Hwang	Review correspondences S. Kim, G. Felcyn, C. Johnson, and G. Kaplan regarding case status and Committee meeting (.1); review correspondence H. Binder regarding meeting with Debtor and regarding K. Beresford correspondence (.1); attend Committee meeting (1.5); memorandum J. Murray regarding communication to H. Binder, regarding meeting with Debtor (.2)	1.90	798.00
05/22/13 R. Franklin	Prepare for Committee meeting (1.1); telephone conference with J. Proctor regarding financial advisor presentation (.1); attend meeting (1.5)	2.70	1,377.00
05/22/13 J. Murray	Prepare for Creditors' Committee meeting (.5); attend same (1.5)	2.00	1,340.00
05/22/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding N. Antonopolous and correspondence from C. Johnson regarding same (.1); review correspondence from S. Kim regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
05/23/13 J. Murray	Telephone conference D. Wright regarding next weeks meetings and today's subcommittee meeting with Debtor (.2)	0.20	134.00
05/24/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to and from S. Kim regarding Debtor's counsel's continued involvement in case (.2)	0.20	134.00
05/24/13 J. Murray	Review, analysis and evaluation	0.30	201.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 27 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 21

Bb	Communications With Committee correspondence from G. Bailey to M. Brown regarding Green Array (.2); correspondence to S. Kim regarding same (.1)		
05/28/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding changes in weeks schedule (.1); work out logistics regarding same (.2); correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding Thursday meeting with Debtor (.1)	0.40	268.00
05/29/13 J. Murray	Preparation of agenda for Committee meeting and correspondence to Committee regarding same (.4); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding minutes of Committee meeting of May 22 (.1)	0.50	335.00
05/29/13 T. Hwang	Review agenda for Committee meeting and minutes; conference J. Murray regarding same (.2)	0.20	84.00
05/29/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from K. Beresford regarding obtaining Markman Judgment (.1); correspondence to J. Ottesen and H. Binder regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
05/29/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from G. Kaplan regarding Committee conference call (.1)	0.10	67.00
05/29/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to Committee regarding multiple committee calls on May 30th (.2)	0.20	134.00
05/31/13 R. Franklin	Draft correspondence to Committee members regarding status (.4)	0.40	204.00
05/31/13 J. Murray	Telephone conference with C. Hoge regarding ITC rulings and settlement prospects (.2); correspondence to committee regarding developments in ITC litigation and possible convening of subcommittee (.1); correspondence to/from K. Beresford regarding same (.2); review	0.70	469.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 28 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 22

Bb	Communications With Committee correspondence from S. Kim, C. Johnson, D. Wright, G. Kaplan and C. Brown regarding same (.2);		
05/31/13 J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence from G. Felcyn of May 10, 2013 regarding strategy going forward (.2)	0.20	134.00
05/31/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to committee regarding Tuesday conference call (.2)	0.20	134.00
06/01/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to committee regarding agenda for committee call of June 4, 2013 (.2)	0.20	134.00
06/04/13 R. Franklin	Prepare for Committee meeting (.3); attend meeting (1.3)	1.60	816.00
06/04/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from M. Imhoff regarding communications from debtor and willingness to assist in restructure (.1); review multiple correspondence from D. Wright regarding communications with M. Imhoff (.1)	0.20	134.00
06/04/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding attendance at same (.1); attend same (1.2)	1.30	871.00
06/04/13 T. Hwang	Meeting with Committee (1.2)	1.20	504.00
06/05/13 J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding conference call with K. Beresford and D. Wright regarding developments (.2); review multiple correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding Alliacense (.2)	0.40	268.00
06/05/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding next committee meeting (.1); correspondence to committee regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
06/05/13 J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from D.	0.20	134.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 29 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 23

Bb		Communications With Committee Wright regarding conference call regarding recent developments (.2)		
06/06/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference with Keith Beresford and D. Wright regarding communications from debtor's representatives, claims and Objections to Claim (.6)	0.60	402.00
06/06/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence from committee members regarding availability for next subcommittee meeting with debtor and next committee meeting (.2); correspondence to/from M. Brown regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
06/10/13	J. Murray	Prepare agenda for committee meeting of June 13 (.3)	0.30	201.00
06/13/13	T. Hwang	Attend Committee meeting (1.0)	1.00	420.00
06/13/13	R. Franklin	Prepare for meeting with Committee (.8); attend meeting (1.0)	1.80	918.00
06/13/13	J. Murray	Attend committee conference call regarding all matters (1.0)	1.00	670.00
06/20/13	J. Murray	Prepare agenda for committee meeting; correspondence to committee regarding same (.5)	0.50	335.00
06/21/13	J. Murray	Prepare for committee meeting (.3); review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding conversations with debtor's counsel regarding status for update to committee (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding Ford payment dispute (.2); attend committee meeting (1.3)	1.90	1,273.00
06/21/13	T. Hwang	Attend meeting with Committee (1.2); continue discussion with C. Brown, M. Brown, P. Marcoux, J. Murray; meeting J. Murray regarding same, regarding action items (.1)	1.30	546.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 30 of 50



Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of March 17, 2014
Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001 Page 24

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

Bb	Communications With Committee		
06/25/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding correspondence from G. Kaplan (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.1); review correspondence from C. Johnson regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
06/25/13 J. Murray	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding committee meeting and strategy going forward (.2); telephone conference with D. Wright regarding notice of committee meetings (.1); correspondence to committee regarding next committee meeting (.1)	0.40	268.00
06/25/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding committee meeting (.1); correspondence to committee regarding next meeting (.1)	0.20	134.00
06/26/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding rescheduling committee meeting due to G. Kaplan's absence. (.1)	0.10	67.00
06/26/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding debtor's financial projections (.1); Multiple correspondence to/from committee members regarding postponement of committee meeting (.2)	0.30	201.00
06/26/13 T. Hwang	Correspondences Committee regarding scheduling of meeting and case status; review correspondences regarding same; conference J. Murray regarding same (.3)	0.30	126.00
06/27/13 J. Murray	Miscellaneous regarding next week's meetings (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.1); review correspondence to/from M. Imhoff regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
06/27/13 T. Hwang	Review correspondences M. Imhof, G. Felcyn regarding scheduling and	0.20	84.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 31 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 25

Bb	Communications With Committee correspondence G. Felcyn, C. Johnson regarding same (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)		
06/28/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from C. Brown regarding TPL's gross receipts (.1); regarding correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.1); review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding same (.1); multiple correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding same (.2); review correspondence from C. Brown to G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.60	402.00
07/01/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to committee regarding meeting agenda (.1)	0.10	67.00
07/01/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding minutes of committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
07/01/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding strategy going forward and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding committee conference call (.1)	0.30	201.00
07/02/13 J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from committee members regarding coordination of next meeting date (.2)	0.20	134.00
07/02/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from C. Johnson regarding C. Hoge attendance at committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
07/03/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn, M. Brown, M. Imhof, G. Kaplan regarding availability for next committee meeting (.1); correspondence to remaining committee members regarding same (.1); correspondence to/from P. Marcoux	0.50	335.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 32 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 26

Bb		Communications With Committee		
		regarding telephone conference to discuss various matters (.1); telephone conference with P. Marcoux regarding administrative expenses and negotiation strategy with the debtor (.2)		
07/08/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding Friday committee meeting (.1); correspondence to committee regarding same (.1); review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
07/11/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to committee regarding meeting agenda (.7)	0.70	469.00
07/11/13	T. Hwang	Review agenda from J. Murray regarding meeting; conferences J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
07/12/13	R. Franklin	Prepare for and attend committee meeting (2.1)	2.10	1,071.00
07/12/13	T. Hwang	Meeting with Committee (1.7)	1.70	714.00
07/15/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding strategy going forward (.2)	0.20	134.00
07/18/13	J. Murray	Prepare for committee meeting (.6)	0.60	402.00
07/18/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence from committee members over last 4 days; correspondence to committee regarding same (1.5)	1.50	1,005.00
07/19/13	J. Murray	Prepare for committee meeting (.3); attend same (1.8)	2.10	1,407.00
07/19/13	R. Franklin	Prepare for Committee meeting (.3); attend Committee meeting (1.8); interoffice conference T. Hwang and J. Murray regarding action items and minutes (.2)	2.30	1,173.00
07/19/13	T. Hwang	Attend meeting Committee (1.8); review correspondences from D. Wright regarding case status and negotiations (.1); review	2.00	840.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 33 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 27

Bb	Communications With Committee		
	correspondences J. Murray regarding same (.1)		•
07/22/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to committee regarding next committee conference call (.1); review multiple correspondence from committee members regarding availability for same (.1)	0.20	134.00
07/22/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding executive salaries (.1); review correspondence from C. Brown regarding the hearing project (.1)	0.20	134.00
07/23/13 J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence from committee regarding availability for committee meeting (.2)	0.20	134.00
07/25/13 R. Franklin	Review correspondence regarding status of negotiation with Debtor and prepare for Committee meeting (1.0); attend creditor meeting (1.8)	2.80	1,428.00
07/25/13 J. Murray	Interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding committee conference call (.1); correspondence to committee regarding conference call (.1); prepare for committee conference call (.3); attend same (1.8)	2.30	1,541.00
07/25/13 T. Hwang	Memoranda J. Murray regarding Committee meetings and meeting minutes; investigation regarding same (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1); meeting with Committee (1.8);	2.50	1,050.00
, ,	conference J. Murray regarding same (.1); review memorandum J. Murray regarding post-meeting discussions (.1); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.3)		
07/29/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to committee regarding agenda for committee call (.2); correspondence to R. Franklin and T.	0.30	201.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

\_ ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 34 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 28

Bb		Communications With Committee Hwang regarding tomorrow's committee meeting (.1)		
07/30/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding committee meeting (.2); correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding agenda for committee meeting (.1); attend committee conference call (2.0); review memoranda from D. Wright, provide comments and correspondence to committee regarding same (.5); review memoranda from G. Felcyn, provide comments and correspondence to committee regarding same (.3)	3.10	2,077.00
07/31/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding appeals in Brown v. TPL (.1)	0.10	67.00
08/02/13	R. Franklin	Detailed telephone conference with D. Wright regarding status report (.4)	0.40	204.00
08/02/13	R. Franklin	Interoffice conferences T. Hwang regarding status report (.4); conference call D. Wright, J. Murray and T. Hwang regarding status report and strategic considerations, revisions to status report (.6)	1.00	510.00
08/02/13	T. Hwang	Analysis and evaluation Committee meeting and memorandum J. Murray regarding same, regarding action items (1.3)	1.30	546.00
08/05/13	R. Franklin	Review correspondence K. Curry regarding statutes of limitation regarding avoidance actions (.1); analysis and evaluation regarding same and respond (.6)	0.70	357.00
08/05/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn, K. Curry and R. Franklin regarding statute of limitations regarding Objections to Claims, fraudulent conveyance litigation, and tolling	0.20	134.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 35 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 29

Bb		Communications With Committee agreements (.2)		
08/06/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding update regarding Brown litigation and agenda for committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
08/08/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from M. Brown regarding committee mailing list (.1)	0.10	67.00
08/09/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from M. Brown regarding committee mailing list and correspondence to G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
08/14/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to committee members regarding responses from members regarding availability for committee conference call (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding ALJ Essex Issues Notice Of Initial Determination (.1)	0.20	134.00
08/29/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding fewer committee meetings (.1)	0.10	67.00
09/05/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences J. Murray, P. Marcoux regarding case status and strategy, regarding scheduling; memorandum J. Murray regarding same review correspondence R. Franklin regarding license and demand for documents	0.10	42.00
09/05/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to committee regarding committee meeting and agenda (.2)	0.20	134.00
09/06/13	J. Murray	Review ITC ruling, analysis and evaluation regarding same, and multiple correspondence to/from committee regarding same (.4)	0.40	268.00
09/06/13	T. Hwang	Review ruling from ITC, and review	0.20	84.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 36 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 30

Bb	Communications With Committee correspondences S. Kim, C. Johnson regarding same; meeting R. Franklin regarding same		
09/06/13 R. Franklin	Review ITC ruling and correspondence among Committee members (.3); correspondence Committee regarding same (.2)	0.50	255.00
09/06/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding list of TPL related entities (.1)	0.10	67.00
09/09/13 J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence from M. Imhoff regarding unavailability for committee meetings and proxy to D. Wright (.1); correspondence to committee regarding next committee conference call (.1)	0.20	134.00
09/11/13 J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding committee conference call with debtor regarding ITC ruling, review correspondence to H. Binder regarding same (.1); review correspondence to/from P. Marcoux regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
09/12/13 T. Hwang	Review correspondence J. Murray regarding Committee meeting and agenda; memorandum J. Murray regarding meeting minutes	0.10	42.00
09/12/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to committee regarding committee meeting on September 13 (.2); interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same, correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same (.1); prepare agenda for committee conference call, prepare for call (.3)	0.60	402.00
09/12/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from M. Brown regarding committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 37 of 50



March 17, 2014

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of

Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001 Page 31 Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\* Bb **Communications With Committee** 09/13/13 J. Murray Conference call with committee and debtor 1.50 1,005.00 regarding ITC ruling, conference call committee regarding same, etc. (1.5) Review multiple correspondence from C. 09/15/13 J. Murray 0.10 67.00 Johnson regarding committee conference call (.1) 09/16/13 R. Franklin Prepare for Committee meeting (.3); attend 2.30 1,173.00 Committee meeting (2.0) 09/16/13 J. Murray Review correspondence from G. Kaplan 0.40 268.00 regarding attendance at committee meeting (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding Holland & Knight counsel (.1); review correspondence from S. Kim regarding patent ownership, review correspondence to committee regarding same, regarding multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding same, review multiple correspondence from R. Franklin regarding patent counsel analysis (.2) Review and respond to multiple 09/17/13 R. Franklin 1.00 510.00 correspondence G. Felcyn regarding D. Leckrone's claim and employment agreement (.6); correspondence with S. Kim regarding Assignment Agreement between Brown and TPL and analysis and evaluation regarding same in preparing for meeting (.3); correspondence B. Kirkendall regarding same (.1) 0.30 201.00 09/17/13 J. Murray Review multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding D. Leckrone compensation agreement (.1); review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding ITC rulings (.2) 09/17/13 J. Murray Review correspondence from P. Marcoux 67.00 0.10regarding D. Leckrone's motives in light of ITC ruling, correspondence to committee

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 38 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 32

Bb	Communications With Committee regarding same (.1)		
09/18/13 T. Hwang	Review outline of Committee issues and memorandum from J. Murray (.1); conference J. Murray regarding case status; review correspondence J. Murray regarding same (.1); review correspondences G. Kaplan, P. Marcoux, K. Beresford regarding case strategy (.1)	0.30	126.00
09/18/13 J. Murray	Continue preparation of correspondence to G. Felcyn regarding her correspondence of September 17 (.4); review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding same (.1); review correspondence from K. Beresford regarding emails and D. Wright's continued involvement (.1); correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding K. Beresford's email address (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding agenda item regarding payments by debtor to Alliacense, correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.80	536.00
09/19/13 J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from committee members regarding availability to participate on committee conference call (.1)	0.10	67.00
09/20/13 J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from D. Wright and G. Felcyn regarding committee conference call (.1)	0.10	67.00
10/01/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding HTC trial and distribution from PDS (.1)	0.10	67.00
10/01/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from M. Brown regarding attendance at committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
10/02/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from committee	0.10	67.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 39 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 33

Bb	Communications With Committee members regarding next committee meeting (.1)		
10/04/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding article regarding jury verdict, review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding same, review article (.2)	0.20	134.00
10/05/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding HTC jury verdict and K. Prochnow's offer to make presentation to committee regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
10/06/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding Monday conference call and Tuesday committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
10/07/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from D. Sciarrino regarding presentation to committee regarding the results of the TPL v HTC case, correspondence to committee regarding same, review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same; review correspondence from C. Brown regarding same, telephone conference with K. Prochnow regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
10/07/13 T. Hwang	Review correspondences P. Marcoux, D. Sciarrino, C. Brown regarding HTC ruling, regarding C. Moore and meeting; review correspondences regarding Committee meeting (.1)	0.10	42.00
10/07/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding contact information (.1); correspondence from D. Wright regarding committee meeting, correspondence to committee regarding same, review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding same, correspondence to committee regarding call in number for committee meeting (.2)	0.30	201.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 40 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 34

Bb	Communications With Committee		
10/07/13 J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from committee members regarding start time for committee meeting (.2)	0.20	134.00
10/07/13 J. Murray	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding committee meeting, multiple correspondence to/from committee members regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
10/08/13 T. Hwang	Prepare for Committee meeting (.1)	0.10	42.00
10/08/13 T. Hwang	Meeting with Committee (3.4); meeting Committee, K. Prochnow and D. Sciarrino regarding case status, regarding ITC and HTC rulings (1.2)	4.60	1,932.00
10/08/13 R. Franklin	Prepare for and attend Committee meeting regarding mediation (5.5)	5.50	2,805.00
10/08/13 J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence from committee members regarding committee meeting (.1); multiple correspondence to/from committee members regarding K. Prochnow presentation to committee regarding jury verdict, multiple correspondence to/from K. Prochnow regarding same (.2)	0.30	201.00
10/08/13 J. Murray	Prepare for committee meeting, prepare agenda for same (.5); attend same (5.0)	5.50	3,685.00
10/08/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding Scientific Patriot website (.1)	0.10	67.00
10/21/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding debtor's projected revenues and strategy going forward (.1)	0.10	67.00
10/24/13 J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from committee regarding debtor's summary of outstanding issues (.2)	0.20	134.00
10/24/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding conversation with K. Prochnow	0.10	67.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 41 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 35

Bb	Communications With Committee regarding MMP patents (.1)		
10/25/13 T. Hwang	Memorandum R. Franklin regarding case status and scheduling, and correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
10/28/13 T. Hwang	Review memorandum G. Felcyn and Debtor's term sheet, and prepare for meeting with Committee (.2); meeting with Committee (1.7)	1.90	798.00
10/28/13 R. Franklin	Prepare for meeting with Creditors Committee (1.5); meeting (1.6)	3.10	1,581.00
10/31/13 R. Franklin	Detailed telephone conference with G. Felcyn regarding strategy in removing management (.2); detailed telephone conference D. Wright regarding status and strategy (.4)	0.60	306.00
11/01/13 R. Franklin	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding status (.1); detailed telephone conference C. Hoge regarding developments at Patriot and D. Leckrone conduct (.3); draft status report to J. Murray (.5)	0.90	459.00
11/04/13 J. Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding communications to committee regarding monthly fees and costs, and correspondence to committee regarding September fees and costs (.3)	0.30	201.00
11/06/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to G. Felcyn and C. Johnson regarding conference call regarding correspondence from D. Leckrone regarding PDS and Alliacense (.1)	0.10	67.00
11/06/13 J. Murray	Conference call G. Felcyn, D. Wright and C. Johnson regarding motion to terminate exclusivity, Objection to cash collateral motion, creditor plan, mediation, etc. (.7);	0.90	603.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 42 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 36

Bb		Communications With Committee interoffice conference R. Franklin		
11/00/12	T. M.	regarding same (.2)	1.20	071.00
11/09/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from committee and debtor's counsel regarding informational requests, cash collateral Motion, objections thereto, cash collateral budgets, motions to convert, terminate exclusivity and appoint trustee, employment applications (objection and reply), Debtor's Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement, objections thereto (1.3)	1.30	871.00
11/12/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences J. Murray regarding case status; correspondence Committee regarding meeting (.1); Committee meeting (.8); meeting R.	1.00	420.00
		Franklin, J. Murray regarding case status (.1)		
11/14/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from K. Beresford and M. Imhoff regarding availability for Creditors Committee conference call (.1)	0.10	67.00
11/15/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding conversion of case to chapter 7, review correspondence from M. Brown and C. Brown regarding mediation (.1)	0.10	67.00
11/18/13	R. Franklin	Prepare for Committee meeting (.5); attend meeting (.9); interoffice conference J.  Murray regarding action items (.1)	1.50	765.00
11/18/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding conference call (.1); correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding agenda for conference call, prepare same (1.5); prepare for and attend Creditors Committee conference call (.9);	2.70	1,809.00
		correspondence to/from P. Marcoux regarding Creditors Committee conference		

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 43 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 37

Bb	Communications With Committee		
	call (.1); correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding minutes of Creditors Committee meeting (.1)		
11/19/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding memorandum to Creditors Committee regarding confirmation standards (.1)	0.10	67.00
12/10/13 J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding scheduling Creditors Committee conference call (.1); correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding interoffice conference regarding Creditors Committee conference call (.1)	0.20	134.00
12/11/13 T. Hwang	Committee meeting (1.6); meeting R. Franklin, J. Murray regarding same (.2)	1.80	756.00
12/11/13 R. Franklin	Prepare for meeting with Creditors Committee (2.0); attend meeting (1.6); interoffice conference T. Hwang and J. Murray regarding action items (.2)	3.80	1,938.00
12/11/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding agenda for Creditors Committee conference call, review detailed agenda and short form agenda re same (.2); multiple interoffice conferences with R. Franklin regarding communications with M. Brown (.3); prepare for Creditors Committee conference call, interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same, attend same (2.1); review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding minutes of Creditors Committee conference call, review minutes (.4)	3.00	2,010.00
12/12/13 J. Murray	Review, analysis and evaluation regarding correspondence from M. Brown regarding Creditors Committee concerns (.3); review minutes of last committee meeting, review	0.50	335.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 44 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 38

Bb	Communications With Committee correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.2)		
12/13/13 R. Franklin	Review and revise correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding status (.4)	0.40	204.00
12/13/13 R. Franklin	Meeting with Creditors Committee regarding miscellaneous issues and Plan of Reorganization (1.0)	1.00	510.00
12/13/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to committee regarding status, correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (1.3); attend Creditors Committee conference call regarding same, post-call meeting with R. Franklin regarding same (1.0)	2.30	1,541.00
12/13/13 T. Hwang	Review correspondence M. Brown and memoranda from R. Franklin and J. Murray regarding same (.1); attend Committee meeting (1.0)	1.10	462.00
12/24/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding Alliacense and Patriot, analysis and evaluation regarding same, involuntary bankruptcy against Alliacense, substantive consolidation (.2)	0.20	134.00
12/24/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding MMP, PDS and Alliacense (.1)	0.10	67.00
12/30/13 J. Murray	Review detailed correspondence from C. Hoge regarding Alliacense, review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
01/02/14 J. Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding implications of ITC ruling, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2); review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding replacement of management (.1)	0.30	201.00
01/03/14 R. Franklin	Detailed telephone conference David	0.40	204.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 45 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 39

Bb	Communications With Committee		
	Wright regarding action items and status of hearings (.4)		
01/07/14 R. Franklin	Correspondence with Committee regarding input on topics (.3)	0.30	153.00
01/07/14 J. Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding motion for order approving compensation to Creditors Committee members as consultants (.1);	0.10	67.00
01/09/14 J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin, G. Felcyn and P. Marcoux regarding implications of ITC ruling and PDS capital call (.2)	0.20	134.00
01/14/14 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from P. Marcoux regarding no right of Creditors Committee members to receive compensation, legal research regarding same (.5)	0.50	335.00
01/21/14 R. Franklin	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding status (.1)	0.10	51.00
01/21/14 J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from P. Marcoux, G. Felcyn and M. Brown regarding impact of ITC ruling (.2)	0.20	134.00
01/23/14 J. Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding judgment against D. Leckrone (.1)	0.10	67.00
01/24/14 J. Murray	Review correspondence to/from K. Beresford and G. Felcyn regarding P. Marcoux Judgment against D. Leckrone (.1)	0.10	67.00
01/24/14 J. Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding absence and proxy (.1)	0.10	67.00
01/27/14 T. Hwang	Evaluation regarding case status and outstanding matters, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same, regarding agenda items for Committee meeting (1.4)	1.40	588.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 46 of 50



March 17, 2014

Page 40

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of

Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\* Bb **Communications With Committee** 0.20 134.00 01/27/14 J. Murray Multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding committee call, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2) 01/27/14 J. Murray Review correspondence from B. 0.50 335.00 Kirkendall regarding Creditors Committee meeting (.1); review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding Creditors Committee meeting agenda (.4) 01/28/14 T. Hwang 2.30 966.00 Conference J. Murray regarding Committee meetings and meeting minutes, and correspondence Committee regarding same (.2); investigation regarding Committee meetings, and telephone conference with Global Crossing regarding same (1.0); memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.2); telephone conference with D. Wright regarding same (.1); analysis and evaluation meeting agenda and case issues; legal research and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (8.)01/28/14 J. Murray Review recent meeting minutes and 3.40 2,278.00 developments, prepare agenda (annotated and unanotated) for Creditors Committee meeting, review and revise action item memorandum (3.2); correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding agenda for committee meeting (.2) Review correspondence from M. Imhoff 0.80 536.00 01/28/14 J. Murray regarding Creditors Committee conference call (.1); multiple correspondence to/from correspondence Creditors Committee regarding minutes, review same (.4); continue preparation of agenda for Creditors Committee conference call, multiple correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same, correspondence

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 47 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 41

Bb	N.	Communications With Committee		
		to Creditors Committee regarding same (.3)		
01/29/14	R. Franklin	Review status of case and review and revise agenda for Committee meeting (1.0)	1.00	510.00
01/29/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding annotated agenda for Creditors Committee conference call (.1)	0.10	67.00
01/29/14	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding agenda for Creditors Committee conference call (.3)	0.30	201.00
01/30/14	T. Hwang	Committee meeting (1.3)	1.30	546.00
01/30/14	R. Franklin	Prepare for Committee meeting (1.2); attend committee meeting (1.3); interoffice conference J. Murray and T. Hwang regarding same (.2)	2.70	1,377.00
01/30/14	J. Murray	Conference call with Creditors Committee regarding status and strategy going forward (1.3); interoffice conference R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.2)	1.50	1,005.00
02/05/14	J. Murray	Review detailed correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding commercialization of patents, analysis and evaluation regarding same, multiple correspondence to/from P. Marcoux regarding same (.4)	0.40	268.00
02/06/14	T. Hwang	Review and evaluation correspondences J. Murray and P. Marcoux regarding new management and Alliacense work product (.1)	0.10	42.00
02/06/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding commercialization of patent portfolios, analysis and evaluation regarding same, multiple correspondence to/from P. Marcoux regarding same, conference call to discuss same, review	0.20	134.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 48 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 42

Bb	Communications With Committee		
	correspondence from R. Franklin regarding same (.1); review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding multiple patent portfolios, commercialization agreements regarding same, and debtor's rejection of same (.1)		
02/07/14 J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee members regarding next Creditors Committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
02/07/14 R. Franklin	Prepare for Monday meeting with Creditors Committee (.2)	0.20	102.00
02/07/14 J. Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding agreement among Patriot, PDS, Alliacense, TPL and others, correspondence to G. Felcyn regarding same, review correspondence from C. Flowers regarding same, telephone conference with P. Marcoux regarding same, review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding same, review agreements (1.1); multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding same and regarding Judgment, review correspondence from C. Flowers regarding same (.1); review correspondence from C. Flowers regarding Leckrone shareholder interest in Patriot (.1); review detailed correspondence from R. Franklin regarding claims of insiders and excess portfolios (.3)	1.60	1,072.00
02/07/14 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from P. Marcoux regarding Alliacense / PDS accounting (.1)	0.10	67.00
02/10/14 T. Hwang	Meeting with Committee (.8); meeting J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding case status and action items (.1)	0.90	378.00
02/24/14 T. Hwang	Review ITC ruling and notice of	0.20	84.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 49 of 50



Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001

Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

March 17, 2014 Page 43

Bb	Communications With Committee		
	determination regarding '337 investigation and review correspondence P. Marcoux regarding same (.2)	•	
02/26/14 J. Murray	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding continuance of Wed. hearings, correspondence to committee regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
02/27/14 J. Murray	Review correspondence form P. Marcoux and K. Beresford regarding continuance of hearings (.1)	0.10	67.00
02/28/14 T. Hwang	Meeting with Committee regarding negotiations with debtor (.9)	0.90	378.00
Subtotal for	Communications With Committee		108,818.00

## **Communications With Committee**

Task	Timekeeper	Rate	Hours	- Amount
Bb	Erin Darda	300	3.60	1,080.00
Bb	John Murray	670	98.30	65,861.00
Bb	Robert Franklin	510	50.90	25,959.00
Bb	Thomas Hwang	420	37.90	15,918.00
Bb	Total		190.70	108,818.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Case: 13-51589 Doc# 465-1 Filed: 03/19/14 Entered: 03/19/14 14:49:29 Page 50 of 50