

1 JOHN WALSHE MURRAY (074823)
ROBERT A. FRANKLIN (091653)
2 THOMAS T. HWANG (218678)
DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP
3 305 Lytton Avenue
Palo Alto, CA 94301
4 Telephone: (650) 857-1717
Facsimile: (650) 857-1288
5 Email: murray.john@dorsey.com
Email: franklin.robert@dorsey.com
6 Email: hwang.thomas@dorsey.com

7 Attorneys for Official
Committee of Unsecured Creditors
8

9 **UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT**
10 **NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA**
11 **SAN JOSE DIVISION**

12 In re:

13 **TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED LLC,**
14 **fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED**
15 **INC., A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**
16 **fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED,**
17 **A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**

18 Debtor.

Case No. 13-51589-SLJ-11

Chapter 11

Date: April 9, 2014

Time: 1:30 p.m.

Place: United States Bankruptcy Court
280 S. First Street, Room 3099
San Jose, CA 95113

Judge: Honorable Stephen L. Johnson

19 **EXHIBIT "AA"**

20 **TO**

21 **FIRST APPLICATION FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES**
22 **BY ATTORNEYS FOR OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS**
23
24
25
26
27
28

EXHIBIT COVER

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 295

Q		Committee's Plan		
07/29/13	T. Hwang	Legal research regarding Sec. 365 and ride through doctrine (.7); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.6)	1.30	546.00
11/25/13	R. Franklin	Detailed telephone conference P. Marcoux regarding Committee plan (.2)	0.20	102.00
11/28/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences G. Kaplan, P. Marcoux, G. Felcyn regarding proposed Plan of Reorganization and case strategy	0.10	42.00
11/28/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to/from G. Kaplan and C. Brown regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	67.00
11/29/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from M. Imhoff, D. Wright and P. Marcoux regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	67.00
11/30/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to M. Imhoff and C. Brown regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.1); review correspondence to/from G. Felcyn and P. Marcoux regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.20	134.00
12/02/13	J. Murray	Review, analysis and evaluation correspondence from D. Wright regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.20	134.00
12/03/13	T. Hwang	Review drafts of Committee plan and Debtor's plan (.3); review correspondences R. Franklin and G. Felcyn, and correspondences G. Felcyn regarding same (.2)	0.50	210.00
12/04/13	T. Hwang	Revise drafts Plan of Reorganization, regarding Committee comments (.1);	0.10	42.00
12/05/13	T. Hwang	Prepare drafts of Plan of Reorganization, regarding Committee comments (1.0);	1.40	588.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

EXHIBIT AA

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 296

Q	Committee's Plan		
	correspondences Committee regarding same (.1); draft outlines of key provisions regarding same (.3)		
12/05/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding Brown's treatment under Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	67.00
12/06/13 T. Hwang	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding case status, Plan of Reorganization (.1); draft outline summary regarding same (.3); correspondence Committee regarding same, regarding scheduling; memoranda J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.50	210.00
12/06/13 J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding committee conference call regarding committee Plan of Reorganization (.1); review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding committee Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.30	201.00
12/09/13 T. Hwang	Correspondence Committee regarding scheduling and meeting; correspondence D. Wright regarding same; review correspondences Committee members regarding same (.1); memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same, regarding Committee's draft Plan of Reorganization (.1); meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
12/09/13 R. Franklin	Interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding contents of competing plan and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.5); review correspondence Creditors Committee relative to points to be made in competing plan and analysis and evaluation regarding same and Disclosure Statement (1.3)	1.80	918.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 297

Q		Committee's Plan		
12/10/13	R. Franklin	Review draft of committee plan (.4)	0.40	204.00
12/10/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization, review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding same, review draft of Plan of Reorganization (1.0)	1.00	670.00
12/10/13	T. Hwang	Analysis and evaluation Committee draft Plan of Reorganization and draft summary outline regarding same (3.0); memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	3.20	1,344.00
12/11/13	T. Hwang	Review memoranda R. Franklin regarding Committee Plan of Reorganization issues and Committee meeting (.2)	0.20	84.00
12/11/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding correspondence from K. Prochnow regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization, review same (.4)	0.40	268.00
12/12/13	T. Hwang	Meeting R. Franklin regarding Committee Plan of Reorganization (.1); Review and analysis correspondence P. Marcoux and proposed plan of K. Prochnow (.3); draft Committee Plan of Reorganization (2.2)	2.60	1,092.00
12/12/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	67.00
12/13/13	T. Hwang	Draft Plan of Reorganization (5.8); meetings R. Franklin regarding same (.1); analysis and evaluation projections and correspondences R. Franklin, and memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.4)	6.30	2,646.00
12/14/13	T. Hwang	Legal research and analysis regarding Committee Plan of Reorganization and draft same (9.0)	9.00	3,780.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 298

Q		Committee's Plan		
12/15/13	T. Hwang	Legal research and analysis regarding Plan of Reorganization and draft same (4.7); memoranda R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	4.80	2,016.00
12/16/13	R. Franklin	Review and revise creditor Plan of Reorganization (1.2)	1.20	612.00
12/16/13	R. Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding Committee Plan of Reorganization and classification issues (.7); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same (.2); review and revise Plan of Reorganization (.4); draft correspondence Creditors Committee regarding same (.2)	1.50	765.00
12/16/13	T. Hwang	Telephone conferences R. Franklin regarding Plan of Reorganization (.4); revise same (2.2); memoranda R. Franklin regarding same (.2); review and analysis correspondences R. Franklin, S. Kim, M. Brown, G. Felcyn regarding classification issues, regarding Plan of Reorganization (.2); review correspondence G. Felcyn and correspondence R. Franklin regarding same (.1); review and respond to correspondences M. Brown regarding Plan of Reorganization (.2)	3.30	1,386.00
12/17/13	J. Murray	Interoffice conference R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.2); multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
12/17/13	J. Murray	Legal research regarding rules of evidence (.2); legal research regarding Section 1125(b) (.2)	0.40	268.00
12/17/13	T. Hwang	Meetings R. Franklin regarding creditor Plan of Reorganization (.2); meeting R. Franklin, J. Murray regarding same (.2);	3.40	1,428.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 299

Q	Committee's Plan		
	memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.5); review and analysis comments from Committee to same; draft, revise same (2.5)		
12/18/13 T. Hwang	Correspondence Committee regarding Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	42.00
12/18/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding correspondence from C. Hoge regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
12/21/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding review of Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	67.00
12/23/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding rejection of Core Flash and Fast Logic executory contracts, etc. (.2); review correspondence from K. Hiensch regarding Fujitsu and Creditors Committee's Plan of Reorganization, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2);	0.40	268.00
12/23/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and potential settlement with debtor (.2); review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding inquiry R. Neilson regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement (.1); review multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement (.2)	0.50	335.00
12/27/13 T. Hwang	Draft amended Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.20	84.00
12/30/13 T. Hwang	Draft amended Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.20	84.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 300

Q		Committee's Plan		
12/30/13	R. Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding plan issues and rejection of executory contracts (.2) review correspondence K. Heins regarding Fujitsu issues (.1); review correspondence G. Felcyn regarding projections and Alliacense issue (.2); review action items (.4)	0.90	459.00
12/30/13	J. Murray	Preparation of memorandum regarding Plan of Reorganization action items (.3); correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding confirmation procedures motion (.1)	0.40	268.00
12/30/13	J. Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization regarding treatment of secured creditors, subordination, etc. (.4); correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding plan procedures / solicitation motion (.1)	0.50	335.00
12/31/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding current version of Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement, miscellaneous regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
12/31/13	T. Hwang	Review and respond correspondence D. Wright regarding Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement (.1); meetings R. Franklin regarding Plan of Reorganization (.2); review and evaluation action items (.1)	0.40	168.00
01/02/14	T. Hwang	Review memorandum R. Franklin regarding Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement, regarding case strategy and issues, and regarding motion for contempt and appointment of trustee, and memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.3); legal research	0.50	210.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 301

Q		Committee's Plan		
		regarding same (.2)		
01/02/14	R. Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding issues and action items and draft memorandum regarding same creditor Plan of Organization (2.6); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same (.2)	2.80	1,428.00
01/02/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
01/02/14	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.3)	0.30	201.00
01/03/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding new management candidate (.1)	0.10	67.00
01/03/14	T. Hwang	Review correspondences R. Franklin, G. Felcyn regarding Plan of Reorganization and regarding Fast Logic and CoreFlash portfolios	0.20	84.00
01/07/14	T. Hwang	Review memoranda R. Franklin and J. Murray regarding case action items and regarding Committee Plan of Reorganization and objection to Debtor's Disclosure Statement (.2); memorandum R. Franklin, J. Murray regarding action items (.4)	0.60	252.00
01/07/14	T. Hwang	Review correspondences D. Wright, J. Murray regarding Committee Plan of Reorganization, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same	0.10	42.00
01/07/14	R. Franklin	Review plan projections and correspondence with G. Felcyn regarding same (.8); correspondence with G. Felcyn regarding executory contracts to be assumed or rejected (.2); correspondence	1.10	561.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 302

Q
Committee's Plan

		T. Hwang regarding same (.1)		
01/07/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding fiduciaries under Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization, correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.2); multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization, new management and settlement, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2); review multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding projections regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2); correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding action items regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.1); review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding issues regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2); review correspondence from D. Wright regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	1.10	737.00
01/08/14	R. Franklin	Continue review of projections and detailed telephone conference G. Felcyn regarding same (.7)	0.70	357.00
01/08/14	R. Franklin	Review ITC decision (.2); analysis and evaluation regarding power of Creditors Committee representative on PDS Management Committee and restoration of seat to D. Leckrone and review correspondence with S. Kim and G. Felcyn regarding same (.5)	0.70	357.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 303

Q	Committee's Plan		
01/08/14 J. Murray	Review detailed correspondence from S. Kim, G. Felcyn and R. Franklin regarding D. Leckrone and PDS regarding capital call issue(.2); review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding projections regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization, review projections (.3)	0.50	335.00
01/09/14 T. Hwang	Correspondence G. Charles regarding Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement	0.10	42.00
01/09/14 R. Franklin	Detailed telephone conference with G. Felcyn regarding projections (.2); correspondence with Creditors Committee regarding same (.2); review correspondence with P. Marcoux and G. Felcyn regarding same (.2)	0.60	306.00
01/09/14 J. Murray	Review correspondence to/from G. Charles regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement (.1); review multiple correspondence to/from P. Marcoux and G. Felcyn regarding projections regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2); review multiple correspondence to/from C. Curry, G. Felcyn and G. Kaplan regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization regarding Alliacense involvement going forward, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.50	335.00
01/10/14 J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization, classification, Disclosure Statement and PDS (.3)	0.30	201.00
01/11/14 J. Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding discussions regarding projections regarding Plan of	0.10	67.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 304

Q	Committee's Plan		
	Reorganization and availability for conference call regarding same, miscellaneous regarding same (.1)		
01/12/14 J. Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding conference call regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization regarding projections (.1)	0.10	67.00
01/13/14 T. Hwang	Telephone conference with G. Felcyn, D. Wright, P. Marcoux regarding Plan of Reorganization and case status (1.0); meeting R. J. Murray, Franklin regarding same; conference with R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	1.10	462.00
01/13/14 R. Franklin	Conference call with D. Wright, P. Marcoux, G. Felcyn and J. Murray regarding revisions to plan, projections and post-confirmation business plan (1.0); interoffice conference T. Hwang and J. Murray regarding same (.1); review revised projections (.1)	1.20	612.00
01/13/14 J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from P. Marcoux, D. Wright and G. Felcyn regarding conference call regarding Creditors Committee's Plan of Reorganization (.2); conference call G. Felcyn, P. Marcoux and D. Wright regarding modifications to Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (1.0); interoffice conference R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	1.30	871.00
01/13/14 J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from P. Marcoux, D. Wright, G. Felcyn and R. Franklin regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization , analysis and evaluation	0.70	469.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 305

Q
Committee's Plan

		regarding same (.2); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding revised forecasts regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.3); review correspondence from C. Brown regarding post-confirmation composition of Board of Directors (.1)		
01/14/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux and D. Wright regarding forecasts supporting Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.1); review correspondence regarding D. Sciarrino regarding MMP sale forecasts (.1)	0.20	134.00
01/15/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding D. Sciarrino regarding forecasts for MMP licenses (.1); review correspondence from K. Beresford, G. Felcyn, C. Johnson and P. Marcoux regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and TPL management, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.30	201.00
01/17/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding T. Lavelle CV, review same (.2)	0.20	134.00
01/18/14	T. Hwang	Correspondence Committee regarding potential management	0.10	42.00
01/18/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding T. Lavelle's CV, review correspondence from P. Marcoux, G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
01/19/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright and P. Marcoux regarding T. Lavelle (.1)	0.10	67.00
01/20/14	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding T. Lavelle and C. Bostick (.2)	0.20	134.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 306

Q		Committee's Plan		
01/21/14	T. Hwang	Review correspondences R. Franklin regarding treatment of licenses, and assumption and assignment issues, and legal research regarding same (.3); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1); memorandum R. Franklin regarding comments to Disclosure Statement and Plan of Reorganization and investigation regarding same (.1)	0.50	210.00
01/23/14	R. Franklin	Interoffice conference T. Hwang and J. Murray regarding confirmation issues (.4)	0.40	204.00
01/23/14	J. Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and "swamping" of classes (.2); correspondence to/from E. Darda and J. Mikhailevich regarding legal research regarding 11129(a)(10) (.1)	0.30	201.00
01/24/14	T. Hwang	Review memorandum J. Murray regarding plan voting issues, and review and respond correspondence E. Darda regarding same	0.10	42.00
01/24/14	J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding distribution of plans and disclosure statements with summary comparison (.1)	0.10	67.00
01/25/14	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee members regarding PDS, cash collateral and Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.3)	0.30	201.00
01/27/14	T. Hwang	Analysis and evaluation regarding service of Disclosure Statement and Plan of Reorganization matters, and investigation regarding same (.5)	0.50	210.00
01/27/14	T. Hwang	Analysis regarding Plan of Reorganization, regarding voting issues, and legal research regarding same	0.60	252.00
01/27/14	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence from M.	0.10	67.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 307

Q		Committee's Plan		
		Brown regarding D. Sciarrino (.1);		
01/28/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from K. Prochnow regarding business plan regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
01/30/14	T. Hwang	Memorandum J. Murray regarding confirmation and voting issues (.3)	0.30	126.00
01/31/14	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding settlement and Alliacense's continued involvement, correspondence to H. Binder regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
02/01/14	J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding classification issue (.1)	0.10	67.00
02/03/14	T. Hwang	Review and evaluation correspondence R. Franklin regarding voting and classification (.2); evaluation and analysis regarding same and regarding Proofs of Claim, and prepare report regarding same (.4)	0.60	252.00
02/04/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding classes of claims, confirmation issues, estimation of claims, legal research regarding same, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.6)	0.60	402.00
02/04/14	T. Hwang	Analysis and legal research regarding voting and estimation of claims regarding confirmation of competing plans, and evaluation regarding Proof of Claim and creditor joinders (1.6); prepare report regarding voting of claims (3.5); memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.4)	5.50	2,310.00
02/05/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence to/from Creditors	0.20	134.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 308

Q		Committee's Plan		
		Committee regarding revisions to Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement regarding treatment of licenses, ride though same, consequences if rejection (.2)		
02/05/14	T. Hwang	Review, revise and draft amended Plan of Reorganization of Committee (.6); evaluation regarding licensee objections and proposed language, and review correspondences R. Franklin, J. Murray, K. Hiensch, G. Kaplan and A. Lewis regarding same, regarding motion to appoint licensing committee (.2)	0.80	336.00
02/06/14	T. Hwang	Review, revise and draft amended Plan of Reorganization (3.6); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	3.70	1,554.00
02/06/14	J. Murray	Correspondence to team regarding Creditors Committee immunity (.1)	0.10	67.00
02/06/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization, insider claims, multiple classification and subordination of same, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
02/06/14	J. Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and ownership of reorganize debtor, liquidating trust plan agent, sale of portfolios, waiver of insider claims and court jurisdiction (.3)	0.30	201.00
02/07/14	R. Franklin	Review correspondence Prochnow regarding Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.20	102.00
02/07/14	J. Murray	Review detailed correspondence from K. Prochnow regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.20	134.00
02/09/14	J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin and T.	0.40	268.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 309

Q

Committee's Plan

Hwang regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and swamping of classes (.1); review correspondence from M. Brown regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization regarding new management and payments to creditors (.1); correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding Brown's claim and confirmation of Plan of Reorganization (.1); review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and waiver of claims (.1)			
02/09/14	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding conference call to discuss Plan of Reorganization and waiver of claims, correspondence to D. Wright regarding same, correspondence to P. Marcoux regarding same, review correspondence from C. Johnson regarding same (.2)	0.20 134.00
02/10/14	J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding "confirmable" Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10 67.00
02/10/14	T. Hwang	Legal research and analysis regarding exculpation and immunity of Committee and third parties, regarding Committee Plan (.5); review correspondence J. Murray and R. Franklin regarding confirmation issues, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.60 252.00
02/10/14	R. Franklin	Review and respond to correspondence J. Murray regarding confirmation of Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.3)	0.30 153.00
02/10/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from K. Prochnow regarding TPL, MMP and Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10 67.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 310

Q		Committee's Plan	
02/10/14	J. Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and committee immunity, correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.2)	0.20 134.00
02/10/14	J. Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding ability of debtor to swamp class (.2)	0.20 134.00
02/11/14	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from G. Kaplan regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and treatment of Class 7, review settlement proposal regarding same (.2)	0.20 134.00
02/11/14	T. Hwang	Review Committee Plan of Reorganization and memorandum R. Franklin regarding same, regarding Schedule D debts (.3); review correspondences P. Marcoux, C. Brown regarding Committee Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.40 168.00
02/11/14	R. Franklin	Review and amend Plan of Reorganization (4.0)	4.00 2,040.00
02/11/14	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding revisions to Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement (.1); review detailed correspondence from R. Franklin regarding impairment of classes under Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.30 201.00
02/12/14	T. Hwang	Review multiple correspondences Committee members regarding Plan of Reorganization of Committe (.1); review correspondences G. Felcyn, R. Franklin and C. Flowers regarding Committee Plan of Reorganization and executory contracts (.2)	0.30 126.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 311

Q		Committee's Plan		
02/12/14	R. Franklin	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding changes to Plan of Reorganization (.3)	0.30	153.00
02/12/14	R. Franklin	Correspondence with G. Felcyn regarding assumption of PTSC/TPL (.2); review agreement and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.8)	1.00	510.00
02/12/14	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from M. Brown regarding treatment under Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.20	134.00
02/12/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from Creditors Committee members regarding committee Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement (.1); correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding plan confirmation and classification regarding insider claimants swamping non-insider claimants, review, analysis and evaluation memorandum regarding same (.8); analysis and evaluation regarding cram down of non-accepting creditors and correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.4)	1.30	871.00
02/13/14	T. Hwang	Review correspondences G. Felcyn, P. Marcoux, B. Kirkendall, G. Kaplan, K. Beresford, J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding Committee Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	42.00
02/13/14	R. Franklin	Review, revise and finalize Plan of Reorganization (1.8)	1.80	918.00
02/13/14	R. Franklin	Review correspondence G. Felcyn regarding assumption of 2012 agreement and analysis and evaluation regarding same (1.2)	1.20	612.00
02/13/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding Plan of Reorganization and	0.10	67.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 312

Q		Committee's Plan		
		Disclosure Statement, and miscellaneous regarding same (.1)		
02/14/14	R. Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding Alliacense and rejection of contract (.3)	0.30	153.00
02/14/14	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris and R. Franklin regarding termination of Alliacense agreement (.2)	0.20	134.00
02/14/14	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and R. Harris regarding assumption or rejection of Alliacense agreement (.2); review multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn and R. Franklin regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement (.2)	0.40	268.00
02/16/14	J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and committee exculpation, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
02/18/14	T. Hwang	Investigation and evaluation Committee Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.20	84.00
02/18/14	R. Franklin	Interoffice T. Hwang regarding classification and treatment issues (.3)	0.30	153.00
02/20/14	T. Hwang	Prepare redlines of Committee Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement (.1); review exhibit to Committee Disclosure Statement and attention to filing of same (.1); correspondence R. Harris regarding Committee Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement and exhibit to same (.1); draft correspondence Court regarding same and attention to lodging of same (.2)	0.50	210.00
02/24/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from R. Franklin	0.20	134.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

1 JOHN WALSH MURRAY (074823)
ROBERT A. FRANKLIN (091653)
2 THOMAS T. HWANG (218678)
DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP
3 305 Lytton Avenue
Palo Alto, CA 94301
4 Telephone: (650) 857-1717
Facsimile: (650) 857-1288
5 Email: murray.john@dorsey.com
Email: franklin.robert@dorsey.com
6 Email: hwang.thomas@dorsey.com

7 Attorneys for Official
Committee of Unsecured Creditors

8
9 **UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT**
10 **NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA**
11 **SAN JOSE DIVISION**

12 In re:

13 **TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED LLC,**
14 **fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED**
15 **INC., A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**
16 **fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED,**
17 **A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**

18 Debtor.

Case No. 13-51589-SLJ-11

Chapter 11

Date: April 9, 2014

Time: 1:30 p.m.

Place: United States Bankruptcy Court
280 S. First Street, Room 3099
San Jose, CA 95113

Judge: Honorable Stephen L. Johnson

19 **EXHIBIT "BB"**

20 **TO**

21 **FIRST APPLICATION FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES**
22 **BY ATTORNEYS FOR OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS**

23
24
25
26
27
28
EXHIBIT COVER

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 314

Qa		Committee's Disclosure Statement	
12/08/13	T. Hwang	Correspondence to Committee regarding scheduling and meeting on Disclosure Statement and Plan of Reorganization; correspondence J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same	0.10 42.00
12/10/13	R. Franklin	Commence preparation of Disclosure Statement (1.7); prepare checklist of issues (.8)	2.50 1,275.00
12/15/13	T. Hwang	Continue preparation of creditor Disclosure Statement (2.5)	2.50 1,050.00
12/15/13	R. Franklin	Continue draft of Disclosure Statement (4.0)	4.00 2,040.00
12/15/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding Committee's Disclosure Statement and Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.20 134.00
12/16/13	T. Hwang	Draft Disclosure Statement (1.0)	1.00 420.00
12/16/13	R. Franklin	Continue preparation of Committee's Disclosure Statement (2.2)	2.20 1,122.00
12/17/13	T. Hwang	Draft, revise Disclosure Statement (3.8)	3.80 1,596.00
12/17/13	R. Franklin	Continue preparation of Creditors Committee's Disclosure Statement (1.2); analysis and evaluation regarding Plan of Reorganization (1.2); interoffice conference T Hwang regarding same (.4); interoffice conference J. Murray and T. Hwang regarding same (.2); review and revise Plan of Reorganization (.2); review and revise Disclosure Statement (.8); correspondence and telephone conference with Committee members regarding status and comments (.4)	4.40 2,244.00
12/19/13	T. Hwang	Draft, revise notice of hearing regarding creditor's Disclosure Statement (1.0);	3.10 1,302.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

EXHIBIT BB

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 315

Qa

Committee's Disclosure Statement

review local and bankruptcy rules regarding same (.3); meetings R. Franklin, J. Murray regarding same (.2); review correspondences R. Franklin, J. Murray, R. Harris, R. Bracegirdle regarding same, and review Court orders regarding same (.3); attention to preparation of service lists, and attention to service and filing issues; multiple meetings S. Bloomer, C. Cavazos regarding same (1.1); telephone conference with R. Shakoori regarding same (.1); review correspondence R. Franklin regarding Disclosure Statement and exhibits, and meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1)

12/19/13 R. Franklin	Review Notice of Hearing on Disclosure Statement (.2); multiple correspondence and telephone conference with R. Harris regarding same (.3); draft action item list (.5); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding Exhibits to Disclosure Statement (.2)	1.20	612.00
12/19/13 J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/ from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding notice of hearing regarding Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.1); review multiple correspondence from R. Franklin regarding exhibits to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (projections) (.1); review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding motion for plan procedure and solicitation order (.1)	0.30	201.00
12/20/13 T. Hwang	Review notice regarding creditor Disclosure Statement and notice regarding motion to appoint trustee, and attention to filing and service of same (.2); review action item list, and correspondences J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding Disclosure	0.40	168.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 316

Qa		Committee's Disclosure Statement	
		Statement (.1); meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	
12/20/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from C. Cavazos regarding notice of hearing regarding Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement and trustee motion (.1);	0.10 67.00
12/23/13	T. Hwang	Attention regarding service and filing of Disclosure Statement and notice regarding same, regarding motion to appoint trustee; meetings S. Bloomer regarding same (.5)	0.50 210.00
12/23/13	T. Hwang	Review Disclosure Statement and draft supplemental language to same (.4)	0.40 168.00
12/27/13	T. Hwang	Draft amended Disclosure Statement (.4)	0.40 168.00
12/29/13	T. Hwang	Draft amended Disclosure Statement	1.20 504.00
12/30/13	T. Hwang	Draft amended Disclosure Statement (2.1)	2.10 882.00
01/16/14	J. Murray	Review debtor's objection to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement, analysis and evaluation regarding same, review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.6); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding "meet & confer" regarding objection to Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.70 469.00
01/17/14	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding notifying court regarding intent to proceed with Disclosure Statement hearing (.1)	0.10 67.00
01/17/14	T. Hwang	Meeting J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding Disclosure Statement hearing, Trustee Motion hearing and case action items and strategy	0.70 294.00
01/17/14	T. Hwang	Call to T. Bracegirdle regarding Disclosure Statement hearing (.1)	0.10 42.00
01/17/14	R. Franklin	Review Debtor's objection and analysis	0.70 357.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 317

Qa	Committee's Disclosure Statement		
	and evaluation regarding same (.3); correspondence with Creditors Committee regarding objections and status of hearing (.4)		
01/21/14 R. Franklin	Review Debtor's objection to disclosure statement and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.3) draft memorandum regarding status status report (1.4)	1.70	867.00
01/21/14 J. Murray	Interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding objections to Disclosure Statement (.2)	0.20	134.00
01/22/14 J. Murray	Review statement of status of objections to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.2)	0.20	134.00
01/22/14 T. Hwang	Attention to filing of statement regarding objections to Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	42.00
01/22/14 R. Franklin	Draft status report to Court regarding objections to Disclosure Statement (3.0); detailed telephone conference R. Harris regarding objection (.2); detailed telephone conference J. Wesolowski regarding status of objections (.3)	3.50	1,785.00
01/23/14 R. Franklin	Prepare for hearing on Disclosure Statement and Trustee Motion (1.8); conference with L. Engel, attend hearing and post-hearing conferences (3.2); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding action items (.5)	5.50	2,805.00
01/31/14 R. Franklin	Review Debtor's Disclosure Statement and continue preparation of revised Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (2.5)	2.50	1,275.00
02/04/14 T. Hwang	Review and analysis revisions to Committee Disclosure Statement	0.10	42.00
02/04/14 R. Franklin	Review and revise February 14 Disclosure Statement (3.1)	3.10	1,581.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 318

Qa	Committee's Disclosure Statement		
02/05/14 T. Hwang	Review, revise and draft amended Disclosure Statement of Committee (5.2); memoranda R. Franklin regarding same (.2);	5.40	2,268.00
02/05/14 R. Franklin	Review and revise Committee's Disclosure Statement and draft correspondence Licensee's counsel regarding same (2.0); review selected commercialization contracts and analysis and evaluation regarding rejection of commercialization agreements and respond to G. Kaplan's inquiry regarding same (1.6); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding conforming changes in Committee's Plan of Reorganization (.3); correspondence with K. Hiensch regarding changes (.2)	4.10	2,091.00
02/06/14 T. Hwang	Review, revise and draft amended Disclosure Statement of Committee (.4)	0.40	168.00
02/06/14 R. Franklin	Continue revisions to Committee Disclosure Statement and draft correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (1.5)	1.50	765.00
02/06/14 J. Murray	Review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding revised Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	67.00
02/10/14 R. Franklin	Review Creditors Committee's Disclosure Statement and respond to inquiries from committee (1.0)	1.00	510.00
02/10/14 R. Franklin	Review correspondence G. Kaplan regarding comments to Disclosure Statement draft (.1)	0.10	51.00
02/11/14 R. Franklin	Review comments from G. Kaplan and respond to same (.5); review and revise Disclosure Statement regarding same (.9)	1.40	714.00
02/12/14 R. Franklin	Conform Disclosure Statement with Plan	0.90	459.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 319

Qa		Committee's Disclosure Statement of Reorganization (.9)		
02/12/14	R. Franklin	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding the Committee's Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	51.00
02/13/14	R. Franklin	Review and finalize Disclosure Statement (2.8)	2.80	1,428.00
02/13/14	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement, review exhibits to same (.2)	0.20	134.00
02/14/14	R. Franklin	Finalize all pleadings re Disclosure Statement and Plan of Reorganization 2.5); review projections and correspondence with G. Felcyn regarding same (.6);	3.10	1,581.00
02/14/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding Disclosure Statement, forecasts, review same (.2)	0.20	134.00
02/17/14	J. Murray	Review detailed correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding Creditors Committee's revised Disclosure Statement (.3)	0.30	201.00
02/20/14	J. Murray	Review Exhibit A to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.2); review summary of debtor's revisions to Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement, review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same, review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.2); review correspondence to R. Harris regarding revisions to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.50	335.00
02/21/14	J. Murray	Review debtor's objection to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.2)	0.20	134.00
02/21/14	T. Hwang	Review and evaluation objection of Debtor to Committee Disclosure Statement (.2); correspondence Committee regarding same	0.30	126.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 320

Qa		Committee's Disclosure Statement		
		(.1)		
02/21/14	R. Franklin	Review objection by Debtor to Disclosure Statement (.3)	0.30	153.00
02/22/14	J. Murray	Review objection of debtor to committee's Disclosure Statement (.2); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding revisions to Creditors Committee's Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.30	201.00
02/24/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from J. Wesolowski regarding status of hearing on Disclosure Statement, regarding correspondence from H. Binder regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
02/26/14	T. Hwang	Review correspondence T. Bracegirdle regarding hearing on Disclosure Statements; conference R. Franklin regarding same (.1); telephone conference with C. Brown regarding same; correspondence Committee regarding same; review correspondences J. Murray, P. Marcoux regarding same (.2)	0.30	126.00
02/26/14	R. Franklin	Attend telephonic hearing on the Disclosure Statements and motion to gain standing (.2)	0.20	102.00
Subtotal for		Committee's Disclosure Statement		35,965.00

Committee's Disclosure Statement

Task	Timekeeper	Rate	Hours	Amount
Qa	John Murray	670	3.70	2,479.00
Qa	Robert Franklin	510	46.80	23,868.00
Qa	Thomas Hwang	420	22.90	9,618.00
Qa	Total		73.40	35,965.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

1 JOHN WALSH MURRAY (074823)
ROBERT A. FRANKLIN (091653)
2 THOMAS T. HWANG (218678)
DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP
3 305 Lytton Avenue
Palo Alto, CA 94301
4 Telephone: (650) 857-1717
Facsimile: (650) 857-1288
5 Email: murray.john@dorsey.com
Email: franklin.robert@dorsey.com
6 Email: hwang.thomas@dorsey.com

7 Attorneys for Official
Committee of Unsecured Creditors
8

9 UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
10 NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA
11 SAN JOSE DIVISION

12 In re:)
13 TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED LLC,) Case No. 13-51589-SLJ-11
fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED)
14 INC., A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,) Chapter 11
fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED,)
15 A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,) Date: April 9, 2014
16 Debtor.) Time: 1:30 p.m.
Place: United States Bankruptcy Court
280 S. First Street, Room 3099
17 San Jose, CA 95113
Judge: Honorable Stephen L. Johnson

18
19 EXHIBIT "CC"
20 TO
21 FIRST APPLICATION FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES
22 BY ATTORNEYS FOR OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS
23
24
25
26
27
28

EXHIBIT COVER

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 321

R		Trustee / Contempt Motion		
10/28/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding motion to appoint a trustee (.1)	0.10	67.00
12/11/13	T. Hwang	Legal research regarding appointment of trustee, civil contempt (.7)	0.70	294.00
12/12/13	J. Murray	Commence preparation of motion for appointment of trustee and Order to Show Cause regarding contempt (2.3); multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding legal research regarding trustee motion, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.7)	3.00	2,010.00
12/12/13	T. Hwang	Legal research regarding appointment of trustee and contempt (2.3); memoranda regarding same (1.0)	3.30	1,386.00
12/13/13	J. Murray	Continue preparation of motion for appointment of trustee and Order to Show Cause regarding contempt (4.5); correspondence to team regarding Motion for Order Shortening Time (.1)	4.60	3,082.00
12/14/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences Committee members and J. Murray, regarding case strategy and trustee motion (.1); review trustee motion (.1); memoranda J. Murray regarding same (.3)	0.50	210.00
12/14/13	J. Murray	Commence preparation of motion for Order Shortening Time regarding trustee /contempt motion (1.7); commence preparation of Declaration in support of trustee /contempt motion (.5); multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding trustee /contempt motion (1.5); correspondence to/from P. Marcoux regarding same (.1); correspondence to/from S. Kim regarding same (.1); continue preparation of trustee/contempt	4.40	2,948.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

EXHIBIT CC

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 322

R	Trustee / Contempt Motion		
	motion (.5)		
12/15/13 J. Murray	Continue preparation of trustee/contempt motion (6.7); multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding same (.6) review multiple correspondence from D. Wright regarding same, correspondence to D. Wright regarding same and regarding Creditors Committee's Plan of Reorganization (.2)	7.50	5,025.00
12/15/13 J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding trustee/contempt Motion (.6); multiple correspondence to/from S. Kim regarding state court litigation transcripts (.2); correspondence to G. Felcyn and S. Kim regarding their Declarations in support of trustee/contempt Motion (.1)	0.90	603.00
12/15/13 T. Hwang	Draft insert to trustee motion, regarding Alliacense (1.0); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	1.10	462.00
12/16/13 T. Hwang	Review and revise trustee motion, and legal research regarding same (.7); review correspondences G. Kaplan, G. Felcyn, D. Wright regarding same; memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.80	336.00
12/16/13 R. Franklin	Review and revise Motion to appoint a trustee (1.6); draft Declaration of Sallie Kim (.3); draft Declaration of Gloria Felcyn (.3); review and revise same (.1); review Declarations of Cliff Flowers and Carl Johnson (.4); multiple correspondence and telephone conference with C. Hoge, AC. Johnson regarding same (.4); finalize Motion, prepare exhibits, multiple correspondence S. Kim regarding exhibits (1.8)	4.90	2,499.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 323

R		Trustee / Contempt Motion		
12/16/13	R. Franklin	Detailed telephone conference with D. Wright regarding Motion to appoint a Chapter 11 Trustee (.4)	0.40	204.00
12/16/13	J. Murray	Review, analysis and evaluation correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding trustee/contempt motion, correspondence to G. Kaplan regarding same; correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding same (.6); multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding trustee/contempt motion, revise Motion per Creditors Committee's comments (4.9); preparation of JWM Declaration in support of motion (.8); multiple correspondence to/from team regarding same, multiple interoffice conferences team regarding same (.7); preparation of motion, declaration and order shortening time for hearing on trustee/contempt motion (2.0); review multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee and team regarding Creditors Committee's Plan of Reorganization (.3)	9.30	6,231.00
12/17/13	J. Murray	Analysis and evaluation message from K. Prochnow regarding motion for Order Shortening Time regarding trustee motion (.1)	0.10	67.00
12/17/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to H. Binder regarding debtor's response to trustee motion, review same (.7)	0.70	469.00
12/18/13	J. Murray	Review debtor's response to trustee/contempt motion, correspondence to committee regarding same (.8)	0.80	536.00
12/18/13	J. Murray	Analysis and evaluation post hearing logistics (1.1)	1.10	737.00
12/18/13	T. Hwang	Review Debtor's statement and filings	0.20	84.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 324

R	Trustee / Contempt Motion		
	regarding motion to appoint trustee, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.2)		
12/19/13 T. Hwang	Draft, revise notice of hearing regarding motion to appoint trustee (.5); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same; meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.60	252.00
12/19/13 J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence from R Harris regarding transcript of hearing regarding dates and deadlines fixed by court, review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding same, review correspondence to/from court Clerk regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
12/23/13 T. Hwang	Analysis and evaluation regarding motion for trustee and Plan of Reorganization and regarding correspondence from J. Murray, regarding case status and action items, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (1.9)	1.90	798.00
12/24/13 J. Murray	Review message from C. Johnson regarding Declaration regarding threats from D. Leckrone, miscellaneous regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
12/27/13 J. Murray	Review Court docket regarding C. Moore's Motion to appoint Trustee, etc. (.1)	0.10	67.00
12/30/13 T. Hwang	Review Motion of C. Moore regarding appointment of trustee (.2); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
01/02/14 R. Franklin	Review evidentiary issues for trustee motion (.3); correspondence with and detailed telephone conference K. Prochnow regarding Moore's Motion to appoint Chapter 11 Trustee (.5)	0.80	408.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 325

R		Trustee / Contempt Motion		
01/02/14	J. Murray	Telephone conference with S. Caplan regarding Motion for appointment of Trustee, etc. (.3); review correspondence from K. Prochnow to H. Binder regarding C. Moore's joinder in motion to appoint trustee, etc. (.1)	0.40	268.00
01/02/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from K. Prochnow regarding telephone conference with H. Binder regarding Order Shortening Time regarding C. Moore Motion for appointment of trustee (.1)	0.10	67.00
01/06/14	T. Hwang	Review and evaluation Debtor's opposition C. Moore joinder motion, regarding appointment of trustee	0.10	42.00
01/06/14	J. Murray	Preparation of action item memorandum regarding Motion for appointment of Trustee and confirmation hearings (1.5); attend interoffice conference R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (2.0)	3.50	2,345.00
01/06/14	J. Murray	Draft correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding review of trustee motion and Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.20	134.00
01/07/14	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from S. Caplan regarding Patriot, review correspondence from S. Caplan to C. Flowers regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
01/07/14	J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding additional evidence regarding trustee motion (.1)	0.10	67.00
01/09/14	T. Hwang	Review and evaluation Debtor's opposition to Motion to Appoint Trustee (.2); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
01/09/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding debtor's Opposition	0.90	603.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 326

R

Trustee / Contempt Motion

to Trustee motion, review same (.5);
 review Court order denying debtor's
 motion to file documents under seal (.1);
 review correspondence from V. Torres
 regarding debtor's Opposition to Trustee
 motion, Declaration of D. Leckrone,
 review multiple correspondence to/from G.
 Felcyn, P. Marcoux and R. Franklin
 regarding same (.2); review
 correspondence from S. Kim regarding
 Creditors Committee members contacts
 with debtor (.1)

01/10/14 T. Hwang	Evaluation motion to appoint trustee (.2); review correspondences P. Marcoux, G. Felcyn, M. Imhof regarding communications with D. Leckrone and Debtor opposition to motion to appoint trustee (.1); investigation regarding same, and review D. Leckrone pleadings filed in state court action regarding same (.2)	0.50	210.00
01/10/14 R. Franklin	Review correspondence P. Marcoux regarding D. Leckrone receiving inside information from one or more committee members (.1); review Leckrone Declaration filed in state court (.3); correspondence with and detailed telephone conference with P. Marcoux regarding same and status of Committee Plan of Reorganization (.4); interoffice conference J. Murray regarding Leckrone Declaration (.1); review Opposition by Debtor to Motion (1.1); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	2.10	1,071.00
01/10/14 J. Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux and enclosed declaration of D. Leckrone regarding Leckrone's communications with Creditors Committee members (.3) telephone conference with K. Prochnow	3.30	2,211.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 327

R	Trustee / Contempt Motion		
	regarding trustee motion (.2); analysis and evaluation regarding multiple correspondence from S. Caplan regarding D. Leckrone conduct (.3); review response, correspondence from creditor, commene preparation of reply (2.5)		
01/10/14 J. Murray	Review Court Order denying C. Moore Motion for Order Shortening Time regarding joinder regarding Trustee motion (.1); review, analysis and evaluation Declaration of D. Leckrone regarding receipt of confidential Creditors Committee communications, correspondence to/from C. Hoge, R. Franklin regarding same, correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.2); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding debtor's Opposition to trustee motion (.1); review debtor's motion to file documents under seal regarding trustee motion (.2)	0.60	402.00
01/11/14 J. Murray	Continue review of Debtor's Opposition to motion for appointment of Trustee (1.2); continue preparation for hearing on motion to appoint Trustee (.9);	2.10	1,407.00
01/12/14 J. Murray	Review correspondence from P. MArcoux regarding D. Leckrone's conduct (.1); review and revise Motion regarding standing, multiple correspondence to/from correspondence from T. Hwang regarding same (.2)	0.30	201.00
01/13/14 T. Hwang	Analysis and evaluation Debtor's opposition to Trustee motion, memorandum from J. Murray and related documents, and legal research regarding same	1.80	756.00
01/13/14 R. Franklin	Interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding	0.50	255.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 328

R	Trustee / Contempt Motion		
	reply to opposition to Trustee motion and motion for standing to assert claims (.5)		
01/13/14 R. Franklin	Review correspondence C. Hoge regarding reply to opposition (.2); review supplemental declarations of G. Felcyn and C. Johnson (.3)	0.50	255.00
01/13/14 J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding reply to debtor's response to motion of appoint trustee (.1); interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same (.1); review correspondence from S. Kim regarding same, correspondence to committee regarding same (.1); continue preparation of reply to debtor's Opposition to motion for appointment of trustee (.8)	1.10	737.00
01/13/14 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding reply to Opposition to trustee motion and telephone conference with G. Felcyn and D. Wright and P. Marcoux (.1); further correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding reply to debtor's Opposition to trustee motion, review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.3); review correspondence from M. Brown regarding Creditors Committee members contact with debtor (.1); review correspondence from S. Kim regarding same (.1); review correspondence from B. Kirkendall regarding recent Creditors Committee communications (.1); multiple correspondence to/from C. Hoge regarding supplemental Declaration of C. Johnson regarding debtor's Opposition to trustee motion, review correspondence from C. Johnson regarding same, review Declaration (.2); review supplemental	1.20	804.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 329

R

Trustee / Contempt Motion

Declaration of G. Felcyn regarding same, correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.2); correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding debtor's litigation settlements (.1)

01/14/14	T. Hwang	Meeting R. Franklin regarding Debtor's opposition to Trustee motion (.1); Draft reply to Debtor's opposition to Trustee motion (8.8); correspondences S. Kim regarding same (.2); analysis and evaluation correspondences and documents from K. Curry and S. Kim regarding same (.5); review correspondence and information from K. Prochnow regarding same (.5); memoranda R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	10.30	4,326.00
01/14/14	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence from Creditors Committee members regarding contact with debtor (.2); review correspondence from K. Prochnow regarding argument regarding motion for appointment of trustee, review brief regarding same (.3); correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.1); review Declaration of C. Johnson in support of reply to debtor's Opposition to trustee motion (.1); review Court Order regarding debtor's motion to file documents under seal (.1)	0.80	536.00
01/15/14	T. Hwang	Review and evaluation comments to reply to Debtor's opposition to Trustee motion, and revise same (2.9); review and evaluation correspondences P. Marcoux, G. Felcyn and K. Beresford regarding same (.3); memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.1); review and investigation correspondences C. Johnson, J. Murray regarding same (.2); draft	4.50	1,890.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 330

R	Trustee / Contempt Motion		
	request for judicial notice in support of same (1.0)		
01/15/14 R. Franklin	Review and revise Reply to opposition to motion for Trustee (6.1); correspondence and telephone conferences with Creditors Committee members regarding same (.5)	6.60	3,366.00
01/15/14 J. Murray	Continue preparation of reply to Opposition to trustee motion, multiple correspondence and interoffice conferences with R. Franklin regarding same, review correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding same (2.5); review debtor's evidentiary objection regarding trustee motion (.5); multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding D. Leckrone Declaration regarding receipt of confidential Creditors Committee communications (.1); review exhibits to debtor's Opposition to trustee motion (.2)	3.30	2,211.00
01/16/14 T. Hwang	Draft, revise Reply to Opposition to Motion to appoint trustee, and legal research and evaluation of comments, correspondences J. Murray, R. Franklin to same (1.7); memoranda J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.1); revise request for judicial notice (.1); draft R. Franklin Declaration (.3); continue preparation of same (.5); prepare redline and correspondence Committee regarding same (.2)	2.90	1,218.00
01/16/14 J. Murray	Continue preparation of reply to debtor's Opposition to Trustee motion (.3); multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.40	268.00
01/16/14 J. Murray	Review and revise reply (.8); review multiple correspondence from T. Hwang	0.90	603.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 331

R	Trustee / Contempt Motion		
	regarding reply, Declarations, review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.1)		
01/17/14 T. Hwang	Review joinders to TPL opposition to Motion to Appoint Trustee, and correspondence from R. Franklin regarding same; correspondence Committee regarding same	0.20	84.00
01/17/14 J. Murray	Prepare for hearing regarding Trustee Motion (4.6); interoffice conference R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.7)	5.30	3,551.00
01/17/14 J. Murray	Review multiple joinders to debtor's Opposition to trustee motion, correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding same, review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding same, review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
01/18/14 J. Murray	Correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding parties joining in debtor's Opposition to trustee motion (.1)	0.10	67.00
01/18/14 J. Murray	Review correspondence from M. Brown regarding attendance at hearing on motion to appoint trustee (.1)	0.10	67.00
01/19/14 J. Murray	Continue preparation for hearing on trustee motion (4.3); correspondence to/from Creditors Committee members regarding attendance at hearing on trustee motion (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding argument regarding trustee motion, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2); review correspondence from M. Brown regarding identity of parties joining in debtor's Opposition to trustee motion (.1); correspondence to S. Caplan regarding	4.80	3,216.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 332

R	Trustee / Contempt Motion		
	trustee motion (.1)		
01/20/14 T. Hwang	Review correspondences P. Marcoux, G. Felcyn, G. Kaplan, M. Imhof, S. Kim, D. Wright regarding joinders in opposition to trustee motion and regarding potential manager for company (.2); review and evaluation memoranda J. Murray regarding trustee motion (.2)	0.40	168.00
01/20/14 J. Murray	Continue preparation for hearing on trustee motion, preparation of action item memorandum regarding same, multiple correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (4.5)	4.50	3,015.00
01/20/14 J. Murray	Review correspondence from M. Imhoff regarding joinders (.1)	0.10	67.00
01/20/14 J. Murray	Review Venkidus response to trustee motion (.1); review Creditors Committee response to debtor's evidentiary objections to trustee motion (.3)	0.40	268.00
01/21/14 T. Hwang	Review and evaluation memoranda J. Murray regarding Trustee motion, and memoranda J. Murray regarding same (.5); research local rules regarding same (.1); conference J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.70	294.00
01/21/14 T. Hwang	Finalize reply to Debtor's evidentiary objections (.3); revise same, and memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.40	168.00
01/21/14 R. Franklin	Review and draft response to evidentiary objections (2.0)	2.00	1,020.00
01/21/14 J. Murray	Continue preparation for hearing on trustee motion (6.9); telephone conference with S. Caplan regarding same (.2)	7.10	4,757.00
01/21/14 J. Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding hearing presentation regarding	1.00	670.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 333

R
Trustee / Contempt Motion

trustee motion (.2); review multiple joinders in debtor' Opposition to trustee motion, preparation of memorandum regarding same (.2); review court docket regarding debtor's submission of exhibits under seal, correspondence to/from H. Binder, V. Torres and R. Franklin regarding same (.2); multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding motion practice and live testimony (.2); continue preparation of hearing presentation on trustee motion regarding request for judicial notice (.2)

01/22/14	T. Hwang	Review joinders to opposition regarding motion to appoint trustee and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.4); correspondence Committee regarding Alliacense joinder (.2); telephone conference with J. Wesolowski regarding case status, regarding motion to appoint trustee (.2); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.2); review Order regarding hearing on same, matters at issue (.1); attention to filing of responses to evidentiary objections, and review same; conference S. Bloomer regarding same (.3)	1.40	588.00
01/22/14	R. Franklin	Review Court order regarding late filed pleadings (.2); detailed telephone conference R. Michelson regarding status of objections (.2)	0.40	204.00
01/22/14	J. Murray	Continue preparation for hearing on trustee motion, multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same (1.9); review court's order striking pleadings, correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same, interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same (.4)	2.30	1,541.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 334

R		Trustee / Contempt Motion		
01/22/14	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence regarding response to debtor's objections to Creditors Committee's Declarations, review response and multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same (.2); review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding T. Kirkendall joinder to debtor's Opposition to trustee motion (.1); review correspondence from K. Prochnow regarding joinders, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2); review statement of position of CCC regarding trustee motion, miscellaneous regarding same (.2); review correspondence from C. Johnson regarding M. Leckrone's joinder, review correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding same (.1); review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding debtor's communications with United States Trustee regarding settlements (.1)	0.90	603.00
01/23/14	T. Hwang	Meeting R. Franklin regarding case status and scheduling, regarding hearing on Motion to appoint trustee and Disclosure Statements (.3); meeting J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.3)	0.60	252.00
01/23/14	R. Franklin	Draft correspondence Creditors Committee regarding results of hearings (.5)	0.50	255.00
01/23/14	J. Murray	Prepare for hearing regarding trustee motion, attend same, conference committee members regarding same (3.0)	3.00	2,010.00
01/23/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence to Creditors Committee re results of hearing on trustee motion, etc. (.2)	0.20	134.00
01/24/14	T. Hwang	Review Court minute orders regarding Committee Motion to appoint trustee, Disclosure Statement dates and Committee standing Motion, and review memoranda J.	0.40	168.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 335

R		Trustee / Contempt Motion		
		Murray regarding same (.4)		
01/24/14	R. Franklin	Detailed telephone conference with D. Wright regarding results of 1/23 hearing and agenda for Creditors Committee meeting (.3)	0.30	153.00
01/24/14	J. Murray	Miscellaneous regarding calendar items from hearing of Jan 23 (.3); Review CD of hearing on trustee (1.5)	1.80	1,206.00
01/24/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Caplan regarding trustee motion (.1); review correspondence to/from P. Marcoux regarding summary of Jan 23 hearing (.1); correspondence to S. Caplan regarding need for more evidence regarding trustee motion (.2);	0.40	268.00
01/25/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright telephone conference to discuss results of hearing, settlement discussions and statement going forward (.1); review multiple correspondence from S. Caplan regarding trustee motion (.2)	0.30	201.00
01/26/14	J. Murray	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding results of hearing regarding trustee motion, status of settlement discussions with debtor, debtor's conduct, candidates for new manager, etc. (.6)	0.60	402.00
01/26/14	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence from S. Caplan regarding trustee motion (.2)	0.20	134.00
01/29/14	R. Franklin	Respond to inquiry from J. Murray regarding Intellasys (BEC)	0.50	255.00
01/29/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Caplan regarding Intellasys BEC, review Bahamian Supreme Court docket regarding same, correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.3); review	0.70	469.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 336

R		Trustee / Contempt Motion		
		correspondence from K. Beresford regarding standing motion and debtor's assignment of patents, review assignments, correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.4)		
02/03/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from R. Good regarding correspondence from S. Caplan regarding Trustee motion (.1)	0.10	67.00
02/14/14	J. Murray	Status report to R. Franklin regarding correspondence from S. Caplan regarding Trustee motion (.1)	0.10	67.00
02/26/14	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from correspondence to/from team regarding CD of 1/23/14 hearing (.2)	0.20	134.00
02/28/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from C. Hoge regarding trustee motion (.1)	0.10	67.00
Subtotal for		Trustee / Contempt Motion		82,272.00

Trustee / Contempt Motion

Task	Timekeeper	Rate	Hours	Amount
R	John Murray	670	86.70	58,089.00
R	Robert Franklin	510	19.50	9,945.00
R	Thomas Hwang	420	33.90	14,238.00
R	Total		140.10	82,272.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

1 JOHN WALSH MURRAY (074823)
ROBERT A. FRANKLIN (091653)
2 THOMAS T. HWANG (218678)
DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP
3 305 Lytton Avenue
Palo Alto, CA 94301
4 Telephone: (650) 857-1717
Facsimile: (650) 857-1288
5 Email: murray.john@dorsey.com
Email: franklin.robert@dorsey.com
6 Email: hwang.thomas@dorsey.com

7 Attorneys for Official
Committee of Unsecured Creditors
8

9 **UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT**
10 **NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA**
11 **SAN JOSE DIVISION**

12 In re:)
13 **TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED LLC,**) Case No. 13-51589-SLJ-11
14 **fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED**)
15 **INC., A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**) Chapter 11
16 **fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED,**)
17 **A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**)
18 Debtor.)
Date: April 9, 2014
Time: 1:30 p.m.
Place: United States Bankruptcy Court
280 S. First Street, Room 3099
San Jose, CA 95113
Judge: Honorable Stephen L. Johnson

19 **EXHIBIT "DD"**
20 **TO**
21 **FIRST APPLICATION FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES**
22 **BY ATTORNEYS FOR OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS**

EXHIBIT COVER

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 337

S		Claims		
05/03/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to W. Smith regarding Vendiku lien and requested documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
05/03/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences R. Harris, R. Franklin regarding secured claims (.1); evaluation UCC filings regarding same (.2)	0.30	126.00
05/03/13	T. Hwang	Correspondence Committee members regarding Proofs of Claim (.3)	0.30	126.00
05/03/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to and from R. Harris regarding secured loan documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
05/03/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding Vendiku lien and avoidability (.2)	0.20	134.00
05/04/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to T. Hwang regarding Creditors' Committee proofs of claim (.1)	0.10	67.00
06/04/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondence J. Murray and S. Kim regarding Proof of Claim, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
06/04/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding claims (.1); correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
06/05/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to S. Kim regarding Proof of Claim (.1)	0.10	67.00
06/10/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding Proofs of Claim (.1)	0.10	67.00
06/10/13	T. Hwang	Correspondences Committee members regarding Proofs of Claims (.1)	0.10	42.00
06/11/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence from S. Kim regarding Brown's Proof of Claim (.1); correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 338

S		Claims		
06/12/13	T. Hwang	Review and evaluation correspondence and regarding Proof of Claim from D. Andrews (.2); telephone conference with D. Andrews regarding same (.1); evaluation regarding same (.3)	0.60	252.00
06/13/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding proofs of claim (.1)	0.10	67.00
06/13/13	T. Hwang	Review Proof of Claim of M. and C. Brown and correspondences from S. Kim (.3)	0.30	126.00
06/14/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding claims (.1)	0.10	67.00
06/17/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to/from P. Marcoux regarding Proof of Claim (.1)	0.10	67.00
06/20/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from D. Andrews regarding Beresford Proof of Claim (.1)	0.10	67.00
06/24/13	T. Hwang	Review and evaluation Proof of Claim from M. Imhoff; correspondence M. Imhoff regarding same (.3); evaluation Proof of Claim K. Beresford (.1); evaluation Proof of Claim and correspondences from P. Marcoux; memorandum R. Franklin regarding same, regarding nondisclosure agreement (.3)	0.70	294.00
06/25/13	T. Hwang	Review and evaluation Proof of Claim from M. Imhoff; correspondence M. Imhoff regarding same (.2); correspondences P. Marcoux regarding Proof of Claim (.1)	0.30	126.00
06/25/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to P. Marcoux regarding settlement agreement regarding Proof of Claim (.1)	0.10	67.00
06/26/13	T. Hwang	Review Proofs of Claims from Committee members; review and respond correspondence D. Andrews regarding	0.20	84.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 339

S		Claims		
		same (.2)		
06/26/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to/from D. Andrews regarding Beresford Proof of Claim (.1)	0.10	67.00
07/05/13	T. Hwang	Review and evaluation Proof of Claim and correspondences from P. Marcoux; correspondences P. Marcoux regarding same (.3)	0.30	126.00
07/05/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding filing of Proofs of Claim (.2); correspondence to T. Hwang regarding same (.1); review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.40	268.00
07/06/13	T. Hwang	Review and respond to correspondence P. Marcoux regarding Proof of Claim (.1)	0.10	42.00
07/10/13	J. Murray	Multiple interoffice conference with T. Hwang regarding claims bar date (.1)	0.10	67.00
07/15/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences regarding B. Kirkendall, regarding Proof of Claim; correspondence R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
07/16/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences R. Franklin, J. Murray, S. Kim regarding Proof of Claim and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
07/16/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from S. Kim regarding filing of Proofs of Claim (.2); review multiple correspondence regarding proofs of claim (.2)	0.40	268.00
07/16/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding Proofs of Claim (.1)	0.10	67.00
07/17/13	T. Hwang	Review Proof of Claim and attention to filing of same; telephone conference with	0.50	210.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 340

S		Claims		
		B. Kirkendall regarding Proof of Claim (.5)		
07/18/13	T. Hwang	Analysis and evaluation regarding Proofs of Claims (.4); correspondences G. Felcyn, C. Johnson and G. Kaplan regarding same (.1)	0.50	210.00
07/18/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from team and committee regarding Proofs of Claim (.2)	0.20	134.00
07/18/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to G. Kaplan regarding Proof of Claim (.1); review correspondence to G. Felcyn regarding Proof of Claim (.1); correspondence to/from T. Hwang re confirmation that G. Kaplan and G. Felcyn will file their own Proofs of Claim (.1)	0.30	201.00
07/18/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Bloomer regarding B. Kirkendall claim (.1); review multiple correspondence to/from team regarding Proofs of Claim (.1); multiple correspondence to/from team regarding Proofs of Claim (.1); correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding Kirkendall Proof of Claim (.1); multiple correspondence to/from team regarding Farella's and PTSC Proofs of Claim (.2)	0.60	402.00
07/19/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding Proof of Claim (.1)	0.10	67.00
07/22/13	R. Franklin	Review Proofs of Claims filed by Committee members (.5)	0.50	255.00
07/22/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to committee re Proofs of Claim (.2);	0.20	134.00
07/22/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to T. Hwang regarding analysis and evaluation of priority claims (.1)	0.10	67.00
07/22/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to T. Hwang regarding	0.10	67.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 341

S	Claims		
	analysis and evaluation of priority claims (.1)		
07/24/13 T. Hwang	Evaluation and analysis regarding Schedules, Amended Schedules and Proofs of Claims, and priority claims; prepare report regarding same (1.4)	1.40	588.00
07/25/13 T. Hwang	Continue preparation of priority claims matrix and report, and research 507(a)(4) regarding same (.3); memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.1); meeting R. Franklin regarding preparation of claims analysis (.1); meeting R. Franklin, J. Murray regarding same (.1); evaluation regarding same, regarding claims register (.1)	0.70	294.00
07/25/13 R. Franklin	Initiate claims review and preparation of claims matrix (2.6)	2.60	1,326.00
07/25/13 J. Murray	Review summary of priority claims (.1); interoffice conference with R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.2)	0.30	201.00
07/25/13 J. Murray	Interoffice conference R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding analysis of claims (.2)	0.20	134.00
07/26/13 R. Franklin	Review claims and continuation preparation of claims matrix (3.0)	3.00	1,530.00
07/26/13 T. Hwang	Continue preparation of claims matrix (2.6)	2.60	1,092.00
07/27/13 T. Hwang	Continue preparation of claims matrix (.7)	0.70	294.00
07/28/13 T. Hwang	Continue preparation of claims matrix (.8); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.90	378.00
07/29/13 R. Franklin	Continue preparation of claims matrix (1.7); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same and finalize same for Committee meeting (.5)	2.20	1,122.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 342

S		Claims		
07/29/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding summary of claims (.1)	0.10	67.00
07/29/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding claims analysis (.1); correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding claims matrix (.1)	0.20	134.00
07/29/13	T. Hwang	Review and revise claims matrix analysis (.4); meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1); memoranda R. Franklin and J. Murray regarding same (.1); analysis and evaluation Debtor's claims analysis report (.4); correspondence Committee regarding claims matrices (.1); update and finalize claims matrix; meeting J. Murray regarding same (.3)	1.40	588.00
07/30/13	T. Hwang	Review and investigation regarding correspondence M. Imhoff and claims matrices (.1); correspondence M. Imhoff regarding same (.1)	0.20	84.00
07/30/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding claims analysis (.1)	0.10	67.00
08/06/13	R. Franklin	Continue preparation of claims matrix (.2)	0.20	102.00
08/13/13	R. Franklin	Prepare claims matrix for discussion with Committee regarding proposed classifications (4.4)	4.40	2,244.00
08/13/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences S. Kim, C. Johnson, G. Felcyn regarding insider claims (.1); memorandum R. Franklin, J. Murray regarding claim of R. Neilsen (.1)	0.20	84.00
08/14/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding claims matrix and review claims matrix (.4)	0.40	268.00
08/15/13	R. Franklin	Review Proofs of Claim of employees (2.0)	2.00	1,020.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 343

S		Claims		
08/16/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding Leckrone's children's claims (.1)	0.10	67.00
08/19/13	R. Franklin	Review claims matrix prepared by Debtor and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.9)	0.90	459.00
08/19/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding claims matrix (.2)	0.20	134.00
08/28/13	T. Hwang	Review and analysis statement of GreenArrays and Proof of Claim of GreenArrays, and memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same, regarding assignment of patents (.4)	0.40	168.00
09/06/13	T. Hwang	Review and evaluation correspondence S. Kim regarding Browns claim, position for basis of claim	0.10	42.00
09/06/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding chart summarizing status of claims (.2)	0.20	134.00
09/19/13	J. Murray	Interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding status of analysis of TPL employment contracts and statute of limitations (.1); correspondence to committee regarding next committee conference call (.1)	0.20	134.00
09/19/13	J. Murray	Review detailed correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding employee incentive compensation claims, review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding same, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
09/20/13	R. Franklin	Review correspondence and memorandum from G. Felcyn regarding employment incentive contracts (.5)	0.50	255.00
09/23/13	T. Hwang	Investigation regarding priority claims; review claims matrix regarding same;	0.20	84.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 344

S	Claims		
	review memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.2)		
09/24/13 T. Hwang	Review and evaluation memoranda from R. Franklin, G. Felcyn regarding investigation into employee compensation claims	0.20	84.00
09/24/13 R. Franklin	Draft correspondence and review materials to T. Hwang regarding analysis of employee incentive compensation claims (.7)	0.70	357.00
09/24/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding G. Felcyn's analysis of employee compensation claims, interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same (.2); review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding analysis and evaluation of employee compensation agreements and correspondence to T. Hwang regarding same (.3)	0.50	335.00
09/25/13 T. Hwang	Investigation regarding claims matrix and Debtor's characterization of claims and amounts, and memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.4)	0.40	168.00
09/25/13 T. Hwang	Review and evaluation memoranda G. Felcyn regarding investigation into employee compensation claims (.2)	0.20	84.00
09/26/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to T. Hwang regarding status of analysis of employee incentive compensation claims (.1)	0.10	67.00
09/26/13 T. Hwang	Analysis and evaluation of employee claims; review Debtor's documents regarding same, and legal research regarding same (4.1); draft memorandum regarding same (2.8); meetings R. Franklin regarding same (.3); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1); review	7.40	3,108.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 345

S	Claims		
	memorandum R. Franklin regarding same, regarding subordination (.1)		
09/27/13 T. Hwang	Evaluation of employee claims and revise, finalize memorandum regarding same (.6); memoranda R. Franklin regarding same (.8); review correspondences J. Murray, G. Felcyn regarding same and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	1.50	630.00
09/27/13 R. Franklin	Review and revise memorandum regarding potential objections to Employee Compensation Claims (2.2)	2.20	1,122.00
09/27/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding employee incentive program (.1); correspondence to/from Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
09/27/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding status of memorandum regarding employee incentive claims (.1); correspondence to G. Felcyn regarding analysis of employee incentive compensation claims, multiple correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding same (.2)	0.30	201.00
09/30/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding employee incentive compensation agreements, correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
09/30/13 T. Hwang	Analysis and evaluation correspondences from S. Anhalt and R. Franklin regarding employee claims and Alliacense documents, and Alliacense incentive program document, and memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.4); review correspondences J. Murray, R. Franklin and G. Felcyn regarding analysis of employee compensation claims and	0.80	336.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 346

S	Claims		
	investigation regarding same (.2); review correspondence S. Kim and J. Murray regarding M. Leckrone claim and review memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1); investigation regarding same and memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)		
09/30/13 R. Franklin	Review correspondence regarding Felcyn's analysis of compensation claims (.4); review Mac Leckrone Proof of Claim and draft response to S. Kim regarding basis of claim (.7)	1.10	561.00
09/30/13 J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding employee incentive compensation claims, correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
10/01/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to committee regarding correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding analysis of employee incentive compensation claims, review same (.2)	0.20	134.00
10/01/13 T. Hwang	Review and analysis correspondence and documents from S. Anhalt regarding employee claims	0.10	42.00
10/01/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding employee incentive compensation claims (.1)	0.10	67.00
10/02/13 T. Hwang	Review correspondences R. Franklin, C. Brown, S. Anhalt regarding employee claims (.1); meeting R. Franklin regarding same, regarding memorandum of same (.1)	0.20	84.00
10/02/13 R. Franklin	Continue review of Proof of Claim of M. Davis and correspondence with S. Anhalt regarding calculations and supporting documents (.9)	0.90	459.00
10/02/13 R. Franklin	Review Felcyn memorandum regarding	1.60	816.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 347

S	Claims		
	calculation of employment claims (.7); finalize memorandum regarding viability of employee claims (.9)		
10/02/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding employee incentive compensation program, correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same, review correspondence from C. Brown regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
10/02/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding Alliacense's claim (.1)	0.10	67.00
10/03/13 J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence from R. Franklin and S, Anhalt regarding Alliacense Proof of Claim (.2)	0.20	134.00
10/03/13 T. Hwang	Review and evaluation correspondences R. Franklin, S. Anhalt and related documents, regarding Alliacense claim and offset (.2)	0.20	84.00
10/03/13 R. Franklin	Review correspondence S. Anhalt regarding intercompany debts and offset and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.3)	0.30	153.00
10/08/13 T. Hwang	Evaluation issues regarding employee incentive claims and employment of counsel by Debtor (.4)	0.40	168.00
10/08/13 T. Hwang	Memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding employee compensation claims (.4)	0.40	168.00
10/08/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding calculation of employee incentive compensation claims (.2)	0.20	134.00
10/08/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding incentive compensation agreement (.2)	0.20	134.00
12/10/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence to/from S. Kim	0.10	67.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 348

S		Claims		
		regarding Brown claim (.1)		
12/18/13	J. Murray	Review multiple notices of claim transfer regarding Shore Chan claim (.1)	0.10	67.00
01/23/14	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding administration of expense claims (.1)	0.10	67.00
02/01/14	T. Hwang	Investigation regarding Alliacense claim and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.2)	0.20	84.00
02/01/14	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding Alliacense administrative claim (.1)	0.10	67.00
02/03/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding administrative claims, review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding summary of same, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
02/06/14	T. Hwang	Prepare report regarding insiders and affiliate claims, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.8)	0.80	336.00
02/06/14	J. Murray	Review, analysis and evaluation regarding Patriot's claim (.1)	0.10	67.00
02/10/14	T. Hwang	Review and evaluation memorandum R. Franklin regarding insider claims, claims allowance and potential objections	0.10	42.00
02/10/14	R. Franklin	Review, analyze and prepare summary of insider claims (2.0)	2.00	1,020.00
02/14/14	J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding claims analysis (.1)	0.10	67.00
02/22/14	J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding calculations of claims (.1); review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding J. Neal's incentive compensation claim (.1)	0.20	134.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 349

S	Claims		
02/24/14 R. Franklin	Review claims matrices and prepare response to inquiry from J. Murray regarding claim amounts (2.5)	2.50	1,275.00
02/24/14 J. Murray	Review correspondence from H. Binder regarding S. Anhalt's claims analysis, analysis and evaluation regarding same, correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
02/27/14 T. Hwang	Analysis regarding claims and classification and regarding debtor's analysis, and prepare matrix regarding same (1.3); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.3)	1.60	672.00
Subtotal for	Claims		32,720.00

Claims

Task	Timekeeper	Rate	Hours	Amount
S	John Murray	670	10.40	6,968.00
S	Robert Franklin	510	27.60	14,076.00
S	Thomas Hwang	420	27.80	11,676.00
S	Total		65.80	32,720.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

1 JOHN WALSHE MURRAY (074823)
ROBERT A. FRANKLIN (091653)
2 THOMAS T. HWANG (218678)
DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP
3 305 Lytton Avenue
Palo Alto, CA 94301
4 Telephone: (650) 857-1717
Facsimile: (650) 857-1288
5 Email: murray.john@dorsey.com
Email: franklin.robert@dorsey.com
6 Email: hwang.thomas@dorsey.com

7 Attorneys for Official
Committee of Unsecured Creditors

8
9 **UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT**
10 **NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA**
11 **SAN JOSE DIVISION**

12 In re:

13 **TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED LLC,**
14 **fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED**
15 **INC., A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**
16 **fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED,**
17 **A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**

18 Debtor.

Case No. 13-51589-SLJ-11

Chapter 11

Date: April 9, 2014

Time: 1:30 p.m.

Place: United States Bankruptcy Court
280 S. First Street, Room 3099
San Jose, CA 95113

Judge: Honorable Stephen L. Johnson

19 **EXHIBIT "EE"**

20 **TO**

21 **FIRST APPLICATION FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES**
22 **BY ATTORNEYS FOR OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS**

23
24
25
26
27
28
EXHIBIT COVER

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 350

T	Objections to Claims		
07/26/13 J. Murray	Telephone conference with R. Harris regarding Objections to Claims (.2)	0.20	134.00
07/28/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding claims analysis and Objections to Claims, and forward to committee (.2)	0.20	134.00
01/14/14 J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding Objections to Claims of insiders (.1)	0.10	67.00
01/21/14 T. Hwang	Draft Objection to Claim of D. Hannah, and legal research and analysis of claim regarding same	1.50	630.00
01/22/14 T. Hwang	Draft Objection to Claim of D. Hannah (.2); draft Notice of same (.5); draft Objection to Claim of J. Neal, and evaluation of Proof of Claim (.3)	1.00	420.00
01/27/14 T. Hwang	Draft Objection to Claim of J. Neal	1.10	462.00
01/29/14 T. Hwang	Draft Objection to Claim of Janet Neal and legal research regarding same (1.8); draft notice of same (.2); draft Objection to Claim Dwayne Hannah (.2); analysis and evaluation regarding 13% claims, regarding Objections to Claim (.2)	2.40	1,008.00
01/30/14 T. Hwang	Draft Objection to Claim of J. Leckrone, and legal research regarding same and regarding recharacterization issues	2.00	840.00
01/31/14 T. Hwang	Draft Objection to Claim of J. Leckrone (.4); draft Notice of same (.3); draft Objection to Claim of M. Davis, and analysis of claim regarding same (1.9)	2.60	1,092.00
Subtotal for	Objections to Claims		4,787.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
Page 351

Objections to Claims

Task	Timekeeper	Rate	Hours	Amount
T	John Murray	670	0.50	335.00
T	Thomas Hwang	420	10.60	4,452.00
T	Total		11.10	4,787.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY