

1 JOHN WALSHE MURRAY (074823)
ROBERT A. FRANKLIN (091653)
2 THOMAS T. HWANG (218678)
DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP
3 305 Lytton Avenue
Palo Alto, CA 94301
4 Telephone: (650) 857-1717
Facsimile: (650) 857-1288
5 Email: murray.john@dorsey.com
Email: franklin.robert@dorsey.com
6 Email: hwang.thomas@dorsey.com

7 Attorneys for Official
Committee of Unsecured Creditors
8

9 **UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT**
10 **NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA**
11 **SAN JOSE DIVISION**

12 In re:

13 **TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED LLC,**)
fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED)
14 **INC., A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**)
fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED,)
15 **A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**)

16 Debtor.)

Case No. 13-51589-SLJ-11

Chapter 11

Date: April 9, 2014

Time: 1:30 p.m.

Place: United States Bankruptcy Court
280 S. First Street, Room 3099
San Jose, CA 95113

Judge: Honorable Stephen L. Johnson

18
19 **EXHIBIT "Q"**

20 **TO**

21 **FIRST APPLICATION FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES**
22 **BY ATTORNEYS FOR OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS**
23
24
25
26
27
28

EXHIBIT COVER

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 151

Ja		Compensation of Professionals - Binder & Malter LLP	
07/18/13	J. Murray	Review amendment to Rule 2016 statement filed by Binder & Malter (.1); correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same (.1); correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding Rule 2016 statement (.1)	0.30 201.00
Subtotal for		Compensation of Professionals - Binder & Malter LLP	201.00

Compensation of Professionals - Binder & Malter LLP

Task	Timekeeper	Rate	Hours	Amount
Ja	John Murray	670	0.30	201.00
Ja	Total	670	0.30	201.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

EXHIBIT Q

1 JOHN WALSHE MURRAY (074823)
ROBERT A. FRANKLIN (091653)
2 THOMAS T. HWANG (218678)
DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP
3 305 Lytton Avenue
Palo Alto, CA 94301
4 Telephone: (650) 857-1717
Facsimile: (650) 857-1288
5 Email: murray.john@dorsey.com
Email: franklin.robert@dorsey.com
6 Email: hwang.thomas@dorsey.com

7 Attorneys for Official
Committee of Unsecured Creditors
8

9 **UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT**
10 **NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA**
11 **SAN JOSE DIVISION**

12 In re:

13 **TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED LLC,**
14 **fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED**
15 **INC., A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**
16 **fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED,**
17 **A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**

18 Debtor.

Case No. 13-51589-SLJ-11

Chapter 11

Date: April 9, 2014

Time: 1:30 p.m.

Place: United States Bankruptcy Court
280 S. First Street, Room 3099
San Jose, CA 95113

Judge: Honorable Stephen L. Johnson

19 **EXHIBIT "R"**

20 **TO**

21 **FIRST APPLICATION FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES**
22 **BY ATTORNEYS FOR OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS**
23
24
25
26
27
28

EXHIBIT COVER

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 152

Ka		Settlement Procedures Motion	
04/04/13	T. Hwang	Analysis of debtor's motion regarding settlement procedures and memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.5)	0.50 210.00
04/07/13	E. Darda	Review schedules, settlement motion and other materials for committee call (.6)	0.60 180.00
04/09/13	T. Hwang	Investigation regarding Rule 9019 motion, and notice of same (.1); conferences J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.20 84.00
04/09/13	J. Murray	Review detailed voicemail from T. Lewis regarding Debtor's Motion regarding settlement Protocol (.1); correspondence to T. Lewis regarding same (.1)	0.20 134.00
04/09/13	J. Murray	Review, analysis and evaluation Debtor's Motion etc, regarding settlement protocol (.5)	0.50 335.00
04/10/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to and from E. Keller regarding Debtor's Motion regarding settlement procedures (.1); telephonic conference call with E. Keller and E. Dowell regarding same (.2)	0.30 201.00
04/15/13	T. Hwang	Analysis and evaluation regarding debtor's motion regarding settlement procedures and legal research regarding same (1.4); draft opposition regarding same (.5)	1.90 798.00
04/16/13	T. Hwang	Legal research regarding debtor's motion for settlement procedures (.6); draft opposition to same (3.5)	4.10 1,722.00
04/16/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference G. Charles regarding PDS/Alliasence agreement and Debtor's settlement protocol Motion (.2)	0.20 134.00
04/17/13	T. Hwang	Continue preparation, finalize opposition to settlement procedures motion	1.30 546.00
04/18/13	T. Hwang	Review objection of United States Trustee	0.10 42.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 153

Ka		Settlement Procedures Motion	
		to motion regarding settlement procedures; review objections to cash collateral motion	
04/22/13	T. Hwang	Review and analysis regarding reply to opposition regarding settlement procedures motion	0.20 84.00
04/22/13	J. Murray	Prepare for hearing regarding settlement protocol Motion (.2); review U.S. Trustee's objection regarding same (.2)	0.40 268.00
04/22/13	J. Murray	Review Debtor's reply regarding objection to settlement procedures Motion (.4)	0.40 268.00
04/23/13	T. Hwang	Evaluation and analysis, and legal research regarding Debtor's reply to opposition regarding settlement procedures motion (.7); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.4)	1.10 462.00
04/23/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference D. Wright regarding settlement procedures Motion and creation of sub-committee (.2)	0.20 134.00
04/23/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding Debtor's reply to Opposition to Motion regarding settlement protocol (.1)	0.10 67.00
04/25/13	T. Hwang	Review memoranda J. Murray regarding proposed settlement procedures protocol and comments thereto from Committee members	0.20 84.00
04/25/13	J. Murray	Commence preparation of protocol regarding litigation settlements/licensing (1.2); conference with H. Binder and J. Ottesen regarding same (1.2); continue preparation of settlement protocol (1.0)	3.40 2,278.00
04/25/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from K. Prochnow regarding settlement protocol (.1); correspondence to and from S. Kim regarding same (.2); correspondence to H. Binder and J. Ottesen regarding same (.1)	0.40 268.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 154

Ka		Settlement Procedures Motion	
04/29/13	E. Darda	Emails with J. Murray, G. Kaplan, P. Marcoux, S. Kim and committee regarding settlement protocol	0.40 120.00
04/29/13	T. Hwang	Reivew correspondences D. Wright, R. Franklin, J. Murray, S. Kim regarding case status, regarding Alliacense and settlement procedures (.2)	0.20 84.00
04/29/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding debtor's position regarding flow of settlement funds (.3); correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding settlement protocol motion and distributions to Alliacense (1.0)	1.30 871.00
04/30/13	R. Franklin	Draft status update pleading regarding Relief from Automatic Stay Motion and Settlement Procedures Motion and correspondence with Committee regarding same (3.5)	3.50 1,785.00
04/30/13	R. Franklin	Detailed telephone conference D. Wright regarding settlement procedures motion and NDA (.4); review "Waterfall" summary of distribution of proceeds (.4); review correspondence from Members regarding settlement procedures and NDA (.5)	1.30 663.00
04/30/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding meeting regarding Creditors' Committee position regarding NDA and settlement protocol Motion (.1)	0.10 67.00
04/30/13	J. Murray	Review Technology Properties cascade of funds analysis (.6); correspondence to and from H. Binder regarding same (.1); correspondence to and from S. Anhalt regarding same (.1); review revised cascade of funds (.2)	1.00 670.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 155

Ka
Settlement Procedures Motion

04/30/13	J. Murray	Interoffice conference R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding outstanding issues regarding NDA and settlement protocol and supplemental Opposition to Motion (.5); review and forward relevant correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.3)	0.80	536.00
05/01/13	J. Murray	Prepare for hearing regarding settlement protocol Motion (.5)	0.50	335.00
05/01/13	T. Hwang	Review comments R. Franklin to motion to file under seal and revise and finalize same (.5); attention to filing of same and to communication to court regarding same (.3); review supplement regarding settlement procedures motion and provide comments to same (.4); revise and finalize supplement to settlement procedures motion and exhibits (.5); telephone conferences with court (L. Chen) regarding motion to seal, regarding local civil rules (.3); evaluation regarding local civil rules (.3); meetings and memoranda to R. Franklin regarding motion to seal, regarding supplement to settlement procedures motion (.3); draft, finalize declaration regarding motion to seal (.8); prepare pleadings for submission to court, and attention to service and filing matters regarding same, and meetings S. Bloomer regarding same; manage preparation of pleadings for hearing and status conference (1.3); review statement filed by debtor regarding settlement procedures (.1); meetings R. Franklin regarding same and regarding correspondence R. Harris (.1)	4.90	2,058.00
05/01/13	R. Franklin	Review and revise Status Update regarding Settlement Procedures Motion and finalize same (2.5); interoffice conferences with T.	3.00	1,530.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 156

Ka		Settlement Procedures Motion	
		Hwang regarding procedure for filing under seal (.3); review Debtor's Status Update Report and correspondence Committee regarding same (.2)	
05/01/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference R. Harris regarding settlement procedure Motion and interoffice conference with R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.10 67.00
05/02/13	T. Hwang	Meeting R. Franklin regarding hearing on settlement procedures motion; review correspondence J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.10 42.00
05/02/13	R. Franklin	Prepare for hearing on Settlement Procedures Motion (1.2); attend hearing and conference with Committee Members regarding results (3.0); draft memorandum to Members regarding same (.4)	4.60 2,346.00
05/02/13	J. Murray	Prepare for hearing on Motion to establish settlement protocol (.2); attend same (3.0); commence preparation of proposed form of order regarding same (.3); telephone conference H. Binder regarding same (.1); correspondence to and from W. Smith regarding same (.1); review revised Order (.2); correspondence to W. Smith regarding same (.1)	4.00 2,680.00
05/02/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding results of hearing regarding settlement protocol Motion (.9)	0.90 603.00
Subtotal for		Settlement Procedures Motion	22,756.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
Page 157

Settlement Procedures Motion

Task	Timekeeper	Rate	Hours	Amount
Ka	Erin Darda	300	1.00	300.00
Ka	John Murray	670	14.80	9,916.00
Ka	Robert Franklin	510	12.40	6,324.00
Ka	Thomas Hwang	420	14.80	6,216.00
Ka	Total		43.00	22,756.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

1 JOHN WALSHE MURRAY (074823)
ROBERT A. FRANKLIN (091653)
2 THOMAS T. HWANG (218678)
DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP
3 305 Lytton Avenue
Palo Alto, CA 94301
4 Telephone: (650) 857-1717
Facsimile: (650) 857-1288
5 Email: murray.john@dorsey.com
Email: franklin.robert@dorsey.com
6 Email: hwang.thomas@dorsey.com

7 Attorneys for Official
Committee of Unsecured Creditors

8
9 **UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT**
10 **NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA**
11 **SAN JOSE DIVISION**

12 In re:

13 **TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED LLC,**
14 **fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED**
15 **INC., A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**
16 **fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED,**
17 **A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**

18 Debtor.

Case No. 13-51589-SLJ-11

Chapter 11

Date: April 9, 2014

Time: 1:30 p.m.

Place: United States Bankruptcy Court
280 S. First Street, Room 3099
San Jose, CA 95113

Judge: Honorable Stephen L. Johnson

19 **EXHIBIT "S"**

20 **TO**

21 **FIRST APPLICATION FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES**
22 **BY ATTORNEYS FOR OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS**

23
24
25
26
27
28
EXHIBIT COVER

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 158

Kb	Settlements		
05/03/13 R. Franklin	Review correspondence regarding settlement procedures and status of NDA from R. Harris and Committee members (.2)	0.20	102.00
05/13/13 R. Franklin	Review correspondence W. Smith regarding sub-committee on settlement procedures (.2)	0.20	102.00
05/13/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to and from W. Smith regarding presentation to settlement subcommittee (.2); follow up correspondence to W. Smith regarding same (.3)	0.50	335.00
05/14/13 T. Hwang	Review order regarding settlement procedures and correspondences of J. Murray and W. Smith regarding same (.2); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
05/14/13 J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to and from W. Smith regarding settlement sub committee (.2); review Court Order regarding settlement protocol (.2); correspondence to W. Smith regarding same (.2)	0.60	402.00
05/20/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to and from W. Smith regarding subcommittees telephone conference; miscellaneous regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
05/21/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to and from H. Binder and W. Smith regarding telephone conference with subcommittee regarding settlements (.1); correspondence to subcommittee regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
05/21/13 J. Murray	Telephone conference H. Binder regarding sub-committee telephone conference with Debtor (.2); correspondence to H. Binder regarding same (.1); correspondence to	0.50	335.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

EXHIBIT S

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 159

Kb	Settlements		
	subcommittee regarding change of date for telephone conference (.1); correspondence to subcommittee regarding cancellation of Wednesday call (.1)		
05/21/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to and from D. Wright regarding meeting with Debtor and subcommittee and scope of agenda (.2)	0.20	134.00
05/22/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to and from K. Beresford and subcommittee regarding telephone conference with Debtor (.2)	0.20	134.00
05/22/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from H. Binder regarding subcommittee telephone conference and correspondence to subcommittee regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
05/23/13 T. Hwang	Meeting with sub-committee and Debtor's representatives regarding settlement protocol and status (1.6); review order regarding settlement protocol (.1); draft summary of meeting (1.3)	3.00	1,260.00
05/23/13 R. Franklin	Attend meeting of subcommittee regarding status of litigation and potential settlement negotiations (1.5); conference M. Brown regarding issues (.2)	1.70	867.00
05/23/13 J. Murray	Conference call subcommittee and Debtor regarding settlement process and expectations (1.6); telephone conference with H. Binder regarding meeting and follow-up meeting (.2); correspondence to subcommittee regarding availability over weekend for emergency meetings (.1); correspondence to S. Kim regarding same (.1); correspondence to H. Binder regarding weekend contact information for emergency conference call (.1)	2.10	1,407.00
05/23/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from K. Hiensch regarding composition of sub-committee	0.30	201.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 160

Kb	Settlements		
	(.1); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.1); correspondence to K. Hiensch regarding same (.1)		
05/24/13 T. Hwang	Draft, revise summary report of Sub-Committee meeting with Debtor (1.6); meeting J. Murray and review comments J. Murray regarding same (.1)	1.70	714.00
05/24/13 R. Franklin	Draft correspondence to H. Binder regarding information requested to evaluate potential settlements of IP litigation (.5)	0.50	255.00
05/24/13 R. Franklin	Review and revise minutes of first meeting of subcommittee and Debtor regarding settlement protocol (.4)	0.40	204.00
05/24/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to and from D. Wright regarding subcommittee weekend call (.1)	0.10	67.00
05/24/13 J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to and from S. Kim regarding information needed to evaluate settlement proposals (.2); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
05/24/13 J. Murray	Review and revise notes of subcommittee meeting with Debtor (.4); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.50	335.00
05/26/13 T. Hwang	Review correspondence R. Franklin regarding sub-committee meeting minutes and finalize same (.2)	0.20	84.00
05/26/13 T. Hwang	Review comments to notes regarding Sub-Committee meeting with Debtor, and finalize same (.3); correspondence Committee members regarding same (.1)	0.40	168.00
05/27/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to T. Hwang regarding subcommittee minutes (.1)	0.10	67.00
05/27/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to and from H. Binder	0.50	335.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 161

Kb
Settlements

		regarding re-scheduling subcommittee meeting (.1); correspondence to subcommittee regarding same (.1); review multiple responses from subcommittee regarding same (.2); correspondence to and from S. Kim regarding same (.1)		
05/28/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to subcommittee regarding Wednesday call with Debtor (.1)	0.10	67.00
05/29/13	T. Hwang	Sub-Committee meeting with Debtor regarding status of settlements (.4)	0.40	168.00
05/29/13	R. Franklin	Attend subcommittee meeting regarding settlement protocol (.3); conference M. Brown regarding same (.1)	0.40	204.00
05/29/13	J. Murray	Review, analysis and evaluation regarding correspondence to H. Binder regarding information Committee needs to evaluate settlement proposals (.2); attend conference call with debtor and subcommittee regarding status of litigation and settlement (.5);	0.70	469.00
05/31/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from W. Smith regarding meeting with subcommittee to discuss Dell settlement (.5); correspondence to subcommittee regarding same (.1); review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding possible recusal regarding conflict (.1)	0.70	469.00
05/31/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to C. Hoge regarding subcommittee informational requirements regarding proposed settlements (.2)	0.20	134.00
06/01/13	T. Hwang	Telephone conference meeting with Sub-Committee and Debtor (1.0)	1.00	420.00
06/01/13	R. Franklin	Attend sub-committee meeting regarding potential settlement (1.0)	1.00	510.00
06/01/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from	1.60	1,072.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 162

Kb

Settlements

subcommittee regarding conference call with debtor regarding proposed Dell settlement (.2); review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding slides regarding Dell settlement (.2); conference call debtor's representative and subcommittee regarding proposed settlement with Dell (1.0); correspondence to debtor regarding subcommittee's decision regarding same (.1); review correspondence from H. Binder regarding same (.1)

06/02/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding subcommittee call and written presentation (.2); correspondence to subcommittee regarding same (.1.); multiple correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding letter to Dell regarding committee's approval of settlement (.2); correspondence to D. Leckrone regarding same (.2); review correspondence from S. Kim regarding disposition of license proceeds (.1)	0.80	536.00
06/02/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from C. Hoge regarding conference call regarding Ford (.2)	0.20	134.00
06/03/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence from C. Hoge regarding Ford and status of ITC settlements (.2)	0.20	134.00
06/04/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from C. Johnson regarding Dell settlement (.1); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same (.1); review correspondence to committee regarding debtor's written presentation to subcommittee and security regarding same (.1); review multiple correspondence to/from S. Kim and S. Anhalt regarding license proceeds and direct payments to counsel (.2); review correspondence H.	0.60	402.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 163

Kb
Settlements

		Binder regarding security of settlement information (.1)		
06/04/13	T. Hwang	Correspondence Committee regarding S. Anhalt email, regarding Subcommittee meeting; exchange correspondence C. Johnson regarding same (.1); review correspondences S. Kim, S. Anhalt regarding payment stream to other entities (.1)	0.20	84.00
06/05/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from H. Binder regarding meeting with subcommittee regarding developments at ITC (.1); correspondence to committee regarding same (.1); review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding resignation from subcommittee (.1); correspondence to committee regarding same (.1)	0.40	268.00
06/08/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence from H. Binder, K. Beresford and S. Anhalt regarding conference call to discuss Marvell settlement (.2)	0.20	134.00
06/09/13	J. Murray	Conference call with subcommittee and debtor regarding proposed settlement with Marvel (1.0); conference call with subcommittee regarding same (.3); multiple correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding same (.2); correspondence to subcommittee regarding same (.1); multiple correspondence to/from K. Beresford regarding same (.2); multiple telephone conferences with M. Brown regarding same (.1); correspondence to D. Wright regarding same (.1); multiple correspondence to/from debtor regarding same (.2); multiple telephone conferences with H. Binder regarding same (.2); correspondence to subcommittee regarding same (.1); review multiple correspondence	3.10	2,077.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 164

Kb
Settlements

		from K. Beresford regarding same (.1); correspondence to debtor regarding same (.1); review correspondence from H. Binder regarding same (.1); review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding correspondence confirming committee approval of Marvell settlement (.1); correspondence to D. Leckrone regarding same (.2)		
06/09/13	J. Murray	Review message from C. Johnson regarding service on subcommittee; correspondence to/from C. Johnson regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
06/09/13	T. Hwang	Telephone conference Debtor and Subcommittee regarding Fast Logic settlement (.7); telephone conference Subcommittee regarding same (.3)	1.00	420.00
06/09/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding questions for debtor regarding settlement considerations (.1)	0.10	67.00
06/10/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding correspondence from committee regarding approval of Marvell settlement (.1); correspondence to D. Leckrone, et al. regarding same (.1); correspondence to subcommittee regarding information for future settlements (.1); regarding correspondence from D. Wright regarding same (.1) correspondence to H. Binder regarding same (.2)	0.60	402.00
06/10/13	R. Franklin	Review correspondence regarding settlement presentation meeting (.3)	0.30	153.00
06/11/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding proceeds of Dell license and Marvell settlement (.1)	0.10	67.00
06/11/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from K. Beresford	0.20	134.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 165

Kb		Settlements		
		regarding replacement of subcommittee member (.1); multiple correspondence to/from S. Kim regarding next committee meeting (.1)		
06/12/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from K. Beresford regarding replacing member of subcommittee (.1); multiple correspondence to/from C. Johnson and G. Felcyn regarding same (.2); correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding need for subcommittee meeting (.1); correspondence to subcommittee regarding same (.1)	0.50	335.00
06/13/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding recomposition of subcommittee (.1)	0.10	67.00
06/13/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from C. Johnson regarding service on the subcommittee (.1)	0.10	67.00
06/13/13	T. Hwang	Correspondence H. Binder, R. Harris regarding subcommittee membership (.1)	0.10	42.00
06/17/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding subcommittee meeting with Debtor (.2)	0.20	134.00
06/19/13	T. Hwang	Review memorandum R. Franklin regarding proposal of settlement, regarding Ford matter; review correspondence G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
06/19/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from R. Harris regarding Ford license proposal (.1); multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same (.2); review correspondence to committee regarding same (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.50	335.00
06/20/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from C. Johnson	0.10	67.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 166

Kb	Settlements		
	regarding dispute regarding Ford license proceeds (.1)		
07/26/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from J. Neal regarding meeting of the settlement subcommittee (.1); telephone conference with J. Neal regarding same (.1); correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding composition of settlement subcommittee (.1); correspondence to settlement subcommittee conference call (.1); review multiple responses from subcommittee regarding same (.1); multiple correspondence to/from J. Neal regarding same (.1)	0.60	402.00
07/29/13 T. Hwang	Subcommittee telephone conference with with Debtor regarding potential settlement (.4); telephone conference with Subcommittee regarding same (.5)	0.90	378.00
07/29/13 R. Franklin	Conference call regarding settlement proposal and approval (.9)	0.90	459.00
07/29/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence and analysis from S. Anhalt regarding settlement with Brother International (.2); correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding participation in subcommittee meeting (.1); review correspondence from J. Neal regarding conference call with subcommittee (.1); correspondence to all attendees regarding same (.1); attend subcommittee meeting with debtor regarding negotiation with Brother (.3); attend subcommittee call to discuss proposal (.5); correspondence to debtor regarding same (.2); review correspondence from S. Anhalt in response and correspondence to subcommittee regarding same (.1); multiple correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding confirmation of committee	1.80	1,206.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 167

Kb

Settlements

		approval of Brother settlement(.1); correspondence to D. Leckrone regarding same (.1)		
07/30/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from W. Smith regarding iListen transaction, correspondence to W. Smith regarding same, correspondence to committee regarding same, and review correspondence from K. Curry and C. Johnson regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
07/31/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from W. Smith regarding iLearn transaction, correspondence to committee regarding same, review committee comments regarding same, correspondence to W. Smith regarding same (.6); review multiple correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding same, correspondence to/from committee regarding same, correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding same (.5)	1.10	737.00
08/16/13	T. Hwang	Conferences J. Murray regarding settlement subcommittee (.1); investigation regarding same, regarding communications to S. Anhalt (.1); review correspondences S. Anhalt regarding potential settlement (.1)	0.30	126.00
08/16/13	J. Murray	Review further correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding requests of settlement subcommittee, correspondence to subcommittee regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
08/16/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding meeting of settlement subcommittee (.1); multiple correspondence to/from settlement subcommittee regarding same and commence preparation of response to S. Anhalt (.7); correspondence to/from S.	1.10	737.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 168

Kb

Settlements

		Kim regarding same (.1); correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding meeting of subcommittee, correspondence to subcommittee regarding same (.2)		
08/17/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference with settlement subcommittee and debtor's representatives regarding settlement and license agreement with Kyocera (.9); correspondence to D. Leckrone regarding same (.3)	1.20	804.00
08/19/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to/from P. Marcoux, G. Felcyn, C. Johnson and D. Wright regarding Kyrocera license (.1); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.1); review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding correspondence regarding Kyocera consent, multiple correspondence to C. Cavazos regarding same (.2)	0.40	268.00
08/20/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding Kyrocera license agreement and miscellaneous regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
08/26/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from debtor and committee regarding meeting of settlement subcommittee (.4)	0.40	268.00
08/26/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding meeting of settlement subcommittee (.1)	0.10	67.00
09/03/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding disposition of Amazon settlement funds (.1)	0.10	67.00
09/03/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding conference call with settlement subcommittee regarding Amazon and correspondence to/from subcommittee regarding same (.1); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.1); prepare for	1.70	1,139.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 169

Kb

Settlements

conference call with debtor regarding Amazon settlement (.2); correspondence to sub committee regarding post-meeting call (.1); attend conference call with subcommittee and debtor regarding settlement with Amazon (.4); telephone conference with subcommittee regarding same (.2); multiple correspondence to/from debtor regarding extent of proposed license (.2); review correspondence from K. Beresford regarding same (.1); review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding Amazon and correspondence to subcommittee regarding same (.1); commence preparation of correspondence to D. Leckrone regarding subcommittee's approval of Amazon settlement (.2)

09/04/13 T. Hwang	Review correspondence J. Murray and R. Harris regarding potential settlement, regarding settlement subcommittee (.1); evaluation order regarding settlement procedures and Committee bylaws (.2); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.40	168.00
09/04/13 R. Franklin	Review Bylaws and settlement protocol order regarding procedures to obtain Creditor Committee approval (.3)	0.30	153.00
09/04/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding a meeting with the settlement subcommittee (.1); multiple correspondence to/from the settlement subcommittee regarding same, correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.2); multiple correspondence to/from J. Otteson regarding same (.1); correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding same (.1); review correspondence from R. Harris	0.90	603.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 170

Kb

Settlements

		regarding same (.1); correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding whether subcommittee can act with two members, and multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.3)		
09/04/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from K. Beresford regarding communications with debtor regarding Amazon (.2); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding Amazon, review correspondence from M. Brown regarding same, correspondence to F. Felcyn regarding same (.1); correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding same (.1)	0.40	268.00
09/04/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding her questions / concerns regarding Amazon proposal, review correspondence from C. Johnson regarding same (.1); review correspondence from K. Beresford to debtor regarding same (.1); review correspondence between K. Beresford and S. Anhalt regarding Amazon proposal, and attachment, and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2); review correspondence from M. Brown regarding same (.1)	0.50	335.00
09/05/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from K. Beresford, G. Felcyn and M. Brown regarding regarding Amazon (.1); review correspondence from K. Beresford regarding attendance at subcommittee conference call (.1); review debtor's slides regarding settlements with Acer and Amazon (.2); conference call with debtor and settlement subcommittee regarding Amazon and Acer settlements (.7); conference call settlement subcommittee regarding same, and correspondence	2.20	1,474.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 171

Kb

Settlements

to/from K. Beresford regarding same (.3);
 telephone conference with H. Binder
 regarding same (.3); telephone conference
 with S. Anhalt regarding same (.2);
 multiple correspondence to/from S. Anhalt
 regarding same (.2); correspondence to
 committee regarding committee
 conference call (.1)

09/06/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondence J. Murray to S. Anhalt regarding contacts with subcommittee, regarding Green Arrays issue; memorandum J. Murray regarding same	0.10	42.00
11/12/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding conference call with licensing subcommittee regarding Acer, multiple correspondence to/from subcommittee regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
11/13/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from licensing subcommittee regarding conference call with Debtor to discuss settlement with Acer (.2); multiple correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding licensing subcommittee conference call regarding Acer (.1); review materials received from debtor regarding proposed transaction with Acer, attend conference call with debtor and licensing subcommittee regarding same (1.4); conference call subcommittee regarding same (.5); telephone conference with H. Binder regarding same (.2); correspondence to D. Leckrone regarding Creditors Committee's approval of Acer licensing transaction, correspondence to TPL regarding same, miscellaneous regarding same (.3)	2.70	1,809.00
11/13/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding subcommittee approval of Acer	0.10	67.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 172

Kb	Settlements		
	transaction (.1)		
11/19/13 R. Franklin	Review settlement protocol order for upcoming conference (.2)	0.20	102.00
11/19/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding proposed settlement with AMD regarding Fast Logic, multiple correspondence to/from committee regarding same (.4); correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding court order regarding settlements (.1); multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn and D. Wright regarding conference call to discuss response to S. Anhalts's proposed settlement with AMD regarding Fast Logic (.2); conference call G. Felcyn and D. Wright regarding same (.2); review court order regarding settlement procedures regarding proposed settlements with infringers (.2); correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding committee's response to proposed settlement with AMD regarding Fast Logic, correspondence to committee regarding same (.3)	1.40	938.00
11/19/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding settlement with SK Hynix (.1)	0.10	67.00
11/20/13 T. Hwang	Review correspondences Committee members, S. Anhalt and J. Murray regarding proposed settlements by debtor	0.10	42.00
11/20/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding licensing agreements, correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
11/20/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding Debtor's request for consent to license to AMD and Hynix, multiple correspondence to/from K. Beresford, P.	0.30	201.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 173

Kb

Settlements

Marcoux, S. Anhalt, B. Kirkendall, G. Felcyn, M. Brown and G. Kaplan regarding same (.3)

11/21/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding concern that debtor will consummate licenses without committee's consent, correspondence to debtor's counsel regarding same (.1); multiple conference calls with D. Wright regarding debtor's position regarding licensing (.4)	0.50	335.00
11/22/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from K. Beresford regarding Debtor's request for subcommittee conference call (.2)	0.20	134.00
11/26/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding ON Semiconductor proposed settlement, correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
11/28/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to H. Binder and R. Harris regarding debtor's compliance with court's order regarding settlements (.1)	0.10	67.00
11/29/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to H. Binder and R. Harris regarding debtor's compliance with court's order re settlements (.3)	0.30	201.00
11/29/13	J. Murray	Analysis and evaluation debtor's multiple requests for subcommittee meeting regarding proposed settlements, review correspondence regarding same, review court's order regarding same, correspondence to H. Binder and R. Harris regarding same (1.5)	1.50	1,005.00
12/02/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondence P. Marcoux and R. Franklin regarding Chipscale settlement agreement and Debtor payments, and review and evaluation settlement agreement (.2)	0.20	84.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 174

Kb	Settlements		
12/02/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence to/from R. Franklin and P. Marcoux regarding ChipScale settlement (.1)	0.10	67.00
12/05/13 T. Hwang	Review correspondences J. Murray, R. Harris regarding settlements (.1); review and evaluation order regarding settlement procedures (.2)	0.30	126.00
12/05/13 J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding litigation settlements (.3)	0.30	201.00
12/09/13 T. Hwang	Analysis and evaluation settlement procedures pleadings and orders, and review correspondences J. Murray and R. Franklin regarding Debtor's settlements (.4); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.3)	0.70	294.00
12/09/13 J. Murray	Commence preparation of correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding debtor's consummation of settlements without Creditors Committee consent, commence preparation of correspondence to R. Harris regarding same, correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (1.2); review multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding Creditors Committee conference call (.1)	1.30	871.00
12/10/13 T. Hwang	Review correspondences Committee members and J. Murray regarding case status, scheduling, Plan of Reorganization and Debtor's settlements (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1); review and analyze correspondence H. Binder and M. Brown regarding Debtor's settlements (.1)	0.40	168.00
12/10/13 R. Franklin	Review correspondence regarding settlement protocol and analysis and	1.00	510.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 175

Kb		Settlements		
		evaluation regarding settlements not approved by Creditors Committee (1.0)		
12/10/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from Creditors Committee regarding Debtor's violation of court order (1.8); correspondence to R. Harris regarding same (1.6); review, analysis and evaluation correspondence from H. Binder regarding same (.8)	4.20	2,814.00
12/15/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding settlements (.1)	0.10	67.00
12/18/13	T. Hwang	Investigation regarding settlement procedures order and meeting regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
12/18/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding correspondence from K. Beresford regarding settlements, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
Subtotal for		Settlements		38,635.00

Settlements				
Task	Timekeeper	Rate	Hours	Amount
Kb	John Murray	670	44.80	30,016.00
Kb	Robert Franklin	510	7.10	3,621.00
Kb	Thomas Hwang	420	11.90	4,998.00
Kb	Total		63.80	38,635.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

1 JOHN WALSHE MURRAY (074823)
ROBERT A. FRANKLIN (091653)
2 THOMAS T. HWANG (218678)
DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP
3 305 Lytton Avenue
Palo Alto, CA 94301
4 Telephone: (650) 857-1717
Facsimile: (650) 857-1288
5 Email: murray.john@dorsey.com
Email: franklin.robert@dorsey.com
6 Email: hwang.thomas@dorsey.com

7 Attorneys for Official
Committee of Unsecured Creditors

8
9 **UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT**
10 **NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA**
11 **SAN JOSE DIVISION**

12 In re:

13 **TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED LLC,**
14 **fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED**
15 **INC., A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**
16 **fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED,**
17 **A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**

18 Debtor.

Case No. 13-51589-SLJ-11

Chapter 11

Date: April 9, 2014

Time: 1:30 p.m.

Place: United States Bankruptcy Court
280 S. First Street, Room 3099
San Jose, CA 95113

Judge: Honorable Stephen L. Johnson

19 **EXHIBIT "T"**

20 **TO**

21 **FIRST APPLICATION FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES**
22 **BY ATTORNEYS FOR OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS**

23
24
25
26
27
28
EXHIBIT COVER

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 176

L		Cash Collateral		
04/05/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference R. Harris regarding cash collateral, etc (.4)	0.40	268.00
04/11/13	J. Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding Debtor's cash collateral budget (.2)	0.20	134.00
04/12/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from R. Harris regarding cash collateral (.1)	0.10	67.00
04/13/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding cash collateral motion, bylaws, NDA, etc. (.2)	0.20	134.00
04/13/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from R. Harris regarding request for Order Shortening Time regarding hearing regarding motion to use cash collateral; review Application regarding same (.5)	0.50	335.00
04/14/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference with R. Harris regarding cash collateral motion (.2)	0.20	134.00
04/16/13	T. Hwang	Review and analysis debtor's pleadings regarding cash collateral motion	0.20	84.00
04/16/13	R. Franklin	Review cash collateral motion, analysis and evaluation regarding potential issues and draft memorandum regarding same (2.5)	2.50	1,275.00
04/16/13	J. Murray	Review Debtors' Motion for Order Shortening Time regarding hearing on cash collateral Motion (.2); review cash collateral Motion (.5)	0.70	469.00
04/17/13	R. Franklin	Review cash collateral motion and prepare opposition thereto (2.0); finalize opposition (.4)	2.40	1,224.00
04/17/13	J. Murray	Continue preparation of objection to Cash Collateral Motion (.2)	0.20	134.00
04/17/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference R. Harris regarding cash collateral Motion (.2);	0.40	268.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 177

L		Cash Collateral		
		correspondence to and from R. Harris regarding carveout regarding same (.2)		
04/18/13	J. Murray	Prepare for hearing regarding Debtors' cash collateral Motion (1.0); attend same (3.2)	4.20	2,814.00
04/19/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to and from R. Harris, C. Hart and J. Ellahie regarding form of cash collateral Order (.2); review CD of cash collateral hearing and review and revise Order regarding same (1.9)	2.10	1,407.00
04/22/13	T. Hwang	Investigation regarding security interests in debtor; evaluation cash collateral motion regarding same (.4); exchange correspondences R. Harris regarding same; correspondence R. Franklin and J. Murray regarding same; review correspondence R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	0.60	252.00
04/22/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from R. Harris regarding cash collateral Order (.1); correspondence to C. Cavazos regarding comparing to markup (.1); analysis and evaluation regarding same (.1); correspondence to R. Harris regarding same (.1)	0.40	268.00
04/25/13	R. Franklin	Draft correspondence to R. Harris regarding status of cash collateral budget (.1)	0.10	51.00
04/25/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to and from R. Harris regarding status of cash collateral order (.2)	0.20	134.00
04/29/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from R. Harris regarding payments due under cash collateral order (.2)	0.20	134.00
04/30/13	T. Hwang	Evaluation and analysis regarding case status, regarding cash collateral, settlement	5.20	2,184.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 178

L

Cash Collateral

procedures and relief from stay matters (.3); review memoranda R. Franklin regarding same, and review and evaluation update and opposition pleadings (.5); legal research and investigation local and procedural rules regarding motion to seal documents (1.3); draft, revise same (2.9); meetings R. Franklin regarding same (.1); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)

05/02/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from attorney Harris regarding payments due under cash collateral Order (.1)	0.10	67.00
05/03/13	T. Hwang	Review and evaluation cash collateral budget (.2); review memoranda R. Franklin regarding same and review comments from G. Felcyn, P. Marcoux regarding same (.4)	0.60	252.00
05/03/13	R. Franklin	Review supplemental Hannah declaration and long term budget (1.4); review comments from G. Felcyn and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.4); telephone conference with R. Harris regarding budget (.2) review UCC filings (.2); review correspondence P. Marcoux regarding cash collateral budget (.2); interoffice conference J. Murray regarding budget (.2); draft correspondence to R. Harris requesting further information and clarification of line items in budget (.6)	3.20	1,632.00
05/03/13	J. Murray	Review Debtor's proposed cash collateral budget (.4); interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same (.1); correspondence to R. Harris and H. Binder regarding same (.1); telephone conference R. Harris regarding same (.2); interoffice R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	1.00	670.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 179

L		Cash Collateral		
05/03/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to and from Creditors' Committee regarding Debtor's cash collateral budget (.2)	0.20	134.00
05/05/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding cash collateral motion (.4)	0.40	268.00
05/05/13	T. Hwang	Review memoranda J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding cash collateral motion, case strategy; correspondence R. Franklin regarding same; review correspondence G. Felcyn regarding same; (.2)	0.20	84.00
05/06/13	T. Hwang	Review memoranda R. Franklin and correspondence from R. Harris regarding cash collateral budget items (.1)	0.10	42.00
05/06/13	R. Franklin	Review correspondence G. Felcyn and J. Murray regarding expenditures and revenues and review budget regarding same (.4)	0.40	204.00
05/07/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding cash collateral motion (.1); review and evaluation correspondences J. Ellahie and R. Franklin regarding cash collateral motion (.1); draft and revise opposition to same (2.2); memoranda R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	2.50	1,050.00
05/07/13	R. Franklin	Review correspondence R. Harris regarding cash collateral budget and draft correspondence Committee regarding same (.4); analysis and evaluation regarding issues and opposition (.3); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding opposition to motion for use of cash collateral (.1); interoffice conference J. Murray regarding status (.1); draft correspondence to R. Harris regarding issues and requests for information (.4); initial reviews of	2.90	1,479.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 180

L	Cash Collateral		
	documents evidencing claims of alleged secured creditors (1.0); commence review and revision of supplemental opposition to motion for use of cash collateral (.6)		
05/07/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to and from R. Harris regarding status of payments per cash collateral Order (.1); correspondence to and from M. O'Leary regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
05/08/13 R. Franklin	Review budget and supplemental Hannah Declaration and Committee comments and continue preparation of opposition to cash collateral motion (3.4); conference call S. Anhalt, N. Antonopolous and W. Smith regarding Venkidu Transaction (.4); interoffice conference J. Murray regarding cash collateral hearing and strategy related thereto (.2); analysis and evaluation regarding Venkidu secured claim (.8); review Stipulations for use of cash collateral (.8)	5.60	2,856.00
05/08/13 J. Murray	Review Stipulation between Debtor and CCC regarding use of cash collateral (.8); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.2); review objection of United States Trustee regarding same (.2); review Debtor's proposed cash collateral budget (.2); correspondence to R. Harris regarding same (.2); prepare hearing regarding contract motion (.5); correspondence to and from R. Franklin regarding Venkidu security interest (.4)	2.50	1,675.00
05/09/13 J. Murray	Review message from K. Prochnow regarding cash collateral hearing and correspondence to K. Prochnow regarding meeting (.2)	0.20	134.00
05/09/13 T. Hwang	Review correspondences S. Anhalt and P. Marcoux regarding production of	0.10	42.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 181

L	Cash Collateral		
	documents, cash collateral budget; review correspondence J. Murray to J. Ellahie, R. Harris regarding cash collateral hearing, regarding adequate protection payments (.1)		
05/09/13 T. Hwang	Evaluation stipulation regarding cash collateral, regarding Vendiku claim (.2); review correspondence R. Franklin regarding same and meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
05/09/13 T. Hwang	Correspondence D. Wright regarding cash collateral opposition; review correspondences G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
05/09/13 R. Franklin	Prepare for hearing and review recently filed pleadings supporting use of cash collateral (1.3); attend hearing (1.5); post-hearing conferences with R. Harris and J. Ellahie, and with M. Brown, C. Brown and S. Kim (1.0); review and revise cash collateral order (.2)	4.00	2,040.00
05/09/13 J. Murray	Prepare for hearing regarding Debtor's Motion to use cash collateral (.5); attend same (3.5); analysis and review regarding results of hearing (.5); correspondence to R. Harris regarding informational requests and cash collateral hearing (.9)	5.40	3,618.00
05/13/13 R. Franklin	Review revised cash collateral order and call with R. Harris regarding same (.3)	0.30	153.00
05/17/13 T. Hwang	Investigation regarding scheduling and case status, regarding cash collateral hearing and motion to reject hearing (.1)	0.10	42.00
05/20/13 T. Hwang	Meeting J. Murray and R. Franklin regarding case status, regarding cash collateral and debtor's rejection motion (.2)	0.20	84.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 182

L		Cash Collateral	
05/21/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to J. Ellahie regarding cash collateral issues (.2); telephone conference J. Ellahie regarding same (.1)	0.30 201.00
05/22/13	T. Hwang	Evaluation and analysis Debtor's monthly operating report and cash collateral budgets and orders (.4); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1); review correspondences S. Kim and G. Felcyn regarding same; correspondence S. Kim and G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.60 252.00
05/24/13	R. Franklin	Interoffice conference regarding cash collateral motion with J. Murray (.3); telephone conference with R. Harris and J. Murray regarding same (.3)	0.60 306.00
05/28/13	R. Franklin	Draft correspondence requesting additional documents regarding line items in cash collateral budget (.6); analysis and evaluation regarding response to motion and issues (.6); draft objection to cash collateral motion (3.0)	4.20 2,142.00
05/29/13	R. Franklin	Continue preparation of Opposition to cash collateral motion (1.8)	1.80 918.00
05/30/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from R. Harris regarding proposal to Vinkedu regarding cash collateral (.1); interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same (.1); review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding proposal to Venkidu et al. regarding same and correspondence to all regarding same (.2)	0.40 268.00
05/30/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondence R. Franklin and legal research regarding use of cash collateral and regarding fraudulent conveyance matters (1.2); meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1); review and revise opposition regarding cash collateral	2.50 1,050.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 183

L	Cash Collateral		
	motion (1.1); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)		
05/30/13 R. Franklin	Continue preparation of opposition to cash collateral motion (1.2); detailed telephone conference R. Harris regarding adequate protection Stipulation (.2); draft correspondence J. Ellahie regarding same (.1)	1.50	765.00
05/31/13 R. Franklin	Interoffice conference with J. Murray regarding cash collateral budget and issues regarding negotiation of stipulated order (.3); multiple detailed telephone conferences R. Harris and J. Murray regarding same (.6); telephone conference with R. Harris regarding status of cash collateral negotiations (.1); review and analyze proposals and respond (.4); review and revise opposition to cash collateral motion and prepare for filing (1.2)	2.60	1,326.00
05/31/13 J. Murray	Analysis and evaluation multiple correspondence from R. Harris regarding proposal to Venkidu regarding cash collateral and adequate protection payments (.4); multiple telephone conferences with R. Harris regarding same (.3); review correspondence from R. Harris regarding same (.1); interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding objection to cash collateral motion regarding payments to Vinkedu (.1); review, analysis and evaluation correspondence from J. Ellahie regarding same (.2); review correspondence to J. Ellahie regarding same (.1); review correspondence from R. Harris regarding same (.1); regarding correspondence from R. Harris regarding new proposal; interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same; respond to same	1.80	1,206.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 184

L
Cash Collateral

		(.3); review correspondence from R. Harris regarding same (.1); review correspondence from J. Ellahie regarding same (.1)		
06/01/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence from R. Harris, J. Ellahie and S. Anhalt regarding negotiation of cash collateral order (.3); correspondence to committee regarding terms of resolution of cash collateral issues (2.1); correspondence to R. Harris regarding same (.2)	2.60	1,742.00
06/02/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences J. Murray, M. Brown, G. Kaplan regarding cash collateral issues, status of negotiations with Debtor and S. Venkidu (.1)	0.10	42.00
06/02/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to /from G. Kaplan regarding cash collateral order (.6); review correspondence between R. Harris and J. Ellahie regarding same (.2)	0.80	536.00
06/03/13	R. Franklin	Review status of agreement on use of cash collateral (.4) review and revise order for use of cash collateral with multiple calls and emails exchanging comments (1.0); conference call with R. Harris, S. Anhalt and D. Hannah regarding finalization of order and calculation of amounts authorized (.4); analysis and evaluation regarding same (.1)	1.90	969.00
06/03/13	J. Murray	Correspondence R. Harris regarding cash collateral order (.1); telephone conference with R. Harris regarding same (.1); interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same (.1); review form of order regarding use of cash collateral (.5); multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding same (.2); multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin	1.20	804.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 185

L		Cash Collateral		
		regarding same (.2)		
06/04/13	R. Franklin	Review versions of cash collateral final order (.4); draft correspondence and telephone conference with R. Harris regarding same (.3); prepare for and attend hearing on motion and conference with R. Harris regarding Ford controversy and finalization of cash collateral order (2.8)	3.50	1,785.00
06/04/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from R. Harris regarding cash collateral budget and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2); continue preparation for hearing on debtor's motion to use cash collateral (.2); attend same; post-hearing meeting with R. Harris regarding form of order (2.7); review multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding form of order regarding cash collateral (.2)	3.30	2,211.00
06/05/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/fr K. Beresford regarding hearing on motion to use cash collateral, etc. (.1)	0.10	67.00
06/10/13	R. Franklin	Correspondence with R. Harris regarding cash collateral (.1); review and revise order and send to R. Harris with comments (1.2)	1.30	663.00
06/10/13	J. Murray	Review revised Order regarding cash collateral and interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same (.2); review correspondence to R. Harris regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
06/12/13	R. Franklin	Correspondence with R. Harris regarding cash collateral order and review same (.3)	0.30	153.00
06/12/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding cash collateral order (.1); review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 186

L		Cash Collateral	
06/13/13	T. Hwang	Review Debtor's proposed cash collateral order (.1)	0.10 42.00
06/13/13	R. Franklin	Correspondence with R. Harris regarding form of cash collateral order (.2) review drafts and comment (.3)	0.50 255.00
06/13/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding cash collateral order (.2)	0.20 134.00
06/14/13	R. Franklin	Telephone conference R. Harris regarding cash collateral order and Fastlogic settlement (.2)	0.20 102.00
06/17/13	R. Franklin	Review revised cash collateral budget (.4); detailed telephone conference R. Harris regarding same (.3); analysis and evaluation regarding same (.4)	1.10 561.00
06/18/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding cash collateral order (.1); review correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding revised cash collateral budget (.2); correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.40 268.00
06/18/13	R. Franklin	Review cash collateral order (.2); correspondence with J. Murray and R. Harris regarding issues and corrections to budget (.5)	0.70 357.00
06/19/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding cash collateral budget (.2)	0.20 134.00
06/19/13	R. Franklin	Detailed telephone conference with R. Harris regarding cash collateral budget and issues revolving around carve-outs for Ropers and Hess (.3); review budget (.2)	0.50 255.00
06/21/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence regarding wire transfer regarding carve out from cash collateral budget; correspondence M.	0.20 134.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 187

L		Cash Collateral		
		O'Leary regarding same; correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding same (.2)		
06/24/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from R. Harris regarding Vinkedu adequate protection payment (.1); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
06/25/13	J. Murray	Review Debtor's revised cash collateral budget (.4); correspondence to R. Harris regarding same (.1)	0.50	335.00
06/25/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding revised cash collateral budget (.2)	0.20	134.00
07/10/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to R. Harris regarding July payment of carve out (.2)	0.20	134.00
07/11/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Harris regarding carve out payment (.1)	0.10	67.00
07/16/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from E. Keller regarding cash collateral Stipulation (.1)	0.10	67.00
08/05/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to H. Binder and R. Harris regarding payment of August carve out (.1)	0.10	67.00
08/09/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding budget, review budget and correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding same (.2); review court docket regarding orders granting use of cash collateral and budgets (.7); correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding August carve out payment (.1)	1.00	670.00
08/13/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding August carve out, correspondence to M. O'Leary regarding same (.1); multiple correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding August carve out (.1)	0.20	134.00
08/14/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from M.	0.70	469.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 188

L	Cash Collateral		
	O'Leary regarding cash collateral careout payments (.2); analysis and evaluation regarding court orders regarding use of cash collateral (.5)		
08/20/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Harris regarding October carve out (.1)	0.10	67.00
09/04/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding payment of September carve out (.1)	0.10	67.00
09/10/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to H. Binder regarding status of carve out payment (.1)	0.10	67.00
09/13/13 J. Murray	Telephone conference with R. Harris regarding cash collateral motion and exclusivity (.1)	0.10	67.00
09/15/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to H. Binder regarding September carve out payment (.1)	0.10	67.00
09/16/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Harris regarding September carve out payment (.1)	0.10	67.00
09/17/13 J. Murray	Telephone conference with R. Harris regarding September carve out payment (.1)	0.10	67.00
09/19/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to H. Binder regarding status of payment of September carve out (.1)	0.10	67.00
09/20/13 J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding cash collateral budget and cash collateral hearing (.1)	0.10	67.00
09/21/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from team regarding cash collateral hearing (.1)	0.10	67.00
09/23/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from R. Harris regarding payment of September carve out, review debtor's Monthly Operating Report regarding cash balance, and review cash collateral order (.3); correspondence to R.	0.40	268.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 189

L	Cash Collateral		
	Franklin and T. Hwang regarding next cash collateral hearing (.1)		
10/02/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding cash collateral budget and hearing (.1)	0.10	67.00
10/09/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding cash collateral budget, review same, review correspondence to committee regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
10/23/13 T. Hwang	Review correspondence from R. Harris and proposed cash collateral budget (.1); investigation regarding same, and memoranda R. Franklin regarding same (.3)	0.40	168.00
10/23/13 R. Franklin	Review cash collateral budget for Nov-February (.3)	0.30	153.00
10/24/13 R. Franklin	Review response from R. Harris regarding line items on cash collateral budget (.1); draft correspondence Creditors Committee regarding approval of cash collateral budget (.2)	0.30	153.00
10/24/13 J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence from R. Harris regarding cash collateral budget, review correspondence to committee regarding same, review budget (.2)	0.20	134.00
10/28/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence to/from committee regarding debtor's proposed cash collateral budget and objection to motion to use cash collateral (.2)	0.20	134.00
10/29/13 R. Franklin	Conference call with R. Harris, S. Anhalt and D. Hannah regarding cash collateral budget (.3); review and respond to multiple correspondence R. Harris regarding preliminary cash collateral hearing and budget issues (.5)	0.80	408.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 190

L		Cash Collateral	
10/30/13	R. Franklin	Review cash collateral issues and detailed telephone conferences and correspondence with R. Harris regarding same (.7)	0.70 357.00
10/30/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to/from committee regarding hearings on debtor's motion to use cash collateral and extend exclusivity (.1)	0.10 67.00
10/31/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences R. Franklin, G. Felcyn regarding cash collateral budget; meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.10 42.00
10/31/13	R. Franklin	Review and respond to correspondence G. Felcyn regarding cash collateral hearing (.2); prepare for hearing (.5); attend hearing on motion (2.0)	2.70 1,377.00
10/31/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding debtor's motion to use cash collateral (.2)	0.20 134.00
11/01/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding cash collateral hearing (.1)	0.10 67.00
11/01/13	T. Hwang	Meeting R. Franklin regarding case status; review Court minute entry regarding use of cash collateral (.1)	0.10 42.00
11/05/13	R. Franklin	Review budget and analysis and evaluation regarding Opposition to cash collateral motion (.5); draft correspondence R. Harris regarding information requested (.8)	1.30 663.00
11/06/13	R. Franklin	Prepare for call with G. Felcyn (.2); conference call J. Murray, G. Felcyn, C. Johnson, D. Wright regarding opposition to cash collateral and motion to terminate exclusivity and supporting evidence (.8); analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	1.20 612.00
11/06/13	R. Franklin	Review Monthly Operating Reports and other evidence preparatory to filing Opposition to motion to use cash collateral	1.00 510.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 191

L	Cash Collateral		
	(.8); commence preparation of opposition to cash collateral motion(.2)		
11/08/13 T. Hwang	Review correspondences D. Wright, J. Murray regarding cash collateral, case strategy (.1)	0.10	42.00
11/08/13 R. Franklin	Review cash collateral issues and expense line items with Committee's comments thereto (.7); draft Opposition to cash collateral motion (.8); detailed telephone conference R. Harris regarding same (.2)	1.70	867.00
11/10/13 J. Murray	Review detailed correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding grounds for objecting to cash collateral Motion (.2)	0.20	134.00
11/12/13 R. Franklin	Review comments of committee, cash collateral budget, information from Debtor and draft opposition to cash collateral motion (3.5)	3.50	1,785.00
11/12/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding continuance of final cash collateral hearing and hearings on employment Applications of Heller and Henneman (.2)	0.20	134.00
11/13/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from H. Binder and R. Harris regarding continuance of cash collateral hearing (.1)	0.10	67.00
11/13/13 J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from H. Binder and R. Harris regarding continuance of cash collateral hearing (.2)	0.20	134.00
11/18/13 J. Murray	Review court docket regarding entry of cash collateral order (.1); telephone conference with R. Harris regarding cash collateral hearing (.2); multiple correspondence to/from correspondence R. Harris and T. Bracegirdle regarding continued hearing regarding cash collateral	0.50	335.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 192

L	Cash Collateral		
	(.1); review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding objection to cash collateral motion, review correspondence from P.Marcoux regarding same (.1)		
11/19/13 R. Franklin	Review comments from Committee members regarding draft of opposition to use of cash collateral (.4)	0.40	204.00
11/19/13 J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding cash collateral hearing (.2)	0.20	134.00
11/19/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from R. Harris regarding form of cash collateral order, review same (.3); review message from D. Wright regarding objection to cash collateral Motion (.1)	0.40	268.00
11/20/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding objection to Debtor's continued use of cash collateral (.1)	0.10	67.00
11/27/13 R. Franklin	Finalize objection to use of cash collateral (1.1)	1.10	561.00
12/01/13 J. Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding cash collateral order entered on 11/25, compare to earlier versions (.2)	0.20	134.00
12/02/13 T. Hwang	Review correspondences J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding payment of carve-out, and memoranda J. Murray regarding same (.2); review cash collateral order regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
12/02/13 J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding debtor's compliance with cash collateral order (.3); review multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and Creditors Committee regarding objection to debtor's cash collateral motion and Disclosure Statement (.2); review consent of Creditors	0.60	402.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 193

L		Cash Collateral		
		Committee regarding cash collateral motion (.1)		
12/03/13	J. Murray	Review consent of CCC to cash collateral Motion (.1)	0.10	67.00
12/04/13	T. Hwang	Attend (telephonically) hearing on cash collateral and employment applications of Heller and Henneman (1.1); review and analysis budget and Debtor's reply regarding cash collateral (.2); review correspondence G. Felcyn regarding same, and review memoranda J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	1.40	588.00
12/04/13	R. Franklin	Prepare for cash collateral hearing and review Reply brief (1.5); attend hearing (.5)	2.00	1,020.00
12/04/13	R. Franklin	Draft correspondence Creditors Committee regarding 12-4 hearings regarding cash collateral, etc. (.3)	0.30	153.00
12/04/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding hearings (.1); attend hearing (telephonically) debtor's cash collateral motion and employment applications (1.8); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding form of cash collateral Order (.1); correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding hearing, correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (1.7)	3.70	2,479.00
01/11/14	J. Murray	Correspondence to H. Binder regarding debtor's compliance with cash collateral order regarding payments of carve outs (.1)	0.10	67.00
02/20/14	J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding expiration of cash collateral order (.1)	0.10	67.00
02/20/14	J. Murray	Correspondence to H. Binder regarding cash collateral order compliance and carve	0.10	67.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 194

L		Cash Collateral		
		out (.1)		
02/21/14	J. Murray	Correspondence to H. Binder regarding cash collateral order and debtor's compliance with carve outs (.1)	0.10	67.00
02/25/14	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding status of cash collateral order, review correspondence to R. Harris regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
02/26/14	T. Hwang	Investigation regarding use of cash collateral, regarding budget; review correspondences R. Franklin, J. Murray regarding same (.1); memoranda J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.20	84.00
02/26/14	R. Franklin	Review status of cash collateral budget and telephone conference with R. Harris regarding same	0.20	102.00
02/26/14	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding expiration of cash collateral order, review correspondence to R. Harris regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
02/28/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence to R. Harris regarding continued use of cash collateral (.1)	0.10	67.00
Subtotal for		Cash Collateral		67,442.00

Cash Collateral

Task	Timekeeper	Rate	Hours	Amount
L	John Murray	670	45.20	30,284.00
L	Robert Franklin	510	59.60	30,396.00
L	Thomas Hwang	420	16.10	6,762.00
L	Total		120.90	67,442.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY