

1 JOHN WALSH MURRAY (074823)
ROBERT A. FRANKLIN (091653)
2 THOMAS T. HWANG (218678)
DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP
3 305 Lytton Avenue
Palo Alto, CA 94301
4 Telephone: (650) 857-1717
Facsimile: (650) 857-1288
5 Email: murray.john@dorsey.com
Email: franklin.robert@dorsey.com
6 Email: hwang.thomas@dorsey.com

7 Attorneys for Official
Committee of Unsecured Creditors
8

9 **UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT**
10 **NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA**
11 **SAN JOSE DIVISION**

12 In re:

13 **TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED LLC,**
14 **fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED**
15 **INC., A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**
16 **fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED,**
17 **A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**

18 Debtor.

Case No. 13-51589-SLJ-11

Chapter 11

Date: April 9, 2014

Time: 1:30 p.m.

Place: United States Bankruptcy Court
280 S. First Street, Room 3099
San Jose, CA 95113

Judge: Honorable Stephen L. Johnson

19 **EXHIBIT "E"**

20 **TO**

21 **FIRST APPLICATION FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES**
22 **BY ATTORNEYS FOR OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS**

23
24
25
26
27
28
EXHIBIT COVER

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 44

Bc		Committee Meeting Minutes		
04/08/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from E. Darda regarding attendance at Creditors' Committee telephone conference regarding recording minutes (.2)	0.20	134.00
04/09/13	J. Murray	Prepare minutes regarding Creditor telephone conference call (.8)	0.80	536.00
04/10/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference with with D. Wright regarding Creditors' Committee meeting minutes (.2)	0.20	134.00
04/11/13	E. Darda	Prepare minutes of creditors' committee conference	0.40	120.00
04/14/13	E. Darda	Revise committee conference minutes	0.30	90.00
04/17/13	E. Darda	Prepare minutes of committee call	0.90	270.00
04/17/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding minutes of Creditors' Committee meeting of April 10 (.1)	0.10	67.00
04/24/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding minutes of 4/17/13 Creditors' Committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
04/25/13	E. Darda	Emails with T. Hwang, J. Murray and R. Franklin regarding committee minutes	0.20	60.00
04/25/13	T. Hwang	Draft minutes to Committee meeting	1.30	546.00
04/25/13	E. Darda	Revise committee minutes	0.40	120.00
04/26/13	T. Hwang	Continue preparation of meeting minutes (1.4); memorandum J. Murray and R. Franklin regarding same (.3); correspondence Committee regarding same; review correspondence C. Brown regarding same (.1); review memorandum from R. Franklin regarding same, regarding action items (.1)	1.90	798.00
04/26/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from R. Franklin	0.10	67.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 45

Bc		Committee Meeting Minutes		
		and T. Hwang regarding Creditors' Committee meeting minutes (.1)		
05/02/13	T. Hwang	Draft committee meeting minutes (2.4)	2.40	1,008.00
05/04/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding preparation of minutes of Creditors' Committee meeting 5/1/13 (.1)	0.10	67.00
05/08/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondence R. Franklin and continue preparation of meeting minutes (.3)	0.30	126.00
05/08/13	R. Franklin	Review and revise May 1 committee meeting minutes (.3)	0.30	153.00
05/13/13	T. Hwang	Draft minutes of May 10 Committee meeting (2.1); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	2.20	924.00
05/14/13	T. Hwang	Revise committee meeting minutes (.2)	0.20	84.00
05/14/13	R. Franklin	Review and revise minutes of committee meeting (.5)	0.50	255.00
05/14/13	R. Franklin	Review action items and revise agenda for meeting (.5)	0.50	255.00
05/17/13	T. Hwang	Draft minutes for May 15 committee meeting (2.3)	2.30	966.00
05/20/13	T. Hwang	Draft, revise, finalize minutes from May 15 committee meeting (.3)	0.30	126.00
05/24/13	T. Hwang	Draft minutes regarding May 22 meeting (3.1); investigation regarding prior minutes and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	3.20	1,344.00
05/24/13	R. Franklin	Review and revise minutes of Committee meeting (.4)	0.40	204.00
05/24/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from T. Hwang regarding minutes of Creditor's Committee meeting May 22 (.1); correspondence to team regarding minutes of April meetings,	0.30	201.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 46

Bc		Committee Meeting Minutes		
		analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)		
05/26/13	J. Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding Creditors' Committee meeting minutes (.3); commence review of minutes and review and revise action items memorandum (1.0)	1.30	871.00
05/27/13	J. Murray	Continue review of minutes and preparation of action item memorandum (3.0)	3.00	2,010.00
05/31/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from C. Cavozos regarding preparation of minutes of committee meetings (.2)	0.20	134.00
06/04/13	R. Franklin	Review and revise minutes of meeting (.4)	0.40	204.00
06/04/13	J. Murray	Continue preparation for committee meeting (.3)	0.30	201.00
06/08/13	T. Hwang	Prepare minutes for June 3 meeting (1.0)	1.00	420.00
06/10/13	T. Hwang	Prepare, revise minutes for June 3 meeting (2.1); memoranda R. Franklin and J. Murray regarding same (.1)	2.20	924.00
06/10/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from T. Hwang and R. Franklin regarding minutes of June 4 committee meeting (.2)	0.20	134.00
06/19/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding minutes of committee meeting; review correspondence to committee regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
06/19/13	T. Hwang	Draft, revise minutes for June 13 meeting (2.3)	2.30	966.00
06/20/13	T. Hwang	Correspondence J. Murray regarding meeting minutes	0.10	42.00
06/20/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding minutes of committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 47

Bc		Committee Meeting Minutes	
06/21/13	T. Hwang	Exchange correspondences M. Brown regarding meeting minutes; correspondence Committee regarding same (.1); revise meeting minutes (.1); prepare minutes of June 21 meeting (1.9)	2.10 882.00
06/21/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding revised minutes of committee meeting (.1)	0.10 67.00
06/23/13	T. Hwang	Prepare minutes of Committee meeting (.3)	0.30 126.00
06/24/13	T. Hwang	Prepare, finalize minutes of Committee meeting (.3); memoranda J. Murray regarding same; correspondence to Committee regarding same (.1)	0.40 168.00
06/24/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding minutes of committee meeting (.1)	0.10 67.00
06/24/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding minutes of committee meeting (.1)	0.10 67.00
06/25/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding meeting minutes (.1)	0.10 67.00
06/27/13	T. Hwang	Review and evaluation notes and correspondence M. Brown regarding meeting minutes; revise meeting minutes (.3); correspondence G. Felcyn regarding same; correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.40 168.00
06/30/13	T. Hwang	Prepare minutes for Committee meeting; memorandum J. Murray regarding same	2.00 840.00
07/01/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding minutes of committee meeting (.1)	0.10 67.00
07/11/13	T. Hwang	Draft minutes for July 2 meeting (3.3)	3.30 1,386.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 48

Bc		Committee Meeting Minutes	
07/12/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding revised minutes of last meeting (.1)	0.10 67.00
07/12/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences M. Brown, G. Felcyn regarding minutes for July 2 meeting, and revise same (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same, regarding accountant interviews for July 12 meeting (.1); draft minutes for July 12 meeting (1.8); meetings and memorandum to J. Murray regarding same (.1)	2.10 882.00
07/17/13	R. Franklin	Review July 12 minutes and status of action items (.5)	0.50 255.00
07/17/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding minutes of committee meeting (.1)	0.10 67.00
07/17/13	T. Hwang	Prepare minutes of July 12 meeting (1.7)	1.70 714.00
07/18/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding minutes of last committee meeting (.1)	0.10 67.00
07/18/13	J. Murray	Review minutes of last committee meeting (.3)	0.30 201.00
07/19/13	T. Hwang	Memorandum J. Murray regarding July 12 meeting minutes; correspondence Committee members regarding same; evaluation memorandum R. Franklin regarding same, regarding action items (.2); draft minutes regarding creditor meeting of July 19, 2013 (2.7); telephone conference with R. Franklin regarding creditor meeting of July 19, 2013; memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	3.00 1,260.00
07/19/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding minutes of last committee	0.20 134.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 49

Bc		Committee Meeting Minutes		
		meeting (.1); review correspondence to committee regarding minutes of last meeting (.1)		
07/22/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondence M. Brown regarding July 12 meeting minutes; revise same; correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
07/22/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence from T. Hwang regarding minutes of last committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
07/25/13	T. Hwang	Draft minutes of July 25, 2013 creditor meeting (1.5)	1.50	630.00
07/25/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding status of minutes of committee meetings (.2)	0.20	134.00
07/26/13	T. Hwang	Draft minutes of July 25 meeting (2.0)	2.00	840.00
07/29/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding minutes of last committee meeting (.1); review correspondence from T. Hwang to committee regarding minutes of meetings and correspondence to T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
07/29/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondence J. Murray regarding meeting minutes and correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
07/30/13	T. Hwang	Prepare minutes regarding creditor meeting of July 30, 2013 (3.3); exchange memorandum R. Franklin regarding same and correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	3.40	1,428.00
07/31/13	T. Hwang	Meeting R. Franklin regarding meeting minutes and comments to Debtor's plan (.1); revise minutes and prepare redline; correspondence Committee regarding same	0.30	126.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 50

Bc		Committee Meeting Minutes	
		(.2)	
07/31/13	R. Franklin	Review minutes of July 29 meeting (.4); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.50 255.00
07/31/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding minutes of committee meeting; review same (.5)	0.50 335.00
08/02/13	R. Franklin	Review minutes of 7.30.13 Committee meeting and prepare bullet points of items discussed (.7); analysis and evaluation issues (.2)	0.90 459.00
08/11/13	T. Hwang	Draft minutes from August 7 Committee meeting (1.4)	1.40 588.00
08/14/13	T. Hwang	Draft minutes from August 7 Committee meeting (1.5)	1.50 630.00
08/14/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding minutes of 8/13/13 (.1)	0.10 67.00
08/19/13	T. Hwang	Draft minutes for August 13 Committee meeting (.3)	0.30 126.00
08/20/13	T. Hwang	Prepare minutes from August 13 Committee meeting (3.7)	3.70 1,554.00
08/21/13	T. Hwang	Prepare minutes from August 13 Committee meeting (1.5); memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	1.60 672.00
08/23/13	T. Hwang	Prepare minutes regarding August 16 meeting (3.8)	3.80 1,596.00
08/24/13	T. Hwang	Prepare minutes regarding August 16 meeting (.5)	0.50 210.00
08/26/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding minutes of last 2 meetings, and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.20 134.00
08/28/13	T. Hwang	Prepare meeting minutes from August 16 meeting (.4)	0.40 168.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 51

Bc		Committee Meeting Minutes	
08/29/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences G. Felcyn, M. Brown, P. Marcoux, and revise Minutes from prior meetings (.3); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1); draft minutes for August 16 meeting (3.4)	3.80 1,596.00
08/30/13	T. Hwang	Continue preparation of minutes for August 16 meeting (.9); review correspondence M. Brown regarding minutes and revise minutes for July 25 meeting (.2); review correspondence G. Felcyn regarding meeting minutes and correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	1.20 504.00
09/01/13	T. Hwang	Review and respond correspondence M. Brown regarding meeting Minutes, and revise Minutes for August 16 meeting; correspondence Committee regarding same (.2)	0.20 84.00
09/06/13	T. Hwang	Prepare meeting minutes for September 6 meeting (3.3)	3.30 1,386.00
09/08/13	T. Hwang	Draft meeting minutes for September 6 meeting	0.40 168.00
09/09/13	J. Murray	Review minutes of committee meeting and correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding same (.2)	0.20 134.00
09/09/13	T. Hwang	Continue preparation of minutes from September 6 meeting (1.3); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	1.50 630.00
09/11/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondence G. Felcyn regarding meeting minutes and revise same (.2); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.30 126.00
09/12/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang	0.10 67.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 52

Bc		Committee Meeting Minutes		
		regarding minutes of September 6th committee meeting (.1)		
09/15/13	T. Hwang	Draft minutes for September 13 meeting (3.7); correspondence Committee regarding same; correspondence J. Murray regarding same (.1)	3.80	1,596.00
09/16/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding minutes of September 13 committee meeting (.1)	0.10	67.00
09/16/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from C. Cavazos regarding minutes of committee meetings (.1); correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding minutes of September 13th committee meeting (.1)	0.20	134.00
09/17/13	T. Hwang	Draft minutes from September 16 meeting	2.40	1,008.00
09/18/13	T. Hwang	Draft minutes from September 16 meeting (2.3); conference J. Murray regarding same; correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	2.40	1,008.00
09/20/13	T. Hwang	Review and respond correspondence M. Imhof regarding September 16 minutes; correspondence Committee regarding same (.1); revise same (.1)	0.20	84.00
09/20/13	T. Hwang	Prepare minutes for September 20 Committee meeting (.2)	0.20	84.00
09/21/13	T. Hwang	Memorandum J. Murray regarding meeting minutes, regarding discussions regarding administrative costs (.2)	0.20	84.00
09/21/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding committee minutes (.1)	0.10	67.00
09/23/13	T. Hwang	Draft meeting minutes for September 20 meeting (1.4)	1.40	588.00
09/24/13	T. Hwang	Prepare minutes for September 20 meeting	2.10	882.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 53

Bc		Committee Meeting Minutes	
09/25/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding minutes of September 16 and 20 committee meetings (.1)	0.10 67.00
09/25/13	T. Hwang	Prepare minutes for September 20 meeting (1.9); revise minutes for September 16 meeting (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	2.10 882.00
09/25/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding minutes of September 16th committee meeting (.1)	0.10 67.00
09/30/13	T. Hwang	Revise September 20 meeting minutes (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same, and exchange correspondences S. Kim regarding same (.1)	0.20 84.00
10/01/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding minutes of September 20 meeting (.1)	0.10 67.00
11/11/13	T. Hwang	Draft minutes for October 28 meeting (2.9)	2.90 1,218.00
11/12/13	T. Hwang	Draft meeting minutes for October 28 meeting (.4)	0.40 168.00
11/18/13	R. Franklin	Draft minutes (2.5)	2.50 1,275.00
11/19/13	J. Murray	Finalize minutes of committee conference call, correspondence to committee regarding same (.9)	0.90 603.00
12/20/13	T. Hwang	Draft meeting minutes for December 13 meeting (1.8)	1.80 756.00
12/23/13	T. Hwang	Draft meeting minutes for December 13 meeting	0.90 378.00
01/27/14	T. Hwang	Review and revise meeting minutes (.4)	0.40 168.00
02/03/14	T. Hwang	Draft meeting minutes for February 3 meeting (3.5)	3.50 1,470.00
02/05/14	J. Murray	Review and revise minutes of 2/2/14 meeting, correspondence to Creditors	1.30 871.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 54

Bc	Committee Meeting Minutes		
	Committee regarding same (1.3)		
02/06/14 T. Hwang	Draft Committee meeting minutes (.7)	0.70	294.00
02/07/14 T. Hwang	Draft Committee meeting minutes (3.8); correspondence G. Felcyn, C. Johnson regarding same (.1); revise and finalize minutes from prior meetings (.2); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	4.20	1,764.00
02/08/14 T. Hwang	Draft meeting minutes (.2)	0.20	84.00
02/09/14 J. Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding minutes of Jan 30 Creditors Committee conference call, review same, review and revise action items regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
02/10/14 T. Hwang	Draft meeting minutes	2.40	1,008.00
02/11/14 T. Hwang	Draft meeting minutes (.4)	0.40	168.00
02/28/14 T. Hwang	Draft minutes for February 25 meeting	0.80	336.00
Subtotal for	Committee Meeting Minutes		54,844.00

Committee Meeting Minutes

Task	Timekeeper	Rate	Hours	Amount
Bc	Erin Darda	300	2.20	660.00
Bc	John Murray	670	13.30	8,911.00
Bc	Robert Franklin	510	6.50	3,315.00
Bc	Thomas Hwang	420	99.90	41,958.00
Bc	Total		121.90	54,844.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

1 JOHN WALSH MURRAY (074823)
ROBERT A. FRANKLIN (091653)
2 THOMAS T. HWANG (218678)
DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP
3 305 Lytton Avenue
Palo Alto, CA 94301
4 Telephone: (650) 857-1717
Facsimile: (650) 857-1288
5 Email: murray.john@dorsey.com
Email: franklin.robert@dorsey.com
6 Email: hwang.thomas@dorsey.com

7 Attorneys for Official
Committee of Unsecured Creditors

8
9 **UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT**
10 **NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA**
11 **SAN JOSE DIVISION**

12 In re:

13 **TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED LLC,**)
fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED)
14 **INC., A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**)
fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED,)
15 **A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**)

16 Debtor.)

Case No. 13-51589-SLJ-11

Chapter 11

Date: April 9, 2014

Time: 1:30 p.m.

Place: United States Bankruptcy Court
280 S. First Street, Room 3099
San Jose, CA 95113

Judge: Honorable Stephen L. Johnson

18
19 **EXHIBIT "F"**

20 **TO**

21 **FIRST APPLICATION FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES**
22 **BY ATTORNEYS FOR OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS**

23
24
25
26
27
28
EXHIBIT COVER

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 55

C		Communications With Debtor	
04/06/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Harris regarding telephone conference (.1)	0.10 67.00
04/08/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference R. Harris regarding presentation to Creditors' Committee regarding cash flow (.3)	0.30 201.00
04/09/13	T. Hwang	Telephone conference R. Harris regarding call with committee and debtor (.1)	0.10 42.00
04/09/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference R. Harris regarding whether Acer claim for attorney fees is a pre or post petition claim; meeting with Debtor and Creditors' Committee, etc. (.2)	0.20 134.00
04/09/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference R. Harris regarding meeting with Creditors' Committee regarding cash flow (.1)	0.10 67.00
04/11/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference with R. Harris regarding Debtor's issues going forward (.2)	0.20 134.00
04/11/13	E. Darda	Emails with J. Murray, T. Hwang, J. Mikhailevich and H. Binder regarding creditors' committee conference	0.30 90.00
04/11/13	E. Darda	Telephone conference with creditors' committee, debtor's counsel and debtor	3.90 1,170.00
04/13/13	J. Murray	Review draft of minutes of 4/11/13 Creditors' Committee meeting with Debtor (.2); correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding same (.1)	0.30 201.00
04/13/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from H. Binder regarding telephonic conference call (.1)	0.10 67.00
04/15/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference H. Binder regarding status (.1)	0.10 67.00
04/16/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from H. Binder regarding miscellaneous action items (.5)	0.50 335.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 56

C		Communications With Debtor	
04/16/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference H. Binder regarding miscellaneous action items and information for Creditors' Committee (.5)	0.50 335.00
04/20/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to H. Binder and R. Harris regarding Debtor's presentation to Creditor's Committee regarding Alliacense (.1)	0.10 67.00
04/22/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to and from H. Binder regarding Alliasence presentation (.2); multiple correspondence to and from Creditors' Committee regarding same (.2); correspondence to and from E. Darda regarding same (.1); correspondence to and from C. Johnson regarding same (.1)	0.60 402.00
04/22/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from H. Binder regarding Beresford claim; correspondence to K. Beresford regarding same (.1)	0.10 67.00
04/23/13	E. Darda	Emails with J. Murray and committee members regarding Alliacense presentation; attend Alliacense presentation and prepare minutes	4.00 1,200.00
04/23/13	R. Franklin	Review and revise minutes (.4)	0.40 204.00
04/23/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to M. Lecrone regarding copy of powerpoint presentation (.1)	0.10 67.00
05/07/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences R. Harris and R. Franklin regarding confidentiality and sec. 1102(b)(3) motion (.1)	0.10 42.00
05/10/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference W. Smith regarding fund for ultimate creditor distribution (.2)	0.20 134.00
05/11/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Harris regarding telephone conference regarding repayment plan to creditors (.1)	0.10 67.00
05/15/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondence J. Murray to H. Binder and correspondence from R.	0.20 84.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 57

C	Communications With Debtor		
	Franklin, and provide comments to same; review correspondence G. Felcyn regarding same (.2)		
05/20/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from R. Harris regarding Ford dispute (.1)	0.10 67.00
05/21/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from K. Beresford regarding handouts for meeting with Debtor (.1); correspondence to H. Binder regarding same (.1)	0.20 134.00
05/22/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to H. Binder regarding response to Beresfords email (.1)	0.10 67.00
06/06/13	R. Franklin	Telephone call W. Smith regarding 1102(b) motion (.1)	0.10 51.00
06/11/13	R. Franklin	Telephone conference with W. Smith regarding hearing on Sec. 1102(b) motion (.1); prepare for same (.2)	0.30 153.00
06/13/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from H. Binder and R. Harris regarding status (.2)	0.20 134.00
06/19/13	R. Franklin	Telephone conference with R. Harris regarding status of Ford settlement talks (.1); review offer (.1)	0.20 102.00
06/20/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding his conversations with R. Harris regarding status of various matters (.1); correspondence to R. Harris regarding same (.1)	0.20 134.00
07/28/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Afhalt regarding alleged demand for Attorneys' fees (.2); multiple correspondence to R. Harris regarding same (.3); multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding debtor's misrepresentation regarding attorneys' fees (.3); correspondence to committee regarding same (.1); review correspondence from P.	1.00 670.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 58

C		Communications With Debtor	
		Marcoux regarding same (.1)	
07/29/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding her statement about attorneys' fees (.1); multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding same (.2); correspondence to S. Anhalt and R. Harris regarding same (.1); telephone conference with W. Smith regarding sale of chips for stock (.1)	0.50 335.00
07/31/13	J. Murray	Review further correspondence from S. Anhalt, analysis and evaluation regarding same, and correspondence to committee regarding same (.2)	0.20 134.00
09/06/13	R. Franklin	Correspondence R. Harris regarding ITC ruling (.1)	0.10 51.00
09/06/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding contact with members of the committee (.2); correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.30 201.00
09/07/13	J. Murray	Correspondence H. Binder and R. Harris regarding conference call with debtor and committee regarding ITC ruling (.1);	0.10 67.00
09/09/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding communications with S. Anhalt (.2)	0.20 134.00
09/09/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference with S. Anhalt regarding email of Sept. 6 (.6); telephone conference with R. Harris regarding emails (.2); correspondence to H. Binder and R. Harris regarding same (.1)	0.90 603.00
09/10/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from H. Binder regarding meeting with committee regarding ITC ruling, interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same and review correspondence to H. Binder	0.10 67.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 59

C	Communications With Debtor		
	regarding same (.1)		
09/10/13 R. Franklin	Correspondence with H. Binder regarding presentation of ITC ruling (.1);	0.10	51.00
09/11/13 T. Hwang	Review correspondence J. Murray regarding Debtor's counsel's communications with Committee members; memorandum J. Murray regarding same	0.10	42.00
09/11/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding S. Anhalt contact with members of the committee (.2); correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.1); review correspondence from H. Binder regarding committee meeting, multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	0.50	335.00
09/16/13 J. Murray	Telephone conference with R. Harris regarding Stipulation to extend exclusivity, cash collateral, September carve out payment and employment applications, correspondence to R. Harris regarding carve out (.2); correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same (.1); interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.40	268.00
10/03/13 R. Franklin	Conference J. Otteson regarding jury verdict in HTC trial (.1)	0.10	51.00
02/25/14 J. Murray	Review correspondence from H. Binder regarding Volvo (.1)	0.10	67.00
02/26/14 J. Murray	Review correspondence from H. Binder regarding Volvo and MMP (.1)	0.10	67.00
02/27/14 J. Murray	Review correspondence from H. Binder regarding Volvo, review multiple correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

1 JOHN WALSH MURRAY (074823)
ROBERT A. FRANKLIN (091653)
2 THOMAS T. HWANG (218678)
DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP
3 305 Lytton Avenue
Palo Alto, CA 94301
4 Telephone: (650) 857-1717
Facsimile: (650) 857-1288
5 Email: murray.john@dorsey.com
Email: franklin.robert@dorsey.com
6 Email: hwang.thomas@dorsey.com

7 Attorneys for Official
Committee of Unsecured Creditors
8

9 **UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT**
10 **NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA**
11 **SAN JOSE DIVISION**

12 In re:)	
13 TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED LLC,)	Case No. 13-51589-SLJ-11
14 fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED)	
15 INC., A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,)	Chapter 11
16 fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED,)	
17 A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,)	Date: April 9, 2014
)	Time: 1:30 p.m.
18 Debtor.)	Place: United States Bankruptcy Court
)	280 S. First Street, Room 3099
)	San Jose, CA 95113
)	Judge: Honorable Stephen L. Johnson

19 **EXHIBIT "G"**
20 **TO**
21 **FIRST APPLICATION FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES**
22 **BY ATTORNEYS FOR OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS**
23
24
25
26
27
28

EXHIBIT COVER

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 61

D		Communications With Third Parties		
04/10/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference with M. Lubic regarding Acer litigation (.3); correspondence to A. Jarvis regarding same (.1)	0.40	268.00
04/10/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from G. Charles regarding meeting with C. Hoge regarding TPL litigation (.1); telephone conference with G. Charles regarding same (.2); correspondence to G. Charles regarding telephonic conference call (.1)	0.40	268.00
04/11/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from C. Cavazos regarding Creditors' Committee directory (.1); correspondence to and from E. Keller regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
04/11/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to G. Charles regarding meeting with Creditors' Committee (.1)	0.10	67.00
04/22/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference E. Keller regarding telephone participation at Section 341 Meeting of Creditors (.1); correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding same (.1); correspondence to E. Keller regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
05/01/13	T. Hwang	Call to E. Keller regarding 341 meeting of creditors; review correspondence E. Keller regarding same	0.10	42.00
05/03/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from E. Keller regarding conclusion of Section 341 Meeting of Creditors (.1)	0.10	67.00
05/08/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence P. Vargas regarding amended Notice of appointment of Creditors' Committee; correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
06/04/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from J.	0.20	134.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 62

D		Communications With Third Parties	
		Wesolowski regarding crackdown on patent trolls (.2)	
06/24/13	T. Hwang	Review and evaluation regarding correspondence S. Kim to E. Keller, and regarding information regarding Debtor and insider conduct (.3)	0.30 126.00
08/28/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondence M. Ralston regarding case status inquiries and memorandum J. Murray regarding same; investigation regarding creditor Shore Chan (.2)	0.20 84.00
08/29/13	T. Hwang	Memorandum J. Murray regarding inquiry from M. Ralston, regarding creditor Shore Chan (.1); draft correspondence M. Ralston regarding case status, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.3); conference with J. Murray regarding same; memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1); review correspondence H. Binder regarding same; review Court Order regarding sec. 1102(b)(3) (.1); respond correspondence M. Ralston regarding case status (.1)	0.70 294.00
08/29/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding inquiry from M. Ralston regarding status of case (.1); legal research regarding same (.2); multiple correspondence to/from debtor's camp regarding same (.1)	0.40 268.00
09/10/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference with W. Tanoma regarding status of case and purchase of claims (.1)	0.10 67.00
09/15/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from W. Tanona regarding purchase of claims and correspondence to committee regarding same (.1)	0.10 67.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 63

D		Communications With Third Parties	
10/25/13	T. Hwang	Telephone conference with J. Wesolowski regarding case status (.3)	0.30 126.00
10/31/13	R. Franklin	Conference J. Wesolowski regarding case (.5)	0.50 255.00
11/11/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding communications from K. Prochnow, and investigation regarding same (.1)	0.10 42.00
11/13/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding correspondence from Shore, Chan & DePumpo regarding status of case (.1)	0.10 67.00
11/13/13	T. Hwang	Telephone conference with M. Ralston regarding case status (.2); review correspondence M. Ralson regarding same, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.2)	0.40 168.00
11/13/13	R. Franklin	Detailed telephone conference with K. Prochnow regarding status (.2)	0.20 102.00
11/14/13	R. Franklin	Correspondence creditor regarding status of case (.2)	0.20 102.00
11/15/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding inquiry from Shore Chan regarding status of case (.1)	0.10 67.00
11/16/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding inquiry from Shore Chan (.2)	0.20 134.00
12/17/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference with S. McNutt regarding Agility's compensation (.2)	0.20 134.00
12/23/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondence R. Neilson and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.10 42.00
12/24/13	J. Murray	Review message from S. McNutt regarding Agility, telephone conference with S.	0.20 134.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 64

D		Communications With Third Parties		
		McNutt regarding same (.1); review correspondence from creditor V. Currington, correspondence to T. Hwang regarding same (.1)		
12/26/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding correspondence form R. Neilson regarding Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	67.00
12/26/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondence J. Murray regarding R. Neilson, and review and respond correspondence R. Neilson regarding Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement (.2)	0.20	84.00
02/02/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Caplan regarding Trustee motion, Patriot and J. Neal residence, review attachment (.2)	0.20	134.00
02/06/14	J. Murray	Correspondence to J. Wesolowski regarding hypothetical question regarding case (.1)	0.10	67.00
02/07/14	T. Hwang	Analysis and evaluation correspondence and proposal from K. Prochnow (.2); investigation and evaluation regarding Charles Moore stipulated judgment (.3)	0.50	210.00
02/14/14	J. Murray	Telephone conference with W. Lewis regarding status of case (.2)	0.20	134.00
02/20/14	J. Murray	Conference call S. Caplan regarding Patriot, PDS, Alliacense and TPL (.3)	0.30	201.00
02/24/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from K. Prochnow regarding ITC ruling, review same, review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Subtotal for		Communications With Third Parties		4,625.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
Page 65

Communications With Third Parties

Task	Timekeeper	Rate	Hours	Amount
D	John Murray	670	4.40	2,948.00
D	Robert Franklin	510	0.90	459.00
D	Thomas Hwang	420	2.90	1,218.00
D	Total		8.20	4,625.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

1 JOHN WALSH MURRAY (074823)
ROBERT A. FRANKLIN (091653)
2 THOMAS T. HWANG (218678)
DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP
3 305 Lytton Avenue
Palo Alto, CA 94301
4 Telephone: (650) 857-1717
Facsimile: (650) 857-1288
5 Email: murray.john@dorsey.com
Email: franklin.robert@dorsey.com
6 Email: hwang.thomas@dorsey.com

7 Attorneys for Official
Committee of Unsecured Creditors

9 **UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT**
10 **NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA**
11 **SAN JOSE DIVISION**

12 In re:)	
13 TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED LLC,)	Case No. 13-51589-SLJ-11
14 fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED)	
15 INC., A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,)	Chapter 11
16 fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED,)	
17 A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,)	Date: April 9, 2014
)	Time: 1:30 p.m.
18 Debtor.)	Place: United States Bankruptcy Court
)	280 S. First Street, Room 3099
)	San Jose, CA 95113
)	Judge: Honorable Stephen L. Johnson

19 **EXHIBIT "H"**
20 **TO**
21 **FIRST APPLICATION FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES**
22 **BY ATTORNEYS FOR OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS**

EXHIBIT COVER

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 66

Ea		Employment of Professionals - Forensic Accountant	
04/24/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to prospective financial advisors and forensic accountants regarding engagement by Creditors' Committee (.5)	0.50 335.00
04/24/13	T. Hwang	Investigation regarding potential financial advisors (.5); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.60 252.00
04/25/13	T. Hwang	Investigation regarding financial advisors and memorandum J. Murray regarding same	0.20 84.00
04/30/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from E. Webb regarding presentation regarding financial advisor position (.1)	0.10 67.00
05/01/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from J. Crom regarding financial advisor position and correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding same (.1)	0.10 67.00
05/01/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference D. Aguilera regarding financial advisor position (.1); correspondence to and from E. Webb regarding same (.2)	0.30 201.00
05/02/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to forensic accounts regarding issues of interest to the Creditors' Committee (.5)	0.50 335.00
05/02/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding presentations by prospective financial advisors, etc. (.3); correspondence to D. Aguilera regarding same (.1); correspondence to E. Webb regarding same (.1); correspondence to K. Prochnow regarding same (.1)	0.60 402.00
05/05/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to D. Aguilera regarding presentation to Creditors' Committee (.1);	0.20 134.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 67

Ea		Employment of Professionals - Forensic Accountant	
		correspondence to and from E. Webb regarding same (.1)	
05/06/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference E. Webb regarding BPM presentation to Creditors' Committee (.3)	0.30 201.00
05/08/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from E. Webb regarding BPM presentation to Creditors' Committee regarding role as financial advisor (.2)	0.20 134.00
05/08/13	J. Murray	Review presentation materials from BPM and circulate to Creditors' Committee (.2)	0.20 134.00
05/10/13	T. Hwang	Committee meeting, including presentations by K. Prochnow, D. Aguilera, E. Webb (3.5)	3.50 1,470.00
05/10/13	R. Franklin	Prepare for committee meeting (.5); attend Committee meeting regarding presentations from K. Prochnow, E. Webb and D. Aguilera (3.5)	4.00 2,040.00
05/10/13	J. Murray	Attend Creditors' Committee meeting regarding presentations by K. Prochnow, D. Aguielera and E. Webb (3.5); correspondence to D. Aguilera regarding same (.1); correspondence to E. Webb regarding same (.1)	3.70 2,479.00
05/17/13	R. Franklin	Correspondence with J. Proctor regarding presentation to Committee regarding financial advisor (.3)	0.30 153.00
05/20/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences R. Franklin regarding debtor's employment pleadings of special counsel, and investigation regarding same (.2); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.30 126.00
05/20/13	R. Franklin	Detailed telephone conference with J. Proctor regarding potential presentation to	0.40 204.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 68

Ea		Employment of Professionals - Forensic Accountant	
		Committee for employment as financial advisor (.4)	
05/20/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to and from R. Franklin regarding interviewing J. Proctor for forensic accountant position (.2)	0.20 134.00
05/21/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from R. Franklin regarding J. Proctor presentation to Creditors' Committee (.1)	0.10 67.00
05/22/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding Rundquist and Assoc. regarding financial advisor position (.1)	0.10 67.00
05/24/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from E. Webb regarding financial advisor position (.1)	0.10 67.00
07/02/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding scope of forensic accountant's investigation and revise correspondence to H. Binder regarding same (.2)	0.20 134.00
07/03/13	T. Hwang	Review and evaluation memorandum J. Murray and correspondences from Committee regarding forensic accountant and communication to Debtor regarding same (.3)	0.30 126.00
07/03/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to J. Proctor regarding presentation to committee regarding serving as committee forensic accountant (.3); correspondence to A. Rundquist regarding same (.2)	0.50 335.00
07/03/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding potential forensic accountants (.1)	0.10 67.00
07/08/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to Rundquist regarding presentation to committee regarding forensic accountant position (.1); review correspondence to J. Proctor	0.20 134.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 69

Ea		Employment of Professionals - Forensic Accountant	
		regarding same (.1)	
07/08/13	T. Hwang	Telephone conference with L. Chung regarding forensic accountant and meeting with Committee; correspondence L. Chung regarding same; review correspondence R. Franklin to J. Proctor regarding same (.2)	0.20 84.00
07/09/13	T. Hwang	Review and respond correspondences L. Chung regarding potential retention as accountant; call to L. Chung regarding same (.2); memoranda J. Murray and R. Franklin regarding same (.2); conference J. Murray regarding same, and review correspondence from J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.50 210.00
07/09/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin and J. Proctor regarding interview with J. Proctor for forensic accountant position (.1); review correspondence to J. Proctor regarding same (.1); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding communicating to committee regarding same (.1); review communication to committee regarding same (.1); multiple correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding communicating with candidates (.2)	0.60 402.00
07/09/13	R. Franklin	Correspondence and telephone conferences with J. Proctor regarding presentation to Committee (.6)	0.60 306.00
07/10/13	T. Hwang	Telephone conference with L. Chung regarding interview of accountants, case status (.1); telephone conference with P. Wahlquist regarding same (.3); correspondence P. Wahlquist regarding same (.1); correspondence to Committee regarding same (.1)	0.60 252.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 70

Ea		Employment of Professionals - Forensic Accountant		
07/10/13	R. Franklin	Correspondence with J. Proctor regarding presentation to Committee (.1)	0.10	51.00
07/11/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondence P. Wahlquist regarding accountant candidacy; memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same; meeting J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
07/12/13	T. Hwang	Prepare conflicts information and correspondence J. Proctor regarding same and regarding case parties (.4)	0.40	168.00
07/12/13	R. Franklin	Draft correspondence J. Proctor re result of committee meeting, request for further information and next steps (.4)	0.40	204.00
07/12/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to J. Proctor regarding retention as committee forensic accountant (.1)	0.10	67.00
07/15/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from J. Proctor re Application for Employment of Forensic Accountant (.2)	0.20	134.00
07/15/13	T. Hwang	Evaluation and exchange correspondences J. Proctor regarding employment (.3); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.40	168.00
07/16/13	R. Franklin	Review correspondence Committee members regarding focus of forensic accountant investigation (.3)	0.30	153.00
07/17/13	T. Hwang	Legal research and evaluation regarding retention of forensic accountant and contract employees (.4); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.2); correspondence J. Proctor regarding same (.1)	0.70	294.00
07/17/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from T. Hwang, R. Franklin and J. Proctor	0.20	134.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 71

Ea		Employment of Professionals - Forensic Accountant	
		regarding Employment of forensic accountant and respond (.2)	
07/17/13	J. Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding message from D. Aguilera re forensic account position (.1); multiple correspondence to/from team regarding same (.1); correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding Employment regarding J. Proctor (.1)	0.30 201.00
07/18/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to D. Aguilera regarding forensic accountant position (.1)	0.10 67.00
07/18/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to team regarding forensic accountant Application for Employment (.1)	0.10 67.00
07/21/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from J. Proctor re employment as forensic accountant (.1)	0.10 67.00
07/22/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from T. Hwang and R. Franklin regarding Employment of forensic accountant (.2)	0.20 134.00
07/22/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding Employment of forensic accountant (.2)	0.20 134.00
07/22/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondence J. Proctor regarding employment and contractors (.1); review and respond correspondences J. Murray regarding same; review correspondence R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.20 84.00
07/26/13	T. Hwang	Review and respond correspondence J. Proctor regarding employment of accountant (.1)	0.10 42.00
07/28/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to/from J. Proctor regarding employment as forensic accountant (.1)	0.10 67.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 72

Ea	Employment of Professionals - Forensic Accountant	
Subtotal for	Employment of Professionals - Forensic Accountant	13,481.00

Employment of Professionals - Forensic Accountant

Task	Timekeeper	Rate	Hours	Amount
Ea	John Murray	670	10.40	6,968.00
Ea	Robert Franklin	510	6.10	3,111.00
Ea	Thomas Hwang	420	8.10	3,402.00
Ea	Total		24.60	13,481.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

1 JOHN WALSHE MURRAY (074823)
ROBERT A. FRANKLIN (091653)
2 THOMAS T. HWANG (218678)
DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP
3 305 Lytton Avenue
Palo Alto, CA 94301
4 Telephone: (650) 857-1717
Facsimile: (650) 857-1288
5 Email: murray.john@dorsey.com
Email: franklin.robert@dorsey.com
6 Email: hwang.thomas@dorsey.com

7 Attorneys for Official
Committee of Unsecured Creditors

8
9 **UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT**
10 **NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA**
11 **SAN JOSE DIVISION**

12 In re:

13 **TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED LLC,**)
14 **fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED**)
15 **INC., A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**)
16 **fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED,**)
17 **A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**)

16 Debtor.)

Case No. 13-51589-SLJ-11

Chapter 11

Date: April 9, 2014

Time: 1:30 p.m.

Place: United States Bankruptcy Court
280 S. First Street, Room 3099
San Jose, CA 95113

Judge: Honorable Stephen L. Johnson

18
19 **EXHIBIT "I"**

20 **TO**

21 **FIRST APPLICATION FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES**
22 **BY ATTORNEYS FOR OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS**

23
24
25
26
27
28
EXHIBIT COVER

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 73

Employment of Professionals - Dorsey & Whitney LLP			
Eb			
04/05/13	T. Hwang	Continue preparation of employment application (1.1); update same; meeting J. Murray regarding same (.1)	1.20 504.00
04/07/13	J. Murray	Continue preparation of application for Employment of Counsel (1.0)	1.00 670.00
04/08/13	J. Murray	Continue preparation of application for employment of counsel (1.0)	0.10 67.00
04/08/13	J. Murray	Continue preparation of application for employment of counsel (1.6)	1.60 1,072.00
04/09/13	J. Murray	Continue preparation of engagement agreement (1.6)	1.60 1,072.00
04/09/13	J. Murray	Multiple telephone conference D. Wright regarding retention as Creditors' Committee Counsel (.3); telephone conference S. Kim regarding same (.1)	0.40 268.00
04/09/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference H. Binder regarding Creditors Committee counsel (.1)	0.10 67.00
04/09/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference M. Brown regarding Creditors' Committee representation (.1)	0.10 67.00
04/10/13	J. Murray	Continue preparation of engagement agreement (1.0); correspondence to and from K. Jorgensen regarding same (.6)	1.60 1,072.00
04/10/13	J. Murray	Continue preparation of engagement agreement (.7)	0.70 469.00
04/19/13	T. Hwang	Meeting J. Murray regarding employment application (.1); continue preparation of same (.4)	0.50 210.00
04/20/13	T. Hwang	Continue preparation of employment application and supporting declaration	0.70 294.00
04/22/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding application for employment of	0.60 402.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 74

Eb		Employment of Professionals - Dorsey & Whitney LLP	
		counsel; continue preparation of same (.3); review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding same (.3)	
04/25/13	T. Hwang	Evaluation regarding engagement agreement, and review and revise employment application (.7); review and revise declaration regarding same (.2); revise order regarding same (.1); memorandum J. Murray regarding same; meeting J. Murray regarding same (.1)	1.10 462.00
04/25/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to M. Brown regarding execution of engagement agreement (.1)	0.10 67.00
04/25/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to and from T. Hwang regarding Dorsey Application for Employment of Counsel, etc (.2)	0.20 134.00
04/26/13	T. Hwang	Evaluation and analysis of employment pleadings filed by Debtor and memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same	1.60 672.00
05/01/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from T. Hwang regarding Dorsey Application for Employment of Counsel (.1)	0.10 67.00
05/02/13	T. Hwang	Revise employment application and order (.2)	0.20 84.00
05/03/13	T. Hwang	Prepare memorandum regarding employment application (.1)	0.10 42.00
05/07/13	T. Hwang	Meeting J. Murray regarding employment application (.1); revise same and supporting pleadings (.3); correspondence M. Brown regarding same (.1)	0.50 210.00
05/07/13	J. Murray	Review Application for Employment Counsel (.8); Interoffice T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.90 603.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 75

Eb		Employment of Professionals - Dorsey & Whitney LLP		
05/08/13	T. Hwang	Investigation regarding status of debtor's employment applications (.2); conference and memoranda J. Murray regarding same (.2)	0.40	168.00
05/08/13	T. Hwang	Revise employment application and revise order regarding same (.2); correspondence Committee regarding same; conference J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
05/10/13	T. Hwang	Review, finalize employment application and order (.3)	0.30	126.00
Subtotal for		Employment of Professionals - Dorsey & Whitney LLP		8,995.00

Employment of Professionals - Dorsey & Whitney LLP

Task	Timekeeper	Rate	Hours	Amount
Eb	John Murray	670	9.10	6,097.00
Eb	Thomas Hwang	420	6.90	2,898.00
Eb	Total		16.00	8,995.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

1 JOHN WALSHE MURRAY (074823)
ROBERT A. FRANKLIN (091653)
2 THOMAS T. HWANG (218678)
DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP
3 305 Lytton Avenue
Palo Alto, CA 94301
4 Telephone: (650) 857-1717
Facsimile: (650) 857-1288
5 Email: murray.john@dorsey.com
Email: franklin.robert@dorsey.com
6 Email: hwang.thomas@dorsey.com

7 Attorneys for Official
Committee of Unsecured Creditors

8
9 **UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT**
10 **NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA**
11 **SAN JOSE DIVISION**

12 In re:

13 **TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED LLC,**
14 **fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED**
15 **INC., A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**
16 **fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED,**
17 **A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**

18 Debtor.

Case No. 13-51589-SLJ-11

Chapter 11

Date: April 9, 2014

Time: 1:30 p.m.

Place: United States Bankruptcy Court
280 S. First Street, Room 3099
San Jose, CA 95113

Judge: Honorable Stephen L. Johnson

19 **EXHIBIT "J"**

20 **TO**

21 **FIRST APPLICATION FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES**
22 **BY ATTORNEYS FOR OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS**

23
24
25
26
27
28
EXHIBIT COVER

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 76

Ec		Employment of Professionals - Debtor's Professional		
04/25/13	T. Hwang	Review memorandum J. Murray, and investigation docket and debtor filings regarding status of employment pleadings	0.30	126.00
05/02/13	T. Hwang	Review debtor's pleadings to employ special counsel Bragalone (.1); review and evaluation court order regarding employment of Simon law firm and memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.8)	0.90	378.00
05/14/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding debtor's employment pleadings, regarding unredacted applications (.1); review correspondences S. Kim, R. Franklin regarding Ropers Majeski application (.1); review applications to employ Ropers Majeski and Adelson Hess firms (.2)	0.40	168.00
05/14/13	R. Franklin	Review and respond to correspondence S. Kim regarding employment of Ropers firm (.4)	0.40	204.00
05/14/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from R. Franklin regarding Debtor employment application (.1); review correspondence to and from attorney Rome-Banks regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
05/22/13	R. Franklin	Review correspondence R. Shakoori regarding Agility employment application (.1)	0.10	51.00
05/23/13	R. Franklin	Review correspondence S. Kim regarding employment of Alliacense as professional for the Debtor and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.3)	0.30	153.00
05/24/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences R. Shakoori, R. Franklin, J. Murray regarding Debtor's employment of Agility (.1); evaluation	0.50	210.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 77

Ec		Employment of Professionals - Debtor's Professional	
		regarding same (.1); review and evaluation employment application regarding Bragalone (.3)	
05/24/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from R. Shakoori regarding Agility Application for Employment of Counsel (.1); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.20 134.00
06/07/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to /from C. Cavazos regarding Roper's Application for Employment of Counsel (.2)	0.20 134.00
06/07/13	R. Franklin	Review order setting hearing for Ropers Application and correspondence with S. Kim regarding same (.2)	0.20 102.00
06/10/13	J. Murray	Interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding debtor's Application for Employment of Counsel regarding Ropers (.1)	0.10 67.00
06/11/13	R. Franklin	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding Roper's response to the Court's request for more information and respond to same (.2); telephone conference with K. Curry regarding same (.2); preparation for hearing (.1); detailed telephone conference with W. Smith regarding same (.2)	0.70 357.00
06/11/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding Ropers Application for Employment of Counsel; correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.10 67.00
06/12/13	R. Franklin	Interoffice conference with J. Murray regarding hearing (.1); prepare for hearing (.4); attend hearing on Ropers/Adelson application for employment (1,2); correspondence with K. Curry regarding results of hearing (.1)	1.80 918.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 78

Ec		Employment of Professionals - Debtor's Professional	
06/12/13	J. Murray	Interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding debtor's applications to employ Ropers firm and Adleson firm (.2); attend hearing regarding same (1.5)	1.70 1,139.00
06/13/13	T. Hwang	Evaluation and analysis employment application and retainer agreement of Bragalone Conroy and Farnan LLP (.8); draft summary memorandum regarding same (.8)	1.60 672.00
06/18/13	T. Hwang	Prepare summary regarding employment application of special counsel (.3)	0.30 126.00
06/20/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding analysis and evaluation of Debtor's Applications for Employment of Counsel (.1)	0.10 67.00
06/20/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding summary of Debtor's counsels' Applications for Employment of Counsel (.1)	0.10 67.00
06/20/13	T. Hwang	Memorandum J. Murray regarding employment of Bragalone and Farnam firms (.3)	0.30 126.00
08/09/13	J. Murray	Miscellaneous regarding debtor's Application to Employ Edward P. Heller as Special Counsel Nunc Pro Tunc (.1)	0.10 67.00
08/19/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding debtor's Applications for Employment of Counsel regarding Alliacense lawyers and Nevada counsel, correspondence to H. Binder regarding same (.2)	0.20 134.00
08/20/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding Applications for Employment of Counsel for Alliacense lawyers	0.20 134.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 79

Ec		Employment of Professionals - Debtor's Professional	
		representing TPL in the US PTO, Nevada attorneys representing TPL in its efforts to seek third party discovery against GreenArrays in the Moore v. TPL litigation, correspondence to H. Binder regarding same (.2)	
08/22/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences G. Felcyn, S. Kim, J. Murray regarding Alliacense and employment of professionals (.1)	0.10 42.00
08/22/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence from S. Kim and G. Felcyn regarding debtor's application to engage special counsel and need to obtain court authority to engage Alliacense's counsel (.2)	0.20 134.00
08/28/13	T. Hwang	Evaluation and analysis employment application and related documents regarding E. Heller (.4); memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.7)	1.10 462.00
08/28/13	T. Hwang	Evaluation and analysis Henneman employment application and related documents (.3); memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.3)	0.60 252.00
09/03/13	J. Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding debtor's Applications to employ Henneman & Associates and E. Heller, multiple correspondence to committee regarding same, interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding objection to applications, correspondence to committee regarding same, correspondence to H. Binder and R. Harris same, interoffice conference C. Cavazos regarding same, multiple correspondence to/from S. Kim regarding GreenArrays (1.7)	1.70 1,139.00
09/03/13	T. Hwang	Meeting J. Murray regarding Debtor's	7.30 3,066.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 80

Ec	Employment of Professionals - Debtor's Professional		
	employment applications, regarding E. Heller and Henneman and Associates (.1); analysis and evaluation, and legal research regarding same (1.8); draft Opposition regarding same (5.3); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)		
09/04/13 T. Hwang	Review comments from R. Franklin, P. Marcoux, J. Murray, S. Kim, M. Brown, and G. Kaplan, and revise Limited Opposition regarding employment applications for E. Heller and Henneman and Associates (2.7); legal research regarding same (.6); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1); meetings J. Murray regarding same (.1); correspondence T. Bracegirdle regarding same (.1)	3.60	1,512.00
09/04/13 R. Franklin	Review and revise Opposition to application to employ attorney Heller (.6)	0.60	306.00
09/04/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from S. Kim regarding debtor's employment applications (.1); correspondence to/S. Kim regarding GreenArrays (.1)	0.20	134.00
09/04/13 J. Murray	Review and revise objection to debtor's applications to employ special counsel (.6); interoffice conference with T. Hwang regarding same (.1); review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding same (.1)	0.80	536.00
09/04/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to T. Hwang regarding communicating with court regarding filing objection to debtor's applications to employ special counsel (.1)	0.10	67.00
09/05/13 T. Hwang	Review correspondences G. Felcyn, K. Beresford, S. Kim, G. Kaplan, J. Murray	0.50	210.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 81

Ec	Employment of Professionals - Debtor's Professional		
	regarding Debtor's employment motions (.1); prepare redline to Committee limited opposition and correspondence Committee regarding same (.2); review and respond correspondences T. Bracegirdle regarding same (.2)		
09/05/13 R. Franklin	Review correspondence Committee members regarding employment application of Heller (.3)	0.30	153.00
09/05/13 J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from P. Macroux regarding further objection to debtor's employment applications (.1)	0.10	67.00
09/05/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from K. Beresford regarding debtor's employment applications and correspondence to committee regarding same (.1); review multiple correspondence from committee members regarding committee's objection to debtor's employment applications; level of professional fees in the case, and correspondence to committee regarding same (.8); review correspondence from S. Kim regarding same, review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding same, review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.2); review correspondence from court clerk regarding same (.1); review correspondence to committee regarding same and correspondence to committee regarding same (.1)	1.30	871.00
09/06/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from S. Anhalt re conference call regarding debtor's employment of Nevada counsel (.1)	0.10	67.00
09/09/13 T. Hwang	Correspondence Committee regarding application for employment of counsel	2.80	1,176.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 82

Ec		Employment of Professionals - Debtor's Professional	
		(.3); meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1) memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1); Franklin regarding same (.3); review Committee objections and memorandum R. Shakoori regarding Debtor proposal regarding same (.2); review and analysis correspondence conference with R. Harris regarding same (.1); telephone Shakoori regarding same (.2); memorandum J. Henneman (.1); telephone conference with R. Harris regarding employment applications of Heller and review correspondence R. Harris regarding same (1.4)	
09/09/13	R. Franklin	Review and revise draft of proposed Stipulation re employment application of Heller and interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same (.5)	0.50 255.00
09/09/13	J. Murray	Review voicemail from R. Harris regarding committee's objection to employment applications and correspondence to T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.10 67.00
09/10/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences Committee members regarding Heller employment application, Debtor's proposal; correspondence Committee regarding same (.1); correspondence R. Shakoori regarding same (.3); review and edit to Application to continue hearing on same and Order regarding Application to continue and to specially set hearing (.3); correspondences R. Shakoori regarding same (.1); review Order regarding hearing on employment motions and review and respond correspondence R. Shakoori regarding same (.1); review correspondence R.	1.20 504.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 83

Ec		Employment of Professionals - Debtor's Professional	
		Shakoori regarding same, regarding negotiation points (.1); correspondences Committee regarding same, regarding status of negotiations (.2)	
09/10/13	R. Franklin	Review responses to questions raised in Heller application (.3)	0.30 153.00
09/10/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence form T. Hwang regarding committee objection to employment Applications (.1)	0.10 67.00
09/10/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence from committee members regarding resolution of objection to debtor's employment applications (.1); correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding same, correspondence to committee regarding same (.2); review multiple correspondence to/from R. Shakoori regarding same (.2); review multiple correspondence from T. Hwang and committee members regarding resolution of objection to debtor's employment applications (.2); review correspondence from R. Harris regarding special setting application regarding debtor's employment applications, review pleading regarding same, review order regarding same (.2)	0.90 603.00
09/11/13	T. Hwang	Review and respond correspondence S. Kim regarding Debtor's employment applications, regarding Heller	0.10 42.00
09/12/13	T. Hwang	Exchange correspondence R. Shakoori regarding employment of Heller and Henneman	0.10 42.00
09/13/13	T. Hwang	Review comments from Committee meeting and memorandum to Committee regarding employment applications of	0.60 252.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 84

Ec	Employment of Professionals - Debtor's Professional		
	Heller and Henneman, regarding issues and action items for Committee consideration (.4); review and respond correspondence R. Shakoori regarding same (.1); review and respond correspondence G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)		
09/13/13 R. Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding Heller application and request for information related thereto and draft correspondence R. Shakoori regarding same (.6)	0.60	306.00
09/13/13 J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from committee regarding objections to employment applications (.4)	0.40	268.00
09/15/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding conference call to discuss employment Applications, cash collateral and status of September carve out payment (.1); review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding employment Applications (.2)	0.30	201.00
09/15/13 T. Hwang	Review comments G. Kaplan regarding Debtor's employment of Heller and Henneman	0.10	42.00
09/16/13 T. Hwang	Review correspondence and voicemail message R. Harris, and correspondence J. Murray regarding employment of Heller and Henneman (.1); telephone conferences R. Harris regarding same (.3); review and respond correspondence R. Harris regarding same; meeting J. Murray regarding same (.1); prepare outline of issues regarding same and correspondence Committee regarding same (1.5)	2.00	840.00
09/16/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to T. Hwang regarding	0.10	67.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 85

Ec		Employment of Professionals - Debtor's Professional	
		communicating with R. Harris regarding employment Applications (.1)	
09/16/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding objection to Heller / Henenman employment Applications (.1); review correspondence to committee regarding same (.1)	0.20 134.00
09/17/13	T. Hwang	Review proposed stipulation and order, regarding continuation of hearings on Heller and Henneman employment applications (.3); finalize same; correspondence R. Shakoori regarding same (.2); review and respond correspondence T. Bracegirdle regarding hearing on employment motions (.1); review Order regarding same (.1)	0.70 294.00
09/18/13	T. Hwang	Investigation regarding Alliacense and Heller invoices (.1)	0.10 42.00
10/03/13	T. Hwang	Review memorandum from J. Murray regarding employment of Heller and Henneman (.1); investigation regarding hearing and status of same (.1)	0.10 42.00
10/03/13	R. Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding status of Heller Application (.1)	0.10 51.00
10/03/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding hearing on debtor's Applications for Employment of Counsel (.1)	0.10 67.00
10/15/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from committee regarding Applications for Employment of Counsel regarding Heller and Henneman (.2)	0.20 134.00
10/15/13	T. Hwang	Telephone conference with R. Shakoori regarding employment applications of	0.60 252.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 86

Ec	Employment of Professionals - Debtor's Professional		
	Heller and Henneman (.1); evaluation regarding case status and correspondence Committee regarding same (.4); correspondence R. Shakoori regarding same (.1)		
10/16/13 T. Hwang	Telephone conference with D. Wright regarding Heller and Henneman employment applications (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same (.3); exchange correspondences R. Shakoori regarding same, regarding Committee proposal (.4); review correspondences from Committee and correspondence G. Kaplan regarding same (.2); review and revise stipulation to continue hearing on employment applications (.3);	1.20	504.00
10/16/13 J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from committee regarding Application for Employment of Counsel regarding Heller and Henneman, and continuance of hearing pending negotiations with debtor (.3)	0.30	201.00
10/21/13 J. Murray	Review notice of continued hearing regarding Applications for Employment of Counsel regarding Heller and Henneman (.1)	0.10	67.00
10/24/13 T. Hwang	Review status of negotiations regarding Heller and Henneman employment, and call to J. Wesolowski regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
11/08/13 T. Hwang	Review reply to opposition regarding employment of Henneman and Heller (.2); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1); review correspondence C. Brown regarding same, and investigation regarding correspondence from C. Brown (.1)	0.40	168.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 87

Ec		Employment of Professionals - Debtor's Professional	
11/12/13	T. Hwang	Evaluation regarding Debtor's application to employ Heller and Henneman, related briefs (.1); telephone conference with, call to R. Shakoori regarding same (.1); review stipulated application and proposed order (.2); meetings J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.1); correspondence R. Shakoori regarding same (.2)	0.70 294.00
11/12/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding hearings regarding Heller and Henneman Applications for Employment of Counsel, etc. (.1); review correspondence from R. Shakooi regarding continuance of hearing regarding Heller and Henemann Applications for Employment of Counsel (.1)	0.20 134.00
11/13/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from R. Shakoori regarding continuance of Heller/Henneman hearing (.1)	0.10 67.00
12/03/13	T. Hwang	Analysis and evaluation pleadings regarding Debtor's employment application of Heller and Henneman, and legal research regarding same (.9); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.4)	1.30 546.00
12/04/13	R. Franklin	Prepare for hearing on Heller and Henneman application (1.3); attend hearing (.5)	1.80 918.00
12/04/13	T. Hwang	Memorandum R. Franklin regarding employment application of Henneman and Heller (.1); meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.30 126.00
Subtotal for		Employment of Professionals - Debtor's Professional	23,721.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
Page 88

Employment of Professionals - Debtor's Professional

Task	Timekeeper	Rate	Hours	Amount
Ec	John Murray	670	10.80	7,236.00
Ec	Robert Franklin	510	7.70	3,927.00
Ec	Thomas Hwang	420	29.90	12,558.00
Ec	Total		48.40	23,721.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

1 JOHN WALSH MURRAY (074823)
ROBERT A. FRANKLIN (091653)
2 THOMAS T. HWANG (218678)
DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP
3 305 Lytton Avenue
Palo Alto, CA 94301
4 Telephone: (650) 857-1717
Facsimile: (650) 857-1288
5 Email: murray.john@dorsey.com
Email: franklin.robert@dorsey.com
6 Email: hwang.thomas@dorsey.com

7 Attorneys for Official
Committee of Unsecured Creditors
8

9 **UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT**
10 **NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA**
11 **SAN JOSE DIVISION**

12 In re:)
13 **TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED LLC,**) Case No. 13-51589-SLJ-11
14 **fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED**)
15 **INC., A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**) Chapter 11
16 **fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED,**)
17 **A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**)
18 Debtor.)
Date: April 9, 2014
Time: 1:30 p.m.
Place: United States Bankruptcy Court
280 S. First Street, Room 3099
San Jose, CA 95113
Judge: Honorable Stephen L. Johnson

19 **EXHIBIT "K"**
20 **TO**
21 **FIRST APPLICATION FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES**
22 **BY ATTORNEYS FOR OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS**

EXHIBIT COVER

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 89

F		Financial Pleadings		
04/03/13	T. Hwang	Analysis and evaluation regarding schedules, statement of financial affairs, and creditor lists; memorandum J. Murray, S. O'Neill, R. Franklin regarding same	0.40	168.00
04/30/13	T. Hwang	Review amended filings of debtor regarding statement of financial affairs and schedules	0.20	84.00
05/01/13	T. Hwang	Evaluation and analysis regarding amended schedules and statement of financial affairs (.6); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.80	336.00
05/01/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from T. Hwang regarding Statement of Financial Affairs (.1)	0.10	67.00
05/22/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding Monthly Operating Report (.1)	0.10	67.00
05/23/13	T. Hwang	Correspondence Committee regarding Monthly Operating Report (.1)	0.10	42.00
05/26/13	T. Hwang	Review and respond correspondence P. Marcoux regarding Debtor's Monthly Operating Report (.1)	0.10	42.00
05/27/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from R. Franklin regarding Debtor's January and February financials (.1)	0.10	67.00
06/19/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding sending May invoice to Debtor for Monthly Operating Report (.2)	0.20	134.00
06/20/13	T. Hwang	Correspondence H. Binder regarding fees and expenses of Committee counsel (.1)	0.10	42.00
06/20/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to H. Binder regarding committee attorney's fees and	0.10	67.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

EXHIBIT K

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 90

F	Financial Pleadings		
		costs for Debtor's Monthly Operating Report (.1)	
06/21/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to committee regarding Debtor's Monthly Operating Reports (.2)	0.20 134.00
06/21/13	T. Hwang	Evaluation regarding Debtor's Monthly Operating Report for May and amendment for April (.4); exchange correspondences R. Shakoori regarding same and regarding employment pleadings (.2); memorandum J. Murray regarding same; correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.70 294.00
06/25/13	T. Hwang	Review and evaluation Debtor's filings, amended schedules (.2); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.30 126.00
06/25/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding debtor's amended schedules (.1)	0.10 67.00
06/27/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to V. Chial regarding May invoice for Debtor's Monthly Operating Report (.2)	0.20 134.00
07/02/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding April and May fees and costs for debtor's Monthly Operating Report (.2)	0.20 134.00
07/22/13	R. Franklin	Review Monthly Operating Report for June 2013 (.5)	0.50 255.00
07/22/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding June fees and costs for Monthly Operating Report (.1); correspondence to committee regarding June fees and costs (.2)	0.30 201.00
07/22/13	J. Murray	Review June Monthly Operating Report (.3); correspondence to committee regarding same (.1); correspondence to T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.50 335.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 91

F		Financial Pleadings	
07/22/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding timing of debtor's Monthly Operating Report (.1)	0.10 67.00
07/23/13	J. Murray	Review debtor's supplement to Monthly Operating Report and correspondence to committee regarding same (.2)	0.20 134.00
08/16/13	R. Franklin	Draft correspondence G. Felcyn regarding Stmt. of Financial Affairs & Schedules (.3)	0.30 153.00
08/21/13	T. Hwang	Review Monthly Operating Report and Amended Monthly Operating Report (.2); correspondences Committee regarding same (.1)	0.30 126.00
08/22/13	T. Hwang	Review and evaluation correspondence G. Felcyn regarding Monthly Operating Report; review correspondences B. Franklin, S. Anhalt, R. Harris, P. Califano regarding document requests and Alliacense (.1)	0.10 42.00
08/25/13	T. Hwang	Investigation regarding Monthly Operating Reports of Debtor and amended reports, regarding Court docket; review June and July Monthly Operating Reports (.2); review and respond correspondence G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.30 126.00
08/26/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding Debtor's Monthly Operating Reports (.2)	0.20 134.00
09/10/13	T. Hwang	Analysis and evaluation regarding Dorsey fees and costs per Debtor's request (.2); correspondence R. Shakoori regarding same (.2)	0.40 168.00
09/10/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from R. Shakoori regarding Attorneys fees and costs, correspondence to V. Chial regarding	0.20 134.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 92

F	Financial Pleadings		
	same, telephone conference with V. Chial regarding same, correspondence to T. Hwang regarding same, telephone conference with T. Hwang regarding same (.2)		
09/23/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding debtor's Monthly Operating Report (.1)	0.10	67.00
09/23/13 T. Hwang	Review and evaluation regarding Debtor's Monthly Operating Report for August 2013, and memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.2); review and respond correspondence R. Franklin regarding same, regarding settlements by Debtor (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.40	168.00
10/16/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence to/from R. Shakoory regarding September fees and costs for Monthly Operating Report (.1)	0.10	67.00
10/17/13 T. Hwang	Analysis regarding professional fees and review and respond correspondence R. Shakoory regarding same, regarding Debtor's Monthly Operating Report (.2)	0.20	84.00
10/21/13 T. Hwang	Review Debtor's Monthly Operating Report (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.20	84.00
10/21/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from debtor's counsel regarding debtor's September Monthly Operating Report and correspondence to committee regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
11/05/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from T. Hwang regarding fees re Monthly Operating Report (.1)	0.10	67.00
11/19/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin	0.20	134.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 93

F	Financial Pleadings		
		regarding October fees and costs for Monthly Operating Report, correspondence to/from V. Chial regarding same (.2)	
11/21/13	R. Franklin	Review October Monthly Operating Report (.5)	0.50 255.00
12/19/13	T. Hwang	Correspondence J. Murray regarding Debtor Monthly Operating Report, regarding professional fees; meeting J. Murray regarding same (.1); investigation regarding same, and review and respond correspondence R. Shakoory regarding same (.3)	0.40 168.00
12/19/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding fees and costs for November Monthly Operating Report, interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same, review correspondence to R. Shakoory regarding same (.2)	0.20 134.00
12/20/13	J. Murray	Review debtor's Monthly Operating Report, analysis and evaluation regarding same, review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same, review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.3)	0.30 201.00
12/20/13	T. Hwang	Review and evaluation Monthly Operating Report (.1)	0.10 42.00
12/21/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding November Monthly Operating Report (.1)	0.10 67.00
01/21/14	T. Hwang	Exchange correspondences R. Shakoory regarding Monthly Operating Report; correspondence J. Murray regarding same (.2); review same (.2); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.50 210.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 94

F		Financial Pleadings	
01/21/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from R. Shakoori regarding Monthly Operating Report, correspondence to T. Hwang regarding same, miscellaneous regarding same (.2); review debtor's Monthly Operating Report, analysis and evaluation regarding same, review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.4)	0.60 402.00
01/23/14	T. Hwang	Review correspondence J. Murray and investigation regarding administrative expenses and Monthly Operating Report	0.20 84.00
01/27/14	T. Hwang	Analysis and evaluation Monthly Operating Reports, Disclosure Statement, employment applications and other pleadings regarding administrative claims and professional fees, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same	1.10 462.00
02/20/14	T. Hwang	Review and respond correspondence R. Shakoori regarding Monthly Operating Report (.1)	0.10 42.00
02/20/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence to R. Shakoori regarding January fees and costs for Monthly Operating Report, miscellaneous regarding same (.1)	0.10 67.00
02/21/14	T. Hwang	Review Monthly Operating Report and memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.2); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.30 126.00
02/21/14	J. Murray	Review Monthly Operating Report, review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.2)	0.20 134.00
02/24/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding debtor's Monthly Operating Report, review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.2)	0.20 134.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 95

F	Financial Pleadings	
Subtotal for	Financial Pleadings	7,146.00

Financial Pleadings

Task	Timekeeper	Rate	Hours	Amount
F	John Murray	670	5.10	3,417.00
F	Robert Franklin	510	1.30	663.00
F	Thomas Hwang	420	7.30	3,066.00
F	Total		13.70	7,146.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY