

1 JOHN WALSH MURRAY (074823)
ROBERT A. FRANKLIN (091653)
2 THOMAS T. HWANG (218678)
DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP
3 305 Lytton Avenue
Palo Alto, CA 94301
4 Telephone: (650) 857-1717
Facsimile: (650) 857-1288
5 Email: murray.john@dorsey.com
Email: franklin.robert@dorsey.com
6 Email: hwang.thomas@dorsey.com

7 Attorneys for Official
Committee of Unsecured Creditors
8

9 **UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT**
10 **NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA**
11 **SAN JOSE DIVISION**

12 In re:)	
13 TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED LLC,)	Case No. 13-51589-SLJ-11
14 fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED)	
15 INC., A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,)	Chapter 11
16 fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED,)	
17 A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,)	Date: April 9, 2014
)	Time: 1:30 p.m.
18 Debtor.)	Place: United States Bankruptcy Court
)	280 S. First Street, Room 3099
)	San Jose, CA 95113
)	Judge: Honorable Stephen L. Johnson

19 **EXHIBIT "L"**
20 **TO**
21 **FIRST APPLICATION FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES**
22 **BY ATTORNEYS FOR OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS**
23
24
25
26
27
28

EXHIBIT COVER

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 96

G		Investigation / Diligence re Debtor		
04/03/13	T. Hwang	Revise memorandum regarding case developments and debtor; meetings J. Murray regarding same (.3); review and evaluation UCC lien search results (.3)	0.60	252.00
04/11/13	T. Hwang	Review and investigation regarding debtor budget and power point presentation, regarding debtor meeting with committee (.2); correspondences E. Darda regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
04/11/13	J. Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding Debtor's slides regarding revenue projections (.3)	0.30	201.00
04/22/13	E. Darda	Emails with J. Murray regarding Alliasense presentation	0.20	60.00
04/22/13	T. Hwang	Legal research regarding debtor's duties of disclosure (.3)	0.30	126.00
04/22/13	R. Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding options to obtain information from Debtor (.4)	0.40	204.00
04/22/13	R. Franklin	Legal research regarding alter ego claim (.6); correspondence with K. Curry regarding alter ego claim (.4)	1.00	510.00
04/22/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to M. Leckrone regarding Allicense presentation (.1)	0.10	67.00
04/22/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from R. Franklin regarding alter ego claims (.2)	0.20	134.00
04/22/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to and from R. Harris regarding request for documents and NDA (.1); review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
04/22/13	J. Murray	Legal research regarding Debtor's obligation to provide financial information (.2); correspondence to and from team regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

EXHIBIT L

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 97

G		Investigation / Diligence re Debtor		
04/23/13	R. Franklin	Attend presentation by Alliacense to the Committee and Committee meeting (3.5); detailed telephone conference W. Smith regarding the NDA and analysis and evaluation regarding protective order (.3)	3.80	1,938.00
04/23/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from K. Beresford regarding meeting with Alliacense (.1); correspondence to and from R. Harris regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
04/23/13	J. Murray	Prepare for meeting with Alliacense (.3); attend same (3.5)	3.80	2,546.00
04/23/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from H. Binder regarding production of documents; correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
04/24/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from M. Lecrone regarding Alliacense presentation and correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding same (.1); correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding minutes of meeting regarding Alliacense (.1)	0.20	134.00
04/25/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to H. Binder regarding document request (.2)	0.20	134.00
04/26/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference C. Johnson and G. Felcyn regarding license fee from Ford Motor Company (.2)	0.20	134.00
04/28/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding payments to Alliacense (.2)	0.20	134.00
04/29/13	T. Hwang	Evaluation regarding status of nondisclosure agreement and memorandum R. Franklin regarding same, regarding Debtor's employment pleadings	0.10	42.00
04/29/13	R. Franklin	Review correspondence from Creditors' Committee members regarding pre-petition conduct of debtor, financial transactions	1.50	765.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 98

G		Investigation / Diligence re Debtor		
		and flow of funds (1.5)		
04/30/13	T. Hwang	Review and analysis waterfalls of payments to Alliacense and correspondences R. Franklin, H. Binder, D. Wright (.3); meeting J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same, regarding case status (.5)	0.80	336.00
04/30/13	R. Franklin	Review waterfalls from settlement proceeds (.2); correspondence with Committee regarding same (.1); review status of NDA (.1)	0.40	204.00
04/30/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from K. Curry regarding payments to Alliacense (.1)	0.10	67.00
05/07/13	T. Hwang	Review and evaluation multiple correspondences R. Franklin, R. Harris and S. Anhalt regarding nondisclosure agreement and committee requests for documents, and regarding responses to committee requests (.6)	0.60	252.00
05/07/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding disclosure of information (.1); correspondence to H. Binder and R. Harris regarding same (.2)	0.30	201.00
05/08/13	R. Franklin	Review and respond to correspondence S. Anhalt and W. Smith regarding response to production of documents (.6); interoffice conference J. Murray regarding procedures for access and use of documents (.2);	0.80	408.00
05/09/13	R. Franklin	Telephone call S. Kim regarding production of documents relating to OnSpec transaction and review and respond to correspondence regarding same (.3); draft correspondence S. Anhalt regarding production of further documents (.2)	0.50	255.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 99

G		Investigation / Diligence re Debtor		
05/10/13	R. Franklin	Review correspondence S. Anhalt, S. Kim and W. Smith regarding production of documents and respond to same (.5); analysis and evaluation regarding same (.3)	0.80	408.00
05/10/13	R. Franklin	Commence review of OnSpec transaction regarding Venkidu's alleged claim (1.2)	1.20	612.00
05/14/13	R. Franklin	Review correspondence from Committee members regarding pre-petition conduct of Debtor and analysis and evaluation regarding same (1.4)	1.40	714.00
05/14/13	R. Franklin	Review documents produced by Debtor and catalog same (3.9)	3.90	1,989.00
05/15/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences S. Anhalt regarding production of documents (.1)	0.10	42.00
05/20/13	R. Franklin	Continue review and cataloging of documents produced by Debtor (2.3)	2.30	1,173.00
05/20/13	R. Franklin	Review merger documents, purchase agreements, license agreements, security agreement and related documents regarding Venkidu security interest (1.5)	1.50	765.00
05/21/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding Venkidu transaction; correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.5)	0.50	335.00
05/21/13	T. Hwang	Review memorandum R. Franklin regarding Venkidu secured claim, merger agreement (.2)	0.20	84.00
05/21/13	R. Franklin	Review and analyze Venkidu transaction and draft memorandum regarding same (3.5)	3.50	1,785.00
05/22/13	T. Hwang	Review and analysis correspondences G. Felcyn and S. Anhalt regarding document request and documents produced regarding motion to reject Occam portfolio (1.2);	1.30	546.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 100

G		Investigation / Diligence re Debtor		
		memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)		
05/22/13	R. Franklin	Detailed telephone conference with S. Anhalt and R. Harris regarding Venkidu security interest (.3)	0.30	153.00
05/22/13	R. Franklin	Telephone conference with S. Kim regarding production of documents (.1); continue review and cataloging of documents (2.9)	3.00	1,530.00
05/23/13	T. Hwang	Review memorandum R. Franklin and correspondence from R. Harris regarding Venkidu security (.1)	0.10	42.00
05/23/13	R. Franklin	Continue review and cataloging of documents produced by Debtor (3.4); telephone conference with S. Kim regarding same (.1);	3.50	1,785.00
05/23/13	R. Franklin	Review Debtor's analysis of validity of Venkidu secured claim and draft response to same (.8)	0.80	408.00
05/23/13	J. Murray	Interoffice telephone conference with R. Franklin regarding Debtor's response regarding Venkidu issues (.1)	0.10	67.00
05/24/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondence R. Franklin to S. Anhalt regarding document production and motion to reject executory contracts (.1); review and respond correspondence R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.20	84.00
05/24/13	T. Hwang	Review and evaluation correspondences R. Franklin regarding Venkidu claim, security transaction (.1)	0.10	42.00
05/24/13	R. Franklin	Review and catalog documents (.6); correspondence with S. Kim regarding same (.1)	0.70	357.00
05/24/13	R. Franklin	Review correspondence regarding VNS	0.80	408.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 101

G	Investigation / Diligence re Debtor		
	portfolio and inquiry related to payment for expenses (.3); review VNS license agreement and related documents and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.5)		
05/24/13 R. Franklin	Analysis and evaluation Venkidu security interest, review correspondence R. Harris and draft correspondence W. Smith regarding same (.6)	0.60	306.00
05/24/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from attorney Harris regarding Venkidu (.1); analysis and evaluation regarding Debtor's position regarding Venkidu (2.2); correspondence to and from R. Harris regarding same (.1); telephone conference R. Harris regarding same (.5)	2.90	1,943.00
05/24/13 J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding J. Neal payments and employment contract (.2)	0.20	134.00
05/29/13 T. Hwang	Review documents and responses from S. Anhalt regarding Committee requests for documents, and regarding monthly operating report information (.2)	0.20	84.00
05/29/13 R. Franklin	Review correspondence S. Anhalt regarding further document requests (.2)	0.20	102.00
05/29/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding requested documents (.1); review correspondence from S. Kim regarding same (.1); review multiple correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding job descriptions (.1)	0.30	201.00
05/29/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding job descriptions for senior management, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
05/30/13 R. Franklin	Review Venkidu secured claim and	1.40	714.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 102

G		Investigation / Diligence re Debtor		
		supporting documents and develop analysis regarding validity thereof (1.4)		
05/31/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence of May 11, 2013 from P. Marcoux regarding debtor misconduct (.2)	0.20	134.00
06/04/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding financial information (.1)	0.10	67.00
06/06/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding production of documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
06/07/13	R. Franklin	Review status of production of documents (1.0); correspondence with S. Anhalt regarding same (.1)	1.10	561.00
06/07/13	R. Franklin	Review materials submitted by Committee members relative to pre-petition conduct by Debtor (1.2)	1.20	612.00
06/13/13	R. Franklin	Review status of production of documents and draft correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding same (.4)	0.40	204.00
06/13/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding production of documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
06/18/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt financing statements (.1)	0.10	67.00
06/24/13	R. Franklin	Review status of production of documents from Debtor and correspondence with S. Kim regarding 2006-2010 financials (.8)	0.80	408.00
06/24/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence form S. Anhalt regarding production of documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
06/25/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding employee job descriptions (.1); review correspondence from R. Harris regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
06/30/13	R. Franklin	Review status of production of documents, signatures on Alliacense NDA, amended	0.60	306.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 103

G		Investigation / Diligence re Debtor	
		Schedules and OnSpec payment regarding Venkidu (.6)	
07/02/13	R. Franklin	Draft correspondence R. Harris regarding job descriptions for Debtor's employees (.1)	0.10 51.00
07/03/13	R. Franklin	Review materials from S. Kim regarding evidence of fraudulent transfers (.3)	0.30 153.00
07/03/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to debtor regarding Alliacense financial statements (.1); review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding job descriptions (.1); review correspondence from M. Leckrone re production of documents (.1); correspondence to T. Hwang regarding same (.1)	0.40 268.00
07/08/13	R. Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding documents to be produced (.2)	0.20 102.00
07/15/13	R. Franklin	Correspondence M. Leckrone re status of production of documents (.2); correspondence with G. Felcyn regarding budget concerns and draft further document request to Debtor regarding same (.4)	0.60 306.00
07/16/13	R. Franklin	Review documents produced to date by Debtor and update index of documents - correspondence with Committee regarding same (2.1)	2.10 1,071.00
07/16/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Harris regarding committee request for information (.2)	0.20 134.00
07/16/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding investigation (.1); regarding correspondence from D. Wright regarding telephone call (.1); review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding production of	0.60 402.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 104

G
Investigation / Diligence re Debtor

		documents (.1); review correspondence from S. Kim regarding investigation of debtor (.1); correspondence to committee regarding correspondence from committee members (.1); review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding investigation (.1)		
07/16/13	R. Franklin	Correspondence with R. Harris regarding production of documents (.1)	0.10	51.00
07/17/13	R. Franklin	Correspondence with Committee regarding investigation (.3); detailed telephone conference R. Harris regarding document production and protocol (.4); review hard copies of documents received from S. Kim (.4); review Volume 1 of trial transcript from alter ego trial regarding potential evidence for motion to appoint trustee (1.5)	2.60	1,326.00
07/17/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding production of documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
07/18/13	R. Franklin	Review trial transcripts regarding alter ego trial (6.0)	6.00	3,060.00
07/19/13	R. Franklin	Review Volume 3 of alter ego trial transcript and statement of decision regarding alter ego trial (1.5)	1.50	765.00
07/24/13	R. Franklin	Review financial statements (.6)	0.60	306.00
07/29/13	R. Franklin	Correspondence with M. Leckrone and Committee regarding status of production of Alliacense documents (.2)	0.20	102.00
07/29/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to/from debtor/Alliacense regarding production of documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
07/29/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding production of documents (.1)	0.10	67.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 105

G		Investigation / Diligence re Debtor		
07/30/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding production of documents (.1); review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding third party litigation and correspondence to committee regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
07/30/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt and summary of litigation support expenses (.1)	0.10	42.00
07/31/13	R. Franklin	Review of appellate brief regarding facts in support of alter ego allegations and fraudulent conveyance (.3)	0.30	153.00
07/31/13	T. Hwang	Review and respond correspondence S. Kim regarding nondisclosure agreements (.1); investigation regarding same (.1); evaluation regarding nondisclosure agreements and review correspondences R. Franklin and J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
08/02/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris and C. Johnson regarding request for Dell license agreement (.2)	0.20	134.00
08/05/13	R. Franklin	Correspondence R. Harris regarding production of license agreement (.1)	0.10	51.00
08/05/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to R. Harris and S. Anhalt regarding request for Dell Contract (.1)	0.10	67.00
08/07/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to/from G. Felcyn, C. Johnson and T. Hwang regarding request for Dell license (.2)	0.20	134.00
08/07/13	T. Hwang	Review and respond correspondences G. Felcyn, C. Johnson regarding Dell license agreement (.1)	0.10	42.00
08/08/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin, S. Anhalt, C. Johnson, G. Felcyn and H. Binder regarding the Dell	0.10	67.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 106

G		Investigation / Diligence re Debtor		
		license (.1)		
08/09/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding Dell license agreement and correspondence to/from committee regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
08/14/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding Dell license agreement, review correspondence to G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
08/15/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding Dell license (.1)	0.10	67.00
08/19/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding debtor's production of Alliacense documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
08/20/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to P. Califano regarding production of Alliance documents (.1); review multiple correspondence to/from P. Marcoux, G. Felcyn and S. Kim regarding flow of funds regarding Dell License and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.30	201.00
08/20/13	R. Franklin	Review correspondence P. Marcoux regarding Alliacense payments on Dell License (.2); review Alliacense Services Agreement and notes of explanation of compensation and correspondence with P. Marcoux regarding same (.6)	0.80	408.00
08/22/13	R. Franklin	Review Alliacense Services Agreement and draft correspondence requesting further information and documents from TPL (.7); review correspondence R. Harris and S. Anhalt regarding same (.1); correspondence with P. Califano regarding Alliacense documents (.1)	0.90	459.00
08/23/13	R. Franklin	Detailed telephone conference with S.	0.50	255.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 107

G		Investigation / Diligence re Debtor	
		Anhalt regarding document production request (.5)	
08/27/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from P. Califano regarding production of documents regarding Alliacense (.1)	0.10 67.00
08/29/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences P. Califano and R. Franklin regarding production of documents from Alliacense (.1)	0.10 42.00
08/29/13	R. Franklin	Correspondence G. Felcyn regarding Alliacense financial statements (.1)	0.10 51.00
09/03/13	R. Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding status of document requests (.2)	0.20 102.00
09/04/13	R. Franklin	Correspondence P. Califano regarding Alliacense response to discovery requests (.2)	0.20 102.00
09/04/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from P. Califano regarding production of documents (.1)	0.10 67.00
09/04/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to/from committee and debtor regarding Alliacense production of documents, analysis and evaluation regarding strategy regarding same, review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.2)	0.20 134.00
09/05/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from committee regarding the Dell license (.1); review multiple correspondence to/from debtor regarding delivery of Kyocera license (.1); review correspondence to/from G. Felcyn, review correspondence S. Anhalt regarding production of documents re Alliacense (.2)	0.40 268.00
09/05/13	R. Franklin	Correspondence S. Anhalt regarding production of documents(.2); correspondence with P. Marcoux regarding production of licences (.1);	0.30 153.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 108

G		Investigation / Diligence re Debtor	
09/06/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences S. Anhalt regarding Alliacense; evaluation regarding Alliacense employee billing information	0.20 84.00
09/06/13	R. Franklin	Review Felcyn memorandum regarding employment contracts and draft correspondence S. Anhalt regarding request for further documents (.8)	0.80 408.00
09/06/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding call with S. Anhalt regarding Patriot's and Moore's agreement to waive 2.5% advances they are entitle to under the Moore settlement agreement (.2); review correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding Alliacense (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding employee bonus compensation claims, and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2); review correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding the Alliacense Incentive Compensation Plan referred to in the employment contracts (.1)	0.60 402.00
09/07/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondence and document production from M. Leckrone regarding document requests, regarding Alliacense (.1)	0.10 42.00
09/13/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding document request (.1)	0.10 67.00
09/13/13	R. Franklin	Draft correspondence S. Anhalt regarding status of production of document request (.1)	0.10 51.00
09/16/13	R. Franklin	Review new documents produced by Debtor (.5); correspondence with S. Anhalt regarding same (.1); draft correspondence M. Leckrone regarding production of Alliacense documents (.1); correspondence with with Committee regarding	1.20 612.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 109

G	Investigation / Diligence re Debtor		
	developments, status and further requests for production of documents (.2); review agreement between Debtor and Thunderbird Technologies and multiple correspondence with S. Anhalt and G. Felcyn regarding same (.3)		
09/16/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding calculation of employee incentive compensation claims and list of affiliate entities, multiple correspondence to committee regarding same (.2); review correspondence to/from S. Anhalt regarding Thunderbird Technologies agreement, correspondence to committee regarding same; review multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding same (.2); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding Alliacense contracts (.1)	0.50	335.00
09/18/13 T. Hwang	Review correspondence G. Felcyn regarding Committee agenda items, Alliacense, and memorandum J. Murray regarding payments to and services of Alliacense (.3)	0.30	126.00
09/18/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding payments to Alliacense by TPL and by PDS (.1); review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding Alliacense billings (.1)	0.20	134.00
09/19/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding Fast Logic documents (.1); review correspondence from M. Leckrone regarding production of documents, correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same, review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
09/20/13 T. Hwang	Review correspondence M. Leckrone and	0.10	42.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 110

G		Investigation / Diligence re Debtor		
		financial documents produced by Alliacense (.1)		
09/21/13	T. Hwang	Investigation regarding Debtor's projections and financial information (.2)	0.20	84.00
09/23/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding S. Kim letter regarding debtor's conduct (.1)	0.10	67.00
09/24/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to/from M. Leckrone regarding production of documents regarding Alliacense (.1)	0.10	67.00
09/28/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris, P. Califano and R. Franklin regarding Alliacense production of documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
09/28/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences R. Franklin, P. Califano, R. Harris regarding Alliacense and production of documents, regarding employee claims	0.10	42.00
09/30/13	R. Franklin	Review and respond to correspondence S. Anhalt regarding production of documents (.7); analysis and evaluation regarding connection between Alliacense and TPL (.6)	1.30	663.00
10/01/13	R. Franklin	Review correspondence S. Anhalt regarding production of documents relating to employment agreements (.2)	0.20	102.00
10/01/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding Alliacense claim and Alliacense incentive program, correspondence to committee regarding same, review correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding same, review multiple correspondence from T. Hwang regarding same, correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 111

G		Investigation / Diligence re Debtor		
10/01/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding memorandum regarding employee incentive claims (.1); review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding M. Leckrone's incentive compensation agreement (.1)	0.20	134.00
10/01/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding Alliance consulting agreement, etc. (.1)	0.10	67.00
10/02/13	T. Hwang	Review and legal research regarding alter ego theory and memorandum regarding same (.4); review correspondence from J. Murray and memorandum from G. Kaplan regarding same (.2)	0.60	252.00
10/02/13	R. Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding alter ego claims and substantive consolidation (.5)	0.50	255.00
10/02/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding Alliacense documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
10/03/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding Alliacense production of documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
10/04/13	R. Franklin	Review status of production of documents (1.0)	1.00	510.00
10/08/13	T. Hwang	Analysis and evaluation correspondences and documents from S. Anhalt regarding employee compensation claims and regarding proposed distribution scheme, Alliacense fees and rates (.4)	0.40	168.00
10/08/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding information from debtor (.1)	0.10	67.00
10/13/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin, G. Felcyn, S. Kim and S. Anhalt regarding forecasts and production	0.20	134.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 112

G		Investigation / Diligence re Debtor		
		of documents regarding Alliacense (.2)		
10/18/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding requested information (.1)	0.10	67.00
10/18/13	T. Hwang	Review and evaluation correspondence S. Anhalt and documents produced regarding information requested by Committee (.2)	0.20	84.00
10/21/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondence A. Anhalt regarding request for documents, regarding patents, and correspondence Committee regarding same (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.20	84.00
10/21/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding production of documents and correspondence to committee regarding same, review correspondence from G. Felcyn to S. Anhalt regarding debtor's revenue projections (.2)	0.20	134.00
10/22/13	T. Hwang	Review and evaluation correspondences S. Anhalt, G. Felcyn regarding Alliacense and analysis of patent prosecution costs (.1); memorandum R. Franklin, J. Murray regarding same, regarding case status; review memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	0.30	126.00
10/22/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence between S. Anhalt and G. Felcyn regarding debtor's projections, review multiple correspondence from T. Hwang and R. Franklin regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
10/29/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence from S. Anhalt and R. Harris regarding production of documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
10/29/13	R. Franklin	Telephone conference with G. Felcyn regarding production of documents (.1)	0.10	51.00
10/30/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence between G. Felcyn	0.10	67.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 113

G		Investigation / Diligence re Debtor		
		and S. Anhalt regarding requested information (.1)		
11/06/13	R. Franklin	Draft Request for Production of Documents to Alliacense (.6)	0.60	306.00
11/08/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding requested documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
11/08/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondence S. Anhalt regarding responses to Committee questions (.1)	0.10	42.00
11/08/13	R. Franklin	Review correspondence S. Anhalt regarding responses to Committee's informational requests and correspondence to Committee regarding same (.6)	0.60	306.00
01/09/14	R. Franklin	Draft Application for Rule 2004 Examination (1.2)	1.20	612.00
01/12/14	R. Franklin	Draft Application for Rule 2004 Examination of Alliacense (.8); draft proposed order (.2); review December 23 Disclosure Statement draft Production of Documents (1.3);	2.30	1,173.00
01/13/14	R. Franklin	Review and revise application for Rule 2004 Examination and production of documents (.3)	0.30	153.00
01/15/14	R. Franklin	Detailed telephone conference with P. Califano regarding Rule 2004 Examination (.2)	0.20	102.00
01/25/14	J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding Rule 2004 Examination of Alliacense (.1)	0.10	67.00
02/03/14	T. Hwang	Analysis and evaluation regarding Proofs of Claim, Stmt. of Financial Affairs and Schedules and Debtor's third-party expense payments; prepare report regarding same (.5)	0.50	210.00
02/04/14	T. Hwang	Analysis and evaluation regarding Proofs	0.20	84.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 114

G		Investigation / Diligence re Debtor		
		of Claim, Stmt. of Financial Affairs and Schedules and Debtor's third-party expense payments; prepare report regarding same		
02/06/14	T. Hwang	Investigation regarding Patriot Scientific SEC filings and memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.2); review correspondences J. Murray, C. Flowers, C. Johnson regarding stock ownership, and legal research regarding related issues (.5)	0.70	294.00
02/07/14	R. Franklin	Review and respond to correspondence P. Marcoux regarding Alliacense contract (.8)	0.80	408.00
02/10/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding 2012 agreement among PDS, Patriot, Alliacense and TPL (.1)	0.10	67.00
02/10/14	J. Murray	Analysis and evaluation multiple correspondence from C. Flowers, G. Felcyn and C. Johnson regarding share ownership in Patriot, correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
02/10/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from C. Johnson regarding T. Lavelle and PDS stalemate (.1)	0.10	67.00
02/11/14	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from C. Johnson regarding composition of PDS board (.2)	0.20	134.00
02/12/14	T. Hwang	Review Patriot-TPL settlement and memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
02/12/14	J. Murray	Review, analysis and evaluation of multiple correspondence from G. Felcyn of 1/31/14 regarding PDS, Alliacense and Agility (.4)	0.40	268.00
02/13/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from R. Harris regarding Patriot and Alliacense (.1)	0.10	67.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 115

G		Investigation / Diligence re Debtor		
02/13/14	R. Franklin	Review MMP agreements and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.8)	0.80	408.00
02/14/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding Rule 2004 Examination of D. Leckrone (.1)	0.10	67.00
02/18/14	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from G. Felcyn regarding Alliacense contract (.2); review correspondence and detailed memorandum from P. Marcoux regarding Alliacense (.9)	1.10	737.00
Subtotal for		Investigation / Diligence re Debtor		53,446.00

Investigation / Diligence re Debtor				
Task	Timekeeper	Rate	Hours	Amount
G	Erin Darda	300	0.20	60.00
G	John Murray	670	21.70	14,539.00
G	Robert Franklin	510	68.10	34,731.00
G	Thomas Hwang	420	9.80	4,116.00
G	Total		99.80	53,446.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

1 JOHN WALSHE MURRAY (074823)
ROBERT A. FRANKLIN (091653)
2 THOMAS T. HWANG (218678)
DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP
3 305 Lytton Avenue
Palo Alto, CA 94301
4 Telephone: (650) 857-1717
Facsimile: (650) 857-1288
5 Email: murray.john@dorsey.com
Email: franklin.robert@dorsey.com
6 Email: hwang.thomas@dorsey.com

7 Attorneys for Official
Committee of Unsecured Creditors

8
9 **UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT**
10 **NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA**
11 **SAN JOSE DIVISION**

12 In re:

13 **TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED LLC,**
14 **fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED**
15 **INC., A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**
16 **fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED,**
17 **A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**

18 Debtor.

Case No. 13-51589-SLJ-11

Chapter 11

Date: April 9, 2014

Time: 1:30 p.m.

Place: United States Bankruptcy Court
280 S. First Street, Room 3099
San Jose, CA 95113

Judge: Honorable Stephen L. Johnson

19 **EXHIBIT "M"**

20 **TO**

21 **FIRST APPLICATION FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES**
22 **BY ATTORNEYS FOR OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS**

23
24
25
26
27
28
EXHIBIT COVER

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 116

Ga		Investigation/Diligence re Debtor - Non Disclosure		
04/04/13	R. Franklin	Draft Committee NDA (.5)	0.50	255.00
04/16/13	R. Franklin	Review and revise NDA (2.8)	2.80	1,428.00
04/17/13	R. Franklin	Review correspondence from D. Wright regarding NDA and respond to same (.4); review and revise NDA (1.0)	1.40	714.00
04/25/13	R. Franklin	Review of Debtor's comments and changes to NDA and preliminary response to same (1.8); draft summary to Committee and draft response to Debtor's changes (1.5); detailed telephone conference D. Wright regarding revisions (.4); correspondence with S. Kim regarding revisions (.1); review and revise response (.5); detailed telephone conference W. Smith regarding revisions (.4)	4.70	2,397.00
04/25/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding NDA and correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
04/26/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from R. Franklin to Creditors' Committee regarding outstanding issues regarding NDA (.1)	0.10	67.00
04/26/13	R. Franklin	Correspondence with W. Smith regarding NDA (.3); detailed telephone conference D. Wright regarding developments and strategies for closing the NDA discussions (.7); review redlined agreement from the Debtor and correspondence with S. Kim regarding same (.4); revise NDA and draft correspondence to W. Smith regarding same (.5)	1.90	969.00
04/29/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences R. Franklin regarding nondisclosure agreement (.1)	0.10	42.00
04/29/13	R. Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding status of	2.20	1,122.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 117

Ga	Investigation/Diligence re Debtor - Non Disclosure		
	NDA (.2); review response by S. Anhalt to Committee's revisions to NDA and draft correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding same (.6); detailed telephone conference D. Wright regarding NDA and settlement procedures protocols (.6); detailed telephone conference H. Binder regarding NDA (.2); draft correspondence to Committee members regarding latest Debtor proposal and settlement procedures status (.4); correspondence with S. Kim regarding NDA (.2)		
04/30/13 T. Hwang	Review correspondences K. Curry, S. Kim, M. Brown, R. Franklin regarding nondisclosure agreement issues, and drafts of same (.4)	0.40	168.00
04/30/13 R. Franklin	Interoffice conference with J. Murray and T. Hwang regarding response to pending motions and NDA	0.50	255.00
04/30/13 R. Franklin	Detailed telephone conference S. Kim regarding NDA negotiations and background (.3); correspondence with S. Anhalt, H. Binder, P. Califano and W. Smith regarding revisions to NDA (.6)	0.90	459.00
04/30/13 J. Murray	Analysis and evaluation issues regarding NDA (.2)	0.20	134.00
04/30/13 J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding NDA (.1); review multiple correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding same (.2)	0.30	201.00
05/01/13 R. Franklin	Telephone call W. Smith regarding closure of NDA negotiation (.1); finalize and circulate NDA to Debtor and Committee members (.9); detailed telephone conference P. Califano regarding	1.30	663.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 118

Ga		Investigation/Diligence re Debtor - Non Disclosure	
		Alliacense NDA and background (.3)	
05/02/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences R. Franklin, R. Harris regarding request for loan documents and nondisclosure agreement (.1)	0.10 42.00
05/02/13	R. Franklin	Review communications and correspondence from Committee members and analysis and evaluation regarding pre-petition conduct of debtor (1.8)	1.80 918.00
05/03/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences R. Franklin, S. Kim regarding nondisclosure agreement and designation of confidential documents (.2)	0.20 84.00
05/03/13	R. Franklin	Review and respond to correspondence S. Kim regarding scope of NDA (.1); draft correspondence to S. Kim regarding request for identification of documents (.1); follow up with members regarding signatures (.4); draft correspondence to members regarding use and duty of confidentiality regarding "Confidential Information" (.4)	1.00 510.00
05/03/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to and from S. Kim regarding NDA (.1); review correspondence to M. Brown regarding execution of NDA (.1)	0.20 134.00
05/06/13	R. Franklin	Review status of signatures to NDA (.2); review and respond to correspondence W. Smith and R. Harris regarding same (.2)	0.40 204.00
05/07/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to and from S. Anhalt regarding scope of NDA (.2)	0.20 134.00
05/07/13	R. Franklin	Correspondence with S. Anhalt, W. Smith regarding signatures on NDA (.4); draft	0.80 408.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 119

Ga		Investigation/Diligence re Debtor - Non Disclosure		
		correspondence to Committee regarding handling of confidential information (.2); draft correspondence to Committee regarding production issues (.2)		
05/07/13	R. Franklin	Review response to production request and draft correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding same (1.2)	1.20	612.00
05/07/13	R. Franklin	Correspondence with S. Anhalt, H. Binder regarding objections to disclosure of information and solutions thereto (.2); commence review and cataloging of documents produced (.7)	0.90	459.00
05/07/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference H. Binder regarding NDA and C. Brown access to information (.2); telephone conference E. Keller regarding same (.2); interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.50	335.00
05/09/13	R. Franklin	Review and respond to correspondence P. Califano regarding NDA with Alliacense (.2)	0.20	102.00
05/14/13	R. Franklin	Correspondence P. Califano regarding NDA for Alliacense (.1)	0.10	51.00
05/15/13	R. Franklin	Conference M. Brown, C. Brown, S. Kim, J. Murray regarding documents and OnSpec transaction (.4); review documents regarding OnSpec transaction (1.0)	1.40	714.00
05/17/13	R. Franklin	Conference P. Califano regarding status of NDA with Alliacense (.1)	0.10	51.00
05/24/13	R. Franklin	Draft correspondence P. Califano regarding status of NDA from Alliacense (.4)	0.40	204.00
05/30/13	R. Franklin	Telephone conference with P. Califano regarding status of Alliacense NDA (.1); creditor G. Charles regarding signature on	0.20	102.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 120

Ga		Investigation/Diligence re Debtor - Non Disclosure	
		NDA with Debtor (.1)	
05/31/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to G. Charles regarding NDA (.1)	0.10 67.00
05/31/13	R. Franklin	Review proposed NDA from Alliacense and revise same (.4); draft correspondence Committee members regarding same (.2)	0.60 306.00
06/01/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from committee and debtor regarding Alliacense NDA (.2)	0.20 134.00
06/01/13	R. Franklin	Review correspondence D. Wright regarding NDA with Alliacense (.1); review and revise NDA (.4)	0.50 255.00
06/01/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding Alliacense NDA (.1); review correspondence to/from D. Wright regarding same (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.30 201.00
06/02/13	R. Franklin	Review correspondence regarding Alliacense NDA (.2); review and revise same and correspondence with D. Leckrone regarding same (.5)	0.70 357.00
06/03/13	R. Franklin	Review correspondence M. Brown regarding Alliacense NDA and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.4)	0.40 204.00
06/03/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence from R. Franklin regarding Alliacense NDA (.2)	0.20 134.00
06/05/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence form K. Beresford regarding Alliacense NDA (.1); review correspondence from D. Wright regarding same (.1)	0.20 134.00
06/05/13	R. Franklin	Review status of signatures to Alliacense NDA (.2)	0.20 102.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 121

Ga		Investigation/Diligence re Debtor - Non Disclosure	
06/10/13	R. Franklin	Review status of signatures on Alliacense NDA and draft correspondence Committee regarding same (.3); draft correspondence G. Charles regarding signature on Debtor NDA (.1)	0.40 204.00
06/10/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding Alliacense NDA (.1); review correspondence from G. Kaplan regarding same (.1)	0.20 134.00
06/13/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Kim regarding Alliacense NDA (.1)	0.10 67.00
06/24/13	R. Franklin	Review status of Alliacense NDA and draft correspondence to Committee members regarding signatures (.3)	0.30 153.00
06/24/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to committee regarding Alliacense NDA(.1)	0.10 67.00
06/24/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences R. Franklin regarding Alliacense Non-Disclosure Agreement; investigation regarding status of same (.2); correspondence G. Charles regarding same; memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.30 126.00
07/03/13	R. Franklin	Correspondence with G. Charles regarding Alliacense NDA (.1); correspondence with P. Califano and M. Leckrone regarding same and production of documents (.2)	0.30 153.00
07/05/13	R. Franklin	Review status of Alliacense NDA and draft correspondence M. Imhoff regarding same (.3)	0.30 153.00
07/08/13	R. Franklin	Review status of signatures to Alliacense NDA (.2); draft correspondence P. Califano and M. Leckrone regarding same (.2)	0.40 204.00
07/08/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to P. Califano and M. Leckrone regarding NDA	0.10 67.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 122

Ga		Investigation/Diligence re Debtor - Non Disclosure		
		and production of documents (.1)		
07/15/13	R. Franklin	Correspondence with M. Brown regarding signature on NDA (.1)	0.10	51.00
07/15/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to P. Califano regarding Alliasence NDAs and production of documents (.1)	0.10	67.00
07/16/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding Alliasence NDA (.1); correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same (.1);	0.20	134.00
07/16/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from C. Brown regarding NDA (.1)	0.10	67.00
07/17/13	R. Franklin	Review correspondence regarding Alliacense NDA signatures and confirm full execution (.4)	0.40	204.00
07/17/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding M. Brown Alliacense NDA (.1); review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding Alliacense NDA for M. Brown and Dorsey & Whitney (.1); review multiple correspondence to S. Anhalt regarding same (.1); review correspondence from C. Brown regarding Alliacense NDA (.1)	0.40	268.00
07/18/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding Dorsey & Whitney's executed NDA (.1)	0.10	67.00
07/31/13	R. Franklin	Review correspondence S. Kim regarding adding bankruptcy counsel to Alliacense and Debtor NDA's, analysis and evaluation regarding issues and respond thereto (.5)	0.50	255.00
07/31/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from S. Kim regarding Brown's retention of counsel and propriety of NDA (.2);	0.40	268.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 123

Ga		Investigation/Diligence re Debtor - Non Disclosure		
		correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same (.1); review correspondence to/from S. Kim regarding same (.1)		
08/26/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from debtor's counsel requesting NDAs, settlement regarding same, and correspondence to/from C. Cavazos regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
Subtotal for		Investigation/Diligence re Debtor - Non Disclosure		18,809.00

Investigation/Diligence re Debtor - Non Disclosure

Task	Timekeeper	Rate	Hours	Amount
Ga	John Murray	670	4.70	3,149.00
Ga	Robert Franklin	510	29.80	15,198.00
Ga	Thomas Hwang	420	1.10	462.00
Ga	Total		35.60	18,809.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

1 JOHN WALSHE MURRAY (074823)
ROBERT A. FRANKLIN (091653)
2 THOMAS T. HWANG (218678)
DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP
3 305 Lytton Avenue
Palo Alto, CA 94301
4 Telephone: (650) 857-1717
Facsimile: (650) 857-1288
5 Email: murray.john@dorsey.com
Email: franklin.robert@dorsey.com
6 Email: hwang.thomas@dorsey.com

7 Attorneys for Official
Committee of Unsecured Creditors

8
9 **UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT**
10 **NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA**
11 **SAN JOSE DIVISION**

12 In re:

13 **TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED LLC,**
14 **fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED**
15 **INC., A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**
fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED,
A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,

16 Debtor.

Case No. 13-51589-SLJ-11

Chapter 11

Date: April 9, 2014

Time: 1:30 p.m.

Place: United States Bankruptcy Court
280 S. First Street, Room 3099
San Jose, CA 95113

Judge: Honorable Stephen L. Johnson

18
19 **EXHIBIT "N"**

20 **TO**

21 **FIRST APPLICATION FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES**
22 **BY ATTORNEYS FOR OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS**

23
24
25
26
27
28
EXHIBIT COVER

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 124

H		Motion for Relief from Stay		
04/08/13	T. Hwang	Evaluation and analysis regarding debtor's motion for relief from stay, and legal research regarding same (1.4); meetings J. Murray regarding same (.2); draft opposition to same (4.2)	5.80	2,436.00
04/08/13	R. Franklin	Review oppositions to Debtor's Relief from Automatic Stay motion (.3)	0.30	153.00
04/08/13	J. Murray	Interoffice conference with T. Hwang regarding Debtor's Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay (.2)	0.20	134.00
04/09/13	T. Hwang	Review responses of ACER and HTC regarding motion for stay relief (.2); obtain pleadings regarding same; meeting J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.30	126.00
04/09/13	J. Murray	Analysis and review regarding Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay (.5)	0.50	335.00
04/10/13	T. Hwang	Evaluation and analysis regarding debtor's response to committee opposition to relief from stay, and memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same	0.40	168.00
04/10/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from Attorney Harris regarding Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay	0.10	67.00
04/10/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference with Attorney Harris regarding telephonic conference call with Creditors' Committee regarding Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay, etc. (.3)	0.30	201.00
04/10/13	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence from H. Binder regarding service of Reply (.1); review Debtor's Reply to Creditors' Committee's Opposition to Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay (.6); prepare for hearing regarding same (.6)	1.30	871.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 125

H		Motion for Relief from Stay		
04/10/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from P. Marcoux regarding Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay (.1)	0.10	67.00
04/11/13	J. Murray	Prepare for hearing regarding Debtor's Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay regarding NorCal litigation (.8); attend same (2.5)	3.30	2,211.00
04/11/13	J. Murray	Attend meeting with Creditors' Committee and Debtor regarding Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay, cash flow and litigation (4.5)	4.50	3,015.00
04/17/13	J. Murray	Continue preparation of Order regarding Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay (.4)	0.40	268.00
04/17/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding Order regarding Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay (.1)	0.10	67.00
04/17/13	J. Murray	Review and revise Order regarding Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay regarding NorCal actions (.2); correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
04/18/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to and from D. Wright regarding Order on Motion for Relief on Automatic Stay (.2); review multiple correspondence from Creditors' Committee members regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00
04/18/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Harris and H. Binder regarding form of Order regarding Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay	0.20	134.00
04/19/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to and from H. Binder regarding Order regarding Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay (.2)	0.20	134.00
04/20/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding further Opposition to Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay regarding NorCal	0.30	201.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 126

H		Motion for Relief from Stay		
		litigation (.1); telephone conference R. Franklin regarding same (.1); correspondence to H. Binder regarding Order regarding Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay (.1)		
04/20/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from D. Rao regarding Stipulation for Relief from Automatic Stay regarding Brown litigation; review proposed stipulation (.2); correspondence to R. Franklin and S. Kim regarding same (.1); correspondence to D. Rao regarding same (.1)	0.40	268.00
04/22/13	R. Franklin	Draft supplemental opposition to Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay filed by Debtor regarding the NorCal actions (.8); review and revise same (.2)	1.00	510.00
04/22/13	R. Franklin	Review proposed Stipulation for Relief from Automatic Stay regarding the Browns (.2); detailed telephone conference S. Kim regarding Stipulation (.2); correspondence with Committee members and Debtor's counsel regarding Stipulation (.2)	0.60	306.00
04/22/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to and from H. Binder regarding Order regarding Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay (.2)	0.20	134.00
04/22/13	J. Murray	Review Creditors' Committee supplemental objection to Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay	0.20	134.00
04/22/13	J. Murray	Review Patriots memorandum of Points and Authorities and declaration regarding Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay and settlement protocol Motion (.2)	0.20	134.00
04/22/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from H. Binder regarding Creditors' Committee Opposition to Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay; correspondence to Creditors' Committee	0.10	67.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 127

H		Motion for Relief from Stay		
		regarding same (.1)		
04/22/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from R. Franklin regarding Stipulation regarding Relief from Automatic Stay regarding Brown (.1); review multiple correspondence to Creditors' Committee and Debtor's counsel regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
04/24/13	J. Murray	Attend hearing regarding Debtor's Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay and Motion to establish settlement protocol (3.5)	3.50	2,345.00
04/26/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences R. Franklin regarding nondisclosure agreement and regarding stay relief and stipulation regarding Browns (.1)	0.10	42.00
04/26/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to and from H. Binder regarding Brown Stipulation regarding Relief from Automatic Stay (.1); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
04/26/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from R. Harris regarding form of Order regarding Debtors' Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay (.2); review correspondence to and from T. Walker and R. Harris regarding same (.2); review correspondence from R. Eisenbach regarding same (.1)	0.50	335.00
04/30/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to and from attorney Harris regarding revised Order regarding Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay (.1); analysis and evaluation regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
Subtotal for		Motion for Relief from Stay		15,667.00

Motion for Relief from Stay

Task	Timekeeper	Rate	Hours	Amount
------	------------	------	-------	--------

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
Page 128

H	John Murray	670	17.80	11,926.00
H	Robert Franklin	510	1.90	969.00
H	Thomas Hwang	420	6.60	2,772.00
H	Total		26.30	15,667.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

1 JOHN WALSHE MURRAY (074823)
ROBERT A. FRANKLIN (091653)
2 THOMAS T. HWANG (218678)
DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP
3 305 Lytton Avenue
Palo Alto, CA 94301
4 Telephone: (650) 857-1717
Facsimile: (650) 857-1288
5 Email: murray.john@dorsey.com
Email: franklin.robert@dorsey.com
6 Email: hwang.thomas@dorsey.com

7 Attorneys for Official
Committee of Unsecured Creditors

8
9 **UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT**
10 **NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA**
11 **SAN JOSE DIVISION**

12 In re:

13 **TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED LLC,**
14 **fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED**
15 **INC., A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**
16 **fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED,**
17 **A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**

18 Debtor.

Case No. 13-51589-SLJ-11

Chapter 11

Date: April 9, 2014

Time: 1:30 p.m.

Place: United States Bankruptcy Court
280 S. First Street, Room 3099
San Jose, CA 95113

Judge: Honorable Stephen L. Johnson

19 **EXHIBIT "O"**

20 **TO**

21 **FIRST APPLICATION FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES**
22 **BY ATTORNEYS FOR OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS**

23
24
25
26
27
28
EXHIBIT COVER

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 129

I		Executory Contracts and Licenses	
05/14/13	T. Hwang	Evaluation and analysis regarding Debtor's motion to reject license agreement and related pleadings (1.0); memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.8)	1.80 756.00
05/14/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding Debtor's Motion to reject Occam license and correspondence to Creditors' Committee regarding same (.3)	0.30 201.00
05/15/13	J. Murray	Review Debtor's Motion to restrict access to Motion regarding Occam (.1); review Court Order regarding same (.1)	0.20 134.00
05/16/13	T. Hwang	Review correspondences G. Felcyn and S. Kim regarding motion to reject Occam license (.1); correspondence committee members regarding same (.1); review motion and new filings by debtor regarding same; review Court order regarding same (.2)	0.40 168.00
05/20/13	T. Hwang	Memorandum R. Franklin regarding request for documents and information, regarding Debtor's motion to reject Occam patents (.6); conference R. Franklin regarding same (.1); review correspondence W. Smith regarding same and correspondence G. Felcyn regarding same (.1)	0.80 336.00
05/20/13	R. Franklin	Interoffice conference T. Hwang and J. Murray regarding Occam motion, cash collateral and employment applications of Debtor's professionals (.3)	0.30 153.00
05/23/13	T. Hwang	Evaluation regarding documents and Debtor's responses, regarding motion to reject and draft report to Committee regarding same (.9); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1); meeting R.	1.50 630.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

EXHIBIT O

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 130

I		Executory Contracts and Licenses		
		Franklin regarding same (.2); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.3)		
05/23/13	R. Franklin	Analysis and evaluation regarding Motion to Reject Occam License (.3); interoffice conference T. Hwang regarding same (.3)	0.60	306.00
05/24/13	R. Franklin	Draft correspondence S. Anhalt regarding Occam motion and analysis and evaluation regarding same (.5)	0.50	255.00
05/24/13	J. Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding status of Debtor's response to question regarding Motion to reject Occum contract (.2)	0.20	134.00
05/28/13	T. Hwang	Correspondence Committee regarding Debtor's motion to reject Occam patent portfolio, case status (.5)	0.50	210.00
05/29/13	T. Hwang	Evaluation regarding assignment agreement between Occam Portfolio LLC and J. Fjelstad, and regarding monthly operating report and proposed payments to Debtor (.4); meeting R. Franklin regarding same (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same (.1)	0.60	252.00
05/29/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from S. Anhalt regarding Occum agreement (.1)	0.10	67.00
05/29/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence to Committee regarding OPL assignment agreement regarding Occam motion to reject (.1); review multiple detailed correspondence to Committee regarding Motion to reject Occam portfolio contract (.4); correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same and relation to cash collateral motion (.1)	0.60	402.00
06/24/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from R. Harris regarding payment to OnSpec (.1);	0.20	134.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 131

I		Executory Contracts and Licenses		
		correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.1)		
07/01/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding OnSpec payment (.1)	0.10	67.00
07/30/13	T. Hwang	Review and evaluation correspondences W. Smith, K. Curry regarding proposed sale (.1)	0.10	42.00
08/01/13	J. Murray	Review correspondence from M. Imhoff regarding iListen transaction and correspondence to M. Imhoff regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
08/02/13	T. Hwang	Memorandum R. Franklin regarding request for Dell license agreement; review correspondence C. Johnson, R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.10	42.00
08/04/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from committee regarding iListen transaction (.2)	0.20	134.00
08/05/13	J. Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding debtor's proposed transaction with iListen (.4); correspondence to/from committee regarding same (.2)	0.60	402.00
08/05/13	T. Hwang	Review and evaluation regarding memoranda R. Franklin and J. Murray regarding questions and responses to G. Felcyn (.3); review correspondences Committee members regarding proposed sale of iListen hearing aid chip sale (.1)	0.40	168.00
08/07/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to G. Felcyn regarding contacting debtor regarding iListen transaction (.1)	0.10	67.00
09/04/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference with L. Stenfeldt regarding client interest in patents (.2)	0.20	134.00
11/11/13	R. Franklin	Review voice mail from K. Prochnow and	0.40	204.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 132

I	Executory Contracts and Licenses		
	research issue re executory contracts raised by him and respond (.4)		
01/02/14 R. Franklin	Review executory contracts issues and telephone conference with G. Felcyn regarding same (.5)	0.50	255.00
01/03/14 R. Franklin	Review commercialization agreements with MCM and HSM and Alliacense (.2); draft correspondence G. Felcyn regarding same (.3); analysis and evaluation regarding executory contracts (.5); review license agreements (.9)	1.90	969.00
01/05/14 J. Murray	Review correspondence from K. Hiensch regarding Fujitsu, miscellaneous regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
01/06/14 J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding inquiry from K. Hiensch regarding Fujitsu (.1); correspondence to K. Hiensch regarding same (.1)	0.20	134.00
01/07/14 J. Murray	Review detailed correspondence from K. Heinsch regarding Fujitsu license and Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
01/08/14 J. Murray	Review correspondence from L. McDowell regarding Toshiba license and Creditors Committee Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	67.00
01/09/14 R. Franklin	Detailed telephone conference with E. Friedman regarding Hewlett Packard license (.2)	0.20	102.00
01/13/14 J. Murray	Review correspondence from L. McDowell regarding Toshiba license and Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement, review correspondence from T.	0.40	268.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 133

I	Executory Contracts and Licenses		
		Hwang regarding same, review correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.2); review multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding discussion of licenses in Disclosure Statement (.1); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding assumption of licenses (.1)	
01/13/14	T. Hwang	Telephone conference with L. McDowell regarding Plan of Reorganization and treatment of executory contracts (.1); memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.1); analysis and evaluation correspondence L. McDowell regarding same (.1); correspondence Committee regarding same (.2)	0.50 210.00
01/14/14	T. Hwang	Correspondence L. McDowell regarding Plan of Reorganization and treatment of executory contracts (.1); review correspondence R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.20 84.00
01/14/14	R. Franklin	Detailed telephone conference with E. Friedman regarding HP license (.2); correspondence with E. Friedman, L. Botts and K. Hiensch regarding same (.2)	0.30 153.00
01/14/14	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence from Creditors Committee regarding assumption of licenses under Plan of Reorganization, review correspondence from L. McDowell regarding same (.2); review correspondence from G. Felcyn regarding rejection of Alliacense / TPL agreement (.1)	0.30 201.00
01/15/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence form L. McDowell regarding Toshiba license (.1); review correspondence from K. Heinsch regarding Fujitsu license (.1); review	0.30 201.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 134

I	Executory Contracts and Licenses		
	correspondence from E. Friedman regarding HP license (.1)		
01/15/14 T. Hwang	Review and evaluation correspondences L. MacDowell, K. Heinsch, E. Friedman regarding Plan of Reorganization and executory contracts	0.20	84.00
01/15/14 T. Hwang	Review and evaluation correspondences L. MacDowell, K. Heinsch, E. Friedman regarding Plan of Reorganization and executory contracts	0.20	84.00
01/16/14 J. Murray	Review correspondence from L. McDowell regarding extension of time to object to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement, correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same, review correspondence from T. Hwang regarding same (.2); review objections of HP and Fujitsu to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.2); review Fujitsu's motion to appoint licensee's committee, joinders by Nikon, Blackberry and Alcon to same(.8); review joinder of Direct TV, Mattel and NEC to Fujitsu's objection to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.1)	1.30	871.00
01/16/14 T. Hwang	Telephone conference with L. McDowell regarding case status, executory contracts and Plan of Reorganization (.1); review correspondence L. McDowell regarding same, and memorandum J. Murray regarding same (.1); review objections to Disclosure Statement and joinders of objections, and evaluation regarding K. Prochnow regarding same (.1); review correspondences R. Frankling and J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.40	168.00
01/17/14 T. Hwang	Review and analysis objections to Disclosure Statement by Fujitsu, and	1.80	756.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 135

I	Executory Contracts and Licenses		
	memoranda R. Franklin regarding proposed resolutions of same (1.7); review correspondences R. Franklin regarding same (.1)		
01/17/14 R. Franklin	Review Fujitsu objection to Disclosure Statement and draft correspondence K. Hiensch regarding same (1.3)	1.30	663.00
01/17/14 J. Murray	Review correspondence to/from K. Heinsch regarding Fujitsu license, review correspondence to T. Hwang regarding same, review correspondence to/from J. Wesolowski regarding same, review memorandum from T. Hwang regarding same, review multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding same (.4); review correspondence to Fujitsu regarding objection to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.50	335.00
01/18/14 J. Murray	Review correspondence from K. Prochnow regarding Fujitsu motion to appoint licensees' committee, sanctions, legal research regarding same (.3)	0.30	201.00
01/20/14 J. Murray	Review objection of Toshiba to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	67.00
01/21/14 T. Hwang	Review correspondences E. Friedman regarding treatment of licenses and Hewlett Packard objection (.1); evaluation and analysis memorandum from R. Franklin and revisions to Disclosure Statement regarding treatment of licenses and Fujitsu objection, and memoranda R. Franklin regarding same (.8); meetings R. Franklin regarding same (.2)	1.10	462.00
01/21/14 R. Franklin	Review Fujitsu objection (1.2); legal research regarding pass through of	3.90	1,989.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 136

I

Executory Contracts and Licenses

executory contracts (1.4); telephone conferences with E. Friedman regarding HP objection (.3); detailed telephone conference with K. Hiensch regarding Fujitsu objection (.4); review Apple objection (.1); analysis and evaluation regarding responses to objection (.5)

01/21/14 J. Murray

Multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding Catapult issues regarding assumption and assignment of IP licenses (.2); review multiple correspondence to/from K. Heinsch regarding Fujitsu license regarding Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement, review multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding revisions of language in Disclosure Statement regarding same (.2); review multiple correspondence to/from E. Friedman regarding HP license and Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.1); review correspondence from P. Marcoux regarding Fujitsu Motion for appointment of licensees' committee (.1); review correspondence from R. Franklin regarding resolution of licensees' objections to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.2); review joinders to Fujitsu's objection to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.2); multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding licensees and objections to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.2)

1.20 804.00

01/22/14 T. Hwang

Analysis and evaluation objections and proposed edits to Plan of Reorganization from Fujitsu, and memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (1.7)

1.70 714.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 137

I		Executory Contracts and Licenses	
01/22/14	R. Franklin	Review language suggested by Fujitsu for inclusion into the plan (.5)	0.50 255.00
01/22/14	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from K. Heinsch regarding Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.2)	0.20 134.00
01/23/14	R. Franklin	Correspondence with K. Hiensch regarding additional concerns by Fujitsu and requesting Alliacense Services Agreement (.3); draft correspondence C. Hoge regarding same (.3)	0.60 306.00
01/23/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from L. Engel regarding "meet & confer" regarding Fujitsu objection to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement, interoffice conference R. Franklin regarding same (.1); review correspondence to/from R. Franklin and K. Heinsch regarding Fujitsu objection to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.1); review correspondence from C. Hoge regarding Fujitsu and Alliacense executory contracts (.1)	0.30 201.00
01/24/14	R. Franklin	Correspondence with C. Hoge regarding Licensee's proposed language for Disclosure Statement (.2); analysis and evaluation regarding same (.4)	0.60 306.00
01/24/14	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from J. Wesolowski, L. Engel and R. Harris regarding status of Fujitsu objection to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10 67.00
01/27/14	J. Murray	Review motions to appear pro hac vice and notice of appearance of L. McDowell and J. Swenson for Toshiba (.1)	0.10 67.00
01/29/14	T. Hwang	Review memorandum J. Murray regarding plan and executory contracts issues, and	1.40 588.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 138

I	Executory Contracts and Licenses		
	legal research and analysis license agreements and licenses (1.0); memorandum J. Murray, R. Franklin regarding same (.2); review correspondences J. Murray, R. Franklin, H. Binder, K. Hiensch, E. Freidman regarding licensee issues (.2)		
01/29/14 R. Franklin	Review correspondence E. Friedman and K. Hiensch regarding suggested language resolving objection of counter parties to license contracts (.2); review and revise language (.6)	0.80	408.00
01/29/14 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding Motion to appoint licensees' committee, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
01/29/14 J. Murray	Correspondence to/from H. Binder and R. Franklin regarding resolution of licensees' issues and Creditors Committee Disbursing Agent, review multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin, K. Heinsch and E. Friedman regarding same, correspondence to R. Franklin regarding same (.2); review correspondence from L. Stenfeldt regarding Sony license and Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.1); correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding debtor's position regarding Motion for appointment of licensee committee (.1)	0.40	268.00
01/30/14 T. Hwang	Analysis and evaluation regarding correspondences and proposed amendments to Plan of Reorganization from K. Hiensch, E. Friedman, and draft revisions and comments regarding same (.8); memorandum R. Franklin regarding same (.1)	0.90	378.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 139

I	Executory Contracts and Licenses		
01/30/14 R. Franklin	Review and provide comments regarding language in Disclosure Statement regarding licensees (1.5); correspondence with licensees' counsel regarding same (.2); review and revise Disclosure Statement (4.0)	5.70	2,907.00
01/30/14 J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from R. Franklin, K. Heinsch, E. Friedman, L. Stenfeldt, A. Lewis, L. McDowell and J. Wesolowski regarding resolution of licensees' objection to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.2)	0.20	134.00
01/31/14 J. Murray	Review correspondence from K. Heinsch to J. Wesolowski regarding resolution of licensees' objection to Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement, miscellaneous regarding same (.1)	0.10	67.00
02/03/14 R. Franklin	Prepare for meeting with counsel for licensees (.3); conference call A. Lewis, K. Heinsch, L. Stenfeldt, L. McDowell and E. Friedman regarding language for Disclosure Statement (.8); continue preparation of revisions to Disclosure Statement (2.4)	3.50	1,785.00
02/05/14 J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from licensees' counsel L. Stenfeldt, A. Lewis, K. Heinsch and R. Franklin regarding treatment of licensees under Creditors Committee's Plan of Reorganization (.2)	0.20	134.00
02/06/14 J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from J. Wesolowski, K. Heinsch and R. Harris regarding licensee's objection to Disclosure Statement and continuance of licensees' motion for a committee, correspondence to/from R. Franklin regarding same, review correspondence from L. Engel	0.20	134.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 140

I		Executory Contracts and Licenses		
		regarding upstream licenses (.2)		
02/07/14	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from R. Harris, L. Engel, K. Heinsch and J. Wesolowski regarding continuance of hearing on licensees' motion (.1)	0.10	67.00
02/10/14	R. Franklin	Review correspondence licensee attorneys regarding revisions to language and response to objection to Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	51.00
02/10/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from G. Kaplan, L. McDowell, E. Friedman, A. Lewis and P. Marcoux regarding questions regarding and questions concerning Disclosure Statement, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.20	134.00
02/10/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from K. Heinsch regarding Disclosure Statement, Plan of Reorganization and 2012 agreement (.1); miscellaneous regarding continuance of licensees' motion for appointment of a committee (.1)	0.20	134.00
02/13/14	T. Hwang	Review correspondences K. Hiensch, R. Franklin regarding licensee objections, amendments to Plan of Reorganization (.1)	0.10	42.00
02/13/14	R. Franklin	Correspondence with K. Hiensch regarding language requested by Licensees (.3)	0.30	153.00
02/14/14	R. Franklin	Correspondence with K. Hiensch regarding licensee's language (.2); review correspondence L. Engel regarding additional request (.2); review license agreements and commercialization agreements and concept of riding through bankruptcy (2.0)	2.40	1,224.00
02/14/14	J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from K. Heinsch and L. Engel regarding	0.20	134.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 141

I	Executory Contracts and Licenses		
	disclosure statement and treatment of licensees (.2)		
02/21/14 T. Hwang	Review objections filed by Apple and licensees to Debtor and Committee Disclosure Statements (.2)	0.20	84.00
02/21/14 R. Franklin	Review objection by Licensees to Disclosure Statement (.5); interoffice conference J. Murray regarding same (.1)	0.60	306.00
02/21/14 R. Franklin	Detailed telephone conference K. Prochnow regarding licensee's objection (.2)	0.20	102.00
02/21/14 J. Murray	Review objections of Apple, HP and Toshiba to Creditors Committee's Disclosure Statement, correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding same (.4); review joinders in same (.2)	0.60	402.00
02/22/14 J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding licensees' proposed language for Creditors Committee Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	67.00
02/24/14 R. Franklin	Conference call with S. Anhalt and R. Harris regarding licensee's objection (.5); analysis and evaluation regarding upstream licensors (.3) conference call with R. Harris, S. Anhalt, L. Engel, K. Hiensch, E. Friedman and A. Lewis regarding licensee objection (.8)	1.60	816.00
02/24/14 J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from K. Heinsch regarding meet and confer regarding licensee's requested revisions to Disclosure Statement (.1)	0.10	67.00
02/25/14 R. Franklin	Draft correspondence and telephone conference with R. Harris regarding licensee objection and continuance of Disclosure Statement hearing date (.2); correspondence with K. Hiensch regarding	0.40	204.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 142

I	Executory Contracts and Licenses		
	same (.1); interoffice conference J. Murray regarding same (.1)		
02/25/14 J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin regarding licenses (.1); review multiple correspondence to/from S. Anhalt and K. Heinsch regarding revisions to Disclosure Statement regarding licensees (.1)	0.20	134.00
02/26/14 J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from S. Anhalt and K. Heinsch regarding language in Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement regarding treatment of licensees, MMP (.1)	0.10	67.00
02/26/14 T. Hwang	Review correspondence H. Binder regarding discussions with licensee parties, regarding correspondence S. Sukduong (.1)	0.10	42.00
02/26/14 J. Murray	Correspondence to R. Franklin and T. Hwang regarding IP licenses (.1)	0.10	67.00
02/27/14 R. Franklin	Review iterations of licensee requested language regarding consent of patent owners (.4) attend conference call with L. Engel, K. Hiensch, E. Freidman, R. Harris and S. Anhalt regarding negotiation of language of consent by patent owners (.8)	1.20	612.00
02/27/14 J. Murray	Review multiple correspondence to/from E. Friedman, K. Heinsch and R. Franklin regarding licensees' requested revisions to Disclosure Statement ((.2)	0.20	134.00
Subtotal for	Executory Contracts and Licenses		28,891.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
Page 143

**Executory Contracts and
Licenses**

Task	Timekeeper	Rate	Hours	Amount
I	John Murray	670	12.10	8,107.00
I	Robert Franklin	510	28.40	14,484.00
I	Thomas Hwang	420	15.00	6,300.00
I	Total		55.50	28,891.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

1 JOHN WALSHE MURRAY (074823)
ROBERT A. FRANKLIN (091653)
2 THOMAS T. HWANG (218678)
DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP
3 305 Lytton Avenue
Palo Alto, CA 94301
4 Telephone: (650) 857-1717
Facsimile: (650) 857-1288
5 Email: murray.john@dorsey.com
Email: franklin.robert@dorsey.com
6 Email: hwang.thomas@dorsey.com

7 Attorneys for Official
Committee of Unsecured Creditors
8

9 **UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT**
10 **NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA**
11 **SAN JOSE DIVISION**

12 In re:

13 **TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED LLC,**
14 **fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED**
15 **INC., A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,**
fka TECHNOLOGY PROPERTIES LIMITED,
A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION,

16 Debtor.
17

Case No. 13-51589-SLJ-11

Chapter 11

Date: April 9, 2014

Time: 1:30 p.m.

Place: United States Bankruptcy Court
280 S. First Street, Room 3099
San Jose, CA 95113

Judge: Honorable Stephen L. Johnson

18
19 **EXHIBIT "P"**

20 **TO**

21 **FIRST APPLICATION FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES**
22 **BY ATTORNEYS FOR OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS**
23
24
25
26
27
28

EXHIBIT COVER

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 144

J		Compensation of Professionals - Dorsey & Whitney LL		
04/20/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to C. Cavazos regarding project billing categories	0.10	67.00
06/07/13	J. Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (1.5)	1.50	1,005.00
06/10/13	J. Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (1.4)	1.40	938.00
06/11/13	J. Murray	Telephone conference with B. Pionk regarding project billing categories for Application for Compensation (.3)	0.30	201.00
06/14/13	R. Franklin	Continue preparation of application for compensation (1.3)	1.30	663.00
06/14/13	J. Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (.8)	0.80	536.00
06/25/13	J. Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (1.3)	1.30	871.00
06/26/13	J. Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (.5)	0.50	335.00
06/28/13	J. Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (.3)	0.30	201.00
07/01/13	J. Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (1.1)	1.10	737.00
07/05/13	J. Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (.1)	0.10	67.00
08/05/13	J. Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (.5)	0.50	335.00
08/06/13	J. Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (1.4)	1.40	938.00
08/14/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to committee regarding July fees and costs (.2); correspondence to R. Harris regarding same (.1)	0.30	201.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 145

		Compensation of Professionals - Dorsey & Whitney LL	
J			
09/11/13	J. Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (1.2)	1.20 804.00
09/17/13	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from B. Pionk regarding time summaries (.1); correspondence to H. Binder and R. Harris regarding interim Applications for Compensation (.1)	0.20 134.00
09/18/13	J. Murray	Analysis and evaluation August invoice and correspondence to committee regarding same (.2)	0.20 134.00
12/12/13	J. Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding Application for Compensation (.1)	0.10 67.00
12/26/13	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from V. Chial regarding Application for Compensation, analysis and evaluation regarding same (.2)	0.20 134.00
12/27/13	J. Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (.9); multiple correspondence to V. Chial regarding same (.1)	1.00 670.00
12/30/13	J. Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (2.3); correspondence to H. Binder regarding negotiations on Applications for Compensation; review court calendar regarding same, legal research regarding service of notice regarding same (.2)	2.50 1,675.00
01/02/14	J. Murray	Review correspondence from H. Binder regarding Applications for Compensation (.1)	0.10 67.00
01/05/14	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding timing of Applications for Compensation, review court's calendar regarding same, analysis and evaluation re same (.3)	0.30 201.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 146

J		Compensation of Professionals - Dorsey & Whitney LL	
01/06/14	J. Murray	Correspondence to V. Chial regarding Application for Compensation (.5)	0.50 335.00
01/06/14	J. Murray	Correspondence to V. Chial regarding project billing categories for Application for Compensation, mock up pro forma regarding same, continue preparation of project billing categories (.3)	0.30 201.00
01/11/14	J. Murray	Correspondence to V. Chial regarding Application for Compensation (.1)	0.10 67.00
01/11/14	J. Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (4.0); analysis and evaluation regarding hearing dates for Application for Compensation, correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding same (.2)	4.20 2,814.00
01/12/14	J. Murray	Correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding scheduling hearing on professionals Applications for Compensation (.1);correspondence to V. Chial regarding Application for Compensation (.1)	0.20 134.00
01/13/14	J. Murray	Correspondence to V. Chial regarding Application for Compensation (.3); telephone conference with V. Chial regarding same (.2); continue preparation of Application for Compensation, correspondence to V. Chial regarding same (1.5)	2.00 1,340.00
01/13/14	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to V. Chial regarding Application for Compensation (.2)	0.20 134.00
01/14/14	J. Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (.5)	0.50 335.00
01/15/14	J. Murray	Correspondence to Creditors Committee	2.30 1,541.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
 Page 147

J		Compensation of Professionals - Dorsey & Whitney LL	
		regarding monthly invoices, review summary regarding same, multiple correspondence to/from C. Cavazos regarding same (.3); continue preparation of Application for Compensation, interoffice conference C. Cavazos regarding same (2.0)	
01/16/14	J. Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation, commence preparation of notice of hearing and form of order regarding Application for Compensation (.6); continue preparation of Application for Compensation (6.3)	6.90 4,623.00
01/17/14	J. Murray	Continue preparation of of Application for Compensation (1.0)	1.00 670.00
01/23/14	J. Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (.2)	0.20 134.00
01/24/14	J. Murray	Analysis and evaluation regarding logistics of hearing regarding Application for Compensation on March 26th (.3); legal research regarding court and United States Trustee revised guidelines for Applications for Compensation (project billing categories, master time summary, etc.), multiple correspondence to/from J. Wesolowski regarding same (1.1);	1.40 938.00
01/24/14	J. Murray	Preparation of memorandum regarding project billing regarding Application for Compensation (.5)	0.50 335.00
01/28/14	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from H. Binder regarding Applications for Compensation (.2)	0.20 134.00
01/31/14	J. Murray	Correspondence to V. Chial regarding pro forma for January (.1)	0.10 67.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 148

J		Compensation of Professionals - Dorsey & Whitney LL	
02/01/14	J. Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (.2)	0.20 134.00
02/03/14	J. Murray	Review excel summary of fees incurred to date, compare to January analysis (.2); continue preparation of project billing (1.2); legal research regarding guidelines regarding Application for Compensation (.5)	1.90 1,273.00
02/03/14	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from V. Chial regarding fees, costs and rates (.1)	0.10 67.00
02/04/14	J. Murray	Continue review of billings regarding preparation of Application for Compensation (2.5)	2.50 1,675.00
02/05/14	T. Hwang	Meetings J. Murray and S. Bloomer regarding preparation of Application for Compensation (.2); review correspondences J. Murray and S. Bloomer, and correspondences S. Bloomer regarding same (.1)	0.30 126.00
02/05/14	J. Murray	Multiple interoffice conferences with T. Hwang and S. Bloomer regarding logistics of Application for Compensation and service thereof (.3)	0.30 201.00
02/09/14	J. Murray	Review and revise project billing categories (.2)	0.20 134.00
02/09/14	J. Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (1.7)	1.70 1,139.00
02/11/14	J. Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (.4); correspondence to Creditors Committee regarding January fees and costs, and summary of fees and costs to date (.2)	0.60 402.00
02/13/14	J. Murray	Continue preparation of project billing categories regarding Application for	0.50 335.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
 Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
 Invoice No.: *****

 March 17, 2014
 Page 149

J		Compensation of Professionals - Dorsey & Whitney LL	
		Compensation (.5)	
02/17/14	T. Hwang	Commence preparation of Application for Compensation (1.5)	1.50 630.00
02/18/14	T. Hwang	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (.4)	0.40 168.00
02/19/14	J. Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation regarding project billing (1.0)	1.00 670.00
02/20/14	J. Murray	Review and revise project billing regarding Application for Compensation (6.0)	6.00 4,020.00
02/21/14	J. Murray	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation regarding preparation of project billing (3.0)	3.00 2,010.00
02/22/14	J. Murray	Correspondence to V. Chial regarding Nov and Dec project billing categories (.2); analysis and evaluation regarding hours devoted to preparation of Application for Compensation to date (.1)	0.30 201.00
02/24/14	J. Murray	Correspondence to T. Hwang regarding preparation of Application for Compensation (.1)	0.10 67.00
02/25/14	T. Hwang	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation (3.9)	3.90 1,638.00
02/26/14	T. Hwang	Continue preparation of Application for Compensation and legal research regarding same	3.40 1,428.00
02/26/14	J. Murray	Multiple correspondence to/from V. Chial regarding project billing (.4)	0.40 268.00
02/27/14	J. Murray	Continue preparation of project billing categories (1.0)	1.00 670.00
Subtotal for		Compensation of Professionals - Dorsey & Whitney LL	42,039.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee of
Client-Matter No.: 494643-00001
Invoice No.: *****

March 17, 2014
Page 150

Compensation of Professionals - Dorsey & Whitney LL

Task	Timekeeper	Rate	Hours	Amount
J	John Murray	670	55.80	37,386.00
J	Robert Franklin	510	1.30	663.00
J	Thomas Hwang	420	9.50	3,990.00
J	Total		66.60	42,039.00

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY